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BROWNSVILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID NAME: B035-26 SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS
DATE & TIME: April 22, 2026 AT 11:30 AM

E1411-01 E1502-00 E1527-00 E1528-00 E1530-00 E1532-00 E1538-00
15 KVA 7200 |37.5 KVA 7200|300 KVA 7200 | 500 KVA 7200 | 750 KVA 7200 | 750 KVA 7200] 2500 KVA
VENDOR
7200
120/240 120/240 277/480 120/208 120/208 277/480 277/480
6 EA SEA 2EA 3 EA 1 EA 6 EA SEA
AKL ENGINEERING. INC | 5 |§5:239.00 $7,509.00 $19,315.00 $24,971.00 $29,089.00 $28,898.00 $60,450.00
HOUSTON, TX NL 160 80 430 460 810 810 2100
T el |5 ]330 450 3700 5910 7600 7600 22100
DELIVERY: 77 DAYS | [399 530 4130 6370 8410 8410 24200
ALPHA PLOTTER NC INCl ¢ [$2:248:00 $5,046.00 $13,400.00 $16,480.00 $20,487.00 $18,580.00 $49.263.00
RALEIGH, NC Mlso 88 495 690 915 960 2480
. LL
M anosn co vt |10 403 2670 4100 5900 5700 15030
DELIVERY: 112 DAYS [m.]210 491 3165 4790 6815 6660 17510
AR TRANSFORMERS ive | 5 [$1:808.00 $5,170.00 $17,426.00 $19,486.00 $23,165.00 $22,721.00 $44,530.00
LAS VEGAS, NV NL1252 522 2,600 4160 5990 5990 17500
MFG: AR L1462 602 3,115 4984 6,890 6890 19450
TRANSFORMERS
DELIVERY: 110 DAYS 1714 1124 5715 9144 12880 12880 36950
BLACKSTAR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $74,491.00
DIVERSIFIED $
ENTERPRISES
NEW ORLEANS, LA |™ 2400
MFG: JST POWER EQUIP |*" 15790
DELIVERY: 26-30 WEEKS | [© 0 0 0 0 0 18190
CAVALRY ENERGY LLC | s $3,818.28 $5,161.76 $27,576.50 $30,546.28 $38,465.68 $37,617.18 $57,415.69
WARRENDALE, pA  |™]45 95 370 520 700 700 1,900
MFG: CALVARY e l180 420 2,750 4,300 6,000 5,900 16,000
ENERGY
DELIVERY: 70-84 DAYS I [22° 515 3120 4820 6700 6600 17900
$3,126.86 $4,261.20 $29.750.00 $33,302.24 $40,697.76 $40,861.94 $86,014.92
CRIBPROCURE INC
LAGO VISTA, TX e |42 85 360 480 780 780 1730
MFG: XIAMEN WINLEY [u. |180 360 3000 4650 6000 6000 16500
DELIVERY: 75 DAYS [ |222 445 3360 5130 6780 6780 18230
D TRANSFORMERS | s [$1,512.00 $2,570.00 $14,365.00 $18,015.00 $21,131.00 $21,131.00 $37,422.00
LAREDO, TX NL |42 80 483 796 1319 1319 2737
MFG: DELTA ELECTRIC |"[198 346 2532 3125 3785 3785 13616
DELIVERY: 16 Wks | =240 426 3015 3921 5104 5104 16353




E1411-0] E1502-00 E1527-00 E1528-00 E1530-00 E1532-00 E1538-00
15 KVA 7200 |37.5 KVA 7200|300 KVA 7200{ 500 KVA 7200 | 750 KVA 7200 750 KVA 7200 2500 KVA
VENDOR
7200
120/240 120,240 277/480 120/208 120/208 277/480 277/480
6 EA SEA 2 EA 3 EA 1 EA 6 EA 5EA
OB SOLUTIONS LLC | [53.25000  [$7.20000  [522,500.00  [530,00000  [$32,500.00 83100000  [$67,500.00
OXFORD, MS NL125 45 450 890 1125 1125 2990
MFG: BEAR POWER L1160 320 2925 3305 5050 5050 9956
SOLUTIONS
DELIVERY: 112 DAYS |m 85 365 3375 4195 6175 6175 12946
EHV NO BID NO BID $25,837.00 $34,817.00 $50,313.00 $42,764.00 $81,563.00
{WEG TRANSFORMERS USA}
WASHINGTON, MO ™+ 498 642 737 924 2128
MFG: WEG L 2654 4343 6634 5844 16262
TRANSFORMER
LEAD TIME: 26-28 - 0 0 3152 4985 7372 6767 18389
WEEKS
ESSENG SOLUTIONS LLC $1,832.00 $5,047.00 $25,620.00 $31,145.00 $40,483.00 $36,383.00 $73,259.00
COPPELL, TX NL 150 87 450 775 900 900 2415
MFG: EAGLERISE L1171 402 2870 3780 5990 5990 15330
RENEWABLE ENERGY
154 DAYS 22 439 3320 4555 6890 6890 17745
INTELLOGIC $1,680.00 $4,950.00 $22,680.00 $30,500.00 $39,660.00 £38,750.00 $56,450.00
ENGINEERING INC
MAPLE RIDGE, BC  [M[55 90 420 660 880 750 2200
MFG: INTELLOGIC LL1140 380 2950 4100 5950 6250 15400
TRANSFORMER
T w195 470 3370 4760 6830 7000 17600
— 5227700 [8461900  [$57,721.00  |[NOBID $54,456.00  [548,333.00  [8172,390.00
BASTROP, TX N34 75 455 1014 1002 2318
wrc. coorer | 1227 437 3077 5833 5925 16360
DELIVERY: 16 - 147 - 261 512 3532 ] 6847 6927 18678
WEEKS
KBS $1,510.00 $4,033.00 $18,074.00 $21,164.00 $37,327.00 $34,053.00 $78,135.00
AUSTIN, TX NLAAS2 35 492 658 830 973 560
MFG: RYMEL:COOPER |"“[164 437 2660 4234 6216 5580 23200
DELIVERY: 84-98 DAYS {1t 216 472 3152 4892 7046 6555 23760
KELLY & HAYES NO BID $18,047.06 $50,132.95 $70,188.24 $£50,235.30 $85,227.06 $184,157.65
NESCONSET, NY et 137 500 700 1500 1500 2500
VTt L 468 3000 5489 9400 9400 18000
DELIVERY: 100 - 110 . 0 605 4100 6851 10400 10400 21000
DAYS
$1,466.00 $3,245.00 $13,480.00 $15,628.00 $19,659.00 $19,659.00 $38,962.00
KLLEN GROUP AMERICA
SIMPSON, NC NL141 30 300 464 645 645 1800
MEG: KLLEN LL 1150 296 2667 4409 6045 6045 16000
191 386 2967 4873 6690 6690 17800

DELIVERY: 112 DAYS




El411-01 E1502-00 E1527-00 E1528-00 E1530-00 E1532-00 E1538-00
15 KVA 7200 |37.5 KVA 7200] 300 KVA 7200 ] 500 KVA 7200 ] 750 KVA 72001 750 KVA 7200 2500 KVA
VENDOR 7200
120240 120/240 277/480 120/208 120/208 277/480 277/480
6 EA 5 EA 2 EA 3 EA 1 EA 6 EA S5 EA
MAGNETRON USA LLC $1,418.00 $3,252.00 $19,046.00 $25,536.00 $34,830.00 $27,338.00 $100.533.00
DORAL. FL wfs3 86 550 806 820 1133 2010
MFG: MAGNETRON LL 1163 418 2475 3718 6456 5074 17463
T Y| el PALS 504 3025 4524 7276 6207 19473
META POWER $7,709.96 $13,644.56 $31,726.23 $42.410.56 $48,951.74 $48,951.74 $77.847.80
SOLUTIONS
PALM BEACH GARDENS, M |55 110 440 720 840 840 1800
FL
MFG: META POWER  ['4|180 420 2550 4300 7300 7300 25500
SOLUTIONS
DELIVERY: 126 - 140 - 235 530 2990 5020 8140 8140 27300
DAYS
MVA POWER INC $4,11924  [88,150.99  [521,886.48  [$33,209.56  [$36,04031  |$35,757.25  [$65,904.93
MONTREAL oBc  |]140 150 480 860 1050 1050 2700
MFG. MvA PowER  |*[610 470 4430 5500 8250 8250 25300
DELIVERY: 154-170 [m.|750 620 4910 6360 9300 9300 28000
PULSEMAC SOLUTIONS | [52100.00  [$4,10000  [$17,800.00  [520,150.00  [$25400.00  [$22,300.00  [$46,900.00
SAN ANTONIO, TX | |42 80 515 615 900 900 1950
5 LL
Nt 210 442 2600 4520 5990 5990 17500
DELIVERY: 65 DAYS  |w 1252 522 3115 5135 6890 6890 19450
*SHIHLIN ELECTRIC $6,100.00 $11,960.00 $37,000.00 $67,370.00 $58,690.00 $121,980.00 $48.480.00
AND ENGINEERING
CORP.
TAIPEI CITY, TAIWAN [|N-{60 106 486 557 807 796 2076
MFG: isivchu ary 2117 299 2483 4364 5816 5930 16105
DELIVERY: 224 DAYS [ |177 405 2969 4921 6623 6726 18181
TECHLINE $2,305.00 $6,423.75 $29,462.50 $42.206.25 $80,826.25 $66,733.75 $162,301.25
SAN ANTONIO, TX NL142 84 535 734 768 987 2587
MEG: HOWARD. IND LL {205 403 2373 3669 6231 5283 13167
DELIVERY: 20-65 WKS ftu 247 487 2908 4403 6991 6270 15754
TECHNOLOGY $3,100.00 $5,400.00 $38,500.00 $65,500.00 $118,700.00 $68.500.00 $228,400.00
INTERNATIONAL INC
LAKE MARY, FL NL123 35 482 579 509 932 1956
MFG: CENTRAL LL 1174 437 2876 4797 7637 5986 16228
MOLONEY
DELIVERY: 32-36 197 472 3358 5376 8146 6918 18184

WEEKS




El411-01

E1502-00 E1527-00 E1528-00 E1530-00 E1532-00 E1538-00
15 KVA 7200 §37.5 KVA 7200[ 300 KVA 7200 | 500 KVA 7200 } 750 KVA 7200 | 750 KvA 7200] 2500 KVA
VENDOR
7200
120/240 120/240 277/480 120/208 120/208 277/480 277/480
6 EA SEA 2EA JEA 1 EA 6 EA SEA
TEXAS METER & $1.331.57 $3,209.31 $17,546.47 $20,474.37 $24,362.34 $24,362.34 $53,509.98
DEVICE COMPANY
ML
WACO. TX 1 56 106 390 650 800 800 2100
MFG: WASION L1148 320 3120 4360 6400 |6400 16800
AMERICAS
DELIVERY: 60 - 90 DAYS | |24 426 3510 S010 7200 7200 18900
NEXGEN $2,376.00 $5,162.00 $32,822.00 $47,520.00 $57,580.00 $51,507.00 $99,393.00
NL
GARDENA. CA 45 95 460 695 1095 1095 2550
MFG: DONG-A ELECTRIC|LL] 150 360 2760 4000 4750 4760 13300
CO. LTD
DELIVERY: 182 DAYS [n.[195 455 3220 4695 5845 5855 5850
PRIESTER-MELL & $2,935.00 $5,125.00 $36,445.00 NO BID $112,004.00  [$64,576.00 $215,433.00
NICHOLSON INC
SAN ANTONIO. TX  [n{23 35 482 509 932 1956
CENTRAL wli7e 437 2876 7637 5986 16228
MOLONEY/WEG
DELIVERY: 80 - 215 . 197 472 3358 10 8146 6918 18184
DAYS ]

Note: *Did Not Sign bid document - Disqualified
**Price subject to change at any time, depending to market conditiens
Technology International, Inc. - Bid price submitted as a Lump Sum {All or none)

Priester Mell & Nicholsen - Central Meloney takes exception to coal tar epoxy tank bottom

AKL Engineering, Inc. - Requesting % payment upfront

APPROVED BY:

DIANE SOLITAIRE

pottre  57-d026




