BROWNSVILLE

PuUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B020-26 FACILITY MAINTENANCE PROJECTS
DATE & TIME: JANUARY 15, 2026 - 3:00 PM
| ) (2]
| D‘:szx-rrica: d *Global Construction| Kingdom Concrecte | “NanoTech Coatings Comsrl:uz:ie:f& PRECOMM ROOFING
c 8 & Design, LLC Coatings. LLC LLC GROUP
onstrucion Maintenance
SOMERSET. TX MCALLEN., TX SAN ANTONIO. TX | BROWNSVILLE. TX | BROWNSVILLE, TX | ROUND ROCK. TX
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 SRWA — Floor Painting 1 LOT $74.000.00 $48,000.00 $66,325.00 $41,250.00 $35,500.00 NO BID
e |l e 1 |LoT|  $70,000.00 $31,890.00 NO BID NO BID $25.000.00 NO BID
Modification
Remediation of Buming Resid
3 and Ice Maker Removal 1 LOT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,000.00 NO BID
Pump House #!
Door Removal & installation 1 LOT $25,800.00 $5,500.00 NO BID NO BID $9.000.00 NO BID
4
WL e 1 |LoT|  $16500.00 $14,000.00 NO BID NO BID $12,000.00 NO BID
Exhaust Fan Installation
Water Plant #1:
Main Office Entry 1 LOT $168,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,000.00 NO BID
Breakroom/Meeting room 1 Lot INCLUDED NO BID NO BID NO BID $16,000.00 NO BID
5
Office Area 1 LOoT INCLUDED NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.000.00 NO BID
Stockroom 1 LOT INCLUDED NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,500.00 NO BID




+
D‘:szlrrluasca‘: 4 *Global Construction| Kingdom Concrecte | *NanoTech Coatings Co:lsr:f::?:ne& PRECOMM ROOFING
205 2 & Design. LLC Coatings. LLC LLC B GROUP
Construcion Maintenance
SOMERSET.TX | MCALLEN.TX |SAN ANTONIO, TX | BROWNSVILLE, TX |BROWNSVILLE, TX | ROUND ROCK. TX
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | TOTALPRICE | TOTALPRICE | TOTALPRICE | TOTALPRICE | TOTALPRICE | TOTAL PRICE
6 | BPUB Administration Building I |LOT|  $98.500.00 $84.500.00 NO BID NO BID $32.000.00 NO BID
Office Remodeling
7 |BPUB Call Center Remodeling 1 |LoT|  $45.900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.500.00 NO BID
8 |Cromack House Repairs 1 |LoT|  $58950.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.500.00 NO BID
9 |John Gloor Park- Sidewalk 1 |LoT|  $74.800.00 $24.500.00 $56,000.00 NO BID $37.500.00 NO BID
(o Resaca Ma Cienance JarEhouss 1 |Lor|  s38.800.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.500.00 NO BID
Roof Repair
TOTAL BID AMOUNT $671,250.00 $208,390.00 $122,325.00 $41,250.00 $233,000.00 $0.00

*Vendors did not sign bid document - Disqualified

**Mathematical error -Vendor's bid price total on response is $230,000.00

Precomm Roofing Group - No bid submitted.
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DIANE SOLITAIRE




