BRROWNSVILLE

PuBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B090-25 ELECTRICAL AND ELECTRONIC SPARE PARTS
OPENING DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 25, 2025 at 10:00 AM

: Sy DEALERS
L o oo S| M omsane| R
1 i E SAN ANTONIO, TX | PRIOR LAKE. MN BROWNSVILLE, TX CORPUS CHRISTI, TX CAMARILLO, CA HARLINGEN. TX
':g"_" COMMODTY| uM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 |Looo1-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $291.00
2 [Looo2-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $361.00
3 |Lo003-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $450.00 $389.00
4 |Loood-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,500 00 $768.00
5 |L000s-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,750 00 $1,350.00
6 |Looos-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,950.00 $3,044 00
7 |Lo007-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $92.50 NO BID NO BID
8 |L0008-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.00 NO BID NO BID
9 |L0009-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $117.50 NO BID NO BID
10 |Loot0-00 EA | 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $117.50 NO BID NO BID
11 [Loot1-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00 $135.00 $63.15
12 |L00I2-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $65.00 $145.00 $63.15
13 [Loo13-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $108.00 $250.00 $106.25
14 |Loo14-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $240.63 $755.00 $240.65
15 |Loo15-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.15 $55.00 $16.65
16 |L0016-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID $904 000 $211.25 $342.90 $12592
17 |Loo17-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID $904.00 $211.25 $407.70 $125.92
18 |Loois-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID $1.216.00 $260.00 $444.60 $183.60
19 [Loo19-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID $1,611.03 $1,242.80 $1,950.00 NO BID
20 |L0020-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID $2,380.90 $1,875.25 $5.590.00 NO BID
21 {L0021-00 EA | 15 NO BID NO BID $1,296.200 $1,034.80 $3.250.00 NO BID
22 |Looz2-p0 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $325.34 $950.00 $431.45
23 |L0023-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $96.10 $115.00 $176.30
24 [1.0024-00 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID $238.36 $650.00 $477.20
25 |1.0025-00 EA | 10 NO BID NOBID | NOBID $329.09 $650.00 $431.45




ANIXTER

CONTEGRA INC

CRAWFORD
ELECTRIC SUPPLY

THE REYNOLDS
COMPANY

DATA EXCHANGE
CORPORATION

DEALERS
ELECTRICAL
SUPPLY

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PRIOR LAKE, MN

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CORPUS CHRISTE, TX

CAMARILLO, CA

HARLINGEN, TX

';f)'.“ umoek | UM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
26 |L0026-00 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID $330.66 $850.00 $428.90
27 |L0027-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.69 $105.00 $91.99
28 |L0028-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.63 $95.00 $29.82
29 |L0029-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.25 $35.00 $35.70
30 |L0030-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.50 $55.00 $35.78
31 |L0031-00 EA | 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.66 $55.00 $35.78
32 |L0032-00 EA | 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.11 $55.00 $35.75
33 |L0033-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID $60,504.00 $7,090.75 $7,500.00 $3.942.65
34 |L0034-00 EA | $0 NO BID NO BID NO BID $479.33 $1,250.00 $503.10
35  |L0035-00 EA | 10 NO BID NO BID NOBID $462.50 $1,250.00 $522.25
36 |L0036-00 EA | 10 NO BID $1,170.00 NOBID $1,345.00 $450.00 $1,487.50
37 |L0037-00 EA 10 NO BID $1,170.00 NO BID $1,345.00 $495.00 $1,487.50
38 |Loo3s-00 FT | 500 NO BID NO BID :3;;?;’; $9.62 NO BID ;fg :27755/’;
39 |L0039-00 FT | 200 NO BID NO BID izz'g;‘::fF"Tc $20.30 NO BID %:2‘;:}?#
40 [Looa0-00 FT | 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.80 $195.00 S
41 |Lood1-00 FT | 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.50 $195.00 ss';']%?gf
42 |Lo043-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $5,302.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID

.

43 [1.0044-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $1,91275 $1,107.97 NO'BID NO BID
44 [L0045-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $3,409 40 $1,107.97 $1,600.00 NO BID
45  |L0046-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $4,653.33 NO BID $770.00 NO BID
46 |L0047-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $530.20 $252.98 $280.00 NO BID
47  |L0048-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $523.49 $328.74 $80.00 NO BID
48 [Lo049-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $617.45 $518.13 $280|.00 NO BID
49  [Loos0-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $488.81 $360.00 NO BID
50 |L0051-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $798.66 $195.20 $550.00 $233.79
51 |Lo052-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $420.13 $189.47 $520.00 $74.95

52 |L0053-00 EA | 10 NO BID NO BID $488 59 $133.32 $195.00 $118.75
53 |LoD54-00 EA | 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $146.73 $175.00 $79.00

54 |L0055-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,525.00 NO BID NO BID
55 |L0056-00 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $518.00 NO BID NO BID
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COMMODITY

No. | CNomah | UM | QrY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
56 [L0057-00 EA | 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $210.00 NO BID NOBID
57 |Looss-00 EA | 6 NO BID NO BID $984.00 $216.35 $950.00 $446.20
58 |L0059-00 EA | 6 NO BID NO BID $2,024.00 $247.56 $1,150.00 $446.20
59 |Loos0-00 EA | 10 NO BID NO BID $503.36 $428.65 $475.00 NO BID
60  [Loos2-00 EA | 4 NO BID NO BID $$53°33_?66 $255.96 $445.00 $444 87
61  |L0063-00 EA | 4 NO BID NO BID $$5’3°33.'53: $256.32 $445.00 $446.20
62 L0064-00 EA | 4 NO BID NO BID $$53°33_'53: $256.32 $445.00 $444 87
63 [Looss-00 EA | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,017.08
64 [Looss-00 EA | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6,900.00 $5,630.62
65  |Loo67-00 EA | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,900.00 $4,471.50
66  |L0063-00 EA | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,600.00 $3,577.75
67 |Looev-00 EA | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,838.10
68  |L0070-00 Ea | 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $520.00 $1,500.00 NO BID
69  |L0071-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
70 |Loo72-00 BX | 100 $11.77 NO BID $7.03 $50.00 NO BID NO BID
71 |Loo73-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID $300.16 $187.75 NO BID $187.75
72 |L0074-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID $570.00 $402.42 $500.00 $402.42
73 |Loo7a-01 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.20 NO BID $34.20
74 |L0075-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.50 $75.00 $42.20
75 |L0076-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.50 $75.00 $42.20
76 |L0077-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID $42.95 $20.81 $75.00 $37.62
77 |Loo78-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID $17.45 $8.13 $145.00 $13.65
718 |L0079-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID $22.82 $9.64 $145.00 $12.25
79 |L0080-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.22 $15.00 NO BID
80 |L0081-00 Ea | 200 NOBID NO BID NO BID $3.04 NO BID NO BID
81 |L0082-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.73 NO BID NO BID
82 [Loos3-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00 NO BID NO BID
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e s
s e LT DEALERS
Sk - | crawrorD THE REYNOLDS | DATA EXCHANGE
e ANIXTER | CONTEGRAINC | ) eCTRICSUPPLY|  COMPANY CORPORATION | FLECTRICAL
i I-;,- L i - | SAN ANTONIO, TX PRIOR LAKE, MN BROWNSVILLE, TX CORPUS CHRISTI, TX CAMARILLO, CA HARLINGEN, TX
'Lg“ c‘?féﬂﬁ?&" UM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
83 |L0084-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.20 NO BID NOBID
84 |L0085-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.88 NO BID NO BID
85 |L0086-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.13 NO BID NO BID
86 |L0087-00 EA | 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.91 NOBID NO BID
87  |L0088-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.50 NO BID NO BID
88 |Loog9-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,700.00 $5,900.00 $2,693.96
80 |Loo9o-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,740.91 $7,500.00 $3,773.40
90  |Lo0S1-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.958.90 $11,500.00 $7,702.84
91 |Lo092-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8,402.00 $17,500.00 $10,875.60
92 |L0093-00 EA 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.67 $107.89 $43.20
93 [L0094-00 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.51 $258.96 $83.05
94 |L0095-00 EA 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $86.99 $377.78 $166.05
95  |L0096-00 EA 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID $132.11 $560.00 $241.00
96  |L0097-00 EA 50 $10.08 NO BID $12.42 $13.45 $55.00 $14.60
97 |L0098-00 EA 50 $12.63 NO BID $14.95 $20.20 $55.00 $2025
98  |L0099-00 EA 50 $26.75 NO BID $45 93 $42.86 $55.00 $38.35
99 |Lo100-00 EA 50 $13.31 NO BID $16.19 $2520 $55.00 $2720
100 [LOt01-00 EA 50 $18.85 NO BID $21.92 $15.70 NO BID $21 59
101 [Lo102-00 EA 50 $24.68 NO BID NO BID $14.78 NO BID $28.28
102 |Lo103-00 EA 50 $37.68 NOBID $46.99 $36.43 NO BID $43.17
103 [Lo104-00 EA 50 $50.21 NO BID $62.62 $40.19 NO BID $57.52
164 [L0105-00 EA 50 $36.96 NO BID $45.70 $41.98 NO BID $41.98
105 [Lo107-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID $12752 $48.07 $195.00 $63.20
106 |L0108-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID $260.40 $74.80 $175.00 $9L.15
107 |L0109-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74 80 $165.00 $91.15
108 |LO110-00 EA 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74 80 $370.00 $91.15
109 [Lot11-00 EA 50 NO BID NO BID $237.58 $74.80 $370.00 $91.15
110 |Lo112-00 EA 50 NOBID NO BID $201 34 $74.80 $370.00 $91.15
11 |Lo113-00 EA 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.18 $90.00 $52.98
—iPaged
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NO. CONMODITY | UM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
(12 [Lo114-00 EA | 30 NO BID NO BID $255.03 $73.41 $215.00 $112.15
113 |LO115-00 EA | 30 NO BID NO BID $16.11 $3.61 NO BID $102.40
114 |L0116-00 FT | 2.000 $0.43 NO BID :ﬁ";:zz;‘f'r $0.58 NO BID ;5;?;22'3;%
115 |L0117-00 fT | 2,000 $0.43 NO BID 3‘188?, o $0.58 NO BID :552,22;;’;4
116 |Lo118-00 FT | 1.000 $3.43 NO BID ﬁi’gg'.'ﬁ?"r $4.65 NO BID $;f_gg;’,2’,l',‘“
17 |Lo119-00 FT | 1,000 $4.28 NO BID $$4£399§?;¥ $5.80 NO BID sgﬁggfgr““
18 [Lo120-00 EA 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $195.00 NO BID
119 [Lo121-00 EA | 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $129.89 $85.00 $118.75
120 [Lo122-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.95 $45.00 NO BID
121 [Lo123-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.85
122 |Lo123-01 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.57 $119.00 $176.40
123 [L0123-02 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $135.98 $295.00 $126.05
124 [L0123-03 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $103.49 NO BID $176.75
125 [L0124-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.85
126 |L0125-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29 85
127 |L0126-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.85
128 |L0127-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD $29.85
129 |L0128-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40 00 $29 85
130 |L0129-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.00 $29.85
131 {L0130-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00 $29.85
132 [L0131-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.00 $29.85
133 [Lo132-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $191 24 $700.00 $175.60
134 |Lo132-01 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $5.369.13 $363.02 $900.00 NO BID
135 [Lo133-00 EA 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID $520 00 $1,50000 NO BID
136 |Loi34-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $275.00 $152.45
137 [Lo135-00 EA | 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.50 NO BID NO BID
138 [L0136-00 EA | 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
139 [Loi37-00 FT | s04 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.12 NO BID NO BID
140 |L0138-00 FT | so4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.02 NO BID NO BID

ETTE)




DEALERS

L o [comoane | Suome | meenons (omecuor) S5
Ry SUPPLY
!j..- : ; SAN ANTONIO, TX | PRIOR LAKE, MN BROWNSVILLE, TX CORPUS CHRISTI, TX CAMARILLO, CA HARLINGEN, TX
r;'('::' Copn | UM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
141 [Lo141-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.00 NO BID NO BID
142 |Lo144-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.09 $19.50 $15.75
143 [L0146-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.45 $35.00 $20.35
144 |LO148-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID $37.24 NO BID $34.85
145 [L.0151-00 EA | 20 $8.83 NO BID $30.20 NO BID $25.00 $31.00
146 [L0153-00 EA | 20 $20.86 NO BID $29.07 NO BID $25.00 $36.80
147 |Lo155-00 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.00 $2.75
148 [L0155-01 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.65
149 [L0159-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $644.89 NO BID NO BID
150 |L0160-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,034.23 NO BID NO BID
151 [L0161-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID $320.25 NO BID NO BID
152 |LO164-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
153 [1.0167-00 BOX | 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
154 |L0170-00 EA 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
155 [1L0172-00 EA 5 $6.35 NO BID NO BID $6.64 NO BID $7.76
156 [1.0173-00 EA 5 $6.35 NO BID NO BID $6.64 NO BID $7.76
157 [LO174-00 EA 5 $6.35 NO BID NO BID $6.85 NO BID $7.76
158 [L0175-00 EA | 50 $6.35 NO BID NO BID $6.95 NO BID $7.76
159 [Lo176-00 EA | 50 $6.35 NO BID $10.82 $7.08 NO BID $7.76
160 [L0177-00 EA | 50 $6.35 NO BID $10.82 $6.78 NO BID $7.76
161 [L0178-00 EA | 50 $6.35 NO BID $10.82 $6.78 NO BID $7.76
162 [L0179-00 EA | s0 $6.35 NO BID $10.82 $6.96 NO BID $7.76
163 [L0180-00 EA | 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
164 |L0180-01 EA | 80 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID
165 |L0181-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $92.55 $250.00 $374.60
166 |LOIBI-01 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.00 $175.00 $374.60
167 |LO181-02 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $98.93 $325.00 $158.80
168 |L0I81-03 EA 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $663.36 NO BID $1,059.70
169 |L0182-00 EA 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $475.00 $335.65
170 |L0182-01 EA 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $475.00 $367.65
(71 |Lo182-02 EA 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $475.00 $668.82
172 |L0182-03 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $475.00 $1,227.25
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NG, oot [ um | @Ty | uNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
173 |Lo183-00 EA | 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.80 NO BID NO BID
174 |Lo183-01 EA 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.80 NO BID NO BID
175 |L0183-02 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.80 NO BID NO BID
176 |L0183-03 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.80 NO BID NO BID
177 {LOV84-00 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.76 $65.00 NO BID
178 |L0184-01 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $30.11 $55.00 NO BID
179 |L0184-02 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.39 $90.00 $16.10
180 |L0184-03 EA | 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID $219] $95.00 $19.00
181 |L0185-00 EA | 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 $35.10
182 {LOIS6-00 EA | 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $95.00 $66.75
183 |L0187-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $63 40
184 |L0187-01 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $63.40
185 |L0187-02 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $136.72
186 |Lo187-03 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $70.68
187 {L0I88-00 EA | so0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.00 NO BID
188 [LOL8R-01 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.00 NOBID
189 [L0188-02 EA | S0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $55.00 NOBID
190  [L0188-03 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $45.00 NOBID
191 [L0188-04 EA | s0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.00 NO BID
192 |L0188-05 EA | s0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $90.00 NOBID
193 |L0188-06 EA | S0 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 NO BID
194 |L0188-07 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 NO BID
195 |L0188-08 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $320.00 NO BID
196 |Lo188-09 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $130.00 NO BID
197 |L0188-10 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $150 00 NO BID
198 |LOL8S-11 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $185 00 NO BID
199 [L0150-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.00 $89.88
200 |L0190-01 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $150 00 $134.89
201 [L0190-02 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.00 $76.85
202 |L0190-03 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.00 $76.85
203 {L0190-04 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.00 $66 56
204 |L0192-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID $260.00 $74.05

Paaa 2
-




ANIXTER

CONTEGRA INC

CRAWFORD
ELECTRIC SUPPLY

THE REYNOLDS
COMPANY

DATA EXCHANGE
CORPORATION

DEALERS
ELECTRICAL
SUPPLY

SAN ANTONIO, TX

PRICR LAKE, MN

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX

CAMARILLO, CA

HARLINGEN, TX

ITEM

COMMODITY

NO. NUMBER UM QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT FPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
205 [LO192-01 EA 20 NOBID NO BID NOBID NGOG BID $260.00 $74.05
206 |L0192-02 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $260.00 $74.05
207 [LO194-00 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.69 NO BID $25.75
208 [LO196-00 EA 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $395.00 $19.65
209 |LO198-00 FT 1000 NOBID NO BID NO BID $1.70 NO BID NOBID
210 |LO198-01 FT 1000 NOBID NO BID NO BID $2.20 NO BID NO BID
211 |Lo198-02 FT 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
212 |LO198-03 FT 1000 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
213 |LO198-04 FT 1000 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID
214 |LO198-05 FT 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID NOBID
215 |L0200-00 EA 6 NO BID NO BID NOBID $1,985.98 NOBID NO BID
216 |L0201-00 EA 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $33.44 $10.25
217 |LO201-01 EA 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $15.00 $10.25
218 |L0201-02 EA 60 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $25.00 $1025
219 |L0201-03 EA 60 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $29.00 $10.25
220 |L0203-00 EA 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.00 $£45.00 NO BID
221 |L0203-01 EA 40 NO BID NOBID NO BID $30.00 $52.11 NO BID
222 |LO205-00 EA 20 NO BID NOBID NO BID $30.00 $55.00 NOBID
223 |L0207-00 EA 20 NOBID NOBID NO BID $20.00 $32.22 NO BID
224 |LO209-00 EA 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $109.52 NQOBID $133.35
225 |LO211-00 EA 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NGO BID NO BID
226 {L0213-00 EA 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $289.29 NOBID NOBID
227 |L0215-00 EA 20 NO BID NO BID $212.91 $166.71 $525.00 NO BID
228 |L0215-01 EA 20 NOBID NO BID $254 47 $198.47 $760.00 NO BID
219 |L0215-02 EA 20 NOBID NO BID $366.44 $286.93 $1,000.00 NO BID
230 [L0215-03 EA 20 NO BID NO BID $593.76 $396 26 $1,650.00 NO BID
231 |L217-00 EA 20 NO BID NO BID $117.90 $72.81 NO BID NO BID
232 |L0219-00 EA 20 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $395.00 $79.20
233 |L0219-01 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $650.00 $323.25
234 L0219-02 EA 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $850.00 $471.65
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L
R atiita SUPPLY

i 3 ot SAN ANTONIO, TX | PRIOR LAKE. MN | BROWNSVILLE, TX | CORPUS CHRISTLTX | CAMARILLO, CA HARLINGEN, TX

'L'g.“ COMMODITY | UM | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
235 |L0219-03 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $295.00 $82.35
236 |L0219-04 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $695.00 $324.50
237 [L0219-05 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $795.00 $471.75
238 [L0220-00 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD $175.00 $88.45
239 [L0220-01 EA | 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $650.00 $223.00
240 [L0220-02 EA 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $650.00 $223.00
241 [L0221-00 EA 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.07 $522.22 $63.10

APPROVED BY: /0-/2 i }5/__.




