BID NAME: B082-25 SUPPLY OF PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS

DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 AT 11:30 AM

Tagw

BROWNSVILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

E1521-00 EL1523-00 E1524-00 E1526-00 E1528-00 E1530-00
75 KVA 7200 150 KVA 7200 225 KVA 7200 300 KVA 7200 500 KVA 7200 750 KVA 7200
VENDOR 120/208 (WITHTAP  |120/208 (WITHTAP  |120/208 (WITH TAP 120/208 (WITHTAP  |120/208, (WITH TAP  |120/208, (WITH TAP
CHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER +/-2.5%) [CHANGER +/.2,5%) CHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER +/-2.5%)
WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT (WITH TAP CHANGER J(WITH TAP CHANGER J{WITH TAP CHANGER
DETECTOR DETECTOR DETECTOR +/-2.5%) +/-2.5%) +/-2.5%)
1 EA 1 EA 2EA 2EA 4EA 1 EA
UNITED TRS ELECTRIC | [$10,227.00 $12,940.00 $15,581.00 $16,779.00 $20,380.00 $25,460.00
INC
LAREDO, TX L1436 458 556 604 730 1162
MFG: UNITED TRS  |]996 1372 1638 1886 3632 5467
ELECTRIC INC
DELIVERY: 11 WEEKS |n.{1432 1830 2194 2490 4362 6629
$25.,308.00 $29,817.00 $33.857.00 $37,615.00 $50,267.00 $85.039.00
TECHLINE
SAN ANTONIO, TX  ["v|174 312 423 423 737 887
MFG: HOWARD g0 1350 1827 1872 3696 5646
INDUSTRIES
DELIVERY: 50+ WEEKS |n.|984 1662 2250 2295 4433 6533
28,019.00 30,027.00 34.062.00 34,489.00 0,043 00 58,062.00
NEXGEN POWER INC 2 3 . . = $
GARDENA, CA NL: 167 270 351 432 1630 990
MFG: DONG-A ELECTRIC |ut:| 704 1455 2024 2639 4001 4717
co.
DELIVERY: 24 WEEKS |m]961 1725 2375 3071 4631 5767
TEXAS ELECTRIC $15.744.00 $17,368.00 $18,714.00 $20,456.00 $23,265.00 $33,239.00
COOPERATIVES
MFG: GE PROLEC | [814 1294 1805 2140 4041 5752
DELIVERY: 1960aYS |77 1598 2213 2690 4724 6631
$18.347.00 $21,101 00 $23.395.00 $25,347 00 $36,534.00 $44,968 00
WEG TRANSFORMERS
WASHINGTON, MO "] 163 202 372 497 701 832
MFG: WEG L1870 1438 2114 2554 3933 5923
TRANSFORMERS
1 5
DELIVERY: 2840 WEEKS [ | 133 1730 2486 305 4634 675
$20,550.00 $22.350.00 $27,540.00 $25.950.00 $32,430.00 $36,390.00
CALVARY ENERGY LLC
WARRENDALE,PA  [M:]220 320 430 520 800 1100
MEG: CALVARY Lt 1600 2700 3800 4800 7200 10200
DELIVERY: 70DAYS  |r]1820 3020 4230 5320 8000 11300
ECB SCLUTIONS $17,000.00 $21,000.00 $22,500.00 $23,000.00 $27.500.00 $29,000.00
OXFORD, MS g0 373 450 450 890 1125
MFG: BEAR POWER  {LL]1270 1163 2925 2925 3305 5050
SOLUTIONS
DELIVERY: 84-112 DAYS | {135 1536 3375 3375 4195 6175




E1521-00 E1523-00 E1524-00 E1526-00 E1528-00 E1530-00
T5 KVA 7200 IS0 KVA 1200 225 KVA 7200 300 KVA 7200 500 KVA 7200 T50 KVA 7200
VENDCR 1201208 (WITHTAP  [120/208 (WITHTAP  |1207208 (WITH TAP 1204208, (WITHTAP | 120/208, (WITH TAP ~ |120/208, (WITH TAP
CHANGER +/-2.5%)  |[CHANGER +-2.5%}  JCHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER +-2.5%)  |CHANGER +-2.5%)  |CHANGER +/-2.5%)
WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT [(WITH TAP CHANGER |{(WITH TAP CHANGER |(WITH TAP CHANGER
|pETECTOR |oETECTOR DETECTOR +(:2.5%) 212.5%) +/-2.5%)
1 EA L EA 2 EA 2EA 4EA | EA
IPREMIER TRANSFORMER $13.280.00 $14,960.00 $16,000.00 $17,440.00 $22,400.00 $25,920.00
LLC
PRINCETON. NJ 91220 336 452 546 756 1103
MFG: HANGSU FIRST  |LL]99g 1838 2730 3570 5880 8505
POWER
DELIVERY: 120 DAYS |n|1?'® 2174 3182 4116 6636 9608
TEXAS METER & pEvicE|  |519-381.00 $20,401.00 $24,680.00 $28,767.00 $34.641.00 $42.693 00
WACO, TX w32 215 286 391 440 616
MFG WASION AMERICAS L1027 1833 2526 3101 5070 7041
DELIVERY: 90-95 DAYS |m. 1159 2047 2812 3492 5510 7657
$12,100.00 $14,170.00 $15,870.00 $16.600.00 $21,670.00 $28,475 00
AR TRANSFORMERS INC
LAS VEGAS. NV NLA175 210 380 485 670 900
MFG ART L1845 1870 2170 2720 4240 5990
DELIVERY: 110 DAYS [r|1020 2080 2550 3205 4910 6890
WESCO/ANIXTER $17411.77 $19,207.07 $20,696.48 $22.62236 $25,729.4] $36,758 83
SAN ANTONIO, TX NLA 163 304 408 550 683 879
MFG GE PROLEC LL1814 1294 1805 2140 4041 5752
DELIVERY: 22-26 WKS [ [977 1598 2213 2690 4724 6631
$10,506 00 $12.921.00 $14,301.00 $15,566.00 $17,406.00 $19,706 00
PULSE MAC SOLUTIONS
SAN ANTONIO, TX N170 210 380 485 670 900
MFG: JIANGSU FIRST {''[1287 1870 2170 2720 4240 5990
POWER
DELIVERY: 75 DAYS [mu[1357 2080 2550 3205 4910 6890
$9.102 28 $11,091 28 $12,436.46 $12,820.16 $15,628.14 $20,714 47
KLLEN GROUP AMERICA
SIMPSON, NC NL 1130 245 290 380 580 760
MFG: KLLEN w1060 1745 2605 3230 4720 6750
1990 289 3610
DELIVERY 12126 DAYS || 895 5300 7510
ZERO MAINTENANCE $£13,44500 $18,169.00 $23.960.00 $27,500.00 $33,269.00 $39,879.00
PRODUCTS LLC
HOUSTON, TX IN-1301 339 439 500 689 B42
MFG DELTA/TSTior  |tt]1023 2115 2946 3284 5802 8671
ORION
DELIVERY: 56 - 84 DAYS [n | 1324 2454 3385 3784 6491 9513
BLACKSTAR $21.645.00 $26,860.00 $27,736.00 $28.615.00 $37,213.00 $42.916 00
DIVERSIFIED
ENTERPRISES
NEW ORLEANS, LA |"°]80 373 390 450 890 1125
MFG: ST POWER L1270 1163 2160 2925 3305 5050
DELIVERY: 18-22 WKS [r.|1350 1536 2550 3375 4195 6175




EI521-00 E1523-00 E1524-00 E1526-00 E1528-00 E1530-00
75 KVA 7200 150 KVA 7200 225 KVA 7200 300 KVA 7200 500 KVA 7200 750 KVA 7200
VENDOR 1207208 (WITHTAP  |120/208 (WITHTAP  [120/208 (WITH TAP 120/208, (WITH TAP  |120/208, (WITH TAP  |120/208, (WITH TAP
CHANGER +/-2 5%) CHANGER +/-2 5%} CHANGER +/-2,5%) CHANGER +/-} 5%) CHANGER +/-2 5%) CHANGER +/-2 5%)
WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT |WITH INTERNAL FAULT J(WITH TAP CHANGER (WITH TAP CHANGER [(WITH TAP CHANGER
|pETECTOR |oETECTOR |oeTECTOR HL2 5%) +-2.5%) +/:2.5%)
1 EA I EA 2EA 2EA 4 EA 1EA
VERDEK, LLC $42,221 58 $46,070.20 $52,364 40 $58,030.50 $66,451.00 $88,645 70
MONRGE, CT NLY240 360 480 600 900 1200
MFG: MADDOX L 100 2000 2700 3300 5000 7200
DELIVERY- 50-80 DAYS Jm [1400 2360 3180 3900 5900 3400
e $20,506.00 $22.110.00 $25.449.00 $26,820.00 $41,061 00 $69.086.00
AUSTIN, TX NL1160 270 366 412 619 360
MFG CENTRAL L1864 1534 2105 2831 4065 7055
MOLONEY
DELIVERY: 280 DAYS [ |1024 1804 2471 3243 4684 7415
$33.58321 $40.970.01 $50,924 67 $62,178 94 £87,998 82 $128,983 50
LARSON ELECTRONICS
KEMP, TX 195 365 462 415 567 982
LL
gl 1536 2395 3244 4625 6106 9685
DELIVERY: 18- 22 WKS [ |1735 2760 3706 5040 6673 10667
CRAWFORD ELECTRIC $48,021 .05 $48,587 37 $48,685 26 $49,128 42 $£54,663.16 $64,190 53
SUPPLY
BROWNSVILLE, TX  |"-[204 330 402 497 733 997
MFG: GIGGA ENERGY  [*-]659 1154 1606 1987 3299 4487
TRANSFORMERS
DELIVERY 27.28 Wks|m. [863 1484 2008 2484 4032 5484
VA POWER NG $12.943.00 $15,664 18 $16,754.59 $17.901 14 $20,717.80 32741845
MONTREAL, QC NL1194 304 452 475 751 967
MFG: MvA Power  |]1527 2562 3464 4567 6030 10142
DELIVERY: 200 DAYS [ 1721 2866 3916 5042 6781 11109
METER POWER £19,359.00 $25,843.00 $28.539.00 $31,234 00 $39,290 00 $50,459.00
SOLUTIONS LLC
LAKE PARK, FL NLIgs 650 450 750 300 950
MFG: META POWER LLl655 860 1800 2500 3500 4500
SOLUTIONS
DELIVERY. 18 WEEKS [ |751 1510 2250 3250 4300 5450
16,900 00 19,900.00 22,900 00 24.900. 29,900.00 42.900.
ALAMO TRANSFORMERS . 2 . S2E0000 . e
SAN ANTONIO, TX NLY 168 331 460 530 855 1078
MFG- ECUATRAN LL 18RO 1340 1820 2515 3430 5188
DELIVERY: 126 - 140 - 1048 16T 2280 3045 4285 6266
DAYS
RBY $23.33850 $25.28292 $27.715 17 NO BID NO BID NO BID
e T L1860 1483 2075
e ey K 1753 1765 2452 0 0 0




|E1521-00 E1523-00 |E1524-00 |Et526-00 E1528-00 |E1530-00
75 KVA 7200 150 KVA 7200 225 KVA 7200 300 KVA 7200 500 KVA 7200 750 KVA 7200
VENDOR 120/208 (WITHTAP  |120/208 (WITHTAP  |120/208 (WITH TAP 1207208, (WITHTAP  [120/208, (WITHTAP  |120/208, (WITH TAP
CHANGER +/-2.5%}) CHANGER +/-2,5%) CHANGER +/-2 5%) {CHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER +/-2.5%) CHANGER. +/-2.5%)
WITH INTERNAL FAULT JWITH INTERNAL FALULT |WITH INTERNAL FALLT {WITH TAP CHANGER [(WITH TAP CHANGER J{(WITH TAPF CHANGER
DETECTOR |pETECTOR DETECTOR 4142 5%) +/-2.5%) +1.2 5%)
| EA 1 EA 2EA 1 2EA 4 EA 1EA
',RBY $20,402.32 $22,844 84 $32.040 27 $35,344. 84 $40,517.27 $54,310.37
BASTROP, TX ul® pE¥ 330 382 502 1030 172
MFG. ZMP 1493 1210 1965 2398 2420 5135
DELIVERY: 140 DAYS | |727 1540 2347 2900 3450 5307
MPWR ELECTRICAL [no BID NO BID $33,397.50 $35.097.50 $37.195.00 $46,690 00
DIRECT
BROWNSVILLE, TX  |* 600 735 1100 1660
MFG JEFFERSON it Js00 735 1000 1600
ELECTRIC
DELIVERY: 7- 10 DAYS |1 | 4] 10 1200 1470 2100 3260
o CORPORATESING $11,195.09 $13,957.59 $16,305 71 $18,101.34 $25,146.88 $30,866.88
KATY, TX w190 290 450 550 900 1000
MFG: ULS Lef 1260 2300 3300 4500 6000 9000
TRANSFORMERS
SELIVERY: 120DAYS ln]t400 2590 3750 5050 6900 10000
| s
APPROVED BY: ,y/&-}zzﬂb‘-"— o ik 5~2 C%’L

DIANE SOLITAIRE




