DATE AND TIME: SEPTEMBER 11, 2025 11:00 AM

# g

BROWNSVYILLFEF

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B087-25 ELECTRICAL INVENTORY MATERIAL

TECHLINE INC

PRIESTER MELL &
NICHOLSON INC

KELLY & HAYES
ELECTRICAL
SUPPLY

ANIXTER

SAN ANTONIO, TX

SAN ANTONIO, TX

NESCONSET, NY

SAN ANTONIO, TX

BRPUB
ITEM COMMODITY DESCRIPTION QTY { UM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

BOLT, MACHINE 5/8" X 20" GALVANIZED

1 E0105-00 STEEL, JOSLYN #18820, ALLIED #8232 50 EA $3.42 3370 $15.57 $7.49
BOLT, OVAL EYE 5/8" X 20" GALVANIZED

2 E0Q113-00 STEEL, JOSLYN #J9420 10 EA 1391 $5.28 $24.97 $11.43
BOLT, DOUBLE ARM 5/ X 18 GALVANIZED

3 E0117-00  [STEEL WITH FOUR SQUARE NUTS, #J8868 50 EA 3419 3414 $14.57 $6.60
HC8868, PLR# R8868, ALLIED PART# J5958
BOLT, DOUBLE ARM 5/8" X 20" GALVANIZED
STEEL WITH FOUR SQUARE NUTS, JOSLYN

4 E0118-00 £18870; ALLIED #5960: GRID POWER 25 EA $4.53 $4.48 $15.39 $7.09
PRODUCT (GPP) #UUBR70
BOLT, 1/2-13 X 2-1/2"L HEX BRASS

5 E0146-00 1/2* THREADED 500 EA 3883 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUT 1/2"-13 HEX BRONZE

6 E0147-00 l4258F1/2-13 200 EA 5276 NG BID MO BID NOBID
PIPE 4" X 10' FT PVC SCH 40 ELECTRIC GRAY

7 E0164-00 COLOR, WITH BELL END 1000 | FT $288 NO BID WO BID $2.50
IPIPE 4" X 10' RIGID, GALVANIZED WITH

8 E0165-00 THREADED BELL END 150 FT NO BID NO BID WO BID MO BID
COUPLING, 2" PVC SCH 40 GRAY COLCR 5

9 E0172-00 ALLIED #59606 75 EA 50,65 NO BID $1.07 50.65




KELLY & HAYES

TECHLINE INC Pﬁﬁﬁi g‘ﬁ‘rﬁg‘ ELECTRICAL ANIXTER
SUPPLY
SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX NESCONSET, NY SAN ANTONIO, TX
BPUB
ITEM A BPUR DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE

CQUPLING, 2 1/2" PVC SCH 40 GRAY COLOR

10 EQ172-01 PART# PVC FIT 212P CP 50 EA 5118 NO BID $192 $1.40
CANTEX #6141629
TERMINAL 4/0-300 MCM CU 1-BARREL, 2-

1 EQG331-00 HOLE PAD #HHL30-2N: DOSSERT #HHL-30-2N 30 EA $23.82 $12225 NO BID NO BID
CONNECTOR #4/0 STRAND COPPER

12 | Esos0 [CO O e 35 | ea $16.96 $14.10 $16.07 $16.58
CONNECTOR #350 MCM COPPER SPLIT

13 | Evor0 [CONNECTS 25 | Ea $25.35 $26.11 $36.54 $24.76
CONNECTOR #500 MCM COPPER SPLIT

14 E0408-00 BOLT, KS34 50 EA $26.62 $31.85 £34 .40 £26.00
CONNECTOR #750 MCM COPPER SPLIT

15 | Eosos0 [CONNECTS 10 | Ea $51.50 $108 25 $70.31 $5032
CONNECTOR #1000 MCM COPPER SPLIT

16 E0410-00 BOLT, KS44 30 EA $66.72 $154 72 $98 96 $65.18

17 | Eosospy [CRIP2/0STR COATED SERVICEDEADEND, | 5 | gy $15.03 NO BID NO BID $15 11
ND-0112
SLEEVE 3/0 STR-1/0 STR SERVICE #IKL36
3/0 STR - 1/0 STR INSULATED SERVICE

18 E0607-00 SLEEVE BLACK-YELLOW; BLACKBURN 50 Ea £3.88 £1.76 50144 50 58
#IKL56, ILSCO PICS-856
PENN-UNION #PIK300
INSULINK #4 STR TO #6 SOL #ESZWEW

19 | E0622:00 |[#4 STR TO #6 SOL INSULINK AL OR CU. 100 | EA 50.82 5198 $2.64 5081
ORANGE-GREEN. BURNDY #ESZW6W
CONNECTOR 477 MCM-1/0 STR AL CU TAP

20 | Eome00 [ SPKGy, WOYSIPB (10PKO) s | Ea $39.86 $54.55 $56.92 $38.17
CONNECTOR 477 MCM-4/0 STR AL CU TAP,

21 EO0718-00 HWCY64: #1-602031-6 20 EA $26 42 536,85 150,095 52580




1TEM

BPUB
COMMODITY

DESCRIPTION

QTY

TECHLINE INC

PRIESTER MELL &
NICHOLSON INC

KELLY & HAYES
ELECTRICAL
SUPPLY

ANIXTER

SAN ANTONIO. TX

SAN ANTONIO, TX

NESCONSET, NY

SAN ANTONIO, TX

UM

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

22

E0731-00

STIRRUP 795 MCM W/ 2/0 BAIL,
BURNDY #WSLI12PB; AMPACT #6021622

50

§90.52

$126.35

$164.37

$88.45

23

E0740-01

CARTRIDGE "YELLOW" WEJTAP
BURNDY PART# WPBYBOX25; 25/BX,

150

NO BID

E0752-00

ADAPTER 477 MCM TERMINAL #48713-8,
477 MCM ADAPTER TERMINALS 2-HOLE
PAD AL. TO CU. BLADE KEARNEY #48713-8

20

$14.70

NO BID

$117.65

§5241
$453

25

E0919-00

PIPE UURD 1" SCH. 40 HD')PE WITH PULLING
ROPE #WP1130

DURA-LINE; PETROFLEX PETRODUCT

Duct Pipe product specifications:

All conduit must meet or exceed one or more of the
following:

ASTM F-2160, ASTM D-3035, ASTM D-2239,
ASTM D-3485, NEMA TC-7, UL 651, Bellcore
GR-356

All conduit must come with Pulling Rope

3000

$0.41

NO BID

NO BID

MO BID

26

E0961-00

SPLICE URD, 1/C TO #25TR.,
3M CAT #CI-T-4,
TRANSITION CONNECTOR

50

EA

$12.24

NO BID

$6.13

£16.40

27

E0962-0¢

SPLICE URD #2 STR 175M #SP15A002
3M BRAND# 5411-C1-2

20

EA

34251

NOBID

NO BID

$89.55

28

E1003-00

BRACKET, ALUM, DOUBLE ARM, LONG
DAB - 6 FT BRACKET ARM “TYPEI" ONLY
LONESTAR CAT #967906

NO SUBSTITUTION

20

EA

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

MO BID

29

E1185-00

FAN, TRANSFORMER COOLING

24" BLADE DIAMETER, 120/208-230 VAC
PART# ZFA-330410-B

NC SUBSTITUTION

EA

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID

MO BID

30

E1378-00

CT INDOOR 400:5 JAB-0 #750X136204
RITZ 110601011.0085, ARTECH# 735323080

EA

$153.00
$176.50

$141.35

NO BID

F150.55




TECHLINE INC

PRIESTER MELL &
NICHOLSON INC

KELLY & HAYES
ELECTRICAL
SUPPLY

ANIXTER

SAN ANTONIO, TX

SAN ANTONIO, TX

NESCONSET, NY

SAN ANTONIO, TX

BFUB
ITEM # COMMODITY DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

CT INDOOR 600:5 JAB-0 GE #750X136206 $153.00

3 E1379-00 |CURRENT RATIO TYPEGE. 6 EA 51 76'50 $141.35 NO BID $150.55
RITZ# 110601011-0086, ARTECHE# 735323120 '
CT OUTDOOR 25:5 JKW-5 #755X50G105,
#D907002550, CURRENT RATIC TYPE G.E. §1.634 00

32 E1387-00 |JKW-5C# 755C150005, 3 EA $]’505'00 $1,493.55 NQ BID $1,586.30
ARTECHE# 756330094-H T
RITZ PART# 112026103 84518
PT OUTDOOR 60:1 URI-17 60:1 0.3Z1, 1500VA

33 E1397-00 ARTECHE PRODUCT 4757060060 3 EA $1,377.00 NO BID NO BID 51,779.73

DELIVERY Stock - 24 weeks 30 - 220 Days 14-147 Days 1-64 Weeks

APPROVED BY:

Dleltre. G305




