BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B061-25 SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS
DATE & TIME: JUNE 18, 2025 - 03:45 PM
Mvapowpr | PRIESTER-MELL Y CAVALRY TECHUNE | TRANSFORMERS |ULS CORPORATE.| \ocoo neren| eca soLurions | NTEDTRS [ puLsenac | o oo o | \canrmnance | KLLEN GROUP Tenas
& NICHOLSON ENERGY, LLC 5 ! INC. : ELECTRIC SOLUTIONS : L ! AMERICA, INC ELECTRIC COOP
USA PRODIUCTS
MONTREAL. | SaN ANTONIO. T |WARRENDALE, PA|SAN ANOTNIO, TX [WASHINGTON, MO KATY.TX  |SAN ANTONIO, TX|  OXFORD.MS LAREDO, TX  |san anTonio, 7x | porTsmoutiyva| Houston.TX | sivpson.NC  |GEorGETOWN, TX
CENTRAL CAVALRY HOWARD ULs UNITED TRS ACTION
» T, SING PH
POLEMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE MVA POWER INC]  CENTEAL s SRR TRANSFORMER | OE PROLEC R Neronmer | AMROCOR KLLEN GE PROLEC
141002 5331902 $2.138.00 $1,825.00 5201100 YO BID $2.321.26 5167440 NO BID $3.148.00 $1.806 00 55,000 00 NO BID $1,384 00 $1.526 00
| 10 Jioxvanm NL: |45 31 2 i 45 30 1992 al a5 36 30
EA [1207240 LL: | 161 85 127 150 153 a4 109 93 120 153
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2 5% TL: | 137 192 105 162 0 225 183 0 6136 150 138 0 156 183
EI411-01 $3.519.12 $2.,356.00 $1,030.00 $3.253 00 NO BID $2,545.43 $1.754 90 NG BID $3,234 00 %1.896 00 $3.000 00 NO BID $1472.00 31,595.00
, | s [rskvanaoo NL: f61 41 30 43 60 2 32.58 52 61 60 2
ea 120240 L |28 226 100 196 220 199 5172 165 28 180 199
{(WITH TAP CHANGER +-2.5%) | TL: |189 267 15 239 0 280 241 o 84.3 217 89 0 240 241
| g CENTRAL CAVALRY HOWARD uLs BEAR POWER UNITED TRS ACTION TST p =
PADM NT, SIN E PH 1 ‘
e (AR MOLONEY ENERGY INDUSTRIES TRANSFORMER | O PROLEC SOLUTIONS ELECTRIC | TRANsFORMER |  AMROCO | TRANSFORMERS KLLEN GE PROLEC
E1500-00 %6665 97 Ta.073 00 32335 00 7,851 00 NO BID $8.058.00 33,754 90 36,500 00 %3,076 00 $4,075 00 $6.599.00 $4.680 00 33,330.00 33,422 00
o | o srvaTm NL: |79 s5 120 64 00 55 70 65 80 29 65 7 55
Ea [120240 LL: f2es 354 225 287 3o 327 271 80.47 290 275 275 265 327
(WITH TAP CHANGER +-2.5%) |TL: |347 109 280 151 o 400 382 341 14547 370 3165 340 336 182
. - ' CENTRAL CAVALRY HOWARD WEG ULs BEAR FOWER | UNITED TRS ACTION TST '
|PADMOUNT, THREE PHASE )
MO ALY R80T MOLONEY ENERGY INDUSTRIES | TRANSFORMERS | TRANSFORMER |  CF PROLEC SOLUTIONS ELECTRIC. | TRANsFORMER |  AMROTO | tRaNSFORMERS VL2 EEHROLES
E1522.00 $36,761.53 $20.902.00 9,500 00 90,831 00 $27,183.00 14,093 42 315,050 0 $18,000,00 $12.990.00 $12.200.00 $26.000.00 $17.500.00 $9.341.00 S18,156.00
. | 3 [nezkvan NL: |370 197 280 220 237 280 227 225 194.91 25 280 250 167 237
Ea |120n08 L 1160 1279 1600 1185 1161 1710 1161 950 28845 1800 1000 ogs 1479 1161
(WITH TAP CHANGER +-2.5%) [TL: |1530 1476 1280 1405 1398 1990 1388 1175 48336 1885 1280 1235 1696 1388
£1527-00 $28,700.02 $29,263.00 $9,500.00 $54 48200 $33,861.00 $18.095.90 523,091 50 $22,000.00 $16.770.00 514,700 00 $29.999.00 $24,150.00 $12.857.14 $20.993 00
s | s [ookva o NL: |450 398 430 582 486 550 577 450 53398 315 430 450 180 577
EA 277030 LL: [2925 2916 1014 2169 2665 4500 2162 2035 702.02 3400 3014 2600 3200 2162
(WITH TAP CHANGER +-2.5%) |TL: |3375 3314 3444 2751 3151 5050 3739 3375 1236 3715 3444 5050 3580 2739
E1523-00 3707149 $96,051.00 519,000 00 579,908 00 $49,876.00 $23.429.25 $28.341 50 $27.000.00 $20.380.00 $17,000.00 539,999.00 $28.680.00 $15.657.19 $25.732 00
. i |s00 kva 7200 NL: [890 619 890 le1s 675 900 707 290 617 680 260 450 560 707
ea |120n08 LL: 3205 14065 3430 1118 4150 6000 4041 3305 806 55 5100 3430 2600 4760 1041
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2,5%) |TL. |4193 3684 4370 4131 4834 6900 1748 195 1423 55 5780 4340 3050 5320 4748
E1529.00 $15.092.00 $32.363.00 15,000 00 72,25 00 $41,022.00 7742025 SIE 0T 75 396,000 00 $20,19000 $17,000 00 $41,909.00 $29.950.00 515,657 14 525,540 00
;| 3 [ooxvarao NL: |s90 605 2890 lsss 639 900 838 800 667.72 680 290 625 560 538
Ea 2770480 LL: |3305 4258 3305 3240 4284 6000 3126 3305 941.36 5100 3305 4000 1760 1126
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) |TL: |4195 4363 14195 1088 1923 6900 3964 4195 1609.08 5780 4195 4625 5320 3964
DELIVERY IN DAYSAVEEKS (ARO) 224 DAYS 100-290 DAYS 63 DAYS 60+ wks 322DAYS 120 DAYS 121-151 DAYS 140 DAYS 10 wks 60 DAYS 1416 whs 56130 DAYS | 112126 DAYS 1290 WES

Note: Cavalry Energy, LLC did not bid sianless sieel ransfonmers

S 7-10-9035

DIANE SOLITAIRE




