DATE AND TIME: JUNE 5, 2024 - 11:30 AM

BROWNSVILLE

PuBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B057-25 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF WATER & WASTEWATER CHEMICALS FOR BPUB & SRWA

ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroxid Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract to
99.5% Anhyd Ammonia L‘O PiiC yfos Z (Liquid Caustic Soda Sodium Hydroxide | (liquid caustic soda | Liquid Chlorine in | Liquid Chlorine in Powdered Liquid A . Sodium Bisulfit Citric Acid 50% Standard Drinking | Calcium Chloride provide Chlorine Sodium Chlorit
'AO MIYEIOUS | price/Lb if truckload (Liqui 5(;1;8 1 50da 25%) as per attached | (Liquid Caustic Soda | 25%) as per attached | one-ton containers | one-ton containers Acti O;Ndeée b lsqullf " n;‘;%‘;:lm S (i :um ;S};lv;Ae Solution for SRWA | Water Grade Ferric Solution Dioxide o 11;$WAON ¢
mmonia deviates from35,000 tof o oo WDP)I & wpa| specifications (BPUB | 50%) for SRWA specifications (BPUB) (SRWA) ctivated Carbon | - Sulfate ( )| Solution ( ) | (330 Gal/Tote) Chloride Solution (SRWA) (BPUB WP1 & ( )
50,000 Lb or WP1 & WP2) (SRWA) for SRWA WP2)
100,000 Pounds 180,000 Pounds 620,000 Pounds 260,000 Pounds 150,000 Pounds 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 275,000 Pounds | 140,000 Pounds |22 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 2,100,00 Pounds | 350,000 Pounds 90,000 Pounds
SKYHAWK
CHEMICALS
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.32 NO BID NO BID
HOUSTON, TX
INTERNATIONAL
DIOXCIDE INC.
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.957 $0.727
NORTH KINGSTOWN,
RI
SOUTHERN IONICS
NO BID $0.1404 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2125 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEST POINT, MS
PVS TECHNOLOGIES
INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $$(§)22§//21 yyrrs NO BID NO BID NO BID
DETROIT, MI ’
AIRGAS
$1.95 $0.245 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAWRENCEVILLE, GA
SHANNON
CHEMICAL $2,783.17/1 yr
CORPORATION NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 ’919 19/ 2yrs NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MALVERN, PA




ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract to
99.5% Anhydrous ) Amr‘noma (Liquid Caustic Soda (Lloquld Caustic Soda S-Odl}lm Hyd?omde (lloquld caustic soda | Liquid Chloru.1e in | Liquid Chlonfle in Powdered Liquid Ammonium | Sodium Bisulfite Cltﬁc Acid 50% Standard Drmkmg Calcium C_hlonde prov1d.e C‘hlorme Sodium Chlorite
Ammonia Price/Lb if truckload 50%) 25%) as per attached | (Liquid Caustic Soda | 25%) as per attached | one-ton containers | one-ton containers Activated Carbon Sulfate (SRWA) Solution (SRWA) Solution for SRWA | Water Grade Ferric Solution Dioxide (SRWA)
deviates from35,000 to for BPUB WP1 & WP2 specifications (BPUB 50%) for SRWA specifications (BPUB) (SRWA) (330 Gal/Tote) Chloride Solution (SRWA) (BPUB WPI &
50,000 Lb or WP1 & WP2) (SRWA) for SRWA WP2)
100,000 Pounds 180,000 Pounds 620,000 Pounds 260,000 Pounds 150,000 Pounds 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 275,000 Pounds | 140,000 Pounds | 22 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 2,100,00 Pounds | 350,000 Pounds 90,000 Pounds
EVOQUA WATER $0.60/ 1yr $0.78/ 1 yr
TECHNOLOGIES LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) |
SARASOTA. FL $0.60/2 yrs $0.78/2 yrs
ATLAS CARBON LLC $0.70/ 1
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID i o NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GILLETTE, WY $0.70/2 yrs
ARQ PURIFICATION
LLC $0.735/ 1 yr
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GREENWOOD $0.735/2 yrs
VILLAGE, CO
CHEMTRADE
CHEMICALS USLLC | No BID NO BID $0.198 $0.13 $0.198 $0.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.159 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PARSIPPANY, NJ
PENCCO, INC
NO BID NO BID $0.268 NO BID $0.268 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1425 NO BID NO BID $0.2897 NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAN FELIPE, TX
NORIT AMERICAS
INE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
MARSHALL, TX
UNIVAR SOLUTIONS
USALLC NO BID NO BID $0.2497 $0.1536 $0.2497 $0.1536 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,595.32 NO BID $0.22 NO BID NO BID
DOVER, FL
CHEMRITE INC. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.18 NO BID NO BID $2.923.80/ 1 yr NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
BUFORD, GA ) $3,157.70 / 2 yrs
PVS DX, INC
NO BID NO BID $0.2290 $0.1474 $0.2290 $0.1474 $2,397.00 $2,397.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CORPUS CHRISTI, TX




ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract to
99.5% Anhydrous i Amn'noma (Liquid Caustic Soda (Llnquld Caustic Soda S'odl'um Hydfomde (lloqllld caustic soda | Liquid Chlom?e in | Liquid Chlom'le in Powdered Liquid Ammonium | Sodium Bisulfite Cltr}c Acid 50% Standard Drmkmg Calcium C'hlonde pr0v1d§ C'hlorme Sodium Chlorite
onia Price/Lb if truckload 50%) 25%) as per attached | (Liquid Caustic Soda | 25%) as per attached | one-ton containers | one-ton containers Activated Carbon Sulfate (SRWA) Solution (SRWA) Solution for SRWA | Water Grade Ferric Solution Dioxide (SRWA)
deviates from35,000 to for BPUB WP1 & WP2 specifications (BPUB 50%) for SRWA specifications (BPUB) (SRWA) (330 Gal/Tote) Chloride Solution (SRWA) (BPUB WPI &
50,000 Lb or WP1 & WP2) (SRWA) for SRWA WP2)
100,000 Pounds 180,000 Pounds 620,000 Pounds 260,000 Pounds 150,000 Pounds 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 275,000 Pounds | 140,000 Pounds | 22 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 2,100,00 Pounds | 350,000 Pounds 90,000 Pounds
BRENNTAG
SOUTHWEST, INC
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.155 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LANCASTER, TX
AMCHEM, INC
NO BID $0.2275 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,808.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LONGVIEW, TX
CHEMSOL SERVICES,
INC NO BID NO BID $0.30 NO BID $0.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.08/gal NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
HARLINGEN, TX
APPROVED BY: LDorane 5 ﬁm 6/10/2025

DIANE SOLITAIRE




	BID TABULATION 

