PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B043-25 ANNUAL TOOL SUPPLY
OPENING DATE & TIME: APRIL 24, 2025 AT 11:00 AM
TRIPLE S STEEL
q CC DIS'I;[;I(I:BUTORS TEXADSEQ:IIIE::'II;ER & TECHLINE INC SU::k:dél;gODI?A ANIXTER SI]:I:[S%(_)A:};NI?:OE ICI\(])C

L MY WORKS )
CORPUS CHRISTL TX WACO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIQ. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX DAVIDSON, NC
[;%M COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 TO001-00 15 $46.55 $46.70 $52.00 $48.35 546.98 $53.79

2 TO003-00 10 $48.45 $48.56 $54.00 $50.27 $48.84 $60.41

3 T0O004-00 10 $20.56 $19.86 $22.00 $38.31 $19.98 $46.06

4 T0005-00 15 $9.87 $9.53 $11.50 $14.84 $9.59 $14.57

5 T0006-00 50 $435.00 $380.15 $424.00 $382.47 $382.33 $367.90

6 T0O0G7-00 10 $18.65 $18.69 $21.00 $19.35 $18.89 $23.26

7 TO008-00 30 $63.13 $64.56 $72.00 $66.84 $564.93 $75.42

8 T0O010-00 20 $45.20 345.40 $53.00 $44.12 345.66 $45.13

9 TOO11-00 20 $21.30 $21.50 $24.00 $22.26 $21.63 $27.90

10 TO012-00 35 $28.30 $28.48 $33.00 $29.48 $28.65 $35.20

11 TOO13-00 40 $10.31 310,51 $12.00 $10.88 $10.58 $13.16

12 T0014-00 25 $7.30 $7.34 $8.75 $7.60 $7.39 $9.36

13 TOO15-00 30 $24.70 $24.80 $28.00 $25.67 $24.94 $27.24

14 TO016-00 20 $7.90 NO BID $9.00 $8.26 $8.03 $10.54

15 TO017-00 15 $6.80 $6.88 $8.00 $7.12 $6.92 $7.78

16 TOO018-00 15 $21.50 $22.38 $25.50 $23.16 $22.45 $26.12




| CC DISTRIBUTORS

TRIPLE S STEEL

SID TOOL CO. INC

i porons | e uEERe | e | SPPYUED | e | " Dotee
e WORKS
- : CORPUS CHRISTI, TX WACO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX DAVIDSON, NC
IL%M COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
17 T0019-00 15 $5.14 $5.16 $6.00 $5.34 $5.19 $5.87
18 T0020-00 15 $25.75 $18.30 $29.00 $26.73 $18.40 $29.55
19 T0OO21-00 8 $5.10 $5.52 $6.50 $6.61 $5.56 $5.32
20 T0022-00 12 NO BID $13.66 $20.00 $8.78 $10.69 $7.52
21 TOO23-00 20 $26.50 $27.53 $32.00 $28.51 $27.70 $31.79
22 T0O24-00 20 $42.92 $43.90 $49.00 $45.45 $44.15 $53.91
23 T0O025-00 25 $28.45 $29.01 $33.00 $30.04 $29.18 $34.06
24 T0O026-00 10 $18.58 $30.36 NO BID $68.65 NO BID $68.58
25 TOO27-00 15 $8.10 $8.14 $9.50 $8.42 $8.19 $9.26
26 T0O028-00 15 $6.50 $6.55 $8.00 $6.78 $6.59 $7.45
27 T0029-00 15 $6.50 $6.55 $8.00 $6.78 $6.59 $7.75
*28 TOO30-00 15 NO BID $113.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID $175.05
29 T0OO31-00 10 $10.40 $10.44 $12.00 $10.81 $10.51 $13.38
30 T0032-00 15 NO BID $545.11 $695.00 $196.94 $540.49 $308.53
31 T0033-00 25 NO BID $258.93 $223.00 $189.04 $260.42 $176.24
32 T0033-01 15 NO BID $25.38 $40.00 $50.14 $27.81 $41.81
33 T0034-00 15 NO BID $70.77 $78.00 $36.92 $55.37 NO BID
34 T0035-00 25 NO BID $16.58 $36.00 $11.85 NO BID 315.07
*35 TO036-00 40 NO BID $542.03 $595.00 NO BID $442.70 $479.99
36 T0037-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.09 NO BID
37 T0038-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
*38 T0039-00 15 NO BID $23.24 $31.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 T0040-00 20 $28.85 $30.20 $34.00 $30.68 $30.38 $31.06




TRIPLE S STEEL

SID TOOL CO. INC
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e = 5 | CORPUSCHRISTL. TX WACO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX $SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX DAVIDSON. NC
ILE(:)M COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
40 T0042-00 13 $24.15 $24.31 $29.00 $25.16 $24.45 $27.53
41 T0043-00 10 $39.20 $39.59 $44.00 $40.99 $39.82 $46.85
42 T0044-00 10 NO BID $326.74 NO BID $137.74 $328.61 $573.43
43 T0045-00 10 NO BID $96.24 $107.00 $81.66 $75.28 NO BID
44 T0046-00 5 NO BID $559.30 $745.00 $327.44 $562.50 $979.64
45 T0046-01 10 NO BID $559.30 $745.00 $327.44 $562.50 $979.64
46 T0046-02 5 NO BID $559.30 $745.00 $327.44 $562.50 $979.64
47 T0046-03 10 NO BID $559.30 $745.00 $327.44 $562.50 $979.64
48 T0046-04 10 NO BID $559.30 $745.00 $327.44 $562.50 $979.64
49 T0047-00 15 NO BID $8.42 NO BID $9.19 NO BID $12.92
50 T0048-00 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.85 NO BID NO BID
51 T0049-00 10 NO BID $114.42 NO BID $118.46 $118.46 $133.78
52 T0049-01 25 NO BID $114.42 NO BID $118.46 $118.46 $133.78
53 T0049-02 35 NO BID $114.42 NO BID $118.46 $118.46 $133.78
54 T0049-03 13 NO BID $t14.42 NO BID $118.46 3118.46 $133.78
55 T0049-04 15 NO BID $117.76 NO BID $121.11 $121.11 $136.77
56 T0049-05 10 NO BID $121.11 NO BID $121.11 $123.75 $139.77
57 T0049-06 5 NO BID $124.53 NO BID 12111 $126.40 $143.40
*538 T0050-00 75 $55.98 $36.93 NO BID $56.46 $54.85 $64.31
*59 T0050-01 100 $55.98 $36.93 NO BID $56.46 $54.85 $64.31
*60 T0050-02 100 $55.98 $36.93 NO BID $56.46 $54.85 $64.31
*61 T0050-03 50 $59.00 $36.93 NO BID $59.52 $57.82 $67.79
*62 T0050-04 20 $62.16 $39.20 NO BID $62.69 $60.91 $71.41
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< WORKS INDUSTRIAL CO
# CORPUS CHRISTI, TX WACO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIG. TX DAVIDSON. NC

I;%M COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

63 TO050-05 10 $65.20 $39.20 NO BID $65.75 $63.88 $74.89

64 TO051-00 100 NO BID $184.84 NO BID $150.14 $185.90 NO BID

65 T0052-00 5 NO BID $451.05 NO BID $838.72 $453.63 $619.06

66 T0052-01 20 NO BID $395.65 NO BID $838.72 $397.91 $617.73

67 TO052-02 15 NO BID $395.65 NO BID $838.72 $397.91 $618.16

68 T0052-03 15 NO BID $395.65 NO BID $838.72 $397.91 $618.16

69 T0052-04 5 NO BID $506.74 NO BID $838.72 $509.64 $659.17

70 T0052-05 5 NO BID $506.74 NO BID NO BID $509.64 $619.06

71 T0053-00 40 NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID $122.13 $194.4]

72 TO054-00 15 NO BID $515.72 $540.00 $317.08 $518.67 $690.40

73 T0054-01 t5 NO BID $973.49 $1.280.00 $804.13 $979.06 $1,707.35

74 TO055-00 100 NO BID $37.30 NO BID $31.25 $42 86 NO BID
NOTE:

APPROVED BY: W 6[" 50 IQ—D}‘S

DIANE SOLITAIRE




