BROWNSYILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B052-24 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF WATER & WASTEWATER CHEMICALS FOR BPUB & SRWA
DATE AND TIME: JULY 11, 2024 - 10:00 AM

ITEM #1 ITEM #2 [TEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM#5 | ITEM#6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM &9 1TEM #10 ITEM #11 [TEM #12
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract io
Ammonia i i {Liquid Caustic Soda | Scdium Hydroxide | (liquid caustic soda | Liquid Chlorine in | Liquid Chlorine in . . . . . Citric Acid 50% Standard Drinking | Calcium Chloride provide Chlorine . -
”'sm""’!“’"“‘ Price/Lb if unackload (Liquid ;";:,"c ] 15%) as per attached | (Liguid Causiic Soda | 259%) as per attached | one-lonc i ! ¥ Ipawug:_b':: g laﬁ:‘mrr ;‘;ﬂ;‘: l(!;:&::) Solution for SRWA | Waer Grade lermic Sotution Dioxide sud(';:g:‘\";""’
Sy deviates rom35,000 1o for BPUB WP & WF2 specifications (BPUB 50%) for SRWA specifications {BPUB) {SRWA) ) {330 Gal/Tote) Chleride Solution for! (SRWA) (BPUB WP1 &
$0.000 Lb p WPI & WP2) (SRWA) SRWA WP
100,000 Pounds | 120,000 Pounds | 620,000 Pounds | 260,000 Pounds | 150,000 Pounds | 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96Tons | 240,000 Pounds | 310,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds | 25 (330-Gal Totes) | 175,000 Pounds | 2,000,000 Pounds | 350,000 Pounds | 120,000 Pounds
PENCCO, INC
NO BID NO BID $0.2469 $0.1548 $0.2469 50,1548 NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NE) BID NG BID NO BID NO BID
SAN FELIPE, TX
CHEMTRADE
CHEMICALSUSLLC | o BID NO BID $0.1900 $0.1250 $0.1900 $0.1250 NO BID NO BID NO) BID $0.170 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PARSIPPANY, NJ
INTERNATIONAL
DIOXCIDE. INC $0.697/1 YR
NO BID NO BID MO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID $0.927/ 1 YR :
NORTH KINGSTOWN.
RI
SOUTHERN IDNICS
NO BID $0.1404 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1855 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEST POINT. MS
AIRGAS
£1.90 £0.2450 NO BID NGO BID NO BID N BID NO BID NO BID N BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
|LAWRENCEYILLE. GA
EVOQUA WATER 0.78/ IYR
TECHNOLOGIES LLC 060/ 1YR
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID N BID N BID 0.81/2YR 061 2vR
SARASOTA, F1.




ITEM#M | ITEM#2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM#9 | ITEM#10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroxide Sodmm Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract 1o
Ammonia K 24 {Liquid Caustic Soda | Sodium Hydroxide | (liquid caustic soda | Liquid Chiorincin | Liquid Chlorine in . ) . Citric Acid 30% | Standard Drinking | Calcium Chiaride | provide Chlorine ! .
Price/Lb if truckloag | (144 ;‘['.‘;’)‘” S04 | 5% as per attached | {Liquid Cansiic Soda | 25%) as per awtached | one-ton containers | one-ton comtat "’°"’*§" ;c,: g Lg.‘:r':u(smm\rm,\’;“ si:udum.o: ?:I:\lw‘":; Solution for SRWA | Water Grade Ferric Solution Dioxide s""(';:‘ﬁ'l‘\*)’"“
deviates from35.000 10 for BPUB WP1 & WP2 specifications (BPUB S for SRWA specifications (BPUB) {SRWA| &l {33 Gal'Towe) Chloride Solution for {SRWA} {BPUB WP1 &
50.000 Lb WPI & WP2) (SRWA) SRWA WwP2)
120,000 Pounds | 620,000 Pounds 260,000 Pounds | 150,000 Pounds | 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 310,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds |25 (330-Gal Totes) | 175,000 Pounds | 2,000,000 Founds | 350,000 Pounds | 120,000 Pounds
DONAU CARBON US
LL.c NO BID N BID MO BID NO BID WO BID MO BID MO BID WO BID BORIRZ WO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WO BID MO BRID NO BID
DUNNELLON, FL
UNIVAR USA
WO BID MO BID $0.2175 01306 $0.2175 20,1306 WO BID KO BID WO BID $0.24 KO BID 197209 N BID NO BID NO BID KO BID
DOVER, FL
CHEMRITE, INC $2,723.00/1 YR
NO BID O BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID $.12 MO BID NO BID $3,049.00/2 YR MO BID KO BRID MO BID N} BID
BUFORD, GA (275 gal tote)
PVS TECHNOLOGILS.
INC. $2359.00/1 YR
NO BID NO BID 307548 80,1556 $0.2548 20,1556 5235900 | w02 yr] NOBD NO BID NO BID MO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CORPUS CHRISTL TX A3
VALLEY SOLVENTS
& CHEMICALS
NO BID N0 BID 0.3 $0.1550 L7 ] §0.1550 NO BID NO BID NC BID NO BID $0.2350 $0.8350 MO BID NO BID N BID NO BID
CORPURS CHRISTI,
T
NORIT AMERICAS
Ll NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 NO BID ND BID NO BID NO BID ND BID NO BID NO BID
MARSHALL. TX
SKY HAWK
CHEMICLAS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID WO BID KO BID WO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID MO BID $0.30 WO BID MO BID
Houslon, TX
ARQ PURIFICATION $0.795/1 YR
Lc NO BID N BID MO BID KO BID MO BID N BID MO BID NGO BID 50‘795 /2YR HO BID ND BID MO BID WO BID N BID NO BID KO BID
Greenwood Villeage, CO :
SHANNON
CHEMICAL $2977.2771YR
CORPORATION NO BID KO BID NO BID MO BID KO BID WO BID MO BID MO BID KO BID MO BID NO BID 33'227 7779YR NO BID KO BID NO BID NO BID
MALVERN. PA




DIANE SOLITAIRE

ITEM 81 ITEM #2 ITEM 3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 INEM#s | ITEM#7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10_ | ITEM #11 ITEM #12_ |
19% Aqueous Sodium Hydroside Sodium Hydrozide Sedium Hydroxide Low Manganese or Service Contract to
Ammenia v S {Liguid Caustic Soda Sodium Hydroxide | (liquid caustic soda | Liquid Chlorine in | Liguid Chilorine in . - . . . Citric Acid 50% Standard Drinking | Calcium Chiloride provide Chlorine - L
%.Srmﬁm:nﬁm | Price/Lb if trackload tliquid ;‘; ;"’; LIbT) 25%) as per aached | (Liquid Caustic Soda | 25%) as per attached | onc-ton containers | one-lon containers Pomg;;‘:. _— l‘;:::;:m sm’:,u;n si(!,::mm ?:;‘u;':] Solution for SRWA | Water Grade Termic Solution Dioxide .\od;l;r;‘(;'l:::mc
devaates [rom35,000 10 for BEUB WP1 & WP2 specifications (BPUB 50°%) for SRWA specifications (BPUR) {(SRWA) ( ron (330 Gal'Totc) Chloride Solution for (SRWA) (BPUB WP & :
50,000 Lb WPl & WP2) {SRWA) SRWA WP2)
100,000 Pounds 120,000 Pounds 620,000 Pounds 260,000 Pounds 150,000 Pounds 250,000 Pounds 354 Tons 96 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 310,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds | 25 (330-Gal Totes) | 175,000 Pounds | 2,000,000 Founds 350,000 Pounds | 120,000 Pounds
PYS TECHNOLOGIES,
INC- NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID gi;:;:g NO BID NO BID NO BID
DETROIT. Mt 5
AMCHEM, INC
RO BID 025 MO BID NO BID NO BID MO BID WO BT NO BID NO BID NO BID N BID MO BID NO BID MO BID NO BID KO BID
LONGVIEW, TX
BRENNTAG
SOUTHWEST MO BID MO BID NO BID NO BID MO BID NO BID RO BID NO BID WO BID i 1595 MO BID HO BID MO BID NO BID NO BID WO BID
Lancaswer, TX
<
APPROVED BY: / ’7




