BID NAME: B043-24 ANNUAL TOOL SUPPLY

OPENING DATE & TIME: MAY 9, 2024 AT 10:30 AM

BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION

MSgUIygdli’SgngL TlTSfl\EIl\i\lIJ]'l(;I[I;,;TY WESCO / ANIXTER IRBY UTILITY cC DIS'l;{qugUTORS TEXA?)I;/I\I;]'I;;R AND

ik e GRAND PRAIRIE. TX TICKFAW, LA SAN ANTONIO, TX BASTROP, TX CORPUS CHRISTI, TX WACO, TX
I;EM COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 T0O001-00 15 $92.07 $48.35 $46.70 $53.05 $46.55 $46.75

2 TG003-00 10 $59.52 $50.27 $48.56 $55.15 $48.45 $48.50

3 T0004-00 10 $50.95 $20.56 $37.00 $22.55 $36.74 $37.00

4 T0005-00 15 $23.86 $9.87 $9.53 $11.21 $10.00 $9.50

5 T0006-00 40 $537.90 $488.07 $471.43 $535.30 $435.00 $471.50

6 T0O007-00 10 $26.66 $19.35 $18.69 $21.21 $18.65 $18.75

7 T0008-00 30 $88.78 $66.84 $64.56 $73.30 $64.97 $64.50

8 T0010-00 20 $56.35 $47.00 $45.40 $51.55 $45.20 $45.50

9 T0011-00 20 $28.46 $22.26 $21.50 $24.42 $21.30 521.50

10 T0012-00 35 $54.25 $29.48 $28.48 $32.32 $28.30 $28.50

11 TG013-00 40 $20.15 $10.88 $10.51 $12.58 $10.31 $10.50

12 T0014-00 25 $14.42 $7.60 $7.27 $8.85 $7.30 $7.50

13 TOG15-00 30 $28.99 $25.67 $24.80 $28.17 $24.70 $24.99

14 T0016-00 20 $12.25 $8.26 $7.98 $9.66 $7.90 $7.99

15 T0017-00 20 $7.38 $7.12 $6.88 $8.29 $6.80 $6.99

16 T0018-00 20 $30.55 $23.16 $22.38 $25.42 $21.50 $22.50




T P

: MS;UIT;&I#S;(];TAL Tl”l'Sll\Sﬁ\LJJl’lc":I'IE,;TY WESCO/ ANIXTER | IRBY UTILITY cC DlS"l;Tl:}I(I?UTORS TEXA?)I}\SA\I;ZI'I"JI?ER AND
1 S GRAND PRAIRIE. TX TICKFAW, LA SAN ANTONIO, TX BASTROP, TX CORPUS CHRISTL, TX WACD, TX
l;f)M COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
17 TG019-00 20 $6.84 $5.34 $5.16 $6.49 $5.14 $5.25
18 T0G20-00 20 $7.33 $26.73 $25.82 $29.32 $25.75 $25.99
19 T0021-00 5 NO BID $5.51 $5.32 $6.69 $5.10 $5.50
20 T0022-00 15 NO BID $11.34 $10.23 $12.84 NO BID $10.99
21 T0023-00 20 $35.59 $28.51 $27.53 $31.27 $26.60 $27.50
22 T0024-00 20 $28.74 $45.45 $43.90 $49.84 $43.70 $49.99
23 T0025-00 25 $47.24 $30.04 $29.01 $32.97 $28.50 $28.99
24 T0026-00 15 $36.49 $25.62 NO BID $41.17 NOBID $24.75
25 T0027-00 15 $9.86 $8.42 $8.14 $10.21 $8.10 $8.25
26 T0028-00 20 $7.93 $6.78 $6.55 $8.21 $6.50 $6.50
27 T0029-00 15 $7.93 $6.78 $6.55 $8.21 $6.50 $6.50
*28 TG030-00 15 NO BID $151.61 NO BID $137.61 NOBID NO BID
29 T0031-00 10 $13.47 $10.81 $10.44 $13.10 $10.40 $10.50
30 T0032-00 10 NO BID $527.42 $£503.01 $529.84 NO BID $509.50
3l T0033-00 15 NOBID $183.46 5169.34 $207.92 NO BID $163.50
32 T0033-01 15 NO BID $24.89 $24.89 $28.66 NO BID $24.25
33 T0034-00 15 NO BID $57.45 $51.78 $60.84 NO BID $55.50
34 T0035-00 25 NO BID $21.45 NO BID $18.66 NO BID $49.25
*35 T0036-00 40 $479.99 $620.85 $458.89 $519.02 NO BID $602.25
36 T0037-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.84 NOBID $3.50
37 T0038-00 10 NO BID NO BID NOBID $35.66 NOBID $4.50
*38 T0039-00 20 NOBID $23.47 NOBID $27.84 NO BID $22.75
39 T0040-00 25 $34.96 $30.68 $29.64 $33.66 $28.85 $29.75




MS;:J;I&[{{SES?AL TI'l'S/;\EI;‘IIJI'l(':lééTY WESCO / ANIXTER IRBY UTILITY cC DlS’I;II:l(l:BUTORS TEXA?)]:;\I/EIEEER AND
GRAND PRAIRIE. TX TICKFAW, LA SAN ANTONIO, TX BASTROP, TX CORPUS CHRISTL TX WACO. TX
IIIE)M COMMODITY!| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
40 T0042-00 20 $44.54 $25.16 $24.51 $27.61 $24.15 $24.50
41 T0043-00 15 $52.24 $40.99 $39.59 $44.97 $39.20 $39.50
42 T0044-00 10 NO BID $320.72 $293.05 $266.21 NO BID $285.99
43 T0045-00 5 NO BID $79.86 $71.99 $90.50 NO BID $77.25
44 T0046-00 5 NO BID $548.99 $506.75 $665.21 NOBID $489.50
45 T0046-01 10 NO BID $548.99 $506.75 $665.21 NC BID $489.50
46 T0046-02 5 NO BID $548.99 $506.75 $665.21 NO BID $489.50
47 T0046-03 5 NO BID $548.99 $506.75 $665.21 NO BID $489.50
48 T0046-04 15 NO BID $548.99 $£506.75 $665.21 NO BID $489.50
49 T0047-00 15 $17.50 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 T0O048-00 24 NO BID $6.19 NO BID £14.66 NO BID NO BIP
51 T0049-00 10 NO BID $131.64 $118.46 $297.17 NO BID $49.50
52 T0049-01 25 NO BID $131.64 $118.46 $297.17 NO BID $49.50
53 T0049-02 35 NO BID $131.64 $118.46 $297.17 NO BID $49.50
54 T0049-03 15 NO BID $131.64 $118.46 $297.17 NO BID $49.50
55 T0G049-04 15 NO BID $134.58 12111 $303.84 NO BID $50.50
56 T0049-05 10 NO BID $137.52 $123.75 $310.37 NO BID $50.50
57 T0049-06 5 NO BID $140.46 $126.40 $317.21 NO BID $50.50
*58 T0050-00 75 NO BID $66.55 $54.53 $84.61 $52.00 $38.64
*59 T0050-01 100 NO BID $66.55 $54.53 $84.61 $52.00 $38.64
*60 T0050-02 100 NO BID $66.55 $54.53 $84.61 $52.00 $38.64
*61 T0050-03 75 NO BID $72.27 $57.49 $87.65 $54.00 $42.00
*62 T0050-04 50 NOBID $76.13 $60.56 $87.65 $57.00 $42.00




MSC INDUSTRIAL TITAN UTILITY ) CC DISTRIBUTORS | TEXAS METER AND
SUPPLY CO. SERVICES LA 250,12 1S LA G E LS INC DEVICE
ol : = GRAND PRAIRIE. TX TICKFAW, LA SAN ANTONIO, TX BASTROP, TX CORPUS CHRISTIL, TX WACO, TX
";f)m COMMODITY| QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
*63 | T0050-05 25 NO BID $79.85 $63.51 $89.84 $60.00 $42.00
64 T0051-00 100 $216.76 $182.25 $182.25 $230.66 NO BID $176.25
65 T0051-01 20 NO BID $182.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 T0052-00 5 NO BID $398.11 :fgg‘ig $666.61 NO BID $354.99
=) o
67 T0052-01 10 NO BID $340.75 i}:?g'; $597.84 NO BID $303.99
68 T0052-02 15 NO BID $340.75 g;?g"s’l $597.84 NO BID $303.99
69 T0052-03 15 NO BID $340.75 g;fi;l $597.84 NO BID $303.99
170 T0052-04 5 NO BID $398.11 A $721.61 NO BID $354.99
77 $367.48 : o
7 T0052-05 5 NO BID $398.11 $367.48 $792.66 NO BID $354.99
7 T0053-00 40 NO BID $108.74 $100.38 $197.00 NO BID $96.99
73 T0054-00 15 NO BID $386.91 $357.14 $487.84 NO BID $373.75
74 T0054-01 15 NO BID $955.54 $882.04 $1.248.61 NO BID $851.99
75 T0055-00 200 $47.25 $36.78 $36.78 $49.97 NO BID $40.50

NOTE: Fastenal did not submit and sign BPUB bid document, therefore, not included in bid tab

APPROVED BY:

DIANE SOLITAIRE

Dppltace & 7-003F




