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PuUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B040-24 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF GENERAL INVENTORY STOCK
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: APRIL 25, 2024 -11:00 AM
TRIPLE S GATEWAY
B i | pierena I}::E%EE TECHLINE INC DISTRECL;JTORS chonTHERN | ANIXTER NG conégosé.%iorq PRINTNG & | coRE & MAIN LP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
S | waco.x | Houston SANANTONIO,| CORPUS | FRANKFORT, | =~ SAN BROWNSVILLE, | oygym, Tx| BROWNSVILLE.
ITEM#| STOCK # QTy UM UNIT COST | UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST | UNIT COST UNIT COST | UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
1 |G0300-00 144 | CAN $5.12 NO BID $5.60 NO BID $3.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |Gosot1-00 1200 | BX $5.29 $12.50 $12.75 NO BID $7.45 $11.84 $12.48 $4.90 NO BID NO BID
3 |Go3o2-00 1500 | PR $9.80 $19.99 $8.45 NO BID $7.10 $9.12 $7.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 |Go3oz-01 800 | PR $9.80 $19.99 $8.45 NO BID $7.10 $9.00 $7.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 |G0303-00 900 | CAN $7.55 $8.50 $8.95 $11.55 $7.70 $8.58 $8.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 |G0303-01 72 | can | NoBD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 |G0304-00 24 | caN | s18.04 $17.50 $23.25 NO BID $20.45 $18.47 $17.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 |G0305-00 200 | CAN $8.92 $8.75 $10.75 $14.00 $5.20 $9.53 NO BID NO BID $7.35 NO BID
9 |Gosos-00 500 | CAN $6.38 NO BID $6.75 NO BID $5.25 $5.57 $6.54 NO BID $11.57 NO BID
10 |G0307-00 600 | CAN $8.45 NO BID $8.95 NO BID $7.45 $7.66 NO BID NO BID $9.36 NO BID
11 |G0308-00 300 | CAN $3.12 $5.00 $4.80 NO BID NO BID $3.53 $2.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 |G0309-00 310 | EA $16.24 $83.50 $4.30 NO BID $3.89 $15.18 $3.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
13 |G0310-00 604 | EA $0.93 $10.25 $0.88 $1.25 $1.10 $1.05 $0.80 NO BID $3.0225 NO BID
14 |G0311-00 400 | EA $1.42 $15.50 $1.35 $1.65 $1.20 $1.52 $1.27 NO BID $3.27 NO BID
15 |G0312-00 500 | EA $8.44 NO BID NO BID $16.00 $9.00 $9.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
16 {G0313-00 30 | EA $1.81 $19.75 $1.33 $2.25 $1.80 $2.20 $1.44 NO BID $13.49 NO BID
17 |G0314-00 504 | EA $1.54 NO BID $1.00 NO BID $1.50 $1.79 $1.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
18 |Go315-00 8o | EA $22.34 $18.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.74 $20.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S GATEWAY
e Doh [TEXAS METER S EJ}EEE TECHLINE INC DISTRII(II:BEJTOFIS GhORTHERN | ANIXTERING coEEEéEion PRINTNS & | CORE & MAIN LP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
or S| waco, x| Houston, x | SANANTONO, |- cORPUS [ FRANKFORT. | AN TGROWNSVILLE. | ey g, x| BROWNSVILLE
ITEM# STOCK# | QTY | UM |UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITGOST | UNITGOST | UNIT COST

19 |G0316-00 460 | EA | $1124 $10.99 NO BID $13.50 $11.29 $13.62 $11.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 |G0317-00 100 | EA $5.85 $56.50 NO BID NO BID $5.40 $5.83 $5.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 |G0318-00 48 | EA $2.48 $2.50 NO BID NO BID $2.52 $2.65 $2.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID
22 |G0318-01 36 | EA $7.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.68 $7.00 NO BID NO BID NO 8ID
23 |G0319-01 240 | EA | s21.18 NO BID NO BID $23.50 NO BID NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 |G0319-02 288 | EA | $21.18 NO BID NO BID $23.50 NO BID NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 G0319-03 340 | EA | s2118 NO BID NO BID $23.50 NO BID NO BID $20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 |G0319-04 240 | EA | s2235 NO BID NO BID $24.50 NO BID NO BID $21.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
27 |G0319-05 120 | EA | $2353 NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID NO BID $22.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
28 [G0319-06 12 | EA | soami NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 |G0319-07 24 | EA | s2471 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
30 |G0319-08 24 | EA | s$2a71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
31 |G0219-00 24 | EA | s$2a7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
32 |G0319-10 24 | EA | $2588 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 |G0319-11 24 | EA | $27.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID $25.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 |G0319-13 12 | EA | $30.00 NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID NO BID $28.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 |G0320-00 8 | EA $6.79 $43.50 $7.20 $15.00 $6.90 $8.49 $6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 |G0320-01 48 | EA $6.79 $43.50 $7.20 $15.00 $6.90 $8.49 $6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 |G0320-02 10 | EA $6.79 $43.50 $7.20 $15.00 $6.90 $8.49 $6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
38 |G0320-03 120 | EA $6.79 $43.50 $7.20 $15.00 $6.90 $8.49 $6.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 |G0320-04 100 | EA $6.79 $44.50 $7.20 $16.50 $6.90 $8.49 $6.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 |Go320-05 60 | EA $7.26 $44.50 $7.60 $18.00 $7.10 $8.49 $7.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 [G0321:00 3% | PR | $7051 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
42 |G0321-01 & | PR | $7051 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.60 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 |G0321-02 108 | PR | $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.60 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
44 |G0321-03 180 | PR | $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S GATEWAY
ASJ\E.% %%AN Rl it %EEE TECHLINE INC ms*rHI%E-Tons Sﬁ?gﬁgg% ANIXTER.INC COEEEE)EEDN PFg':I:gS & | CORE & MAINLP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
oS x| WACo.TX | HousTON, TX SAN ANTONI, CSHO:;I.:I":.’I? | rRankeoRT, | san . BROWNSVILLE. | cryngiyma, Tx BHOW:!:VILLE,
ITEM#| STOCK # QTy UM UNIT COST | UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST UNIT COST
45 |G0321-04 180 | PR $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
46 |G0321-05 180 | PR $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 |G0321-06 36 PR | $194.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 |G0321-07 36 PR | $194.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 |G0321-08 36 PR | $194.02 $177.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 {G0321-09 36 PR | $194.02 $177.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID
51 |G0321-10 36 PR | $194.02 $177.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $160.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID
52 {G0321-11 60 PR $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 1G0321-12 48 PR $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 1G0321-13 12 PR $70.51 $73.25 $68.60 $89.00 $64.00 $62.69 $58.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 |G0322-01 204 | EA $25.40 NO BID $25.50 $40.00 NO BID $27.80 $25.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 |G0323-00 1920 | PR $6.73 $11.50 $6.85 NO BID $6.25 $7.24 $6.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 |G0323-01 38 EA $17.86 $19.99 NO BID $23.00 NO BID $25.25 $19.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID
58 |G0324-00 96 EA NO BID $12.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
59 1G0325-00 3000 | PR $3.24 $49.75 $2.40 NO BID $2.43 $3.53 $3.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID
60 |G0325-01 150 | PR $11.04 $10.0625 $11.95 NO BID $13.00 $10.19 $9.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 (G0325-02 150 | PR $11.04 $10.0625 $11.95 NO BID $13.00 $10.19 $0.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
62 |G0326-00 6 EA $6.81 $7.99 $6.95 NO BID $9.25 $6.30 $5.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 [G0326-01 30 EA $6.81 $7.99 $6.95 NO BID $9.25 $6.30 $5.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
64 |G0326-02 16 EA $6.81 $7.99 $6.95 NO BID $9.25 $6.30 $5.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
65 |G0326-03 12 EA $6.81 $7.99 $6.95 NO BID $9.25 $6.30 $5.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 |G0326-04 6 EA $6.81 $7.99 $6.95 NO BID $9.25 $6.70 $5.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID
67 |G0329-00 2500 | EA | NOBID NO BID $3.60 NO BID NO BID $3.61 $3.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 |G0329-01 1600 | EA | NOBID NO BID $3.60 NO BID NO BID $3.61 $3.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID
69 [G0329-02 1000 EA NO BID NO BID $3.75 NO BID NO BID $3.84 $3.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID
70 |G0329-03 700 | EA | NOBID NO BID $3.95 NO BID NO BID $3.99 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S GATEWAY
STEEL DB [TEXAS METER & ELEEE& TECHLINE INC D'STREETOHS GroRTHERN | ANIXTER.ING COEEE(EE_EON P e & | CoRE & MAIN LP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
SN | waco, x| HousTon, T [ SAN ANTONO, cﬁglFs";ﬁx FRANKFORT, | = SAN N BROWNSVILLE. [ coynpupg, T | BROWNSVILLE.
ITEM# STOCK# | QTY | UM |UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST

71 |G0329-04 50 | EA | NOBID NO BID $4.15 NO BID NO BID $4.24 $3.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID
72 [G0330-00 B0 | EA $8.50 $8.50 $11.50 $7.92 $6.30 $9.09 $6.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
73 [G0331-00 1000 | EA $1.26 $11.75 $1.65 $1.30 NO BID $1.38 $1.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID
74 |G0332-00 1000 | EA $7.21 $0.675 $9.75 $7.89 $6.50 $8.43 $6.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
75 |G0332-01 260 | EA $6.72 $6.50 $8.50 $5.16 $5.65 $7.39 $5.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
76 |G0332-02 260 | EA $6.72 $6.50 $8.50 $5.16 $5.65 $7.39 $5.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
77 |G0332-03 260 | EA $6.72 $6.50 $8.50 $5.16 $5.40 $7.39 $5.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
78 |G0332-04 100 | EA $6.72 $6.50 $8.50 $5.16 $5.40 $7.39 $5.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID
79 |G0338-00 36 EA $7.79 $11.50 $7.10 NO BID $7.15 $5.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
80 |G0339-00 60 EA $18.79 $28.99 NO BID NO BID $23.80 $28.23 $24.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
81 |G0340-00 00 | EA $26.96 $37.50 NO BID NO BID $30.24 $36.43 $31.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
82 |G0342-00 36 EA $17.49 $35.25 NO BID NO BID $14.75 $17.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
83 |G0343-00 48 EA $10.41 $21.25 NO BID NO BID $17.80 $19.25 $17.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID
84 |G0344-00 120 | Ea $1.72 $1.75 $2.20 NO BID $2.67 $1.71 $1.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID
85 [G0346-00 72 EA $9.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.00 $7.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
86 |G0347-00 180 | EA $28.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
87 |G0348-00 60 EA | $236.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $214.06 $131.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID
88 [G0349-00 60 EA $6.01 $5.11 $6.70 NO BID $6.70 $8.64 $4.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
89 |Go350-00 48 EA $12.74 NO BID $13.70 $16.60 NO BID $11.95 $10.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID
90 [G0351-00 150 | EA $19.29 $17.75 $27.95 $28.50 $18.85 $22.22 $18.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID
91 |Goss2-00 150 | EA $17.20 $16.50 $26.45 $34.00 $16.85 $20.35 $16.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID
92 |Go3s3-00 500 | PR | NOBID NO BID $3.88 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $3.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID
93 |G0355-00 200 | EA $4.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $86.00 $3.08 NO BID NO BID $4.6256 NO BID
94 |G0356-00 200 | EA $32.61 $3.92 $33.30 NO BID NO BID $33.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
95 |Goas7-00 150 | EA $51.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43.40 $46.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
96 |G0358-00 150 | EA $36.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.00 $35.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S GATEWAY
STEELDBA |TEXAS METER %’Eﬁi TEGHLINE INC DISTRI:EZJTOHS SACETY GO N | ANIXTERING COEEEéE?ION P Toe & | coRe & AN LP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
oS x| Waco,TX | HousTON, T SAN ANTONI, ngl;l_’rll.'lix FRANKFORT, | SAN ,TX BROWNSVILLE, | ¢rypypg, Tx| BROWNSVILLE
ITEM#| STOCK# | QTY | UM |UNITCOST| UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST

97 |G0360-00 120 | EA $4.36 NO BID $4.36 NO BID $5.15 $5.68 $4.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID
98 |G0361-00 80 EA $73.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.00 $53.65 $36.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 |G0362-00 12 EA | NOBD NO BID NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO 8ID NO BID NO BID
100 |G0362-01 12 EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
101 |G0363-00 1000 | EA $17.02 $32.50 $20.00 NO BID $18.90 $23.61 $19.80 NO BID NO BID $26.48
102 |G0365-00 810 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 NO BID NO BID NO B8ID
103 |G0367-00 304 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO 8ID $13.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
104 |G0368-00 240 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
105 |G0369-00 10 | Pak | $29.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID
106 |G0369-01 20 | PAK | $94.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID
107 |G0370-00 48 | can | ss82 $4.9583 $2.85 NO BID $5.20 $8.11 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
108 |G0370-01 48 | can | sse2 $4.9583 $2.85 NO BID $5.20 $8.11 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
109 }G0370-02 576 | CAN | $582 $4.9583 $2.85 NO BID $5.20 $8.11 $3.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
110 |G0370-03 660 | CAN | $5.82 $4.50 $4.45 NO BID $5.20 $8.11 $3.75 NO BID NO BID ‘NO BID
111 |G0372-00 9% EA $28.35 $24.062 $30.15 $30.00 $22.00 $24.27 NO BID NO BID $30.18 NO BID
112 Gos72-01 96 EA $52.61 $44.25 $55.90 $57.00 $41.00 $43.87 NO BID NO BID $52.98 NO BID
113 |Go373-00 3000 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
114 |Go373-01 2000 | EA $6.51 $5.7491 $6.90 NO BID NO BID $6.83 NO BID NO BID $4.88 NO BID
115 |G0373-02 20 EA $19.40 NO BID $15.90 $32.00 $23.00 $39.71 $15.20 NO BID $42.28 NO BID
116 |G0375-00 96 EA | NOBID NO BID $7.95 NO BID NO BID $2.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
117 |G0376-00 960 | caN | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.60 $10.84 $10.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
118 |G0377-00 576 | CAN | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.20 $14.13 $6.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID
119 |Go378-00 240 | EA | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.92

120 |G0379-00 120 | CAN | $1453 $17.50 $21.50 NO BID $19.40 $14.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
121 |G0380-00 48 | CAN | $1645 $11.99 NO BID NO BID $8.90 $10.94 $8.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
122 |G0385-00 60 QT | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S GATEWAY
SHEFFIELD cc XPRESS
STEEL DBA |TEXASMETER&| ¢ op)vg | TECHLINE ING | pisTRiBuTORS | [NORTHERN | \vixTERING | EXPORT PRINTING& | ~50F & MAIN LP
ALAMO IRON|  DEVICE IRy S s SAFETY CO IN commeorT o | OFFICE
WORKS SUPPLY INC
SAN SANANTONIO.| CORPUS | FRANKFORT, SAN BROWNSVILLE, BROWNSVILLE,
ANTONIO, Tx| WACO,TX | HOUSTON, TX % CHRISTY, TX NY ANTONIO, TX X 2ol (e e X
meEm#| STOCK# | QTY | UM | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST
123 |G0390-00 120 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
124 |G0391-00 120 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID
125 |G0399-00 2500 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.28 $0.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
126 |G0400-00 1260 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.25 NO BID NO BID $8.91
127 |G0401-00 600 | EA $6.04 $4.5829 $6.95 $12.72 $4.55 $4.29 $5.69 NO BID NO BID $9.02

128 |G0405-00 72 BX $13.56 $1.75 $8.70 $22.00 $10.60 $10.08 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID
129 |G0405-01 160 | BX $13.56 $1.75 $8.70 $22.00 $10.60 $10.08 $1.21 NO BID NO BID NO BID
130 |G0405-02 160 | BX $13.56 $1.125 $8.70 $22.00 $9.25 $10.08 $0.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID
131 |G0405-03 200 | BX $6.86 NO BID $6.50 NO BID $4.00 $14.23 $11.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID
132 |G0405-04 200 | BX $9.80 NO BID $6.50 NO BID $6.00 $14.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
133 |GO406-00 4000 | EA $0.45 $0.3958 $0.38 $0.55 $0.50 $0.52 $0.34 NO BID $0.63 NO BID
134 |G0407-00 96 BX $3.28 NO BID $4.95 NO BID $4.80 $3.95 $3.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
135 1G0O407-01 5000 | EA $1.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
136 |G0407-02 3000 | EA $0.12 $1.2495 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
137 |G0407-03 2000 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
138 |G0409-00 192 EA $4.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.00 $12.50 $4.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
139 |G0410-00 36 EA $16.12 $13.50 $12.15 NO BID $10.00 $14.95 $11.64 NO BID $9.98 NO BID
140 |G0411-01 30 EA $36.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.18 $36.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
141 |GO411-02 60 EA $65.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID $54.00 $100.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
142 |G0412-00 450 | EA $0.44 NO BID NO BID $13.00 $9.00 $10.59 $9.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID
143 |G0413-00 200 | EA $7.40 NO BID NO BID $12.75 $7.20 $8.54 $7.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID
144 |GO414-00 2496 | EA $0.45 $0.3958 $0.38 $0.79 $0.50 $0.54 $0.34 NO BID $0.60 NO BID




TRIPLE § GATEWAY
e Mkl Eﬁgﬁg TECHLINE INC DISTHll(:BETOHS GAETHERR | ANIXTER.ING COEEEEE‘TTION P & | coRE & MAINLP
WORKS SUPPLY INC
S 1 waco,mx | Houston, sanaNTONDO,| cORPUS, FRANKEORT, | SAN [ BROWNSVILLE. | coyug g, Tx BROWNSVILLE,
TEM#| STOCK# | QTY | UM | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST | UNITCOST

145 |GO417-00 24 EA $6.89 NO BID $3.45 NO BID $4.30 $3.17 $4.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
146 |Go417-01 36 EA $4.82 NO BID $3.50 NO BID $3.25 $3.71 $3.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID
147 [Go418-00 96 EA $7.06 $6.99 NO BID NO BID $8.40 $7.05 $6.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID
148 |G0419-00 84 EA | $1500 $16.75 NO BID NO BID $17.60 $14.97 $13.48 NO BID NO BID NO BID
149 [G0420-00 24 EA | $10872 $116.75 $110.00 NO BID NO BID $103.10 $95.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
150 |G0421-00 24 EA | $10872 $116.75 $110.00 NO BID NO BID $103.10 $95.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
151 |Go422-00 24 EA | $108.72 $116.75 $110.00 NO BID NO BID $103.10 $95.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
152 [G0423-00 36 EA | $10872 $116.75 $110.00 NO BID NO BID $103.10 $95.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
153 [Go424-00 24 EA | $22.20 $27.50 $22.00 NO BID NO BID $24.51 $21.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID
154 |GD425-00 60 EA | $1091 $13.50 $12.00 NO BID NO BID $12.04 $10.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID
155 |GD426-00 12 EA | $108.72 $116.75 $110.00 NO BID NO BID $103.10 $95.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
156 [(G0427-00 60 EA | $107.13 $117.75 $110,00 NO BID NO BID $104.79 $93.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID
157 |M0200-00 150 | EA $18.96 NO BID $22.00 NO BID $22.80 $16.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
158 |M0201-00 24 EA | $14.09 $13.50 $14.40 $14.50 $15.40 $14.93 $14.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
159 [M0202-00 24 EA | $14.00 $13.50 $14.40 $14.50 $13.20 $14.93 $14.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
160 [M0203-00 36 EA | $1409 $13.50 $14.40 $14.50 $15.30 $15.71 $14.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
161 |M0204-00 100 | PR $7.56 $7.25 $7.75 $23.95 $3.70 $7.79 $3.76 NO BID $48.38 NO BID
162 |M0224-00 5000 | EA $1.84 $2.0112 $2.40 NO BID $1.95 $2.28 $1.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID
163 |M0226-00 1572 | PR $1.18 $1.0416 $1.25 NO BID $1.45 $0.88 $0.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
164 |M0229-00 36 BX $31.76 $25.50 $16.85 NO BID $30.58 $31.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

APPROVED BY:

ClpliTaie  H-367308Y

DIANE SOLITAIRE




