BROWNSVYILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B023-24 SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL INVENTORY MATERIAL
DATE AND TIME: JANUARY 11, 2024 - 3:00 PM

TECHLINEINC |  KBSAUSTIN | "00p ool tives | NICHOLSONING. | DISTRIBUTION
SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX GEORGETOWN. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX
ITEM # Confl\l:llcj)?)lTY QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

1 E0013-00 150 $22.99 $24.50 $22.00 NO BID $19.50

2 E0117-00 20 $7.64 $3.75 $6.10 $6.30 $4.90

3 E0119-00 50 $8.46 $4.30 $£6.70 $6.60 $9.25

4 E0122-00 50 $11.62 NO BID $21.00 NO BID NOBID

5 E0146-00 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6 E0195-00 1,500 $0.49 NO BID $0.39 $0.78 $0.40

7 E0196-00 1,500 NO BID NO BID $0.57 $1.25 $0.50

8 E0339-00 9 NO BID $54.10 $66.00 NO BID $57.50

9 E0544-00 100 $10.05 $12.05 NO BID $16.10 $9.20




TEXAS ELECTRIC |PRIESTER MELL & WESCO
GRS B IUNSHEL UG ORI COOPERATIVES | NICHOLSON INC | DISTRIBUTION
SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX GEORGETOWN.TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX
BPUB
ITEM # COMMODITY QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
10 E0642-00 50 $0.88 $1.20 $1.53 $3.65 $1.10
11 E0646-00 50 $1.49 $2.50 $2.29 $3.35 $1.60
12 E0647-00 100 $1.82 $2.00 $2.44 $3.75 $1.70
13| E£0900-00 300 $142.07 $80.70 $99.00 NO BID $151.55
$121.43
14 E0962-00 20 $39.38 $84.80 $56.00 NO BID NO BID
15 E0994-00 30 $49.26 NO BID $50.00 NO BID $11.50
16 E1018-00 25 $16.78 $14.50 $11.00 NO BID $12.95
17 E0920-00 20,000 $0.96 $0.76 $0.88 $1.90 $0.72
18 E0930-00 2,000 $3.99 $3.67 $3.81 $7.35 $2.80
Stock - 22 weeks
14-100 days
Iten;s 17 & I8 must Stock - 91 days Stock - 112 days Items 6 & 7 must be Stock-16 weeks
¢ purchased
LEAD TIME together LEGE L  f
W /=/2 fava-y
APPROVED BY:

DIANE SOLITAIRE




