



## BID TABULATION

**BID NAME:** B005-24 SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS

**DATE & TIME:** OCTOBER 19, 2023 - 11:30 AM

			TECHLINE	ZERO MAINTENANCE	TEXAS ELECTRIC CO-OP	WEG	*IM INDUSTRIES	KBS AUSTIN	WESCO
			SAN ANTONIO, TX	HOUSTON, TX	GEORGETOWN, TX	WASHINGTON, MO	BROWNSVILLE, TX	AUSTIN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX
POLEMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE			HOWARD IND.	DELTA ELECTRIC	GE PROLEC	WEG TRANSFORMERS	IM INDUSTRIES	CENTRAL MOLONEY	GE PROLEC
1	7 EA	E1419-01 37.5 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 84 LL: 436 TL: 520	\$7,730.00 NO BID 0	\$2,324.00 80 415 495	NO BID 0	\$5,697.56 0	\$5,010.00 85 454 539	\$2,690.80 80 415 495
2	14 EA	E1433-00 75 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 136 LL: 738 TL: 874	\$13,830.00 NO BID 0	\$4,328.00 134 684 818	NO BID 0	\$7,390.69 0	\$6,920.00 135 834 969	\$5,010.50 134 684 818
PADMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE			HOWARD IND.	DELTA ELECTRIC		WEG TRANSFORMERS	IM INDUSTRIES	CENTRAL MOLONEY	GE PROLEC
3	10 EA	E1500-00 25 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 63 LL: 308 TL: 371	\$8,356.00 \$5,990.00 95 145 240	NO BID 0	NO BID 0	\$8,575.88 0	\$6,800.00 55 370 425	\$3,790.80 55 327 382
4	20 EA	E1506-00 75 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 148 LL: 697 TL: 845	\$22,952.00 \$8,875.00 240 500 740	NO BID 0	NO BID 0	\$10,776.94 0	\$7,810.00 151 767 918	\$5,546.25 126 739 865
5	10 EA	E1508-00 100 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 174 LL: 895 TL: 1069	\$29,842.00 \$10,450.00 220 613 833	NO BID 0	NO BID 0	\$11,792.81 0	\$9,185.00 156 1054 1210	\$7,900.00 126 1009 1135

			TECHLINE	ZERO MAINTENANCE	TEXAS ELECTRIC CO-OP	WEG	*IM INDUSTRIES	KBS AUSTIN	WESCO	
			SAN ANTONIO, TX	HOUSTON, T X	GEORGETOWN, TX	WASHINGTON, MO	BROWNSVILLE, TX	AUSTIN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	
			HOWARD IND.	DELTA ELECTRIC		WEG TRANSFORMERS	IM INDUSTRIES	DOELIM BELEFIC	GE PROLEC	
6	1 EA	E1521-00 75 KVA 7200 120/208 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 139 LL: 966 TL: 1105	\$39,673.00 240 500 740	\$21,600.00 240 500 740	NO BID  0	\$39,991.00 168 804 972	\$14,163.19  0	\$25,900.00 171 857 1028	\$24,115.80 69 1219 1288
7	2 EA	E1523-01 150 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 291 LL: 1449 TL: 1740	\$43,222.00 321 1255 1576	\$32,167.00 321 1255 1576	NO BID  0	\$44,118.00 287 1438 1725	\$19,411.88  0	\$27,900.00 309 1451 1760	\$25,471.25 116 2196 2312
8	2 EA	E1525-00 225 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 375 LL: 2094 TL: 2469	\$48,630.00 450 1680 2130	\$35,450.00 450 1680 2130	NO BID  0	\$49,114.00 407 1913 2320	\$22,798.13  0	\$29,000.00 420 2014 2434	\$26,644.75 428 1757 2185
9	2 EA	E1526-00 300 KVA 7200 120/208 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 438 LL: 2781 TL: 3219	\$54,260.00 502 2398 2890	\$39,643.00 502 2398 2890	NO BID  0	\$55,300.00 477 2576 3053	\$26,184.38  0	\$31,800.00 488 2660 3148	\$30,090.00 550 2140 2690
10	3 EA	E1527-00 300 KVA 12470Y/7200 - DELTA 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 465 LL: 2694 TL: 3159	\$53,656.00 542 2202 2744	\$40,150.00 542 2202 2744	NO BID  0	\$52,988.00 477 2587 3064	\$26,184.38  0	\$33,500.00 563 2963 3526	\$28,533.00 557 2162 2719
11	1 EA	E1529-01 500 KVA 12470Y/7200 - DELTA 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL: 0	NO BID 1030 2420 3450	\$46,580.00 1030 2420 3450	NO BID  0	NO BID  0	\$36,343.13  0	NO BID  0	\$32,606.60 810 3116 3926
12	2 EA	E1532-00 750 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 1057 LL: 4992 TL: 6049	\$91,109.00 1050 4800 5850	\$59,750.00 1050 4800 5850	NO BID  0	\$83,005.00 892 5538 6430	\$52,960.75  0	NO BID  0	\$39,534.25 981 5205 6186

			TECHLINE	ZERO MAINTENANCE	TEXAS ELECTRIC CO-OP	WEG	*IM INDUSTRIES	KBS AUSTIN	WESCO	
			SAN ANTONIO, TX	HOUSTON, T X	GEORGETOWN, TX	WASHINGTON, MO	BROWNSVILLE, TX	AUSTIN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	
			HOWARD IND.	DELTA ELECTRIC		WEG TRANSFORMERS	IM INDUSTRIES		GE PROLEC	
13	1 EA	E1536-01 1.500 KVA 12470GRD-Y 7200/2400 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 2906 LL: 11202 TL: 14108	\$144,240.00 \$86,130.00 2000 7600 9600	NO BID 0	\$118,987.00 1924 10698 12622	\$60,371.00 0	NO BID 0	\$64,588.25 1818 11341 13159	
14	1 EA	E1537-00 2.500 KVA, 7200 12470Y/4160D (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: 5041 LL: 13149 TL: 18190	\$198,508.00 \$109,900.00 2700 12700 15400	NO BID 0	\$155,161.00 3094 15307 18401	\$78,988.13 0	NO BID 0	\$89,547.50 4885 12295 17180	
<b>DELIVERY IN DAYS/WEEKS (ARO)</b>				80-90 WEEKS	98-112 Days 126-154 Days	252 DAYS but TBD upon order	84-110 WEEKS	90 Days Did not Sign Bid Document	168 - 224 Days	Polemount - by May 2024 Padmount 1Ph - by July 2024 Padmount 3Ph - Nov 2024 and Feb. 2025

\* Vendor disqualified, did not sign bid or provide documentation

APPROVED BY:

*D Solitaire 10-26-2023*

DIANE SOLITAIRE