g
‘s o'.
BROWNSYILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B065-23 ELECTRICAL AND ELECTRONIC SPARE PARTS
OPENING DATE & TIME: SEPTEMBER 8, 2023 at 1:00 PM
DEALERS
THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER SYSTEM B&M MARINE
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS,
i _ ; : BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPUS CHRIST), TX PA BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAM, FL LEAGUE CITY, TX
ITEM | COMMODITY
NO NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
1STA.RTER, SIZE 00 NEMA | 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL#
8536-SAGT2.
1 |Loooio V25 EA e NO BID $266.85 $199.24 $310 00 NO BID NO BID $838.98 NO BID
{TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-M-TLA23)
“MUST BE EXACT*
STARTER, SIZE 0 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL#
2 |Locoz.c0 ::}‘l'ig‘:)z"ms (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G- | - 10 NO BID $310.50 $237.49 $378.00 NO BID NOBID $1,051.38 NO BID
“*MUST BE EXACT*
STARTER, SIZE | NEMA | 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL#
3 Jososco  [RESCHVOSSTOMCLUDE TWOLUGNUTKITSS140G- | gy 1 50 NO BID $357.60 527234 $431.00 NOBID NO BID $983 25 NOBID
*MUST BE EXACT*
STARTER, SIZE 2 NEMA! 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL?
8536-SDG1-V02S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-
4 |Lo0o4-00 M.TLAZ3) OPEN SIZE 2 48536- SD01-VO2S, OPTION $556. EA 50 NOBID $703 10 $497.56 $880.00 NO BID NOBID $1,174.04 NO BID
SDG1-V02S *MUST BE EXACT*
STARTER, SIZE 3 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL#
8536-SEGI-V025 SQUARE D SIZE 3 8536-SE01-V02S;
s |Loooso0 853685015 (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS #140G:M EA 2 NO BID $1,121.62 $806.20 $1,407.00 NOBID NO BID $2,547.62 NO BID
TLA23) “MUST BE EXACT*
STARTER, SIZE 4 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL#
6 |Loooso00 R EA 20 NO BID $2,529.30 $1,861.19 $3,056.00 NOBID NO BID $4,673.98 NO BID
ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE
7 |Locor-00 S 40 FEET CORD, NORMALLY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, EA 100 $51.28 NO BID $60.45 $85.00 $64,00 NO BID $106.20 NO BID
MODELH# S40NO _
ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE
8 LOGOB-00 S 60 FEET CORD, NORMALY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, EA 100 $66.55 NO BID $65.27 $96.00 $73.00 NOBID $126.26 NOBID
MODEL# S6ONG
ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE
9 LOO09-00 S 80 FEET CORD, NORMALLY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, EA 100 $78.31 NO BID $76.93 $109.00 $83.00 NO BID $126.26 NO BID
MODEL# SBONO
ROTQFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE S 80 FEET CORD,
10 |rooro-00 NORMALLY CLOSED, SELF WEIGHTED, MODEL# EA 40 $92.50 NO BID $82.36 $110.00 $83.00 NO BID $126.26 NO BID
S8ONC
RELAY, 3 PHASE MONITOR 8 PIN 480VAC, 1 CONTACT,
11 |Loo1t-00 TIME MARK MODEL# A258B EA 60 NO BID $59.40 £52.98 $80.00 $76.00 NOBID $136.88 NO BID
RELAY, 3 PHASE MONITOR 8 PIN
12 |Loo12.00 240VAC. 1 CONTACT. TIME MARK MODELS 2578 EA 50 NOBID $59.40 $52.98 $80.00 $76.00 NOBID $146.32 NO BID
RELAY, PHASE MONITOR 11 PIN 240VAC, 2 CONTACT,
13 |Loorso0 N rlgpiiiy) EA 20 NOBID $109.40 $110.05 $127.00 $140.00 NO BID $233.64 NO BID
14 [LoDI4-00 RELAY, 120VAC, TIME MARK MODEL A471-24V EA 10 NO BID $237.50 $215.02 $282.00 £304.00 NO BID $448.40 NO BID
BREAKER, SINGLE POLE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODELF 1492
15 |roo1s-00 SPM1C200 EA 100 NO BID $12.20 $17.48 $35.00 NOBID NO BID $53.10 NO BID
SQUARE D MODEL #QOU120 20 AMP
LE, 40 AMPS, S MODEL# D340,
16 (101600 |orars e O AMPS, SIEMEN ce g | & | NoBID $93.25 $133.40 $152.00 NO BID NOBID $506.22 NOBID
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DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER 5YS B&M MARINE
SUPPLY TEM
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPS CHRISTL TX PA BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MUAMI, FL LEAGUE CTTY, TX
ITEM | COMMODITY
NO. NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
BREAKER, 3 POLE, 60 AMPS,
17 [Lo017-00 SIEMENS MODEL CQD360, SQUARE D $QOU360 EA NO BID $93.25 $139.18 $159.00 NO BID $266.24 $500.32 NO BID
BREAKER, 3 POLE, 80 AMPS, SIEMENS #CQD380, 5Q D
18 |Loois0o #QOUBSO& E. 2 ¢ EA NO BID $136.10 $202.40 $159.00 NO BID NO BID $664.34 NO BID
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 30X24X10, 3 POINT LATCH AND
19 |L0o18-00 LOCK NEMA 4X STAHLIN MODEL# EA 10 NO BID NO BID $1,171.20 $1.776.00 NOBID NO BID $2,950.00 NQ BID
N30208FHLWT, HOFFMAN MODEL# A30H2410GQRLP3PT
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 36X30X12, 3 POINT LATCH AND
LOCK NEMA 4X HOFFMAN MODEL# A36H3012GQRLP3FT
20 |Looz0-00 G EA 10 NO BID NO BID $1,875.25 $2,593.00 NO BID NO BID $4,419.10 NOBID
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 24X24X8, 3 POINT LATCH AND
21 [Lo021-00 LOCK NEMA EA 15 NO BID NO BID $1,034.80 $1,637.00 NOBID NO BID $2,407.20 NO BID
4% HOFFMAN MODEL# AZ4H2408GQRLP3PT
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 100A, SQUARE D 600VAC
MODEL# FAL36100 ALLEN BRADLEY 600VAC $206.87
22 |Loo2z.00 RN T EA 4 NO BID $327.60 AT $388.00 NO BID NO BID $594. 72 NO BID
TRANSFORMER CONTROL,
23 |Looz3-00 SQUARE D 9070T150D23 120/240 TO 24VAC, OR ALLEN EA 20 NO BID $140.20 $81.65 $103.00 NO BID $216.80 $295.00 NO BID
BRADLEY 1497B- Ad-MI13.0-N
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 15A, SQUARE D 600VAC —
24 |L0024-00 MODEL# HDL36015 ALLEN BRADLEY EA 6 NO BID $268.40 . $637.00 NO BID £1,016.97 $379.49 NO BID
MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C15 318.16
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 70A, SQUARE D 600VAC R
MODEL# FAL34070 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 187.84
L0025-00 10
28 PR EA NOBID $327 60 ARG $352.00 NO BID $863.46 $417.48 NO BID
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 80A, SQUARE D 600VAC
2%  |Loozé-00 MODEL# EA 6 NO BID $327.60 Sk $1,037.00 NO BID $1,241.06 $53997 NO BID
HDL26080 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C80 $18.16 a8 redli
DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, 3 POLES HEAVY DUTY 600VAC,
27 |Looz7-00 ILSCO MODEL# PDB-11-2/0-3 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL EA 100 NO BID NO BID $42.10 $8%.00 NO BID NO BID $7.764 40 NO BID
41492.PD3141
DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, | POLE HEAVY DUTY 600VAC,
28 |Loozs-00 ILSgo MODEL# PDB-14.2/0-] MODEL# 1492- EA 100 NO BID NO BID $13.44 $38.00 NO BID NO BID $2,360.00 NOBID
100
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 120VAC, SQUARE D
MODEL#
29 |Lo029-00 8501 KPRI2P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY EA 200 NO BID $35.78 $24 22 $45.00 NO BID $51.05 $6,796.80 NO BID
|MODEL# 700-HA32A14 TO INCLUDE LED INDICATOR
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VAC, SQUARE D
30 |Loo30-00 MODEL #8501KPR12P14V14 MODEL# 700- HAI2A24 EA 200 NOBID $35.78 $20.40 $38.00 NO BID NO BID $5,116.48 NO BID
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 12VDC, SQUARE D
31 Loo3e-00 MODEL #8501 KPDR12P14V51 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# EA 40 NO BID $35.78 $18.18 $37.00 NO BID NO BID $959.86 NO BID
700-HA32Z12
RELAY. 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VDC, SQUARE D
32 |Looszo0 MODEL#8501 KPDR12P14V53 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# EA 40 NO BID $3578 $18.18 $37.00 NO BID $44.99 $959.86 NO BID
700-HA32224
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE NEMA | BODAMP 600VAC,
CUTLER HAMMER
33 |Lo033-00 D D e e e N A 2 NO BID $3,332.40 $7,26198 $15,688.00 NO BID NO BID $8.764,10 NO BID
M6F3-D80
CONTROL PUMP, DUPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS
120VAC,
34 |L0D34-00 T e T L N R P EA 50 NO BID $442.25 $380.00 $437.00 $473.80 NOBID $591.18 NO BID
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DEALERS |
THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER SYSTEM BAM MARINE
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX CORFUS CHRISTI, TX PA BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN. TX NORTH MiAM), FL WEAGUE CTTY, T
ITEM | commoprTy
NO NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

CONTROL PUMP, TRIPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS

35 |Looas-on pahrasiun i illous EA | 10 NO BID $404,07 $346.35 $426.00 $432.95 NO BID $670.24 NOBID
TRANSDUCER, 10 PSI LEVEL 100

36 |Looseoo T Vi T e [ ) NO BID NO BID $1,373.34 $1.272.00 NO BID NO BID $1.244.90 NO BID
TRANSDUCER, 15 PSI LEVEL 100 FEET 4-20MA,

37 |Loosr.00 CONTEGRA PARTH EA | 10 NO BID NOBID $1,373.34 $1,272.00 NO BID NOBID $1,244.90 NO BID
SIYIIOM 1S IS IO BT
PIPE 2" X 10° RIDGID, GALVANIZED,

38 |L0C38-00 METAL, MODEL# GALV2 ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT FT 500 NO BID $9.0245 $9.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.88 NOQ BID
'un'l'\ﬂ § B LS
PIPE 3" X 10 RIDGID, GALVANIZED,

39 |Looss-00 METAL. GALV3, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUTT MODEL# FT | 200 NOEID $19.2745 $20.14 NO BID NOBID NO BID $18.76 NOBID
RIGIG0
UNI-STURT 7/8 88 316 10' SECTION C, MODEL# P1000TSS,

40 |Looac-00 ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# STRUT/8 SS FT | so0 NO BID NO BID $9.24 NO BID NOBID NO BID $42.48 NO BID
SLOTTED 10
UNL-STRUT 5/8 S§ 316 10 SECTION C, ALLIED TUBE &

41 Looa1-00 CONDUIT MODEL# FT | 500 NO BID NO BID $13.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
STRUT |-5/8 SS SLOTTED 10
PLC CONTROLLER PROGRMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC 1100

42 |Looss.0 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY# 1763-L16DWD ea | s NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,747.00 §922.45 NO BID $988.84 NO BID
PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC 1400

43 |Loossoo MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY# 1766.L32BWA EA $ NO BID NO BID $847.66 $1,250.00 $1,307.70 NOBID §1,047.84 NO BID
PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC,

1766~

4 [Lossso  |1i MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODELY ga | s NO BID NOBD $894.75 $1,533.00 $1,484.65 NO BID $1,047.84 NOBID

PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC,
763~ |
a5 |Lossoo  |])%0 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODELY 1763 Ba | s NOBID NOBID $1,369.40 $1,741.00 $922.45 NOBID |  $1.770.00 NO BID
|

46 |Looar00 ODaLE L TAL INFUT 120VAC, ALLEN BRADLEY FA 5 NO BID NO BID $231.45 $334.00 $204.75 NO BID $226.56 NO BID
MODULE, DIGITAL INPUT 120VAC, ALLEN BRADLEY

47 |Looas00 Dk i EA s NO BID NO BID $281.09 $324.00 $250.80 NO BID $331.58 NOBID
MODULE, EXPANSION ANALOG INPUT 4-20MA, ALLEN

4 |Looss-00 BRADLEY MODELS 1062081 ea | s NO BID NO BID $510.53 $523.00 $399.30 NO BID $460.20 NO BID

4 |Looso-00 O ULE, OUPUT 4-20MA. ALLEN BRADLEY MODELK 17621 gy s NO BID NG BID $481.63 $1,125.00 $431.35 NO BID $493.24 NO BID
POWER SUPPLY, 24VDC 2-5A, DIN RAIL, ALLEN BRADLEY

50 |Loos1-00 MODEL# EA 5 NO BID $285.50 $185.28 $320.00 $335.15 NO BID $286.74 NO BID
1606-XLE1 20EN
POWER SUPPLY, 12VDC 2.5A, DIN

51 |Loos2-00 R vt e D eson EA 5 NO BID $96.90 $205.46 $320.00 $396.70 NO BID $286.74 NO BID
RELAY, TIME DELAY 120VAC, TIME MARK MODEL# 310-

52 |Loes3-00 T neaEN BRADLEY MODELY 700-HT OR AB EA | 10 NOBID $100.00 $98 55 $125.00 $92.50 NO BID $188 82 NOBID
SURGE PROTECTOR 120VAC,

53 |Loosa-00 SQUARE D MODELH D120VIP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# | Ea | 12 NO BID NO BID $230.92 NOBID NO BID NO BID $240.72 NO BID
4983-D8120-801
ALTERNATOR, TRIPLEXOR 120VAC, FLYGT MODEL#

54 |Looss-00 14103220 o MPE 005 120230 EA 4 NO BID NOBID NO BID $331.00 NOBID NO BID $424.80 NO BID
PHASE MONITOR 240V, FLYGT MODEL# 14403212 OR MPE

55 |Looss-00 P EA | 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $140.00 $145.54 NO BID $192.34 NO BID
RELAY, 120VAC, INTRINSICALLY SAFE. FLYGT MODEL#

56 L00S7-00 14403222 OR MPE-030-120-118, LITTELFUSE IS5- 101 EA 12 NO BID NO BID $174.29 $195.00 $389.40 NQ BID $306.80 NO BID
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 30A 600VAC, EATON MODEL# $131.80

57 |Looss-00 EHDION0L. 1400030306 EA 4 NO BID pod31299 S8 1 $421.00 NO BID NO BID $424.80 NOBID




DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC PO SYS BAM MARINE
SUPPLY WER SYSTEM
CLIFTON HEIGHTS,
BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPUS CHRISTL TX PA BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAMI, FL LEAGUE OITY, T
ITEM | commoprmy
NO NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 FOLE 50A 630VAC, SIEMENS MODEL S131.80

58 |Looso.00 e EA 2 NOBID $372.99 $18.16 $253.00 NO BID NO BID $151.04 NO BID

59 |Looso-00 I JIONDEVICE 120VAC, EBARRA. MTS MODELE A | 10 NO BID NO BID $409.18 NOBID $749.99 NO BID $590.00 NO BID
CIRCUTT BREAKER, 3 POLE 60A, MOLDED CASE, ALLEN
BRADLEY MODELH 140G-G2C3-C60 (TO $131.80

50 {L0062-00 Elle T e EA 4 NO BID $37299 618 16 $256.00 NO BID NO BID $424 80 NO BID
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 40A 600VAC, MOLDED CASE,
ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C40 (TO INCLUDE $131.80

61 |Loos3-00 L i T o T EA 4 NO BID $37299 1816 $256.00 NO BID NO BID $45430 NO BID
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 20A 600VAC, MOLDED CASE,
ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C20 $131.80

62 |LO064-00 (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G.G-TLC13 LUGS) EA 4 NO BID $372.99 $18.16 $265.00 NO BID NO BID $454.30 NO BID
VD, 100HF 480VAC, ALTIVAR VED

63 |Loces-00 ODLe AT O oD 75N EA 2 NO BID $6,893.07 NO BID $10,402.00 NO BID NO BID $4,602,00 NO BID
SOFT, STARTER, 300HP 480VAC, BENSHAW SOFT

61 |L0066-00 STARTER MODEL# EA 2 NO BID $5,620.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5,546.00 NO BID
RB2-1-5-361-16C
SOFT, STARTER, 200HP 430VAC,

65 |Loos7.00 BENSHAW SOFT STARTER MODEL# RB3-1-5-240A-15C EA 2 NOBID $8,720.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.956.00 NO BID
SOFT, STARTER, 100HF 380VAC, BENSHAW SOFT

66 |Looss-00 STARTER MODELK RB2-1-5-096A-13C EA 2 NO BID $5.208.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,658.00 NO BID
BENSHAW #RE3-1-5-125A-14C
SOFT, STARTER, 160HP 480VAC, ALTIVAR SOFT STARTER

67 |Looss-o0 MODEL# ATS48C25Y EA 2 NO BID $8,597.66 NO BID $4.897.00 NO BID NO BID $5,546.00 NO BID
REACTOR, 3 PHASE 60HP 480VAC. G00VAC 80 AMF MAX.

68 |L0070-00 B EA 2 NO BID NO BID $557.12 $640.00 $714.95 NO BID $751.66 NO BID
PROTECTION DEVICE, MINICAS 120, FLYGT PUMF,

69 |Lo071-00 P gl ittt i Ea | 50 NO BID NO BID $668.30 $418.00 $200.04 NO BID $442.50 NO BID
GLOVES, XL DISPOSABLE NITRILE SMIL, HARDY MODELF

70 lwoorz00 68512 BX | 100 NO BID NO BID $29.73 NO BID $48.55 NO BID $16.52 $7.35
NITRI-COR PLATINUM SMIL STYLE 4097

71 |wors00 ?‘2?,'\3” DAL oot e S i UL R L T L EA | 60 NO BID $175.32 $175.18 $238.00 §206.25 NO BID $220.66 NO BID
LED, 120VAC, WITH PIPE MOUNT ATTACHMENT, RED,

72 |Loora-c0 EDWARDS SIGNALING MODEL# 105XBRMRI20A, EA | 60 NOBID $315.00 $335.18 $532.00 $391.30 NO BID $424 80 NO BID
MOUNTING, BASE, EDW 105 PM PIPE MOUNT

73 |Loora-on ATTACHMENT, PART FOR USE WITH L06074-00 Ea | 60 NO BID $28.27 $28.37 $40.00 $36.85 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
RELAY, 11 PIN 120VAC 10A, SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE D

74 |Loo7s-00 MODEL# EA | 100 NO BID $42.15 $25.72 $39.00 $28.80 NO BID $30.68 NO BID
8501 KPRI13P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HA33A1
RELAY, 1 PIN 24VAC 10A, SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE D

75 |Loors-co MODEL# 8501KPR13P14V14 ALLEN BRADLEY EA 100 NO BID $42.15 $21.66 $51.00 $20.40 NO BID $30.68 NOBID
MODEL# 700HA33A24
RELAY, 11 PIN 24vDC 10A, SQUARE

7% |Loorroo D MODEL# 8501 KPDR13V53 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# Ea | 20 NO BID $37.60 $20.40 $38.00 $28.80 NO BID $30.68 NOBID
T00-HA33Z24
RELAY, 8 PIN 600VAC, SOCKET BASE, DIN RAIL, FINDER
MOD) 8501 LEY MODEL#

77 [Looteoo  [YODELKSSOINRSZ ALLEN BRAD Ea | 200 NO BID $1145 $5.92 $19.50 $7.20 NO BID $t168 NO BID
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DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER SYSTEM BAM MARINE
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN. TX CORPUS CHRISTL, TX Pa BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAML FL LEAGUE CITY, Tx
ITEM | COMMODITY
NO. NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
RELAY, 11 PIN 600VAC, SOCKET BASE DIN RAIL MOUNT,
FINDER MODEL# 8501 NR61 ALLEN BRADLEY
78 |Looo-00 it ey EA | 200 NO BID $10.28 $5.26 $20.50 $7.20 NOBD $13.28 NO BID
LED, 120V-130V, RED, PHILIPS LED MODEL#
79 [Looso-00 R e e ga | so NO BID NOBID $10.09 NO BID NO BID NOBD $25.96 NO BID
NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL
80 LOOS1-00 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PSRS-1/4-5§ EA 200 NO BID NO BID $2.54 NO BID NQ BID NO BID $1.85 NO BID
NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
81 |Loog2-00 N g EA | 200 NO BID NO BID $3.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.13 NOBID
NUT 5/16" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
82 |Loos3-00 ARyl Ea | 200 NO BID NO BID $3.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID s118 NOBID
NUT 172" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
83 |Loose-00 kv gl EA | 200 NOBID NO BID $291 NO BID NOBID NO BID $7.69 NO BID
CLAMP, 1 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 316,
84 |Lo0ss-00 e pmeepal vt S EA | 200 NO BID NO BID $6.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID $8.13 NOBD
CLAMP, 7" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
85 (Lo0B6-00 P EA | 200 NO BID NOBID $3.60 NO BID NOBID NO BID $9.76 NOBID
CLAMP, 2 172" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
86 |Lo0s7-00 N A e gy Ea | 200 NO BID NO BID $7.18 NOBID NOBID NO BID $12.53 NO BID
CLAMP, 3" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE &
87 |Looss.00 CONDUIT MODEL# PS1100-3-SS OR CALBRITE $63000C00 | EA | 100 NO BID NO BID $17.40 NO BID NO BID NO BD 1264 NO BID
FUSE, 100AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL,
88  |Looss-00 iAot ey el vt A EA | 4 NO BID $2,351.96 $1,360.00 $6,028.00 NO BID NOBID $3,707.56 NO BID
89 |Looso-00 sk P G0OVAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, EA | 4 NOBID $3,294.35 $1,900.00 $8,518.00 NO BID NO BID $5,240.38 NO BID
9 |Loos1-00 Pl COTVAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, EA 4 NO BID $8.392.30 $4,960.00 $19,960.00 NO BID NO BID $12,116.24 NO BID
FUSE, 600AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL,
91 [Loos2-00 B DU o eiotas pars Ea | 2 NOBID $10,887.76 $6,825.00 28,51600 NO BID $29,720.85 $17,574.92 NO BID
92 |L0053.00 FUSE, 100AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODELA FLRS100 EA | 30 NO BID 336,25 336.82 NO BDD $%63.15 NO BID 33068 NG BID
53 [L00s4-00 FUSE, Z00AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLSR200 EA | 20 NO BID $69.73 $73.64 NO BID_ $121.35 NO BID $66.08 NG BID
94 [L0095.00 FUSE, 400AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODELR FLOR400 EA | 12 NO BID $139.40 $147.25 NO BID $242.60 $256.47 $96.76 NO BID
95 [Lo0s6-00 FUSE, 600AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODELA FLSRG00 A | 12 NO BID $202.37 $197.69 NO BID $350.50 $372.06 $152.22 NO BID
CONNECTOR # 4,2 PORT 600VAC,
9%  |Loosr-00 UL arn L S O 50 PETS 24 EA | 50 NO BID $12.75 $15.74 NO BID NO BID NO BD $23.60 NOBID
CONNECTOR # 2/0-3/0, 2 PORT 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO
97 |Loossoo ke ot EA | 50 NO BID $17.63 $20.86 NO BID $21.95 NO BID $36.58 NOBID
CONNECTOR 1/0# 250kem, 4 PORT
98 L00%9-00 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO MODEL#TA250 PBTS-4-250 EA 50 NO BID $£33.50 $38.79 NO BID $40.00 NOQ BID $68.44 NO BID
CONNECTOR #10 170, 3 PORT 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO
99 |Lo100-00 b i b i ea | 50 NO BID $23.75 52787 NO BID $29.55 NO BID $48.38 NO BID
100 [Loto1-00 TarE: 47X 30 600VAC 3M, INSULATION, SCOTTMODELS) g4 | 50 NO BID $21.4795 $12.98 NG BID $36.25 NO BID 52878 $19.75
101 |Lotoz-00 TAPE. 1" X 30'600VAC M. INSULATION. SCOTMODEL® | g4 | 50 NO BID $28.1380 $15.94 NOBID $78.99 $35.19 $35.40 52749
102 |Lotos-o0 L‘g{fﬁ';ﬁo’éw e A | so NO BID $42.9587 $33.93 NO BID $72.50 $73.16 $64.90 $39.89
103 |Loros-00 JAPE. 27 X 30'00VAC 3M. INSULATION, SCOTTMODELY | g | 59 NOBID $57.6725 $41.23 NO BID $97.50 $71.52 $70.80 $52.49
104 [Lotosog  [TAPE 347X 6 S0OVACIM, CAMBRIC,SCOTTMODEL: | gy | 5 NO BID $41.7780 $34.82 NO BID 11125 NO BID $50.74 $43.49
SWITCH, 120V 300VAC, HOA N.ON.C. POS SIEMENS
MODEL#H 52PT6G2A ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL¥ BOOT-J2A,
105 |Loto7-00 iepeetny A | 100 NO BID $51.55 $46.53 $78.00 $85.60 NO BID $82.60 NO BID
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DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER SYSTEM B&M MARINE
SUPPLY
1 CLIFTON HEIGHTS,
SR | BROWNSVILLE TX | HARLINGEN.TX | CORPUSCHRISTLTX . BROWNSVILLE. TX | HARLINGEN. TX A, £ Engut ey,
ITEM | COMMODITY
NO NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
LED, RED 120V 300VAC 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN
BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2R SIEMENS MODEL#
106 [L0108-00 $2PLAG2P, SQUARE D 2 EA 100 NO BID 57179 $64.43 $114.00 $137.75 $119.12 $141.60 NO BID
MODEL 9001KP35LRR31 RED PILOT
LED, GREEN 120 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN
BRADLEY MODEL¥ $00T-QH2G, SQUARE D MODEL SQD
107 [Loisoo [ M e 2C:SQ sQ Ea | 100 NO BID $78.65 $64.43 $124.00 $164 35 $119.12 $141.60 NO BID
PILOT
W : 0.5MM, PILOT LIGHT.
108 [L011000  |3Eeorey montes satary T ILOTLIGHT ALLEN] ey [ 50 NO BID $78.65 $75.12 $124.00 NO BID NO BD $141.60 NO BID
LED, BLUE 120V 12-120V 30.5MM,
109 |Lot11-00 PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2ZB EA 50 NO BID $78.65 $75.12 $124.00 $157.75 NO BID $141.60 NO BID
LED, AMBER 120V 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN
110 |Lo112-00 BRADLEY EA 50 NO BID $74.42 $65.98 $124.00 $135.60 NO BID $141.60 NO BID
MODEL# 800T-QH2A
PUSH BUTTON, RESET 120V 300VAC,
N.O. AND N.C., SIEMENS MODEL# 52PA8B2JP ALLEN
111 |LO113-00 BRADLEY MODELK 800T-A2A, SQUARE D EA 60 NO BID $4329 $36.24 $53.00 £70.45 NO BID $70.80 NOBID
MODEL D# 5QD $001KR1BH13 PB&CONT ACT BL
PUSH BUTTON, RED 300VAC, AND LABEL, SIEMENS
112 |LOVi4-00 MODEL# EA 30 NO BID $91.43 $7136 $46.00 $70.45 NO BID $70.80 NO BID
52PASA3KP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL¥ 800T-FX6A1
LABEL, EMERGENCY PUSH BUTTON, ALLEN BRADLEY
113 |Lo115-00 e - EA 30 NO BID $83.65 $3.430 $6.50 $7.86 NO BID $7.08 NO BID
CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC BLACK, SOUTHWIRE
114 |LO116-00 N T i T | 2,000 NO BID $0.46184 $0.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.54 $1.03
CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC
115 |Lo117-00 GREEN, SOUTHWIRE MODEL# THHN&GRN FT 2,000 NO BID $0.46184 $0.55 NO BID NQ BID NO BID $0.54 $1.03
CABLE, COPPER #3/0 THHN 600VAC BLK, SOUTHWIRE
116 [Lo118-00 MODEL #THHN3/0BLK FT | 1,000 NO BID $3.60695 5342 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.81 $7.23
CABLE, COPPER #4/0 THHN 600VAC
17 (L0190 |5/ SOUTHWIRE MODELY THHNAOBLK FT | 1000 | NOBD $4.50241 $4.97 NO BID NOBID NOBID $4.76 $7.89
CHARGER, BATTERY 6AMP 12VDC, MARINCO MODEL#
118 |rer2000 CHARGE PRO 26106 EA 3 NO BID NO BID $179.12 NO BID $138.65 NO BID $109.74 NO BID
LED, SECURITY LIGHT GALVANIZED 4000WATTS,
119 |Lo121-00 LUMENS- 400, HONEYWELL MODELMA0201-1 7CR _ EA 30 NO BID NO BID $117.91 NO BID $£35.00 NO BID $30.68 NO BID
FUSEHOLDER, 600VAC, THREE FUSES DIN RAIL MOUNT
120 |LO122-00 LITTLE FUSE MODEL# L60030C3PQDINR EA 50 NO BID NO BID $19.80 $26.00 $29.78 NO BID $27.14 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D
121 |Lo123-00 STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B25 | EA 60 NO BID $29.84 $46.18 $33.00 $36.70 NO BID $31.85 NO BID
SQUARE D S070T150D23 240/480TQ 24VAC OR ALLEN
122 |L0123-01 BgADLEY 14978 ALMI6ON EA 20 NO BID $140.19 $86.89 $95.00 NO BID NO BID $97.35 NO BID
SQUARE D 9070T150D23 240/480T0 120VAC OR ALLEN
123 |Lo123-02 BRADLEY 1497B- A&-MI4.0-N EA 20 NO BID $100.57 $114.42 $126.00 NO BID NO BID $145.14 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC,
124 |Lo12400 OVERLOADS, EA | 60 NO BID 529.84 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D
125 [Lo2s-00 STARTERS 600VAC. OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B3s| EA | 60 NOBID $29.84 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC,
126 [Lo12600 OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL B45 EA | 0 NO BID $29.84 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NOBID $38.94 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC,
127 [L012700  |oyvERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B79 EA | 60 NO BID $29.84 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D
128 |LO128-00 STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# EA 60 NOBID $29.84 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NOBID $38.94 NOBID
ccnz
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DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN | ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC iy MSC POWER SYSTEN| 28 Manne
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPUS CHRISTI, TX FA BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAML, FL LEAGUE CITY, TX
ITEM | COMMODITY
NG il DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
129 |L6125-00 HEATER ELEMENT. FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, EA 60 NOBID §29.84 $26,00 $33.00 $36.70 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
130 [Lo130-00 HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, EA 60 NO BID $29.34 $26.00 $33.00 $36.70 NOBID $38.94 NO BID
OVERILOANS SOIIADE DyRANNELHCLIOL
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS &00VAC,
131 |Lo131-00 OVERLOADS, Ea | 60 NO BID $29.34 $26.00 $33.00 $36,70 NO BID $38.94 NO BID
SQUARE D MODELA CC208
POWER SUPPLY, 24VAC 120VAC, TELEMECANIQUE
132 |Lo132.00 MODELY ABLERPS24030 O 48] S06XLPTaE EA 5 NO BID NOBID $235.35 $287.00 NO BID $269.84 $310.34 NO BID
DC POWER SUPPLY P/N: ALLEN BRADLEY 1769-PA2
133 {Lo132:01 EA 5 NO BID NO BID $373.89 $416.00 $409.70 NOBID $355.18 NO BID
134 |Lowsso REACTOR, 3 PHASE 600VAC, MTE MODEL# RL-08002 EA 3 NO BID NOBID $557.12 $640.00 $714.95 NO BID $531.00 NO BID
ARRESTOR, SECONDARY SURGE 600VAC, SQUARE D
135 |Lo134-00 ) ,,;;',S 3650 SQ EA 3 NO BID $135.35 NO BID $227.00 $225.35 NO BID $304.44 NO BID
END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE, FOR
136 |L0135-00 UNITSTRUT CHANNEL | 5/8" X 1 5/8" PART# P5 61532 WHT EA 500 NOBID NO BID $2.00 NQ BID £71.60 NO BID $2.36 NQBID
END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE, FOR UNISTRUT CHANNEL |
137 [Lo136-00 X T8 PARTE BS 61598 WHT EA | soo NO BID NO BID $6.00 NO BID $71.60 NO BID $2.36 NO BID
DUCT, PVC 1" X 2" X 6 PANDUIT SLOTTED ADH, LIGHT
138 {L0137-00 FREAE R T | 504 NO BID NO BID $3.91 NO BID $7.83 $7.34 $8.97 NO BID
V] VC I"W .
139 |Lo138-00 ‘,3;’;;’;‘;:32”” LSRR OGS A FT | 504 NOBID NO BID $0.97 NO BID $1.93 52.63 51.89 NO BID
APTE 1 POE 50V P/N# POE 50-60W
140 [Lot41-00 AL S ALY EA 2 NOBID NO BID $75.72 NO BID $47.15 NO BID $59.00 NO BID
BALLAST, UNIVERSAL 1207277 PHILLIPS# ICN-2P32-N
141 |Lo144.00 EA 2 NO BID $11.85 $11.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.05 NO BID
142 [L0146-00 B 202 P HE LIRS I B3 EN EA 2 NO BID $15.35 $14.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.77 NOBID
143 |L0148-00 BALLAST, T8 PART# SOP 2P59N351 EA 2 NO BID $26.25 $34.88 NOBID NO BID NO BID $30.09 NO BID
144 |Lotsi-o0 S?ENEGOR' LA L OB PORTILSO MODELEESTS [ 20 NO BID $26.75 $25.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID $53.93 NO BID
145 |Lo153-00 SS%NNECTOR- R R TILSOVERES 2 EN 20 NO BID $32.15 $39.12 NO BID NOBID NO BID $66.08 NO BID
146 |Lo1s5-00 R AR EA 6 NO BID $2.38 NO BID NOBIDD NO BID NO BID $4.37 NO BID
147 |Lo1ss-01 sl M 2L 2 O e B 2, EA 6 NO BID $12.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.80 NO BID
148 |Lo155.00 MODULE, 4 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUT #1769-1F4 EA 4 NO BID NO BID $739.91 $1,285.00 $580.00 NO BID $637.20 NO BID
149 |Lor6c-00 MODULE, 8 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUT P/N 1769-1F8 EA 4 NO BID NO BID $1,186.63 $2,863.00 $713.60 NO BID $1,012.44 NO BID
150 |Loisi-00 kL C SO EA 4 NO BID NO BID $370.18 $522.00 $259.20 NO BID $356.36 NO BID
151 |Loisa-00 NANOSTATIOIN, UBIQUITY MS P/N NSMSUS EA 4 NOBID NO BID $128.60 NO BID $185.65 NO BID $118.00 NO BID
152 |L0167-00 PLC, COMPACT LOGIC PN 1760-L32E BOX | 4 NO BID NO BID $4.711.00 $5.521.00 $1,153.30 NO BID $1.100.54 NO BID
153 |Lor70-00 VFD, LENZE A/C TECH MODEL# ESU 75 N 04TXB EA 2 NO BID NO BID NOBID $406.00 NO BID NO BID $451.94 NO BID
TAPE, 3/4* SCOTCH SU-PER 33+
154 |Lo172-00 bty Y EA 5 NO EID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $9.03 £9.00 §7.49
155  |Lo17300 ﬁmy"“ B HIEE RICHIVCLTACETARE SN EA 5 NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $8.36 $9.00 $7.49
156 |Lo174-00 ;mwm" SUPER 33 + RED: HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE| 5 NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.50 .12 $9.00 $7.49
TAPE, 3/4" 'TCH SUPER 33 + BLUE; HIGH VOLTAGE
157 [Lozsgo  [TATE S SCOTCHSUPER33 EA | 50 NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $9.03 $9.00 $6.98
TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + YELLOW,; HIGH VOLTAGE
158 |Lo176-00 o Ea | S0 NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $9.03 $9.00 $6.98
TAPE, 374" SCOTCH SUPER 33 +
159 |Lo177-00 (e EA | 30 NOBID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.50 $13.73 $9.00 $6.98

ORANGE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000031581
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DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN ELECTRIC COMPANY CAPP INC AUTOMATION MSC POWER SYSTEM BLM MARINE
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPUS CHRISTL TX PA BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAMI, FL LEABUE &Y, T
ITEM | COMMODITY
NO. NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + BROWN; HIGH VOLTAGE
160 [Lo17800  [TArE ot er S EA | so NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $9.03 $9.00 $6.98
TAPE, 3/4* SCOTCH SUPER 33 + GRAY, HIGH VOLTAGE
161 [LO17900 |TAbEwnt 7ocoosass EA | so NO BID $6.7720 $6.33 NO BID $12.90 $0.03 $9.00 $6.98
TRUMETER, TIME LAPSED 24VAC 50/60HZ
162 [Loisoon [ CHICAGD, MODELE TSOAE A | %0 NO BID $44.91 $33.60 NO BID $35.27 NOBID $28.32 NO BID
50/60] ROH: #722-0004
163 |Lorso-on TRUMETER, 90-264VAC 50/60HZ ROHS MODEL #722 Ea | g0 NO BID $48.59 $28.75 NO BID $42.52 NO BID $34.22 NO BID
TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN, 100 KVA, 120V PRI24VAC
164 |Lois1.00  [SEC, GENERAL ELECTRIC MODEL #5TS8K2875 EA | 20 NOBID $298.16 $87.07 $151.00 NO BID $216.83 $135.70 NO BID
TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN, 100 KVA 240480V
165 |Lo1si-on PRV AL SEe CENERAL ELECTRIC MODEL Ea | 20 NOEBID $298.16 $92.52 $144.00 NO BID NO BID $129.80 NOBID
TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN 100K VA 240-480V
166 |Lo1si-02 PR A SEE G L woTsskagos | EA | 20 NO BID $126.50 $93.77 $163.00 NO BID NO BID $147.50 NO BID
STARTER, MOTOR SLZE 0 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE
167 |Lors2-00 B MODEL 4853638037015 EA | 4 NO BID $290.71 NO BID $350.00 NO BID NO BID $547.52 NO BID
STARTER, MOTOR SIZE | 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE
168 |Lorsz-0n Hmt eyt vt A | 12 NO BID $337.60 NOBID $402.00 NO BID $557.02 $595.90 NOBID
STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 2 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE
169 |Lors2-02 il £a | 12 NO BID $613.99 NO BID $712.00 NO BID $1,012.89 $1,079.70 NO BID
STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 3 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE
170 [Lo182.03 B s A | 6 NOBID $1,221.05 NO BID $1,110.00 NOBID $2.225.29 $1,834.90 NO BID
LIGHT, PILCT 24VAC LED RED POWER MODEL#
171 |L0183-00 CSW30SDIE26 EA 60 NOBID NOBID $67.45 $68.00 $66.47 NCBID £59.00 NO BID
112 oo b ot EA | 10 NO BID NO BID $67.45 $68.00 $66.47 NO BID $59.00 NO BID
LIGHT, P T 24VA D W POW
173 [Losz (S 07 4VACLED YELLOW POWER MODELA EA | 20 NO BID NO BID $67.45 $68.00 $66.47 NO BID $59.00 NO BID
4V
174 |Los3.03 P e et Ea | 20 NO BID NO BID $67.45 $68.00 $66.47 NO BID $59.00 NOBID
RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC & PING POWER MODELY
175 [L018400  [R15-2012.23- S026WTL, AB-T00HA324244, OR ga | 100 NO BID $18.03 $38.02 $41.00 $109.86 NO BID $33.63 NO BID
7S0XBXR{24A-750
RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC 1] PINS POWER MODEL#
176 |LoI84-01 R15-2013-23- 5024-WTL, AB-700HA33A244, OR EA 100 NGO BID $21.20 $38.02 $45.00 $38.40 NO BID $35.40 NO BID
TSOXCXRC4A-750 _
RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VDC & PINS POWER MODEL#
R15-2012-23- 1024-WTL, AB-TOOHA32Z244, OR
177 |Loisa02 B EA | 100 NO BID $15.22 $36.73 $39.00 $28.80 NOBID $32.45 NO BID
RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC 11 PINS POWER MODEL#
R15-2013-23- 1024-WTL, AB-TO0HA33Z244 OR
178 |Lo1sa03 i, EA | 100 NO BID $17.98 $36.73 $39.00 $16 80 NO BID $34.22 NOBID
MODULE, CONTACT NORMALLY CLOSE CONTACT
179 |Lorss-00 g ea | 30 NO BID $35.10 NO BID $38.00 NO BID NOBID $48.97 NO BID
MODULE, CONTACT NORMALLY QPEN INTERLOCK SIZE 0
180 |Lo186-00 et ea | 30 NO BID $59.95 NO BID $79.00 NO BID $86.07 $102.70 NO BID
TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 24VAC, 06-60 SEC
181 [LOIBT0 |SQUARE D 9050JCKI3VI4 A | 20 NO BID $53.83 NO BID $88.00 NO BID $80.02 $97.94 NO BID
TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS |20VAC, 0660 SEC
182 [Loisron Hosrypetizyivdei it e Ea | 20 NO BID $53.83 NO BID $88.00 NO BID $80.02 $97.94 NO BID
TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY & PINS 24VAC 0.1-10 MIN
183 [Loisro2 et S Ea | 20 NO BID $60.03 NOBID $114.00 NO BID $89.36 $123.90 NO BID
TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 120VAC, 0.1-10 MIN
184 |Lo1s7-03 OUASE DR EA | 20 NO BID $60.03 NOBID $114.00 NO BID $89.27 $109.74 NO BID
PBIO11-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1
185 |Lo1ss-00 EA | 50 NO BID NO BID $23.00 NO BID $21.35 NO BID $18.88 NO BID

POLE, EDISON BURNDY BUCHANNA,

Page 8




DEALERS

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN |  ELECTRIC ponidiee CAPPINC | , COMSTAL MSC P ohaiD | ssmvanne
SUPPLY
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX CORPUS CHRISTL, TX PA BROWNSVILLE, TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAMI, FL LEAGUE CTY, TX
ITEM | commonrTy
Te [ conmosn DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
186 |Loissor Fo101-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 | ¢y | 50 NO BID NOBD $33.12 NO BID $30.70 NO BID $27.14 NO BID
187 |Lotss-02 L3 EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1| gy | 50 NO BID NO BID $3247 NO BID $37.35 NO BID $33.04 NO BID
128 [L0188.03 PoL1-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1| | 59 NOBID NO BID $34.29 NO BID $31.35 NO BID $27.14 NOBID
129 |Lotss-0e Tol s -EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTIONBLOCKS 1| g | 59 NOBID NOBID $52.35 NOBID $48.70 NO BID $43.07 NO BID
190 |Lo1ss-0s ey CR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1| gy | 59 NOBID NOBID $62.87 NO BID $58.70 NO BID $51.92 NO BID
PB1061-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS {
191 |Lorss.os T Ea | so NOBID NOBID $56.71 NO BID $52.00 NOBID $46.02 NO BID
192 |Lorss.o7 ':gf:z'ED‘SON L O (e NO BID NQ BID $101.43 NO BID $94.70 NO BID $83.78 NO BID
193 |Lorss-0s P oL % EDISONSCCR POWER DISTRIBUTIONBLOCKS 1| g, | 59 NO BD NO BID $152.18 NO BID $140.00 NOBID $123.90 NO BID
194 [Losgos  [POI0°T-EPISONSCCR POWER DISTRIBUTIONBLOCKS 1 1 gy [ 59 NO BID NO BID $92.44 NO BID $85.35 NOBID $75.52 NO BID
195 [Lotss-10 POy TEDISONSCCR POWER DISTRIBUTIONBLOCKS 1 | g4 | 50 NO BID NO BID $108.60 NO BID $101.35 NO BID 58968 NO BID
196 |Lotssnn Py 063 EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1| g, | 50 NO BID NOBID $130.57 NOBID $120.00 NO BID $106.20 NOBID
197 |Lo19o-00 99995X04 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D EA | 2 NO BID $76.82 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $142.78 NOBID
198 [LO196-01 999951X 18 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D EA [ 20 NO BID $115.20 NOBID $83.00 NO BID NO BID $194.70 NO BID
190 |Lotoo-02 e i 2 A L S Y EA | 20 NO BID $65.54 NO BID $95.00 NO BID NO BID $107.38 NO BID
200 |L0150-03 9999S1X12 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D EA | 20 NO BID $65.54 NO BID $95.00 NOBID NO BID $107.38 NO BID
201 |Lo190-04 999951X14 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARED EA | 20 NOBID $65.54 NO BID $79.00 NO BID NOBID $107.38 NO BID
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 34 600V
02 |Lorsz-00 DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1492-M2€030 A | 2 NG BID $49.09 $138.10 NOBID NO BID NO BID $194.70 NO BID
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 5A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR
203 |Lotsz01 eyt EA | 20 NO BID $49.09 $138.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $194.70 NO BID
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 10A 600V
204 |Loroz02 DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR ALLEN BRALEY 1492:-M2C100 EA | 20 NO BID $20.80 $138.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $194.70 NO BID
205 |Lot94-00 TPOLE DIO-WMSIDI10 240V BREAKER DIN RAIL EA | 2 NO BID $23.08 $20.08 $63.00 NOEBID NO BID $9.44 NO BID
206 |Lo19s00 581‘3‘:55‘; PACT, CIRCUIT BREAKER, 240V, SQUARE D EA 8 NOBID $19.64 NO BID 523.00 NO BID NO BID $354.00 NO BID
207 |Loiss.00 R Fr | 1000 NO BID NO BID $200 NG BID NO BID NO BID $1.49 NO BID
2028 |Loi9s.0r Madiiotb FT | 1000 NO BID NO BID $3.2 NO BID NO BD NO BID $201 NO BID
COPPER WIRE 4C/43 TC 1000 FT REEL
200 |Lotss-02 Fa ¢ Fro| 000 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID $7.08 NO BID
210 |Lo198-03 R ro | 1000 NOBID NOBID $6.12 NOBID NO BID NOBID $1416 NOBID
211 |Lo1os-0a CABLE, COPPER WIRE 4C/#6 TC 1000 FT REEL FT | 1000 NO BID NO BID $7.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID $897 NO BID
22 |Loiesos CABLE, COPPER WIRE 4C/48 TC 1000 FT REEL | 1000 NO BID NO BID $3.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID $6.02 NO BID
213 |Loz00-00 HOFFMAN EA 6 NO BID NO BID $2,157.00 $3,551.00 NO BID NO BID $3,833.82 NO BID
ENCLOSURE A48H3612GQRLP 157, 351 833,
214 |Loz01.00 FUSE TYFE KTK OR KLK IAMP, LF-KLK0I0 er | & NO BID $9.74 $14.09 $13.00 $8.30 $1887 $708 NO BID
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NOTE: CRAWFORD ELECTRIC SUPPLY DID NOT SIGN BID DOCUMENT-DISQUALIFIED
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AT G-F-3053

THE REYNOLDS COASTAL INTEGRATED
CORE & MAIN |  ELECTRIC i CAPPINC |  COMSTAL MSC POEUAAT o
SUPPLY TEM
CLIFTON HEIGHTS.
il o it R e BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN. TX CORPUS CHRISTL TX PA BROWNSVILLE. TX HARLINGEN, TX NORTH MIAMI, FL LEAGUE £ITY, Tx
ITEM | commopiTy
bl e DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
205 fLoz01-01 e Ea | 60 NO BID $9.74 $14.09 $13.00 $8.30 $18.87 $8.26 NO BID
26 |Lo201-02 FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK SAMP, LF- KLK050 EA | 60 NO BID $9.74 §25.18 NO BID $8.30 $9.05 $9.44 NO BID
217 |Lozo103 R A | 60 NOBID $9.74 $25.18 NOBID $8.30 $18.86 $10.62 NO BID
2 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600V 30AMP MAX, LITTLEFUSE
218 |L020300 L 50030C2PODINR Ea | a0 NO BID NO BID $16.18 NO BID NO BID $10.46 $20.06 NOBID
3 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600VAC CLASS CC, 30AMP MAX
219 |Lo203-01 i e e, En | a0 NO BID NO BID $21.33 NO BID NO BID NOBID $26.55 NOBID
FUSE BLOCKS, LF SERIES, CLASS CC/CD, 3 POLES, 30 AMP
220 [Loz0s.00 Hppieigremariniua e s EA | 20 NO BID NO BID $2133 NO BID NO BID $11.98 $29.50 NO BID
2 Joaoran e o ACLUGBOLTBCASEIROMT. | gx | 2 NO BID NO BID $10.86 NO BID 5820 NOBID $14.16 NO BID
4.
222 |Lo209.00 S onreomy | TOERAL SIGNAL 330-024-30, OR AB- ga | a0 NO BID 51282 $99.68 $167.00 $144.50 NO BID $111.51 NO BID
PILOT LIGHT COMPLETE, 30 MM, 24V AC/DC VOLTAGE,
23 {Lo2n-00 LAMP TYPE. LED. TERMINAL CorECTION Precains | EA | 0 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $139.24 NO BID
BEACON WARNING LIGHT, LED, 12
24 |Lo213.00 ‘TO 24V ACIDC OR 120 TO 2407, AB- $55BSS35S14 EA | 40 NO BID NO BID $292.28 $305.00 NOBID NO BID $48.38 NO BID
225 |Lo215-00 BT AAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE ANDBACK PLATE | g, | 39 NOBID NO BID $160.76 $228.00 NOBID NOBID $266.68 NOBID
26 |Lozisol HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONTPLATE ANDBACK PLATE | g, | 59 NO BID NO BID $192.51 $266.00 NO BID NO BID $320.96 NO BID
27 |Loniso2 AN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK PLATE | g, | 20 NO BID NO BID $277.19 $383.00 NOBID NO BID $461.38 NO BID
228 |Lo21503 ey \LUMINUM FRONTPLATEANDBACKPLATE |, | 5 NO BID NO BID $431.99 $597.00 NO BID NOBID $719.80 NO BID
SIZE 1 1EC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D OR AB-
100C30J10 + AB-193EEED
29 fLasce  [sRTeRAR ga | 20 NO BID $53.58 NO BID $130.00 NO BID $143.43 $408.28 NOBID
SIZE 3 1EC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL
230 |Lo219-01 SQUARE D OR AB- 100C85110 + AB-193EEGE EA 20 NOQ BID $178.25 NO BID $351.00 NOQ BID $495.00 $2,342.30 NO BID
SQDLC1D1156B7
SIZE 3 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL
231 |Lozis0z SQUARE D OR AB- 100E116KJ1 1L + AB-193EEH) ea | 2 NO BID $259.00 NO BID $510.00 NO BID $725.00 $1,351.10 NO BID
SQD LCIDI506B7
232 |roz1s-03 255 iéfg;‘;gﬁ B e UICSOLARED Ea | 20 NO BID $61.60 NO BID $146.00 NO BID $166.41 5221714 NO BID
233 |Lo219.04 355 ﬁéfg;‘;:g.f”kmn L e B S Ll A | 2 NO BID $178.25 NO BID $345.00 NOBID $505.14 $849.60 NO BID
234 [Lozis-0s ggg e :T:»?éﬁ STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D ea | 20 NOBID $259.00 NO BID $510.00 NOBID $725.00 $849.60 NO BID
235 |L0220-00 LS oSS L R L S I e FLIE LR EA | 20 NO BID $57.97 NG BID NO BID NO BID NG BID $80.24 NG BID
236 |Lozzc-01 L O A ST R LTS TS L 5 B | 2 NO BID $115.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $364.62 NO BID
237 |Loz2002 ,"E"“Y' LSRR T LRSS Co ga | 20 NO BID $115.42 NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID $364.62 NO BID
NON-ILLUMINATED SELECTOR SWITCH, 30 MM, 3,
238 |Le221-00 MAINTAINED, 2NO/2NC, LEVELER, SQUARE D 800T- EA 5 NO BID $51.30 $40.87 $84.00 NOBID NO BID $96.76 NO BID
] 7A




