



BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B058-23 SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL OVERHEAD AND UNDERGROUND CABLE

DATE AND TIME: AUGUST 10, 2022 - 10:00 AM

ITEM #	BPUB COMMODITY	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	MVA POWER INC.	AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, LLC.	KBS ELECTRIC	TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES, INC	NEXGEN POWER, INC	TECHLINE INC	WESCO
					MONTREAL QUEBEC	MIAMI FL	AUSTIN TX	GEORGETOWN TX	GARDENA CA	SAN ANTONIO TX	SAN ANTONIO TX
					UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	E0202-01	Cable Aluminum #2 STR 3/Conductor HDP Insulated Neutral, Service Drop 2/Conductor #2-7W AAC W/45 Mils PE Plus 1/Conductor #4-7W AAC with Insulated neutral w/45 Mils PE with 1 Ridge Phase ID,	20,000	FT	\$0.99	\$1.05	\$0.861	\$0.77	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.10
2	E0207-00	Cable, AL #4/0 STR 4/C HDP/XLP Insulated Service Drop, Cable, 600V, Quadruplex: 3/Conductors - 4/0 AWG 19W, Compressed Stranded Aluminum Phase, Conductor Insulated with 60 Mils black HDPE/XLP (Surface Printed Numbers for Phase ID); 1/Conductor - 1/0 AWG 19W Compressed Stranded Aluminum Neutral, Conductor Insulated W/60 MILS, Black HDPE/XLP, and must come with Ridge ID or as optional - Yellow Stripe for Identification	2,000	FT	\$3.34	\$7.05	\$3.96	\$2.74	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.15
3	E0210-00	Cable, AL #1/0 STR Bare AAAC Code Name "AZUSA", 6,050 ft/reel/reel (700 Lb)	18,150	FT	\$0.495	\$0.48	\$0.41	\$0.38	NO BID	\$0.54	\$0.53
4	E0214-00	Cable, AL 477 MCM Bare AAC Code Name "COSMOS", Reel Lengths: 5 x 4,245 FT Net Weight: 7,603 644 lb/reel	21,225	FT	\$1.26	\$1.41	\$1.77	\$1.24	\$1.28	\$2.97	\$1.83
5	E0215-00	Cable, AL 795 MCM Bare AAC Code Name "ARBUSUS", 4,900 ft/reel	9,800	FT	\$2.19	\$2.30	\$3.20	\$2.05	\$1.83	\$3.97	\$2.98
6	E0910-00	Cable Underground, 2/0 Straight 3/C Aluminum XLPE 600V URD Service Cable Code Name "CONVERSE" #1 Neutral, (1,000 ft/ reel) "Must Come with Footage Marker"	20,000	FT	\$1.746	\$1.80	\$1.54	\$1.58	\$2.88	\$1.94	\$1.70
7	E0912-00	Cable Underground, 350 MCM 3/C AL XLP, code Name "WESLEYAN", 4/0 Neutral Wire, (1,000 ft/Reels) "Must Come With Footage Marker"	10,000	FT	\$3.536	\$3.70	\$3.53	\$3.41	\$6.26	\$4.73	\$4.15

					MVA POWER INC.	AMERICAN WIRE GROUP, L.L.C.	KBS ELECTRIC	TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES, INC	NEXGEN POWER, INC	TECHLINE INC	WESCO
					MONTREAL, QUEBEC	MIAMI, FL	AUSTIN, TX	GEORGETOWN, TX	GARDENA, CA	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX
ITEM #	BPUB COMMODITY	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
8	E0917-00	Cable Underground 500 MCM 15KV CU (Copper) Primary Direct Burial (PDB), Underground Power Cable, as per BPUB Specifications, page 14, 1,100 Feet Per Reel	4,400	FT	\$27.12	NO BID	\$27.65	\$19.81	\$17.66	NO BID	\$2.47
	Mfg/Brand Name				MVA POWER INC.	AWG	PRIORITY, KINGWIRE, HOUSTON WIRE	CME	DAEWON	PRYSMIAN	
	Lead Time				65 DAYS	1 - 18 WEEKS	7 - 126 DAYS	70 - 385 DAYS	19 WEEKS	12 - 18 WEEKS	1 - 58 WEEKS

APPROVED BY: *D Solitaire 8-11-2023*
 DIANE SOLITAIRE