
ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12

 99.5% Anhydrous 
Ammonia 

19% Aqueous 
Ammonia

Price/Lb if truckload 
deviates from35,000 to 

50,000 Lb

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%)
for BPUB WP1 & WP2

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 
25%) as per attached 
specifications (BPUB 

WP1 & WP2)

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%) for SRWA

Sodium Hydroxide 
(liquid caustic soda 

25%) as per attached 
specifications 

(SRWA)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(BPUB)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(SRWA)

Powdered 
Activated Carbon

Liquid Ammonium 
Sulfate (SRWA)

Sodium Bisulfite 
Solution  (SRWA)

Citric Acid 50% 
Solution for SRWA 

(330 Gal/Tote)

Low Manganese or 
Standard Drinking 
Water Grade Ferric 
Chloride Solution 

for SRWA

Calcium Chloride 
Solution                         
(SRWA)

Service Contract to 
provide Chlorine 

Dioxide
(BPUB WP1 & 

WP2)

Sodium Chlorite 
(SRWA)

100,000 Pounds 120,000 Pounds 650,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds 220,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons 240,000 Pounds 310,000 Pounds 190,000 Pounds 30 (330-Gal Totes) 175,000 Pounds 2,110,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds

 PENCCO, INC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 CARBON ACTIVATED 
CORPORATION                                                                                 
COMPTON, CA                                

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.99 / 1 YR                                                         
$1.05 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CHEMTRADE 
CHEMICALS US LLC

PARSIPPANY, NJ

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.175 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 INTERNATIONAL 
DIOXCIDE, INC

NORTH KINGSTOWN, 
RI 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.147 / 1 YR
$1.18 / 2 YR

$0.689 / 1 YR
$0.717 / 2 YR

 SOUTHERN IONICS

WEST POINT, MS 
NO BID $0.1397 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1865 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 AIRGAS

LAWRENCEVILLE, GA 

$1.90 / 1 YR                                                    
$1.90 / 2 YR

$0.23 / 1 YR                                                       
$0.23 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ITEM #3 ITEM #4

BID NAME: B046-23 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF WATER & WASTEWATER CHEMICALS FOR BPUB & SRWA
DATE AND TIME: JULY 6, 2023 - 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION



ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12

 99.5% Anhydrous 
Ammonia 

19% Aqueous 
Ammonia

Price/Lb if truckload 
deviates from35,000 to 

50,000 Lb

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%)
for BPUB WP1 & WP2

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 
25%) as per attached 
specifications (BPUB 

WP1 & WP2)

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%) for SRWA

Sodium Hydroxide 
(liquid caustic soda 

25%) as per attached 
specifications 

(SRWA)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(BPUB)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(SRWA)

Powdered 
Activated Carbon

Liquid Ammonium 
Sulfate (SRWA)

Sodium Bisulfite 
Solution  (SRWA)

Citric Acid 50% 
Solution for SRWA 

(330 Gal/Tote)

Low Manganese or 
Standard Drinking 
Water Grade Ferric 
Chloride Solution 

for SRWA

Calcium Chloride 
Solution                         
(SRWA)

Service Contract to 
provide Chlorine 

Dioxide
(BPUB WP1 & 

WP2)

Sodium Chlorite 
(SRWA)

100,000 Pounds 120,000 Pounds 650,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds 220,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons 240,000 Pounds 310,000 Pounds 190,000 Pounds 30 (330-Gal Totes) 175,000 Pounds 2,110,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds

ITEM #3 ITEM #4

 EVOQUA WATER 
TECHNOLOGIES LLC

SARASOTA, FL 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
                                            

$0.86 $0.708

 DONAU CARBON US 
LLC                                                                                               

DUNNELLON, FL 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.2362 / 1 YR                                               

$1.2362 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 UNIVAR USA

KENT, WA 
NO BID NO BID $0.2588 $0.1538 $0.2588 $0.1538 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,136.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 CHEMRITE, INC

BUFORD, GA 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.35 NO BID NO BID $3,410.00 / 1 YR                                                            

$3,751.00 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 PVS TECHNOLOGIES, 
INC.

DETROIT, MI 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.27 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID

 CARBPURE 
TECHNOLOGIES

GREENWOOD 
VILLAGE, CO 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.874 / 1 YR                                                   
$0.874 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 SHANNON 
CHEMICAL 

CORPORTION

MALVERN, PA 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7,828.77 / 1 YR
$8,324.57 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 BRENNTAG 
SOUTHWEST

LANCASTER, TX 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.1629 NO BID $3,396.2200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 AMCHEM, INC

LONGVIEW, TX 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,883.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12

 99.5% Anhydrous 
Ammonia 

19% Aqueous 
Ammonia

Price/Lb if truckload 
deviates from35,000 to 

50,000 Lb

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%)
for BPUB WP1 & WP2

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 
25%) as per attached 
specifications (BPUB 

WP1 & WP2)

Sodium Hydroxide 
(Liquid Caustic Soda 

50%) for SRWA

Sodium Hydroxide 
(liquid caustic soda 

25%) as per attached 
specifications 

(SRWA)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(BPUB)

Liquid Chlorine in 
one-ton containers 

(SRWA)

Powdered 
Activated Carbon

Liquid Ammonium 
Sulfate (SRWA)

Sodium Bisulfite 
Solution  (SRWA)

Citric Acid 50% 
Solution for SRWA 

(330 Gal/Tote)

Low Manganese or 
Standard Drinking 
Water Grade Ferric 
Chloride Solution 

for SRWA

Calcium Chloride 
Solution    
(SRWA)

Service Contract to 
provide Chlorine 

Dioxide
(BPUB WP1 & 

WP2)

Sodium Chlorite 
(SRWA)

100,000 Pounds 120,000 Pounds 650,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds 220,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons 240,000 Pounds 310,000 Pounds 190,000 Pounds 30 (330-Gal Totes) 175,000 Pounds 2,110,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 200,000 Pounds

ITEM #3 ITEM #4

 THORNTON, MUSSO 
& BELLEMIN                                                  

ZACHARY, LA 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,280.00 / 1 YR                         

$3,720.00 / 2 YR NO BID NO BID $0.913 / 1 YR                                     
$0.913 / 2 YR

$0.78 / 1 YR
$0.78 / 2 YR

 SKYHAWK 
CHEMICALS                                                  

HOUSTON, TX 
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.29 NO BID NO BID

 DPC INDUSTRIES

CORPUS CHRISTI, TX 
NO BID NO BID $0.2729 $0.1645 $0.2729 $0.1645 $2,359.00 $2,359.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

 DIANE SOLITAIRE 

 APPROVED BY: ___________________________________________________________________________ 
7/7/2023


	BID TABULATION 

