O ey

BROWNSVYVYILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B041-23 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL INVENTORY MATERIAL
DATE AND TIME: JUNE 8. 2023 - 2:30 PM
TRAYER PRIESTER TEXAS
DlS%?SE?ION ENGINEERING | TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY ELECTRIC nggs[)?\igik
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
E0002-00 | 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $97.75 NOBID $67.30 $122.21 $72.00 NO BID
E0005-00 150 | $117.35 NO BID NO BID $122.00 NO BID $110.00 $117.45 $125.00 NO BID
E0006-00 | 200 |  $4.48 NO BID NO BID $12.23 $3.80 $10.50 $11.20 $10.50 NO BID
£0007-00 10 | $27116 NO BID NOBID $297.00 $319.15 $254.80 $186.66 $256.48 NO BID
E0008-00 | 400 |  $10.54 NO BID NO BID $19.03 NO BID $12.10 $12.94 $13.50 NO BID
E0009-00 50 $5.51 NO BID NOBID $6.47 $6.50 $6.65 $6.47 NO BID NO BID
E0010-00 [ 300 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $12.69 NO BID NO BID $11.17 $10.45 NO BID
g)‘g:‘(’)'_’olo 300 | $9.07 NO BID NO BID $12.48 NO BID $10.40 $13.52 NO BID NO BID
E0012-00 | 500 |  $99.94 NO BID NO BID $117.28 NO BID $100.50 $113.84 $107.75 NO BID
Option 1
Ecol200 | 500 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $194.50 $87.50 $100.60 $103.65 $107.75 NO BID
E0012-01 50 | $116.50 NO BID NO BID $220.03 NO BID $116.40 $124.46 $124.50 NO BID
tion | '

g)%;‘;_‘o] 50 | $169.25 NO BID NO BID $382.80 $97.00 $169.15 $182.17 $182.15 NO BID
E0013-00 | 300 |  $20.67 NOBID NO BID $21.30 $19.95 $17.50 $23.98 $25.50 NOBID
E0014-00 | 500 |  $2.00 NO BID NO BID $2.40 $2.79 $2.50 $2.61 $2.75 NO BID




' DIST\YKI?SlCJ(T)I ON ENé;(I\?EYEiI}NG TRASTAR.INC.| TECHLINE PI;RAIIELSIT [;LR KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY ElTEEgl/}RSIC TESS ?)]I\SA\I;:ITCEER
_ CORP. NICHOLSON - COOPERATIVES
| SANANTONIO, TX [SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX | GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
__POMMODITY QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
E0015-00 150 $2.50 NO BID NO BID $8.30 NO BID $3.65 $3.84 $3.70 NO BID
E0016-00 100 $3.90 NO BID NO BID $9.90 $3.00 $4.40 $7.21 $7.00 NO BID
E0017-00 200 $4.42 NO BID NO BID $5.40 $5.15 $3.05 $3.61 $3.50 NO BID
E0018-00 200 $8.70 NO BID NO BID $8.50 $4.93 $3.50 $3.17 $10.00 NO BID
E0020-00 1,500 $8.47 NO BID NO BID $9.90 $8.82 $9.60 $10.21 NO BID NO BID
E0021-00 300 $16.68 NO BID NO BID $29.00 $11.75 $11.20 $14.65 $19.50 NO BID
E0022-00 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.30 $1.17 $1.40 $1.21 NO BID NO BID
E0023-00 200 $3.52 NO BID NO BID $8.70 NO BID $4.03 $4.44 $4.50 NO BID
E0024-00 300 $43.18 NO BID NO BID $73.10 $54.70 $46.80 $44.17 $53.10 NO BID
E0025-00 150 $12.30 NO BID NO BID $20.20 $11.38 $13.90 $14.72 $14.75 NO BID
E0026-00 300 $5.12 NO BID NO BID $13.50 $5.35 $5.90 $6.29 $7.80 NOBID
E0026-01 150 $11.21 NO BID NO BID $51.99 $9.50 $18.75 $19.97 $19.00 NO BID
E0027-00 150 $5.32 NO BID NO BID $19.80 $4.50 $14.90 $15.87 $15.00 NO BID
E0028-00 3,000 $5.23 NO BID NO BID $0.40 NO BID NO BID $0.34 $0.40 NO BID
E0029-00 6,000 $8.94 NO BID NO BID $0.70 NO BID NO BID $0.62 $0.65 NO BID
E0030-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.60 NO BID $8.50 $11.66 $9.15 NO BID
E0031-00 400 $5.27 NO BID NO BID $7.90 NO BID $11.30 $6.52 $6.50 NO BID
E0041-00 50 $84.31 NO BID NO BID $152.70 $71.48 $108.60 $115.86 $109.00 NO BID




Dlsrﬁgﬁ% on ENZEI\(J)A%EI}NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE Nl:rglgglng KBS ELECTRIC| IRBY UTILITY cog%gféﬁ . TESS?)EA\?CE:R
SAN ANTONIO, TX [SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON, TX |SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0049-00 200 $481 | NOBID NO BID $12.40 $4.10 $8.06 $8.60 $8.50 NO BID
E0100-00 150 $1.51 NO BID NO BID $2.60 $1.45 $1.65 $1.99 $2.20 NO BID
 E010100  |2000]  $183 NO BID NO BID $2.94 $1.65 $2.00 $2.15 $2.30 NO BID
E0102-00 500 $2.04 NO BID NO BID $3.30 $1.90 $2.35 $2.57 $2.71 NO BID
E0104-00 100 $2.75 NO BID NO BID $5.43 $2.15 $3.30 $4.73 $3.35 NO BID
E0107-00 20 $4.00 NO BID NO BID $10.74 $3.15 $4.40 $10.20 $9.75 NO BID
E0110-00 100 $3.91 NO BID NO BID $8.43 $3.63 $4.20 $4.96 $5.77 NO BID
E0111-00 100 $4.30 NO BID NO BID $10.23 $4.00 $4.50 $5.75 $7.00 NO BID
E0119-00 50 $4.27 NO BID NO BID $9.14 $3.88 $4.03 $6.05 $5.00 NO BID
E0120-00 50 $4.88 NO BID NO BID $9.23 $4.75 $4.90 $6.45 $5.55 NO BID
E0121-00 100 $5.44 NO BID NO BID $17.13 $4.94 $10.60 $9.37 $8.55 NO BID
E0125-00 200 $0.97 NO BID NO BID $1.70 $0.37 $1.10 $1.25 $1.25 NO BID
E0128-00 300 $2.46 NO BID NO BID $4.05 NO BID $3.45 $3.01 $2.95 NO BID
E0133-00 100 $6.98 NO BID NO BID $13.33 $3.95 $8.60 $7.84 $8.15 NO BID
E0135-00  [1,500|  $1.01 NO BID NOBID $2.15 NO BID $1.20 $1.26 $1.30 NO BID
E0136-00 200 $1.06 NO BID NO BID $3.90 $1.29 $1.80 $2.97 $2.85 NO BID
E0I138-00  [3,000|  $0.54 NO BID NO BID $0.73 $0.38 $0.69 $0.77 $0.75 NO BID
E0139-00  |1,500|  $0.26 NO BID NO BID $0.93 $0.23 $0.29 $0.37 $0.50 NO BID
E0140-00  [1,500|  $0.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.03 $2.26 NO BID NO BID
E0142-00 {1,500  $0.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID |  $031 $1.66 NO BID NO BID




' DIS’:‘??;E?I ON EN;:LAEYE[;:{[:NG TRASTAR.INC.| TECHLINE P&ESEE’LR KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY EI.TEEé('?RSIC ngg%?g&EER
, CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
|| SAN ANTONIO, TX |SAN LEANDRO,CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX |  AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX | GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMODITY UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

E0143-00 1,500 $0.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.18 $0.89 NO BID NO BID
E0144-00 1,500 $0.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.24 $0.82 NO BID NO BID
E0149-00 2,000 $0.70 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.95 $2.07 NO BID NO BID
E0195-00 5,000 NO BID NOBID NO BID 0.64/FT NOBID $0.46 $0.61 NO BID NO BID
E0196-00 3,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1.23/ET NO BID $0.48 $0.89 NO BID NO BID
E0198-00 50 $6.83 NO BID NO BID $10.50 $8.43 $9.16 $8.52 $8.00 NO BID
E0375-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.80 $1.63 $1.60 $1.60 NO BID NO BID
E0376-00 50 $2.15 NO BID NOBID $2.60 $2.92 $2.70 $2.66 NO BID NO BID
E0382-00 50 $8.53 NO BID NO BID $17.99 NO BID $8.00 $8.57 $8.00 NO BID
E0385-00 IS $9.60 NO BID NOBID $22.40 NO BID $9.00 $9.62 $9.00 NO BID
E0400-00 200 NOBID NO BID NO BID $4.90 $1.35 $1.45 $1.97 $1.55 NO BID
E0403-00 50 $1.79 NO BID NO BID $2.40 $2.52 $2.36 $2.12 $3.40 NO BID
E0404-00 50 $2.49 NO BID NO BID $3.33 $2.52 $3.20 $2.94 $3.90 NO BID
E0405-00 50 $4.69 NO BID NO BID $5.90 $6.50 $6.10 $5.52 $4.90 NO BID
E0413-00 1,000 $0.71 NO BID NO BID $0.89 $0.86 $0.80 $0.84 $1.00 NO BID
E0414-00 500 $0.71 NO BID NO BID $0.89 $0.93 $0.88 $0.88 $1.05 NO BID
E0415-00 1,000 $0.71 NOBID NO BID $1.10 $1.12 $1.03 $1.07 $1.00 NO BID
E0416-00 1,000 $0.71 NOBID NO BID $1.10 $1.12 $1.03 $0.88 $1.08 NO BID
E0417-00 100 $1.12 NOBID NO BID $1.49 $1.12 $1.40 $1.37 $1.36 NO BID




D]ST‘YjSICJ(T)ION ENéﬁ\?Eg]}NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE P&ELSE & |esELECTRICiRBY UTILITY EITI?()I('?RSIC Tf;‘g%;‘fﬁ"
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO, TX |SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON, TX |SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0418-00  [1,500|  $1.18 NO BID NO BID $1.60 $1.54 $1.50 $1.44 $1.25 NO BID
E0420-00 300 $2.94 NO BID NO BID $3.60 $4.45 $4.15 $3.55 $3.10 NO BID
 E0422:00 200 $4.67 NO BID NO BID $5.70 $6.50 $6.00 $4.52 $3.85 NO BID
E0464-00 500 [  NOBID NO BID NO BID $67.90 NO BID $44.00 $46.92 $54.65 NO BID
E0465-00 150 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $98.00 NO BID NO BID $99.69 NO BID NO BID
E0467-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $152.40 NO BID NO BID $155.55 NO BID NO BID
E0478-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $15.20 NO BID NO BID $15.12 NO BID NO BID
E0479-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $15.40 NO BID NO BID $15.36 NO BID NO BID
E0480-00 300 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $12.30 NO BID NOBID | $15.36 NO BID NO BID
E0481-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $14.99 NO BID NO BID $17.20 NO BID NO BID
E0483-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID NO BID $17.57 NO BID NO BID
E0485-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.10 NO BID NO BID $6.84 NO BID NO BID
E0486-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.10 NO BID NO BID $6.84 NO BID NO BID
E0487-00 100 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.10 NO BID NO BID $6.84 NO BID NO BID
E0488-00 150 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.10 NO BID NO BID $6.84 NO BID NO BID
E0489-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.49 NO BID NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID
E0490-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.49 NO BID NO BID $8.27 NO BID NO BID
E0491-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.60 NO BID NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID
E0492-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $6.60 NOBID NO BID $7.60 NO BID NO BID
E0493-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $11.30 NO BID NO BID $13.32 NO BID NO BID




" S;‘gfgg% o ENgZI:J:%l}NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE NEESSEEN KBS ELECTRIC| IRBY UTILITY cogl}gé(f{lﬁ/ N Tfﬁéf)gffcik
SAN ANTONIO, TX |SAN LEANDRO, CA{ RICHARDSON, TX |SANANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0495-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $11.50 NO BID NO BID $13.32 NO BID NO BID
E0496-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $12.40 NO BID NOBID “| $13.32 NO BID NO BID
E0497-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $20.90 NO BID NO BID $29.76 NO BID NO BID
E0499-00 200 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID $34.30 NO BID NO BID $44.15 NO BID NO BID
E0501-00  |1,500|  $3.88 NO BID NO BID $4.83 $3.97 $4.30 $4.61 $4.50 NO BID
E0505-00 200 | $10.15 NO BID NO BID $14.20 $11.67 $11.35 $12.15 $13.00 NO BID
E0543-00 200 $3.53 NO BID NO BID $7.60 $4.39 $4.75 $4.57 $5.00 NO BID
E0544-00 200 $5.60 NO BID NO BID $11.71 $9.24 $10.05 $9.58 $11.00 NO BID
E0600-00 50 $3.34 NO BID NO BID $4.70 NO BID $4.05 $4.44 NO BID NO BID
E0601-00 400 $3.32 NO BID NO BID $4.01 NO BID $4.10 $3.97 NO BID NO BID
E0602-00 500 i?g(z) NO BID NO BID $3.90 NO BID $4.00 $3.84 NO BID NO BID
E0603-00 200 $3.70 NO BID NO BID $4.40 $5.35 413 | sadl $6.00 NO BID
E0604-00 200 $3.23 NO BID NO BID $3.93 $5.35 $4.10 $3.89 $6.00 NO BID
E0605-00 50 $4.03 NO BID NO BID $4.30 NO BID $4.05 $4.31 NO BID NO BID
E0607-00 50 $3.53 NO BID NO BID $4.30 $5.35 $4.00 $4.27 $6.00 NO BID
E0609-00 100 $3.59 NO BID NO BID $4.21 $5.35 $3.95 $4.25 $6.00 NO BID
E0610-00 100 $3.44 NO BID NO BID $4.15 NO BID $3.90 $4.21 NO BID NO BID
E0613-00 50 $3.22 NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $2.50 $3.94 NO BID NO BID
E0623-00 200 $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.50 NO BID
E0624-00  |1,000]  $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.74 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.50 NO BID




D[ST":SSS(T’[ON ENgmﬁysil}No TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE PSJEELSLT ZR KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY ELTECXQSC Tf;‘S%’E'fER
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO. TX [SANLEANDRO,CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0627-00 200 $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.55 NO BID
E0628-00 200 $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.55 NO BID
E0629-00  [1,500|  $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.50 NO BID
E0630-00  [2,000]  $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 $0.55 NO BID
E0632-00 150 $0.68 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 NO BID NO BID
E0633-00 700 $0.63 NO BID NO BID $0.76 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 NO BID NO BID
E0634-00  |1,500|  $0.63 NOBID NO BID $0.77 $0.72 $0.86 $0.77 NO BID NO BID
E0635-00 300 $0.64 NO BID NO BID $0.77 $0.72 $0.86 $0.79 NO BID NO BID
E0639-00  |1,500|  $0.48 NO BID NO BID $0.58 $0.60 $0.61 $0.66 NO BID NO BID
E0640-00 500 $0.86 NO BID NO BID $1.04 $1.52 $0.98 $0.94 $0.65 NO BID
E0641-00 500 $0.86 NO BID NO BID $1.04 $2.28 $0.98 $0.94 $0.75 NO BID
E0642-00 200 $2.61 NO BID NO BID $1.14 $3.24 $3.40 $1.32 NO BID NO BID
E0650-00 100 $1.65 NO BID NO BID $1.99 NO BID $1.87 $1.97 $1.50 NO BID
E£0652-00 30 $2.01 NO BID NO BID $2.56 $2.90 $2.70 $2.42 $4.00 NO BID
E0670-00 150 $1.87 NO BID NO BID $2.27 $2.82 $2.10 $2.21 NO BID NO BID
E0671-00 50 $8.67 NO BID NO BID $22.96 $9.90 $9.80 $10.61 NO BID NOBID
E0720-00 40 $24.21 NO BID NO BID $47.32 $29.32 $27.10 $48.96 $17.25 NO BID
E0723-00 25 $42.45 NO BID NO BID $53.25 $62.25 §57.50 $54.54 NO BID NO BID
E0724-00 40 $43.02 NO BID NO BID $52.50 $60.50 $55.90 $54.54 NO BID NO BID
E0727-00 100 [ $17.02 NO BID NO BID $21.31 $23.15 $31.15 $20.94 $21.25 NO BID
E0728-00 15 $22.15 NO BID NO BID $24.07 $2442 $33.00 $35.24 $33.15 NO BID




TRAYER PRIESTER TEXAS
: D[S’;YS;EJ’O”ON ENGINEERING | TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY ELECTRIC T/EIZ(S?)EA\EIE%R
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
Rt e WA B _ SAN ANTONIO, TX |SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

E0730-00 50 $40.39 NO BID NO BID $49.28 $63.38 $57.70 $49.61 $43 .40 NO BID

E0731-00 150 | $65.15 NO BID NO BID $79.34 $90.75 $83.90 $79.92 $117.00 NO BID

E0740-01 100 $2.86 NO BID NO BID $3.66 NO BID $4.00 $3.52 NO BID NO BID

E0744-00 10 $13.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.25 $6.48 $9.75 NO BID

E0796-00 50 $33.32 NO BID NO BID $40.66 $62.90 $58.10 $40.65 NO BID NO BID

E0797-00 50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $81.81 NO BID NO BID

E0900-00 300 | $84.45 NO BID NO BID ::i;g NO BID $80.70 $107.07 $98.50 NO BID

E0903-00  |1,000| NOBID NO BID NO BID iig'gz NO BID $34.00 $36.21 NO BID NO BID
$234.84

E0904-00 50 | $23435 NO BID NO BID o NO BID $247.00 $264.32 NO BID NO BID

£0904-01 30 | $155.05 NO BID NO BID :11 g:;g NO BID $122.80 $131.01 NO BID NO BID
$379.85

E£0907-00 10 | $365.20 NO BID NO BID pedins NO BID $420.40 $448.42 NO BID NO BID
$230.54

E0908-00 100 | $238.05 NO BID NO BID SCyh NO BID $181.10 $193.17 NO BID NO BID

E0909-00 20 | $186.62 NO BID NO BID zzzgg NO BID $211.40 $225.52 $212.00 NO BID
$438.32

£0909-01 60 | NOBID NO BID NO BID Shhes NO BID $367.80 $392.32 $417.00 NO BID

E0921-00 | 320 $3.90 NO BID NO BID $3.86 $3.56 $5.00 $3.84 $4.00 NO BID

£0922-00 300 | $9.60 NO BID NO BID $10.82 NO BID $10.15 $10.82 NO BID NO BID

£0922-01 75 | $165.00 NO BID NO BID $72.28 NO BID $67.80 $7221 NO BID NO BID

E0924-00 | 300 |  $33.61 NO BID NO BID :32'33 NO BID $31.90 $34.17 NO BID NO BID
$101.40

£0925-00 200 | $93.57 NO BID NO BID 0000 NO BID $87.50 $93.21 $136.00 NO BID




D!snﬁgg%ow ENE?I\?E\;ZE(}:NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE P&IEELSLT 0 KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY EEEC)S(?RS]C T/E;(S?)IEA\EEIE%R
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO, TX | SANLEANDRO, CA{ RICHARDSON, TX [SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX I GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0926-00 600 |  $17.72 NO BID NO BID $27.49 NO BID $27.50 NO BID $29.50 NO BID
E0927-00 150 | $26.34 NO BID NO BID $43.33 $3.56 $79.00 $41.95 $84.30 NO BID
E£0932-00 150 $7.48 NO BID NO BID $8.99 $11.45 $12.40 $21.57 $50.75 NO BID
 E0933.00 1,000  $12.07 NO BID NO BID $16.27 $12.82 $13.95 $25.25 $24.70 NO BID
E0933-01 500 | $21.06 NO BID NO BID $33.50 $20.84 $22.70 $36.42 $37.90 NO BID
E0934-00  [1,000]  $5.12 NO BID NO BID $6.02 §550 |  $6.10 $IL11 $6.25 NO BID
E0936-00 30 | NOBID NO BID NO BID :g;‘:g NO BID $42.00 $44.74 NO BID NO BID
E0937-00  |1,000|  $47.80 NO BID NO BID :gg:gg NO BID $33.50 $43.49 $22.75 NO BID
E0939-00 300 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $216.78 NO BID NO BID $315.17 NO BID NO BID
E0942-00 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $17.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-01 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $17.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-02 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $17.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-03 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $17.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-04 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.00 $17.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-05 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 $19.17 NO BID NO BID
E0942-06 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.50 $18.66 NO BID NO BID
E0942-07 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.70 $25.22 NO BID NO BID
E0942-08 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.70 $25.22 NO BID NO BID
E0943-00 10 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $253.00 $269.84 NO BID NOBID
£0945-00 200 | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $462.00 $509.84 NO BID NO BID




WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

TRAYER
ENGINEERING
CORP.

TRASTAR. INC.

TECHLINE

PRIESTER
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NICHOLSON

KBS ELECTRIC

IRBY UTILITY

TEXAS
ELECTRIC
COOPERATIVES

TEXAS METER
AND DEVICE

_. SAN ANTONIO, TX | SANLEANDRO,CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SANANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BUC[TY | _ ) UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
E0945-02 50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $851.60 $939.66 NO BID NO BID
E0946-00 | 200 | NOBID NO BID NO BID 2;'1:23 NO BID $51.80 $55.10 NO BID NO BID
E0948-00 | 300 |  $31530 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $315.00 $345.84 $357.50 NO BID
E0948-01 300 | $278.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $278.80 $305.84 $316.00 NO BID
F0948-02 100 | $115.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $111.80 $123.66 $130.00 NO BID
E0948-03 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $167.00 $183.61 $190.00 NO BID
E0959-00 100 | $105.50 NO BID NO BID $88.19 NO BID $116.20 $103.17 NO BID NO BID
E0960-00  |1,500|  $12.10 NO BID NO BID $21.10 $12.79 $13.90 NO BID $14.00 NO BID
E0963-00 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $431.90 $460.66 $370.00 NO BID
E0965-00 | 300 |  $46.25 NO BID NO BID $50.59 $61.00 $52.35 $36.41 $55.85 NO BID
E0965-01 100 |  $850 NO BID NO BID $10.54 $12.08 $7.80 $8.17 $7.40 NO BID
E0965-02 150 | $10.20 NO BID NO BID $10.54 $12.68 $9.35 $9.92 $11.20 NO BID
E0966-00 | 100 |  $9.40 NO BID NO BID $11.19 $13.98 $9.60 $9.27 $9.25 NO BID
E0967-00 | 100 |  $13.10 NO BID NO BID $14.04 $17.49 $14.85 $15.27 $12.65 NO BID
E0968-00 20 | $166.90 NO BID NO BID $157.82 NO BID $172.20 $123.61 $180.05 NO BID
E0970-00 30 ﬁ?:? fgo NO BID NOBID | $1,86200 | NOBID $843.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
gg;%?olo 20 | $1,20190 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | $1,121.00 | $1,28400 | $1,282.00 NO BID
$1,699.30
E0973-00 50 | $1.4590 | NOBID NOBID | $2,07200 | NOBID | $1,186.25 | NOBID NO BID NO BID
$1,340.00
$2.254.10
E0974-00 20 | $2,001.10 | NOBID NOBID | $271800 | NOBID | $1,627.50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID

$1,840.00




DlS”F;/:ng?l o ENémEgl}NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE PSISLT ZR KBS ELECTRIC|[RBY UTILITY ELTE():(TAESIC Tf;‘g%g‘ffgg
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E0975-00 60 | $165.00 NO BID NO BID $27.07 NO BID $42.00 $29.33 $42.00 NO BID
E0984-00 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.56 NO BID $5.00 $19.70 $4.00 NO BID
E0984-01 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.00 $31.17 NO BID NO BID
E0985-00 50 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.00 $24.47 NO BID NO BID
E0986-00 50 | NOBID NO BID NO BID $140.46 NO BID $175.40 $153.61 NO BID NO BID
E0986-01 100 | $214.25 NO BID NO BID $180.59 NO BID $241.00 $211.07 NO BID NO BID
E0987-00 100 | NOBID NOBID NO BID $19.86 $18.92 NO BID $21.69 NO BID NO BID
E0990-00 150 $7.65 NOBID NO BID NO BID $8.15 $8.80 $19.91 $10.00 NO BID
E0995-00 30 $13.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.85 $15.06 $26.97 $18.00 NO BID
E1010-00 50 | $216.55 NOBID NO BID $458.00 NO BID $235.50 $251.21 $236.00 NO BID
E1011-00 50 $46.45 NO BID NO BID $88.76 $24.40 $50.50 $58.84 $51.00 NO BID
E1012-00 50 $72.75 NO BID NO BID $146.00 NO BID $79.10 $84.84 $79.50 NO BID
E1013-00 50 $87.35 NO BID NO BID $181.00 NO BID $95.00 $101.32 $95.00 NO BID
E1014-00 50 | $120.10 NO BID NO BID $216.00 NO BID $130.60 $139.33 $131.00 NO BID
E1019-00 30 | $262.55 NO BID NO BID $408.00 NO BID $439.00 $411.21 $254.00 NO BID
E1024-00 100 | $26.00 NO BID NO BID $110.00 $28.20 $46.75 $49.87 $47.00 NO BID
E1031-00 30 | $760.50 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $956.00 | $1,020.27 NO BID NO BID
E1031-01 10 | $1,095.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,339.00 | $1,428.32 NO BID NO BID
E1031-02 10 zggg:gg NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $803.00 $857.07 NO BID NOBID
E1033-00 3 $397.50 NO BID NO BID L NO BID NO BID $397.77 NO BID NO BID

$377.92




DlS'I\}I/l?gEJ?'I ON EN-CF}ZT\([}:%E}NG TRASTAR. INC.[ TECHLINE Nfggglggbj KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY Cog[;[gé(fii% o T,E;I(S?)I[\-ZA\I;:IEEER
- | SAN ANTONIO, TX |SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX |  AUSTIN, TX BASTROP,TX | GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY ” QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E1037-00 400 $15.50 NO BID NO BID $25.55 NO BID $17.70 $19.17 $18.00 NO BID
E1038-00 50 $16.20 NO BID NO BID $27.53 NO BID $18.40 $19.66 $18.50 NO BID
E1039-00 150 $27.25 NO BID NO BID $35.19 NO BID $31.00 $33.21 $31.00 NO BID
E1050-00 150 $169.80 NO BID NO BID $189.00 NO BID $164.00 $187.61 $175.00 NO BID
E1051-00 100 $212.80 NO BID NO BID $224.00 NO BID $205.00 $234.57 $220.00 NO BID
E1059-00 100 $26.00 NO BID NO BID $39.82 NO BID $27.30 $36.42 $33.00 NO BID
E1075-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,262.50 $2,414.41 NO BID NO BID
E1075-01 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,339.00 $1,428.32 NO BID NO BID
E1083-00 150 $5.15 NO BID NO BID $21.08 $4.88 $11.40 $12.21 $10.00 NO BID
E1085-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7,799.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1094-00 10 $8.40 NO BID NO BID $48.30 $7.93 $25.90 $41.40 $26.00 NO BID
E1098-00 288 NO BID NO BID NO BID $136.47 $143.75 $157.50 $166.17 NO BID NO BID
E1098-01 288 NO BID NO BID NO BID $62.35 $69.00 $76.25 $84.84 NO BID NO BID
E1145-00 200 $35.50 NO BID NO BID $39.67 NO BID NO BID $46.21 NO BID NO BID
E1202-00 10 $96.90 NO BID NO BID $51.55 NO BID NO BID $107.97 $115.00 NO BID
E1203-00 50 $100.05 NO BID NO BID $64.79 NO BID $108.80 $106.84 $95.00 NO BID
E1207-00 150 $66.95 NO BID NO BID $67.44 NO BID NO BID $83.83 $75.00 NO BID
E1239-00 150 $157.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
E1240-00 200 $11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.20 $21.21 NO BID NO BID
E1241-00 50 $13.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.50 $19.19 NO BID NO BID




D]ST\I;/QlliglCJ(T?l ON ENZ?I?{;YE%NG TRASTAR. INC.| TECHLINE P&?LSJ ELR KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY EEE?‘?RSIC Tfﬁg%;‘f&?
; CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
)| SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX [SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN., TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

E1242-01 3,500(  $32.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.10 $23.40 $28.40 $24.50 NO BID
E1243-01 100 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $36.05 $38.20 $46.35 $44.00 NO BID
E1259-00 30 [ NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1365-00  {1,000(  $4.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.65
E1366-00  |1,000]  $3.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.58
E1367-00  [1,000|  $5.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.38
E1368-00  [1,000|  $7.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.94
E1369-00 1,000|  $0.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.24
E0969-01 6 NO BID $39,984.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E0972-01 5 NO BID $38,102.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1219-02 100 | $203.70 NO BID NO BID $211.00 $216.55 $209.00 NO BID $268.00 NO BID
E1220-02 250 | $286.50 NO BID NO BID $294.00 $304.60 $294.40 $348.38 $377.00 NO BID
E1221-02 400 | $540.55 NO BID NO BID $568.19 $574.70 $556.00 $661.84 $698.00 NO BID
E1222-02 400 |  $138.50 NO BID $112.58 $111.77 $147.70 $142.80 $166.61 $183.00 NO BID
E1223-03 150 | $200.00 NO BID $196.85 $203.00 $216.65 $206.00 $257.57 $263.00 NO BID
E1223-04  [2,000] $189.20 NO BID $178.58 $210.00 $201.15 $194.50 $225.84 $249.00 NO BID
E1224-02 150 | $232.45 NO BID $218.00 $232.00 $247.13 $298.40 $280.21 $306.00 NO BID
E1226-01 50 $243.25 NO BID $239.88 $238.00 $258.63 $334.00 $405.17 $320.00 NO BID
E1302-00 12 | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $225.65 NO BID NO BID




. 51}:/1?;8% - ENCT}FI‘?EYEEKTNG TRASTAR, INC.| TECHLINE A e T b EJE??RS]C T:]Z(DA%’E"EITCEER
b CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
. “ SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
E1303-00 2 | $119.60 NO BID NO BID $126.32 NO BID NO BID $121.21 NO BID NO BID
E1305-00 20 | $178.30 NO BID NO BID $188.32 NO BID NO BID $257.66 NO BID NO BID
E130600  [1,064] NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $74.21 NO BID NO BID
E1307-00 16 | $208.00 NO BID NO BID $219.67 NO BID NO BID $271.15 NO BID NO BID
E1307-01 12 | $260.30 NO BID NO BID $274.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1307-02 48 | $194.00 NO BID NO BID $205.87 NO BID NO BID $344.26 NO BID NO BID
E1308-00  [3,000]  $37.90 NO BID NO BID $39.99 NO BID NO BID $50.52 NO BID NO BID
E1309-00 12 $68.40 NO BID NO BID $72.27 NO BID NO BID $175.00 NO BID NO BID
E1312-00 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1312-02 8 | $1,093.15 NO BID NO BID $1,155.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1313-00 120 | $227.25 NO BID NO BID $240.00 NO BID NO BID $259.84 NO BID NO BID
E1314-00 168 | $227.25 NO BID NO BID $240.00 NO BID NO BID $266.17 NO BID NO BID
E1315-00 60 |  $220.50 NO BID NO BID $232.88 NO BID NO BID $269.65 NO BID NO BID
E1316-00 400 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $161.66 NO BID NO BID
E1317-01 12 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1321-00 8 $119.60 NO BID NO BID $333.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
E1323-00 40 | $119.60 NO BID NO BID $126.32 NO BID NO BID $225.64 NO BID NO BID
E1326-00 24 | $178.15 NO BID NO BID $188.17 NO BID NO BID $275.17 NO BID NO BID
E1327-00 8 $469.30 NO BID NO BID $495.67 NOBID NO BID $317.17 NO BID NO BID
OPTIONAL - REFURBISHED - CERTIFIED ELECTRIC METER

E1302-00 12 $129.00 NO BID




DIANE SOLITAIRE

TRAYER PRIESTER TEXAS
DIST“E/K?;CJ?ION ENGINEERING | TRASTAR.INC.| TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC|IRBY UTILITY ELECTRIC TEL(S%?\EE;R
CORP. NICHOLSON COOPERATIVES
SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN LEANDRO, CA| RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX [ SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX WACO, TX
BPUBCOMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE
E1303-00 42 $53.00 NO BID
E1305-00 20 $129.00 $75.00
E1306-00 1,064 $42.00 $27.00
E1307-00 16 $164.00 $100.00
E1307-01 12 $79.00 $100.00
E1307-02 48 NO BID $120.00
E1308-00  [3,000 $32.00 $21.00
E 1309-00 12 $32.00 $30.00
E1312-00 8 NO BID NO BID
E1312-02 8 NO BID NO BID
E1313-00 120 $216.50 $140.00
E1314-00 168 $216.50 $140.00
E1315-00 60 $244.00 $140.00
E1316-00 400 $81.50 NO BID
E1317-01 12 $301.50 $160.00
E1321-00 8 $216.50 $140.00
E1323-00 40 $96.50 NO BID
E1326-00 24 $164.00 $100.00
E1327-00 8 $129.00 $140.00
2. - =
APPROVEDBY: ___ A é a‘ 3 9093






