BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B040-23 ANNUAL TOOL SUPPLY
OPENING DATE & TIME: JUNE 15, 2023 AT 10:00 AM

cemstamrons. [ 'ees s T s weren
WORKS

; . CORPUS CHRISTL TX SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX WACO. TX
I;%M COMMODITY QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

| TO001-00 15 $51.38 $57.84 $48.35 $46.70

2 T0003-00 3 $5341 $68.58 $50.27 $48.56

3 T0004-00 10 $40.70 $52.26 $38.30 $37.00

4 T0005-00 15 $15.76 $27.63 $14.90 $14.33

5 T0C006-00 40 $594.91 $52.26 $399.00 $394.16

6 T0007-00 10 $20.56 $27.63 $19.35 $18.69

7 TO008-00 20 $71.01 $572.04 $66.85 $66.60

8 TOO10-00 10 $49.94 $23.15 $47.00 $45.40

9 TOO11-00 20 $23.65 $78.55 $22.25 $21.50

10 T0012-00 35 $31.33 $59.19 $29.50 $28.48

11 T0013-00 30 $11.56 $30.37 $10.90 $10.51

12 T0014-00 20 $8.08 $35.27 $7.60 $7.34

13 T0015-00 25 $27.28 $12.79 $25.75 $24.80

14 T0016-00 20 $8.78 $9.09 $8.30 $7.98

15 TC017-00 20 $6.60 $32.33 $6.25 $6.00




TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY

- S5 DlSTg?UTORS' LLC dbz::éé&ll(\go [RON TECHLINE. INC TEX%?E%EEER &
gt CORPUS CHRISTL, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX WACO. TX
I;E:)M COMMODITY QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
16 T0018-00 20 $23.66 $30.38 $22.30 $21.51
17 T0O019-00 20 $5.68 $7.29 $5.35 $5.16
18 T0020-00 20 $28.40 $33.66 $27.00 $25.82
19 T0021-00 5 $6.75 $7.56 $5.75 $5.11
20 T0022-00 10 NO BID NO BID $13.50 $13.15
21 T0023-00 20 $29.33 $33.02 $27.75 $26.66
22 T0024-00 20 $48.29 $57.23 $45.50 $43.90
23 T0025-00 25 NO BID $35.30 $30.25 $29.01
24 T0026-00 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.52
25 T0027-00 15 $8.95 $10.61 $9.00 $8.14
26 T0028-00 20 $7.20 $8.53 $7.00 $6.55
27 T0029-00 10 $7.20 $8.53 $7.00 $6.55
*28 T0030-00 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $113.99
29 T0031-00 10 $11.49 $13.61 $11.25 $10.44
30 T0032-00 10 NO BID NO BID $510.00 $612.10
31 T0033-00 15 NO BID NO BID $169.00 $166.69
32 TO033-01 15 NO BID NO BID $26.00 $22.60
33 T0034-00 15 NO BID $8.53 $62.00 $66.58
34 T0035-00 25 NOBID NO BID $17.50 $16.58
*35 T0036-00 40 NO BID $13.61 NO BID $512.38
36 T0037-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY

t': 5 ce DIS'I;RNIC]%UTORS' LLC dbwgﬁgo IRON TECHLINE. INC TEX?)SE?]EEER &

iz CORPUS CHRISTI. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX WACO. TX

[EE(:)M COMMODITY QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
37 T0038-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
*38 T0039-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.83
39 T0040-00 20 $3199 $41.07 $30.25 $29.08
40 T0042-00 20 $26.74 $30.10 $25.25 $24.31
41 T0043-00 15 $43.55 $55.92 $41.00 $39.59
42 T0044-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $291.44
43 T0045-00 5 NO BID NO BID $92.00 $84.27
44 T0046-00 5 NO BID NO BID $499.00 3498 .88
45 T0046-01 5 NO BID NO BID $499.00 $498 .88
46 T0046-02 5 NO BID NO BID $499.00 $498.88
47 TO0046-03 15 NO BID NO BID $499.00 $498.88
48 T0046-04 5 NO BID NO BID $499.00 $498.88
49 T0047-00 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.09
50 T0048-00 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $118.09
51 T0049-00 10 $221.20 $124.31 NO BID $114.42
52 T0049-01 20 $221.20 $124 .31 NO BID $114.42
53 T0049-02 20 $221.20 $124.31 NO BID $114.42
54 T0049-03 15 $221.20 $124.31 NO BID $114.42
55 T0049-04 15 $226.15 $127.09 NO BID $117.76
56 T0049-05 10 $231.08 $129.86 NO BID $121.11
57 T0049-06 5 $236.03 $132.64 NO BID $124.44




TRIPLE § STEEL SUPPLY

i CCDISTRIBUTORS. 1 'wLie da ALAMORON | TECHLINE. INC TEXAS MRS

T N CORPUS CHRISTL TX SAN ANTONIO. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX WACO. TX

':'gf‘ COMMODITY | QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
*58 T0050-00 50 $59.99 $59.25 NO BID $38.64
*59 T0050-01 100 $59.99 $59.25 NO BID $38.64
*60 T0050-02 100 $59.99 $59.25 NO BID $38.64
%61 T0050-03 75 36324 $62.46 NO BID $40.91
“62 T0050-04 50 $66.61 $65.79 NO BID $40.9]
*63 T0050-05 25 $69.86 $69.00 NO BID $40.91
64 T0051-00 100 NO BID NO BID $179.00 $153.08
65 T0051-01 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
66 T0052-00 5 NO BID NO BID $379.00 $373.16
67 T0052-01 10 NO BID NO BID $379.00 $373.16
63 T0052-02 I5 NO BID NO BID $379.00 $373.16
69 T0052-03 15 NO BID NO BID $379.00 $373.16
70 T0052-04 5 NO BID NO BID $414.00 $409.38
71 T0052-05 5 NO BID NO BID $414.00 $409.38
72 T0053-00 40 NO BID NO BID $105.00 $98 82
73 T0054-00 10 NO BID NO BID $350.00 $300.56
74 T0054-01 10 NO BID NO BID $890.00 $368.31
75 T0055-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.52

APPROVED BY: W 6203

DIANE SOLITAIRE




