



BROWNSVILLE  
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD  
BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B030-23 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF GENERAL INVENTORY STOCK  
BID OPENING DATE/TIME: APRIL 13, 2023 -10:00 AM

				SECURITY SAFETY & SUPPLY	* C & S SAFETY SUPPLY	INDEPENDENT HARDWARE, INC.	TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC	STAPLES	XPRESS EXPORT CORPORATION	TECHLINE INC	CAPP INC	TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY LLC DBA ALAMO IRON WORKS	WESCO	GATEWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.	CC DISTRIBUTORS INC.	CORE & MAIN LP	* R.S. HUGHES CO INC	QUIPCO GLOBAL INC.
				HOUSTON, TX	MCALLEN, TX	PHILADELPHIA, PA	WACO, TX	FRAMINGHAM, MA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	EDINBURG, TX	CORPUS CHRISTI, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	MCALLEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM #	STOCK #	QTY	UM	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
1	G0300-00	144	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.16	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.50	NO BID	\$4.01	\$3.19	NO BID	\$3.39	NO BID	\$4.44	\$44.99
2	G0301-00	1200	BX	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.50	\$11.88	\$0.49	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.96	NO BID	\$7.20	NO BID	\$13.34/CA 10LBS	NO BID
3	G0302-00	1500	PR	NO BID	\$8.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.34	NO BID	\$9.13	NO BID	\$9.90	\$2.59
4	G0302-01	800	PR	NO BID	\$8.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.13	NO BID	\$9.13	NO BID	\$9.90	\$2.89
5	G0303-00	900	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.35	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.26	\$10.75	\$7.16	\$6.72	NO BID	\$8.04	NO BID	\$7.92	\$9.49
6	G0303-01	96	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.94	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.73	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7	G0304-00	24	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.95	NO BID	\$11.78	\$21.52	NO BID	\$15.71	NO BID	\$14.47	\$17.25
8	G0305-00	200	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.25	\$4.82	NO BID	\$10.95	NO BID	\$8.46	\$7.94	\$7.29	\$6.23	NO BID	\$9.36	\$17.99
9	G0306-00	500	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.72	NO BID	\$13.50	\$8.75	\$6.16	\$6.47	\$7.32	\$5.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.00
10	G0307-00	600	CAN	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.90	\$12.36	\$8.59	\$6.51	NO BID	\$7.09	\$8.99
11	G0308-00	300	CAN	\$3.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.13	\$3.13	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.99
12	G0309-00	310	EA	\$4.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.16	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.23	\$3.59	NO BID	\$3.79	NO BID	\$10.48	\$25.99
13	G0310-00	604	EA	\$0.98	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.00	NO BID	\$1.35	NO BID	\$0.93	\$0.80	\$2.62	\$0.95	NO BID	\$0.79	\$2.99
14	G0311-00	400	EA	\$1.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.00	NO BID	\$2.00	NO BID	\$1.26	\$1.27	\$3.00	\$1.06	NO BID	\$1.26	\$2.99
15	G0312-00	500	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$18.50	NO BID	\$15.16	\$1.87	NO BID	\$1.46	NO BID	\$1.67	NO BID
16	G0313-00	300	EA	\$1.85	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.00	NO BID	\$3.00	NO BID	\$1.80	\$1.53	\$3.15	\$1.46	NO BID	\$1.57	\$2.99
17	G0314-00	504	EA	\$1.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.75	\$4.65	NO BID	\$4.50	\$4.50	\$1.58	\$0.93	NO BID	\$1.07	NO BID	\$1.10	\$2.99
18	G0315-00	800	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.38	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$27.03	\$36.99
19	G0316-00	460	EA	\$12.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.60	NO BID	\$20.50	\$14.25	\$10.88	\$11.93	NO BID	\$11.48	NO BID	\$13.85	NO BID
20	G0317-00	100	EA	\$6.61	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	\$9.75	\$5.88	\$5.10	NO BID	\$7.94	NO BID	\$68.34	NO BID
21	G0318-00	48	EA	\$2.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.26	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.62	\$3.40	NO BID	\$3.07	NO BID	\$2.91	\$4.85
22	G0318-01	36	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.80	NO BID	\$16.50	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.45	NO BID	\$5.16	NO BID	\$9.32	\$8.49
23	G0319-01	240	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID	\$20.48	\$20.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.66	NO BID
24	G0319-02	288	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID	\$20.48	\$20.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.66	NO BID
25	G0319-03	340	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID	\$20.48	\$20.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.66	NO BID
26	G0319-04	240	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.00	NO BID	\$21.69	\$21.18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID
27	G0319-05	120	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$27.00	NO BID	\$22.89	\$22.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.33	NO BID
28	G0319-06	12	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	NO BID	\$24.10	\$23.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.66	NO BID
29	G0319-07	24	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	NO BID	\$24.10	\$23.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.66	NO BID

				SECURITY SAFETY & SUPPLY	* C & S SAFETY SUPPLY	INDEPENDENT HARDWARE, INC.	TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC	STAPLES	XPRESS EXPORT CORPORATION	TECHLINE INC	CAPP INC	TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY LLC DBA ALAMO IRON WORKS	WESCO	GATEWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.	CC DISTRIBUTORS INC.	CORE & MAIN LP	* R.S. HUGHES CO INC	QUIPCO GLOBAL INC.
				HOUSTON, TX	MCALLEN, TX	PHILADELPHIA, PA	WACO, TX	FRAMINGHAM, MA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	EDINBURG, TX	CORPUS CHRISTI, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	MCALLEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM #	STOCK #	QTY	UM	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
30	G0319-08	24	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	NO BID	\$24.10	\$23.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.66	NO BID
31	G0319-09	24	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	NO BID	\$24.10	\$23.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.66	NO BID
32	G0319-10	24	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.00	NO BID	\$25.30	\$24.71	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.00	NO BID
33	G0319-11	24	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	NO BID	\$26.51	\$25.88	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.33	NO BID
34	G0319-13	12	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.00	NO BID	\$29.52	\$28.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.66	NO BID
35	G0320-00	48	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.25	\$6.95	\$6.95	NO BID	\$7.40	NO BID	\$7.21	\$11.88
36	G0320-01	48	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.25	\$6.95	\$6.95	NO BID	\$7.40	NO BID	\$7.21	\$11.88
37	G0320-02	100	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.50	\$6.95	\$6.95	NO BID	\$7.40	NO BID	\$7.21	\$11.88
38	G0320-03	120	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.50	\$6.95	\$6.95	NO BID	\$7.40	NO BID	\$7.21	\$11.88
39	G0320-04	100	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.50	\$6.95	\$7.43	NO BID	\$7.40	NO BID	\$7.21	\$14.50
40	G0320-05	60	EA	\$7.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.50	\$7.43	\$7.43	NO BID	\$7.91	NO BID	\$7.21	\$14.50
41	G0321-00	36	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
42	G0321-01	60	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
43	G0321-02	108	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
44	G0321-03	180	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
45	G0321-04	180	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
46	G0321-05	180	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$49.99
47	G0321-06	36	PR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
48	G0321-07	36	PR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
49	G0321-08	36	PR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
50	G0321-09	36	PR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
51	G0321-10	36	PR	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
52	G0321-11	60	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$145.83	\$99.99
53	G0321-12	48	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$83.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$99.99
54	G0321-13	12	PR	\$68.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$89.00	\$70.00	\$66.18	\$58.23	NO BID	\$71.34	NO BID	\$66.20	\$99.99
55	G0322-01	204	EA	\$26.75	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.95	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.50	\$39.00	\$25.76	\$25.76	NO BID	\$37.02	NO BID	\$30.54	\$42.99
56	G0323-00	1920	PR	\$7.25	\$7.65	NO BID	\$6.90	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.50	\$11.50	\$6.89	\$6.43	NO BID	\$6.98	NO BID	\$7.53	NO BID
57	G0323-01	36	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$27.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.37	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
58	G0324-00	96	EA	\$3.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.66	\$77.40	NO BID	\$5.06	NO BID	\$4.30	NO BID
59	G0325-00	3000	PR	\$2.65	\$4.99	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$49.50	NO BID	\$3.66	\$3.55	NO BID	\$2.66	NO BID	\$3.93	\$3.75
60	G0325-01	150	PR	\$11.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.00	\$13.00	NO BID	\$9.12	NO BID	\$14.63	NO BID	\$11.91	NO BID
61	G0325-02	150	PR	\$11.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.00	\$12.00	NO BID	\$9.12	NO BID	\$14.63	NO BID	\$10.66	NO BID
62	G0326-00	6	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.29	\$7.85	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	\$5.82	NO BID
63	G0326-01	30	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.87	\$7.85	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	\$5.82	NO BID
64	G0326-02	16	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.29	\$7.85	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	\$5.82	NO BID
65	G0326-03	12	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.29	\$7.85	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	\$5.82	NO BID
66	G0326-04	6	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.29	\$8.46	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	\$6.30	NO BID

				SECURITY SAFETY & SUPPLY	* C & S SAFETY SUPPLY	INDEPENDENT HARDWARE, INC.	TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC	STAPLES	XPRESS EXPORT CORPORATION	TECHLINE INC	CAPP INC	TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY LLC DBA ALAMO IRON WORKS	WESCO	GATEWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.	CC DISTRIBUTORS INC.	CORE & MAIN LP	* R.S. HUGHES CO INC	QUIPCO GLOBAL INC.
				HOUSTON, TX	MCALLEN, TX	PHILADELPHIA, PA	WACO, TX	FRAMINGHAM, MA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	EDINBURG, TX	CORPUS CHRISTI, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	MCALLEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM #	STOCK #	QTY	UM	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
67	G0329-00	2500	EA	\$3.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.38	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.86	\$9.99
68	G0329-01	1600	EA	\$3.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.38	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.86	\$9.99
69	G0329-02	1000	EA	\$4.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.05	\$9.99
70	G0329-03	700	EA	\$4.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.73	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.25	\$9.99
71	G0329-04	500	EA	\$4.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.91	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.47	\$9.99
72	G0330-00	600	EA	\$8.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$15.24	\$9.50	\$8.81	\$7.02	NO BID	\$5.54	NO BID	\$9.14	NO BID
73	G0331-00	1000	EA	\$1.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.45	\$2.50	\$1.25	\$1.46	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1.34	NO BID
74	G0332-00	1000	EA	\$8.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.99	\$8.50	\$7.18	\$6.49	NO BID	\$5.33	NO BID	\$7.75	NO BID
75	G0332-01	260	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.19	\$8.00	\$6.69	\$6.05	NO BID	\$4.82	NO BID	\$7.22	NO BID
76	G0332-02	260	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.19	\$8.00	\$6.69	\$6.05	NO BID	\$4.82	NO BID	\$7.22	NO BID
77	G0332-03	260	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.19	\$8.00	\$6.69	\$6.05	NO BID	\$4.82	NO BID	\$7.22	NO BID
78	G0332-04	100	EA	\$6.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.19	\$8.00	\$6.69	\$6.05	NO BID	\$4.82	NO BID	\$7.22	NO BID
79	G0338-00	36	EA	\$6.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.80	NO BID	\$9.39	\$11.13	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	\$15.00	NO BID
80	G0339-00	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$46.00	NO BID	\$14.02	\$29.57	NO BID	\$26.06	NO BID	\$13.08	NO BID
81	G0340-00	300	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$37.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.38	\$42.45	NO BID	\$33.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
82	G0342-00	36	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21.15	NO BID	NO BID	\$38.00	NO BID	\$12.96	\$25.48	NO BID	\$19.02	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
83	G0343-00	48	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.51	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.38	NO BID	\$15.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
84	G0344-00	120	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.00	NO BID	\$2.64	\$2.93	NO BID	\$2.00	NO BID	\$1.75	NO BID
85	G0346-00	72	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.61	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.27	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
86	G0347-00	180	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.80	NO BID
87	G0348-00	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$152.00	NO BID	\$371.08	\$131.51	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
88	G0349-00	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	NO BID	\$6.46	\$8.68	NO BID	\$5.91	NO BID	\$6.30	NO BID
89	G0350-00	48	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$20.00	NO BID	\$13.70	\$18.42	NO BID	\$12.55	NO BID	\$13.00	NO BID
90	G0351-00	150	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.00	\$29.00	\$19.76	\$19.76	NO BID	\$19.00	NO BID	\$21.87	NO BID
91	G0352-00	150	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.00	\$29.50	\$17.61	\$17.61	NO BID	\$16.94	NO BID	\$19.49	NO BID
92	G0353-00	500	PR	\$4.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.85	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
93	G0355-00	200	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$351.61	\$299.15	NO BID	\$348.40	NO BID
94	G0356-00	200	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.71	\$35.69	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.02	\$5.02	NO BID
95	G0357-00	150	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$43.98	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
96	G0358-00	150	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$31.63	NO BID	NO BID	\$44.99
97	G0360-00	120	EA	\$4.10	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.00	NO BID	\$5.42	\$6.91	NO BID	\$6.71	NO BID	\$5.42	NO BID
98	G0361-00	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$44.96	\$55.65	NO BID	\$74.33	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
99	G0362-00	12	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
100	G0362-01	12	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
101	G0363-00	1000	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.25	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$19.70	NO BID	\$22.35	\$24.31	\$22.84	NO BID
102	G0365-00	810	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.68	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
103	G0367-00	304	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$12.10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



				SECURITY SAFETY & SUPPLY	* C & S SAFETY SUPPLY	INDEPENDENT HARDWARE, INC.	TEXAS METER AND DEVICE COMPANY, LLC	STAPLES	XPRESS EXPORT CORPORATION	TECHLINE INC	CAPP INC	TRIPLE S STEEL SUPPLY LLC DBA ALAMO IRON WORKS	WESCO	GATEWAY PRINTING & OFFICE SUPPLY, INC.	CC DISTRIBUTORS INC.	CORE & MAIN LP	* R.S. HUGHES CO INC	QUIPCO GLOBAL INC.
				HOUSTON, TX	MCALLEN, TX	PHILADELPHIA, PA	WACO, TX	FRAMINGHAM, MA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	EDINBURG, TX	CORPUS CHRISTI, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	MCALLEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM #	STOCK #	QTY	UM	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
138	G0409-00	192	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.40	\$3.80	NO BID	\$5.34	NO BID	\$4.86	NO BID
139	G0410-00	36	EA	\$11.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.00	NO BID	\$9.75	\$20.32	\$9.44	\$12.63	NO BID	\$12.00	NO BID
140	G0411-01	30	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$46.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$29.29	NO BID
141	G0411-02	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$159.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$75.37	NO BID	\$59.15	NO BID	\$90.14	NO BID
142	G0412-00	450	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.00	NO BID	\$9.66	\$9.67	NO BID	\$9.29	NO BID	\$10.69	NO BID
143	G0413-00	200	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.00	NO BID	\$7.58	\$7.58	NO BID	\$7.29	NO BID	\$8.30	NO BID
144	G0414-00	2496	EA	\$0.41	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.53	NO BID	\$1.50	\$0.47	\$0.43	\$0.34	\$0.43	\$0.41	NO BID	\$0.40	NO BID
145	G0417-00	24	EA	\$3.45	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$3.64	NO BID	\$12.00	NO BID	\$5.24	\$5.77	\$4.59	\$5.84	NO BID	\$5.00	NO BID
146	G0417-01	36	EA	\$3.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.00	NO BID	\$4.47	\$3.43	NO BID	\$3.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
147	G0418-00	96	EA	\$8.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.00	\$7.25	\$6.12	\$6.18	NO BID	\$7.18	NO BID	\$7.26	NO BID
148	G0419-00	84	EA	\$18.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.00	\$21.00	\$15.11	\$13.10	NO BID	\$19.38	NO BID	\$15.41	NO BID
149	G0420-00	24	EA	\$113.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$95.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
150	G0421-00	24	EA	\$113.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$95.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
151	G0422-00	24	EA	\$113.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$95.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
152	G0423-00	36	EA	\$113.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$95.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
153	G0424-00	24	EA	\$21.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$22.73	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
154	G0425-00	60	EA	\$14.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.17	\$11.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
155	G0426-00	12	EA	\$113.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.65	\$95.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
156	G0427-00	60	EA	\$115.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$97.22	\$97.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
157	M0200-00	150	EA	\$25.50	\$21.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28.04	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.41	NO BID	\$41.64	NO BID
158	M0201-00	24	EA	\$14.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.57	\$15.00	\$14.90	\$13.97	NO BID	\$14.51	NO BID	\$15.46	NO BID
159	M0202-00	24	EA	\$14.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.94	NO BID	\$16.57	\$19.75	\$14.90	\$13.97	NO BID	\$14.51	NO BID	\$15.46	NO BID
160	M0203-00	36	EA	\$14.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.57	\$19.75	\$14.90	\$13.97	NO BID	\$14.51	NO BID	\$15.46	NO BID
161	M0204-00	100	PR	\$7.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.86	NO BID	\$7.10	\$5.75	\$7.98	\$3.74	\$43.11	\$7.79	NO BID	\$8.62	NO BID
162	M0224-00	5000	EA	\$2.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.50	NO BID	\$1.53	\$2.00	NO BID	\$2.04	NO BID	\$2.37	NO BID
163	M0226-00	1572	PR	\$1.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$0.89	NO BID	\$0.95	NO BID	\$1.05	\$2.25
164	M0229-00	36	BX	\$16.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$24.94	\$27.52	NO BID	\$30.00	NO BID	\$32.82	NO BID

\* Vendor did not sign cost sheet - Disqualified

APPROVED BY: *D Solitaire 4/14/2023*  
DIANE SOLITAIRE