



BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B020-23 VEHICLES

DATE AND TIME: JANUARY 26, 2023 - 10:00 AM

			GRAPEVINE CHRYSLER JEEP DODGE GRAPEVINE, TX	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET CALDWELL, TX	BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM #	QTY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT COST	UNIT COST	UNIT COST
1	2	2023 or 2024 Model Year – ½ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Single Cab, Short Bed, Full Size w/ Towing Package (Dept. 3310-Unit #269, Unit #462)	\$35,220.00	\$39,271.00	\$41,320.00
2	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year – ¾ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive – Extended Cab, Full Size w/ Utility Service Body (Dept. 2120-Unit #432)	NO BID	\$66,242.00	\$72,000.00
3	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year – ¾ Ton 4 X 4 Wheel Drive, Crew Cab, Full Size with Utility Service Body (Dept. 2130-Unit #4)	\$69,680.00	\$72,935.00	\$85,000.00
4	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year – 1 Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Single Cab w/ Utility Service Body (Dept. 3150-Unit #472, Unit #473)	NO BID	\$71,238.00	\$83,000.00
5	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year – 1 Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Extended Cab, Full Size w/ Utility Service Body (Dept. 2210-Unit #427)	NO BID	\$79,194.00	\$85,000.00

			GRAPEVINE CHRYSLER JEEP DODGE	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	BOGGUS TIPTON MOTORS
6	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year - 1 ½ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Single Cab, Full Size w/ Utility Service Body (Dept. 3150-Unit #431)	NO BID	\$83,252.00	NO BID
7	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year - 2 Ton 4 X 4 Wheel Drive, Crew Cab, Full Size w/ Utility Service Body (Dept. 3150-Unit #471)	NO BID	\$89,741.00	NO BID
8	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year Full-Size SUV, Rear Wheel Drive (Dept. 1135-Unit #401)	NO BID	\$51,655.00	NO BID
		Optional			
9	2	2023 or 2024 Model Year - ½ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Single Cab, Short Bed, Full Size (Dept. 6150-Unit #475, Unit 476)	\$34,780.00	NO BID	\$39,750.00
10	1	2023 or 2024 Model Year - ½ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, Single Cab, Short Bed, Full Size w/ Towing Package (Dept. 3310-Unit #267)	\$35,220.00	NO BID	\$40,000.00
11	2	2023 or 2024 Model Year - ½ Ton 4 X 2 Wheel Drive, 4 Full Size Doors, Short Bed (Dept. 7150-Unit #145; Dept. 1430-New Addition)	\$42,085.00	NO BID	\$46,750.00 x2
		LEAD TIME	150 - 210 DAYS	365 - 465 DAYS	180 - 220 DAYS

APPROVED BY: *D Solitaire 1-26-2023*

DIANE SOLITAIRE