BROWNSYILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B013-23 SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS
DATE & TIME: FEBRUARY 2, 2023 - 10:30 AM

WEG WESCO
TRANSFORMERS TECHLINE, INC. | KBS ELECTRIC
s DISTRIBUTION
Washington, MO San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
= B ___.-. e = .{'TI_" - : e TR A — -H-i_"
POLEMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE 4 ; GEPROLEC | ﬁﬁggi%’. 2
E1410-01 $1,632.05 $5,190.0 $4,305.30
5 [10KVA 7200 NL: 28 37 38
"l ea [reomso LL: 154 133 112
|(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) | Jo 182 170 150
E1410-02 NO BID $1,664.10 $5,053.00 $4,110.60
5 s |1oKkva 7200 NL: 30 3 29
EA [1201240 LL: 150 159 154
J(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) | o 180 190 183
E1412-01 NO BID $1,998.72 $7,357.00 $4,738.60
; | so psxvam200 NL: 56 57 60
EA |1207240 LL 313 327 325
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) | Jo 369 384 385
E1413-01 NO BID $1,971.79 $7,299.00 $4,921.30
. 5 [25KvA 7200 NL: 59 67 63
EA [240/480 LL: 300 292 311
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) | Jo 359 359 374




WEG WESCO
TRANSFORMERS TECHLINE, INC. KBS ELECTRIC
USA, LLC DISTRIBUTION
Washington, MO San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
E1414-01 NO BID $1,908.97 $7,065.00 $4,834.60
15 |25 KVA 7200 NL: 55 57 55
? EA [277/480 LL: 320 335 348
{(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 375 392 403
E1417-01 NO BID $2,311.54 $8,476.00 $5,409.30
60 |37.5 KVA 7200 NL: 80 80 78
| Ea |iz0r40 LL: 403 428 456
I(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: o 483 508 534
E1418-00 NO BID $2,296.15 $8,594.00 $5,516.00
7 5 37.5 KVA 7200 NL: 75 77 77
EA [240/480 LL: 406 459 464
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: {0 481 536 541
E1419-01 NO BID $2,171.79 $8,325.00 $5,390.60
5 37.5 KVA 7200 NL: 70 76 74
8 EA |277/480 LL: 462 471 464
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: o 532 547 538
E1425-00 NO BID $2,533.33 $10,113.00 $6,441.30
9 35 |50 KVA 7200 NL: 94 94 98
EA [120/240 LL: 543 558 543
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 637 652 641
E1427-00 NO BID $2,380.77 $9,654.00 $6,484.00
8 50 KVA 7200 NL: 89 95 89
e EA [|277/480 LL: 565 584 590
[(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: io 654 l679 679
E1434-00 NO BID $3,202.56 $13,853.00 $7,534.60
1 8 75 KVA 7200 NL: 125 135 139
EA [240/480 LL: 748 756 744
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL:  [0] 873 891 883
E1435-00 $3,142.31 $13,594.00 $7,294.60
4 75 KVA 7200 NL: NO BID 123 132 141
e EA |277/480 LL: 759 782 738
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: |0 882 914 879




L35 WESCO
TRANSFORMERS TECHLINE, INC. KBS ELECTRIC
USA, LLC DISTRIBUTION
Washington, MO San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
E1441-00 NO BID $4,565.38 $18,250.00 $9,341.30
8 100 KVA 7200 NL: 63 158 175
131 ga |120240 LL: 1299 943 891
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 1362 1101 1066
E1443-00 NO BID $4,353.85 $16,928.00 $9,226.60
10 |100 KVA 7200 NL: 117 159 168
14 EA |277/480 LL: L 1081 962 917
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 1198 1121 1085
E1448-00 NO BID $7,706.41 $27,528.00 $12,814.60
3 167 KVA 7200 NL: 200 260 265
15 EA [120/240 LL: 1519 1297 1301
I(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: o 1719 1557 1566
E1456-00 NO BID NO BID $34,924.00 $21,466.60
v 1 250 KVA 7200 NL: 359 351
EA [|240/480 LL: 1742 1743
|(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 [0 2101 2094




WEG WESCO
TRANSFORMERS | oo mr oy | TECHLINE, INC. KBS ELECTRIC
USA, LLC
Washington, MO San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
PADMOUNT, THREE PHASE o) : - ‘;’ o Fﬁ; ,‘f,‘,;; oa
E1521-00 $41,03000 |$17,338.67 $42,725.00 $25,450.00
7 1 |75 KVA 7200 NL:L 168 69 155
EA [120/208 Ll (804 1219 900
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) | f972 1288 1055 lo
E1522-00 $43,661.00 $18,796.00 $44,133.00 $29,566.00
8 1 [112.5 KVA 7200 NL:| 233 89 211
EA [120/208 Ll 27 1726 1236
|(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) T 11360 1815 1447 {0
E1522-01 $44,640.00 $18,718.67 $44,684.00 $33,483.00
" 3 [t125KVA 7200 N 245 97 223
EA [120/240 Ll 1055 1712 1185
[(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL:| 1300 1809 1408 jo
E1523-00 $46,454.00 $18,981.33 $48,231.00 $36,116.00
3 [150 KVA 7200 NL:| 1290 115 253
201 Ea |120208 Ll 1416 2161 1614
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) L} 1706 2276 1867 jo
E1523-01 $45,464.00 $18,948.00 $46,547.00 $36,116.00
2 |150 KVA 7200 NLi| 1286 116 291
% EA [277/480 Ll 4s2 2196 1449
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) T | [1738 2312 1740 fo
E1532-00 $78,679.00 $34,082.67 $98,117.00 $69,900.00
I [750 KVA 7200 NLi| 1892 950 1026
2| ea fer7mso L 5538 5498 5109
|(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL:|  [6430 {6448 6135 jo
E1534-00 $80,770.00 $44,877.33 $114,879.00 $74,666.00
2 |1,000 KVA 7200 NL:| 1007 1214 1336
2| ea |rraso LL: | 17657 6843 6273
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL:| 8664 8057 7609 [0




WEG WESCO
TRANSFORMERS TECHLINE, INC. KBS ELECTRIC
DISTRIBUTION
USA, LLC
Washington, MO San Antonio, TX San Antonio, TX Austin, TX
E1537-00 $150,954.00 $£80,206.67 $213,777.00 $95,766.00
1 2.500 KVA, 7200 NL: 3094 4885 3329
24 EA |12470Y/4160D hU-I 15307 12295 15681
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 18401 17180 19010 ]
E1540-00 $156,575.00 $115,132.00 $230,327.00 $115,283.00
a5 1 3,750 KVA INL: 4245 3589 3739
EA |7200, 277/480 LL: 30110 24738 30996
J(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 34355 28327 34735 10
E1541-00 NO BID NO BID $272,933.00 $153,683.00
1 5,000 KVA, 12470Y NL: 5181
26 EA |2400/4160Y/ LL: 28833
(WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%) TL: 0 o 34014 L0
DELIVERY IN DAYS/WEEKS (AROQO) 84 - 104 WEEKS 12 - 52 WEEKS 75+ WEEKS 175 - 238 DAYS

Note: KBS did not submit the load losses to evaluate the padmounts transformers

APPROVED BY:

Protins

R-F-2023

DIANE SOLITAIRE




