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BID TABULATION

ITEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM #7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM #11 ITEM #12
19% Agueous Sodium Hydroxide Sodium Hydroxide Sudlium Hydroxide Service Contraci to
. Ammonia A {Liyuid Caustic Soda Sedium Hydroxide | (liquid caustic soda | Liguid Chlorine in | Liguid Chlorine in N . . - e Cire Acid 500 Low Manganese . B provide Chlorine . S
99.5% ""’:ﬁ“’“’ PricfLb i truckload | 14 :,:;s)lu. S0dd | 5oy as por atached | (Liquid Caustie Soda | 25% b a5 per anached | one-ton one-ton contai ""Wd‘g"h‘:“'“‘“‘"“ I':‘“u‘.“ “’:ﬂ‘:;:‘\‘)“‘ s‘::n:?::: 1{’:‘;&:‘“ Solution for SRWA |  Ferne Chlonde '“"“sf“"'l‘“g::’"dt Dioxide ""“I“;‘;;:'\'f'"“
deviates MOM3SO00 10| e w4 wipp | SPeificasions (BPUB | 504%) far SRWA specifications (BPUB) (SRWA) arbon Sullaie ¢ ; ; (330 GalTore) | Solution for SRWA i {BPLIB WPI & BRYEAL
50.000 Lb ot WP & WP2) (SRWA) W)
130,000 Pounds | 120,000 Pounds | 550,000 Pounds 500,00 Pounds 200008 Pounds | 300,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons | 240,000 Pounds | 260,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds {30 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 1,500,000 Pounds | 270,000 Pounds | 225,000 Pounds
PENCCE. INC NQ BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CABOT NORIT
AMERICAS. INC
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOC BID NGO BID NO BID NO BID $1.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BiD NO BID
MARSHALL. TX
CHEMTRADE
CHE 3
MICALSUSLLC | No BID NO BID $0.2685 $0.1685 $02685 $0.1685 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.257 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PARSIFPANY. NJ
INTERNATIONAI
DIGXCIDE. INC
1471 YR .689/1 YR
NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NQO BID NGO BID :: :6;;2 YR :g 70972 YR
NORTH KINGSTOWN, . |
Rl
SOUTHERN IONICS
NQO BID $0.2771 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOQ BID NO BID NGO BID NG BID $0.1865 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WEST POINT. M$
AIRGAS
$1.90 $0.25 NOQ BID NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LAWRENCEVILLE, GA




ITEM #1 I'TEM #2 ITEM #3 [TEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM #6 ITEM 87 ITEM £8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 | ITEM #11 ITEM #12
T — E'S
199 Aqueous Sodium Hydroside Sodiam Hydrisside Sodium Hydraxide Servive Contract Wy
. . Ammoni g 1 Liguid Causte Suda Sodium Hydroxide | (liguid caustic soda | Ligwid Chlorme in | Tigud Chlonne e | 0 . . N Citric Acid 5005 Luw Manganese N R provide Chlorine s odium Chirite
- ‘A'm““::ﬁ“‘“" PricefLb it truckha | 1941 g'l:;‘,“‘ SO0 gty as per attached | (1 ijuid Caustie Soda | 5% ) s por atached | ane-ton ¢ aneon concsiners || "“d‘("_‘dh‘:\,““‘““' ':":‘:;‘":“;{3:'? \:":]"'Ij"“"' '(’:?':‘::‘R} Solution for SRWA | Terric Chloride '“"'Lfl.‘:'l‘u:“h':'r'l'""‘ Disxide 5""_“;’;;':;"“
deviates Trom3S a0 | o SN g | seecilicanons (BPLIB. | S0 or SRWA specitications (BPUB! ISRWA) Acan uliee nuien ¢ O30 GaWTosct | Sudsthon for SRWA ™ (BPUB WP & 8
S00.000 Lh ™ ¥ WL & W2 {SRWA) win2)
130,000 Pounds 120,000 Pounds 550,000 Pounds 500,00 Pounds 200,000 Pounds 00,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 260,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds | 30 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 1,500,000 Pounds | 270,000 Pounds | 225,000 Pounds
EVOQUA WATER
TECHNOLOGIES LLC $0.78/1 YR $0.748/1 YR
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.819/72 YR £0.785/2 YR
SARASOTA.F1
ATLAS CARBON
MO BID MO BED 0 BID MO BID MO BID MO BID N BID NO BID $0.85 + S&H MO BID MO BID MO BID M B WO BID NO BID NO BID
GILLETTE, WY
UNIVAR USA
MO BID MO BID 50,2525 50,1544 502525 5015 WO BID My BID 0 BID MO BID WO BIE NG BID ND BID MO BID MO BID MO BID
KENT, WA
CHEMRITE. INC
NO BID MO BED MO BID MO BID KO BID N BID MO BID NO BID 5160 NO RID O BID 56,159 80 MO BID NO BID WO BID MO BID
BUIORD. GA
PVS TECHNOLOGIES.
INC- NO BID NO BID KO RID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5037 NO BID MO BID NO BID
DETROIT, Ml
CARBPURE
TECHNOLOGIES
NO BID NOBID MO BID WO BID hth BID N BID MO BID WO BID SLIE MO BID MO BID KO BID NO BID MO BID WO BID WO BID
GREENWOOD
VILLAGE. CO
SHANNON
CHEMICAL $7.676.49/1 YR
CORPORTION WO BID WO BID WO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BID MO BIDY MO BID MO BID MO BID £8.009. 1072 YR MO BID MO RID MO BID M0 BID
MALVERN, PA
BRENNTAG
SOUTHWEST NO BID 14O BID MO BID NO BID NO BID WO BID HO BID NO BID NO BID $0.2475 NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID O BID
LANCASTER. TX
AMCHEM. INC
' MO BID MO BID MO BID N0 BID WO B N0 BID MO BT MO BID NO BID MO BID MO BID $10,560.00 HO BID MO BID NG BID MO BT
LONGVIEW, TX
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[TEM #1 ITEM #2 ITEM #3 ITEM #4 ITEM #5 ITEM#6 | ITEM#7 ITEM #8 ITEM #9 ITEM #10 ITEM#11__| ITEM#12
19% Aqueous Souium Hydroxide Sodivm Hydroxsde Seafium Hydroxide Service Contragt tiv
99.5% Anhydrous | | Ammonia | 5 id Caustic Soda ‘,';“""" Caustic Soda | Sudium Hydroxde | fgid caustc soda | Liguid Chlorite in | Liguid ChIore 01, geeeg acivarea| Liguid Ammonium | Sodium Bisubie Lric Acid 0% Low Manganese | ¢y Chiaride "““'")’.“ RO | ¢ dium Chlorite
Ammonia rice/Lb if truckload S0 25%) as per attached || (Liguid Caustie Soda | 25% 1as per attawhed | one-won containers | ane-lon conlainers Carhon Suliale (SRWA Solwtan (SRWAS Solution for SRWA Yereic Chloride F— Dioxide (SRWAI
deviates fram3SBO0 W0 | oo ol g | SPecilicatons (BPUB | S0 ) tar SRWA specivations (BPUBY (SRWAI ) ) ) (33 GalTow) | Solution for SRWA (BPUB WP &
50,0080 Ln v i WPI & WP (SRWA) wP2)
130,000 Pounds 120,004 Pounds 550,000 Pounds 500,00 Pounds 200,000 Pounds 300,000 Pounds 389 Tons 119 Tons 240,000 Pounds | 260,000 Pounds | 190,000 Pounds | 30 (330-Gal Totes) | 125,000 Pounds | 1,500,000 Pounds | 270,000 Pounds | 225,000 Pounds
VALLEY SOLVENTS
& CHEMICAL NO BID NO BID $0.2770 $0.175 $0.2770 50175 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
COMBES. TX
DPC INDUSTRIES
MO BID MO BID 02944 50, 1805 5002944 0. 1805 £2. 73400 52.124.00 NO BID N BID MO BID MO BID NOBID WO BID MO BID MO BID




