



**BID TABULATION**

**BID NAME: B050-22 RE-BID OF ELECTRICAL AND ELECTRONIC SPARE PARTS**

**OPENING DATE & TIME: JUNE 30, 2022 at 10:00 PM**

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	L0001-00	STARTER, SIZE 00 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SAG12-V02S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-M-TLA23) *MUST BE EXACT*	EA	10	NO BID	\$233.92	\$385.00	\$307.00	NO BID	\$328.52
2	L0002-00	STARTER, SIZE 0 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SBG2-V02S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-M-TLA23)*MUST BE EXACT*	EA	10	NO BID	\$289.20	\$475.00	\$374.00	NO BID	\$413.96
3	L0003-00	STARTER, SIZE 1 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SCG3-V02S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-M-TLA23)*MUST BE EXACT*	EA	40	NO BID	\$402.36	\$370.00	\$426.00	NO BID	\$471.49
4	L0004-00	STARTER, SIZE 2 NEMA1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SDG1-V02S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-M-TLA23) OPEN SIZE 2 #8536- SD01-V02S, OPTION 8536-SDG1-V02S*MUST BE EXACT*	EA	40	NO BID	\$791.07	\$1,070.00	\$870.00	NO BID	\$979.13
5	L0005-00	STARTER, SIZE 3 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SEG1-V02S SQUARE D SIZE 3 8536-SE01-V02S; 8536SE01S (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS #140G-M-TLA23) *MUST BE EXACT*	EA	20	NO BID	\$1,026.56	\$1,700.00	\$1,392.00	NO BID	\$1,664.26
6	L0006-00	STARTER, SIZE 4 NEMA 1 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536-SFG1-V02S *MUST BE EXACT*	EA	20	NO BID	\$2,314.96	\$3,900.00	\$3,024.00	NO BID	\$3,828.21
7	L0007-00	ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE S 40 FEET CORD, NORMALLY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, MODEL# S40NO	EA	30	\$51.28	NO BID	NO BID	\$83.00	\$70.25	NO BID
8	L0008-00	ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE S 60 FEET CORD, NORMALLY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, MODEL# S60NO	EA	50	\$66.55	NO BID	NO BID	\$90.00	\$70.25	NO BID
9	L0009-00	ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE S 80 FEET CORD, NORMALLY OPEN, SELF WEIGHTED, MODEL# S80NO	EA	50	\$78.31	NO BID	NO BID	\$103.00	\$88.60	NO BID
10	L0010-00	ROTOFLOAT, MERCURY FREE TYPE S 80 FEET CORD, NORMALLY CLOSED, SELF WEIGHTED, MODEL# S80NC	EA	10	\$95.81	NO BID	NO BID	\$103.00	\$88.60	NO BID
11	L0011-00	RELAY, 3 PHASE MONITOR 8 PIN 480VAC, 1 CONTACT, TIME MARK MODEL# A258B	EA	50	NO BID	\$53.98	\$70.00	\$80.00	\$85.85	NO BID
12	L0012-00	RELAY, 3 PHASE MONITOR 8 PIN 240VAC, 1 CONTACT, TIME MARK MODEL# 257B	EA	40	NO BID	\$53.98	\$70.00	\$80.00	\$85.85	NO BID
13	L0013-00	RELAY, PHASE MONITOR 11 PIN 240VAC, 2 CONTACT, TIME MARK #2522BM	EA	50	NO BID	\$88.07	\$115.00	\$122.00	\$140.00	NO BID
14	L0014-00	RELAY, 120VAC, TIME MARK MODEL# A471-24V	EA	10	NO BID	\$215.91	\$280.00	\$282.00	\$343.25	NO BID
15	L0015-00	BREAKER, SINGLE POLE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1492-SPM1C200 SQUARE D MODEL #QOU120 20 AMP	EA	60	NO BID	\$10.15	\$35.00	\$35.00	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
16	L0016-00	BREAKER, 3 POLE, 40 AMPS, SIEMENS MODEL# CQD340, SQUARE D #QOU340	EA	20	NO BID	\$77.73	\$260.00	\$177.00	NO BID	\$241.24
17	L0017-00	BREAKER, 3 POLE, 60 AMPS, SIEMENS MODEL# CQD360, SQUARE D #QOU360	EA	20	NO BID	\$77.73	\$260.00	\$177.00	NO BID	\$241.09
18	L0018-00	BREAKER, 3 POLE, 80 AMPS, SIEMENS #CQD380, SQ D #QOU380	EA	15	NO BID	\$113.46	\$380.00	\$251.00	NO BID	\$361.38
19	L0019-00	ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 30X24X10, 3 POINT LATCH AND LOCK NEMA 4X STAHLIN MODEL #N30208FHLWT, HOFFMAN MODEL# A30H2410GQRLP3PT	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,100.00	\$1,776.00	NO BID	NO BID
20	L0020-00	ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 36X30X12, 3 POINT LATCH AND LOCK NEMA 4X HOFFMAN MODEL #A36H3012GQRLP3PT	EA	5	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,300.00	\$2,593.00	NO BID	NO BID
21	L0021-00	ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 24X24X8, 3 POINT LATCH AND LOCK NEMA 4X HOFFMAN MODEL# A24H2408GQRLP3PT	EA	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,800.00	\$1,430.00	NO BID	NO BID
22	L0022-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 100A, SQUARE D 600VAC MODEL# FAL36100 ALLEN BRADLEY 600VAC MODEL# 140G-G2C3-D10	EA	3	NO BID	\$189.82	NO BID	\$378.00	NO BID	NO BID
23	L0024-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 15A, SQUARE D 600VAC MODEL# HDL36015 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C15	EA	6	NO BID	\$155.53	\$925.00	\$637.00	NO BID	\$985.15
24	L0025-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 70A, SQUARE D 600VAC MODEL# FAL34070 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C70	EA	10	NO BID	\$189.82	NO BID	\$343.00	NO BID	\$821.04
25	L0026-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 80A, SQUARE D 600VAC MODEL# HDL36080 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C80	EA	6	NO BID	\$189.83	\$1,150.00	\$778.00	NO BID	\$1,191.57
26	L0027-00	DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, 3 POLES HEAVY DUTY 600VAC, ILSCO MODEL# PDB-11-2/0-3 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL #1492-PD3141	EA	60	NO BID	NO BID	\$85.00	\$84.00	\$50.60	NO BID
27	L0028-00	DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, 1 POLE HEAVY DUTY 600VAC, ILSCO MODEL# PDB-14-2/0-1 MODEL# 1492-100Y	EA	40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$36.00	\$16.40	NO BID
28	L0029-00	RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPR12P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HA32A14 TO INCLUDE LED INDICATOR	EA	150	NO BID	\$26.06	\$60.00	\$41.00	\$37.10	\$51.46
29	L0030-00	RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VAC, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPR12P14V14 MODEL# 700- HA32A24	EA	150	NO BID	\$26.06	\$60.00	\$35.00	\$26.90	NO BID
30	L0031-00	RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 12VDC, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPDR12P14V51 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HA32Z12	EA	20	NO BID	\$26.06	\$60.00	\$34.00	\$21.50	\$52.06
31	L0032-00	RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VDC, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPDR12P14V53 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HA32Z24	EA	20	NO BID	\$26.06	\$60.00	\$34.00	\$25.20	\$56.96
32	L0033-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE NEMA 1 800AMP 600VAC, CUTLER HAMMER MODEL# HND3800T36W ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-M6F3-D80	EA	2	NO BID	\$1,495.49	NO BID	\$11,332.00	NO BID	NO BID
33	L0034-00	CONTROL PUMP, DUPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS 120VAC, DIVERSIFIED ELECTRONICS MODEL# ARM-120-AFE	EA	30	NO BID	\$365.46	\$690.00	\$398.00	\$538.00	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
34	L0035-00	CONTROL PUMP, TRIPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS 1420VAC, DIVERSIFIED ELECTRONICS, MODEL# ARM120ADE	EA	15	NO BID	\$437.27	NO BID	\$352.00	\$535.05	NO BID
35	L0036-00	TRANSDUCER, 10 PSI LEVEL 100 FEET 4-20MA, CONTEGRA PART# SLX130-M-15-10-100-BT	EA	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,272.00	NO BID	NO BID
36	L0037-00	TRANSDUCER, 15 PSI LEVEL 100 FEET 4-20MA, CONTEGRA PART #SLX130-M-15-15-100-BT	EA	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,272.00	NO BID	NO BID
37	L0038-00	PIPE 2" X 10' RIDGID, GALVANIZED, METAL, MODEL# GALV2 ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# RIG200	FT	260	NO BID	\$10.64	\$12.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
38	L0039-00	PIPE 3" X 10' RIDGID, GALVANIZED, METAL, GALV3, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# RIG300	FT	200	NO BID	\$22.72	\$23.85	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
39	L0040-00	UNI-STURT 7/8 SS 316 10' SECTION C, MODEL #P1000TSS, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL #STRUT7/8 SS SLOTTED 10	FT	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40	L0041-00	UNI-STRUT 5/8 SS 316 10' SECTION C, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL #STRUT 1-5/8 SS SLOTTED 10	FT	300	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
41	L0045-00	PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC, 1400 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1766-L32AWA	EA	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$913.00	NO BID	NO BID
42	L0046-00	PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC, 1100 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1763-L16AWA	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,150.00	NO BID	NO BID
43	L0047-00	MODULE, DIGITAL INPUT 120VAC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1762-IA8	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$293.00	NO BID	NO BID
44	L0048-00	MODULE, DIGITAL INPUT 120VAC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1762-OA8	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$296.00	NO BID	NO BID
45	L0049-00	MODULE, EXPANSION ANALOG INPUT 4-20MA, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1762-IF4	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,312.00	NO BID	NO BID
46	L0050-00	MODULE, OUPUT 4-20MA, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL #1762-OF4	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$583.00	NO BID	NO BID
47	L0051-00	POWER SUPPLY, 24VDC 2-5A, DIN RAIL, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL #1606-XLE120EN	EA	5	NO BID	\$187.21	NO BID	\$314.00	NO BID	NO BID
48	L0052-00	POWER SUPPLY, 12VDC 2-5A, DIN RAIL, ALLEN BRADLEY# 1606- XLP50B	EA	3	NO BID	\$211.12	NO BID	\$313.00	NO BID	NO BID
49	L0053-00	RELAY, TIME DELAY 120VAC, TIME MARK MODEL# 310-120V ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HT OR AB 700-HR52TA17	EA	5	NO BID	\$90.91	\$115.00	\$126.00	\$144.55	NO BID
50	L0054-00	SURGE PROTECTOR 120VAC, SQUARE D MODEL# D120VIP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 4983-DS120-801	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
51	L0055-00	ALTERNATOR, TRIPLEXOR 120VAC, FLYGT MODEL #4403220 or MPE 009- 120-23P	EA	1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$350.00	\$1,368.85	NO BID
52	L0056-00	PHASE MONITOR 240V, FLYGT MODEL# 14403212 OR MPE 001-DVM-1212	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$140.00	\$441.70	NO BID
53	L0057-00	RELAY, 120VAC, INTRINSICALLY SAFE, FLYGT MODEL# 14403222 OR MPE-030-120-118, LITTELFUSE ISS- 101	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$195.00	\$496.40	NO BID
54	L0058-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 30A 600VAC, EATON MODEL# EHD3030L, 140G-G2C3-C30	EA	2	NO BID	\$333.29	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	\$686.01
55	L0059-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 50A 600VAC, SIEMENS MODEL #ED63B050MX, 140G-G2C3-C50	EA	2	NO BID	\$333.29	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
56	L0060-00	PROTECTION DEVICE 120VAC, EBARRA, MTS MODEL# MOS-IPE	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$422.00	NO BID
57	L0062-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 60A, MOLDED CASE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C60 (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G- G-TLC13 LUGS)	EA	1	NO BID	\$333.29	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID
58	L0063-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 40A 600VAC, MOLDED CASE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C40 (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS #140G-G-TLC-13 LUGS)	EA	1	NO BID	\$333.29	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID
59	L0064-00	CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 20A 600VAC, MOLDED CASE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C20 (TO INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-G-TLC13 LUGS)	EA	1	NO BID	\$333.29	NO BID	\$250.00	NO BID	NO BID
60	L0065-00	VFD, 100HP 480VAC, ALTIVAR VFD MODEL #ATV75HD75N4 OR ATV630D75N4	EA	1	NO BID	\$6,097.17	\$11,500.00	\$10,292.00	NO BID	NO BID
61	L0066-00	SOFT, STARTER, 300HP 480VAC, BENSCHAW SOFT STARTER MODEL #RB2-1-S-361-16C	EA	1	NO BID	\$2,310.89	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
62	L0067-00	SOFT, STARTER, 200HP 480VAC, BENSCHAW SOFT STARTER MODEL# RB3-1-S-240A-15C	EA	1	NO BID	\$1,640.24	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
63	L0068-00	SOFT, STARTER, 100HP 480VAC, BENSCHAW SOFT STARTER MODEL# RB2-1-S-096A-13C BENSCHAW #RB3-1-S-125A-14C	EA	1	NO BID	\$1,187.77	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
64	L0069-00	SOFT, STARTER, 160HP 480VAC, ALTIVAR SOFT STARTER MODEL# ATS48C25Y	EA	1	NO BID	\$1,640.24	\$4,500.00	\$4,897.00	NO BID	NO BID
65	L0070-00	REACTOR, 3 PHASE 60HP 480VAC- 600VAC 80 AMP MAX, FOR VFD, MTE CORP MODEL# RL-08002	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$817.15	NO BID
66	L0071-00	PROTECTION DEVICE, MINICAS 120, FLYGT PUMP, MINICAS FLYGT MODEL #14-407129 OR MPE-PMR2	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$410.00	\$786.10	NO BID
67	L0072-00	GLOVES, XL DISPOSABLE NITRILE 9MIL, HARDY MODEL# 68512 NITRI-COR PLATINUM 8MIL STYLE 4097	BX	150	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
68	L0073-00	HORN, 120V, FEDERAL SIGNAL #350WB120, HLA HORN 120V	EA	30	NO BID	\$144.89	\$185.00	\$186.00	\$205.65	NO BID
69	L0074-00	LED, 120VAC, WITH PIPE MOUNT ATTACHMENT, RED, EDWARDS SIGNALING MODEL# 105XBRMR120A, MOUNT ATTACHMENT P/N 105PM ,HLA LED LIGHT. TO INCLUDE MOUNTING BASE 105 PM PIPE MOUNT ATTACHMENT	EA	40	NO BID	279.95 23.79 303.74	NO BID	NO BID	\$487.50	\$296.83
70	L0075-00	RELAY, 11 PIN 120VAC 10A, SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPR13P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL #700-HA33A1	EA	100	NO BID	\$30.69	\$65.00	\$36.00	\$31.45	\$59.20
71	L0076-00	RELAY, 11 PIN 24VAC 10A, SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE D MODEL# 8501KPR13P14V14 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700HA33A24	EA	100	NO BID	\$30.69	\$65.00	\$36.00	\$22.00	NO BID
72	L0077-00	RELAY, 11 PIN 24VDC 10A, SQUARE D MODEL #8501KPDR13V53 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HA33Z24	EA	20	NO BID	\$27.40	\$65.00	\$35.00	\$21.85	\$51.14
73	L0078-00	RELAY, 8 PIN 600VAC, SOCKET BASE, DIN RAIL, FINDER MODEL# 8501NR52 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HN100	EA	20	NO BID	\$7.00	\$16.00	\$19.50	\$6.55	NO BID
74	L0079-00	RELAY, 11 PIN 600VAC, SOCKET BASE DIN RAIL MOUNT, FINDER MODEL# 8501NR61 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HN101 OR FINDER 90.21	EA	110	NO BID	\$4.25	\$23.00	\$20.50	\$11.20	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
75	L0080-00	LED, 120V-130V, RED, PHILIPS LED MODEL #ES60A19DL4PK FOR HIGH LEVEL ALARM LIGHT BULB	EA	100	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
76	L0081-00	NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PSRS-1/4-SS	EA	50	NO BID	\$3.51	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
77	L0082-00	NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PSRS-3/8-SS	EA	50	NO BID	\$5.58	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
78	L0083-00	NUT 5/16" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PSRS-5/16-SS	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
79	L0084-00	NUT 1/2" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PSRS-1/2-SS	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
80	L0085-00	CLAMP, 1 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PS1100-1-1/2-SS	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
81	L0086-00	CLAMP, 2" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PS1100-2-SS	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
82	L0087-00	CLAMP, 2 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL #PS1100-2-1/2-SS	EA	100	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
83	L0088-00	CLAMP, 3" STAINLESS STEEL 316, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# PS1100-3-SS OR CALBRITE S63000SC00	EA	100	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
84	L0089-00	FUSE, 100AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H363SS EATON PART# DH363FWK	EA	4	NO BID	\$1,152.00	\$3,800.00	\$3,548.00	NO BID	\$5,568.86
85	L0090-00	FUSE, 200AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H364SS EATON PART# DH364FWK	EA	4	NO BID	\$1,612.41	\$5,300.00	\$5,074.00	NO BID	\$7,885.83
86	L0091-00	FUSE, 400AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H365SS EATON MODEL# DH365FWK	EA	4	NO BID	\$4,213.90	\$10,600.00	\$11,063.00	NO BID	\$15,421.48
87	L0092-00	FUSE, 600AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL, DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H366SS EATON MODEL# DH366FWK	EA	2	NO BID	\$5,798.96	\$15,200.00	\$16,812.00	NO BID	\$26,128.22
88	L0093-00	FUSE, 100AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLRS100	EA	20	NO BID	\$15.84	\$40.00	NO BID	\$44.10	NO BID
89	L0094-00	FUSE, 200AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLRS200	EA	12	NO BID	\$34.84	\$90.00	NO BID	\$88.20	NO BID
90	L0095-00	FUSE, 400AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLRS400	EA	12	NO BID	\$62.82	\$180.00	NO BID	\$171.15	NO BID
91	L0096-00	FUSE, 600AMP, LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLRS600	EA	12	NO BID	\$102.88	\$220.00	NO BID	\$201.35	NO BID
92	L0097-00	CONNECTOR # 4,2 PORT 600VAC INSULATED, ILSCO MODEL#TA250 PBTS-2-4	EA	25	NO BID	\$12.00	\$15.00	NO BID	\$10.70	NO BID
93	L0098-00	CONNECTOR # 2/0-3/0, 2 PORT 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO MODEL#TA250 PBTS-2-1/0	EA	25	NO BID	\$16.42	\$20.00	NO BID	\$22.40	NO BID
94	L0099-00	CONNECTOR 1/0# 250kcm, 4 PORT 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO MODEL#TA250 PBTS-4-250	EA	25	NO BID	\$31.20	\$40.00	NO BID	\$28.10	NO BID
95	L0100-00	CONNECTOR #10 1/0, 3 PORT 600VAC, INSULATED, ILSCO MODEL#TA250 PBTS-3-1/0	EA	25	NO BID	\$22.12	\$75.00	NO BID	\$19.95	NO BID
96	L0101-00	TAPE, 3/4" X 30' 600VAC 3M, INSULATION, SCOTT MODEL# 130C	EA	30	NO BID	\$13.05	\$19.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
97	L0102-00	TAPE, 1" X 30' 600VAC 3M, INSULATION, SCOTT MODEL# 130C	EA	30	NO BID	\$23.87	\$19.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
98	L0103-00	TAPE, 1 1/2" X 30' 600VAC 3M, INSULATION, SCOTT MODEL# 130C	EA	30	NO BID	\$36.44	\$39.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
99	L0104-00	TAPE, 2" X 30' 600VAC 3M, INSULATION, SCOTT MODEL# 130C	EA	30	NO BID	\$48.57	\$51.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
100	L0105-00	TAPE, 3/4" X 60' 600VAC 3M, CAMBRIC, SCOTT MODEL# 2520	EA	30	NO BID	\$35.44	\$40.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
101	L0107-00	SWITCH, 120V 300VAC, HOA N.O.N.C. POS SIEMENS MODEL# 52PT6G2A ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-J2A, SQUARE D MODEL	EA	25	NO BID	\$83.13	NO BID	\$78.00	NO BID	NO BID
102	L0108-00	LED, RED 120V 300VAC 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2R SIEMENS MODEL# 52PLAG2P, SQUARE D MODEL 9001KP35LRR31 RED PILOT	EA	20	NO BID	\$58.61	\$145.00	\$112.00	NO BID	\$133.34
103	L0109-00	LED, GREEN 120 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2G, SQUARE D MODEL SQD 9001KP35LGG31 GREEN PILOT	EA	20	NO BID	\$58.61	\$145.00	\$121.00	NO BID	\$133.34
104	L0110-00	LED, YELLOW 120V 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2Y	EA	20	NO BID	\$83.13	NO BID	\$121.00	NO BID	NO BID
105	L0111-00	LED, BLUE 120V 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2B	EA	20	NO BID	\$83.13	NO BID	\$121.00	NO BID	NO BID
106	L0112-00	LED, AMBER 120V 12-120V 30.5MM, PILOT LIGHT, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2A	EA	20	NO BID	\$66.27	NO BID	\$121.00	NO BID	NO BID
107	L0113-00	PUSH BUTTON, RESET 120V 300VAC, N.O. AND N.C., SIEMENS MODEL# 52PA8B2JP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-A2A, SQUARE D MODEL D# SQD 9001KR1BH13 PB&CONT ACT BL	EA	30	NO BID	\$38.55	\$85.00	\$68.00	NO BID	\$92.73
108	L0114-00	PUSH BUTTON, RED 300VAC, AND LABEL, SIEMENS MODEL #52PA8A3KP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-FX6A1	EA	30	NO BID	\$61.83	NO BID	\$46.00	NO BID	NO BID
109	L0115-00	LABEL, EMERGENCY PUSH BUTTON, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T- X504	EA	30	NO BID	\$74.50	NO BID	\$6.25	NO BID	NO BID
110	L0116-00	CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC BLACK, SOUTHWIRE MODEL #THHN8BLK	FT	2,000	NO BID	\$0.65	\$0.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
111	L0117-00	CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC GREEN, SOUTHWIRE MODEL# THHN8GRN	FT	2,000	NO BID	\$0.65	\$0.82	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
112	L0118-00	CABLE, COPPER #3/0 THHN 600VAC BLK, SOUTHWIRE MODEL #THHN3/0BLK	FT	1,000	NO BID	\$5.14	\$6.87	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
113	L0119-00	CABLE, COPPER #4/0 THHN 600VAC BLK, SOUTHWIRE MODEL# THHN4/0BLK	FT	1,000	NO BID	\$6.42	\$8.145	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
114	L0120-00	CHARGER, BATTERY 6AMP 12VDC, MARINCO MODEL# CHARGE PRO 28106	EA	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$194.20	NO BID
115	L0121-00	LED, SECURITY LIGHT GALVANIZED 4000WATTS, LUMENS- 400, HONEYWELL MODEL#MA0201-17CR	EA	20	NO BID	\$144.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
116	L0122-00	FUSEHOLDER, 600VAC, THREE FUSES DIN RAIL MOUNT LITTLE FUSE MODEL# L60030C3PQDINR	EA	40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.60	NO BID
117	L0123-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B25	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$33.60	NO BID
118	L0123-01	SQUARE D 9070T150D23 240/480TO 24VAC OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1497B- A4-M16-0-N	EA	10	NO BID	\$143.58	\$275.00	\$93.00	NO BID	NO BID
119	L0123-02	SQUARE D 9070T150D23 240/480TO 120VAC OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1497B- A4-M14-0-N	EA	10	NO BID	\$103.00	\$275.00	\$138.00	NO BID	NO BID
120	L0124-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B32	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$33.60	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
121	L0125-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B36	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$33.60	NO BID
122	L0126-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B45	EA	60	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$33.60	NO BID
123	L0127-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B79	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$33.60	NO BID
124	L0128-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# CC112	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$35.30	NO BID
125	L0129-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# CC156	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$35.30	NO BID
126	L0130-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# CC103	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$35.30	NO BID
127	L0131-00	HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 600VAC, OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# CC208	EA	50	NO BID	\$27.13	\$35.00	\$33.00	\$35.30	NO BID
128	L0132-00	POWER SUPPLY, 24VAC 120VAC, TELEMECANIQUE MODEL# ABL8RPS24030 OR AB1606XLP72E	EA	3	NO BID	NO BID	\$265.00	\$287.00	NO BID	\$265.48
129	L0132-01	DC POWER SUPPLY P/N: ALLEN BRADLEY 1769-PA2	EA	5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$416.00	NO BID	NO BID
130	L0133-00	REACTOR, 3 PHASE 600VAC, MTE MODEL# RL-08002	EA	3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$817.15	NO BID
131	L0134-00	ARRESTOR, SECONDARY SURGE 600VAC, SQUARE D MODEL #SDSA3650	EA	5	NO BID	\$98.83	\$250.00	\$162.00	NO BID	\$244.78
132	L0135-00	END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE, FOR UNISTRUT CHANNEL 1 5/8" X 1 5/8" PART# PS 61532 WHT	EA	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
133	L0136-00	END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE, FOR UNISTRUT CHANNEL, 1 5/8" X 7/8" PART# PS 61532 WHT	EA	200	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
134	L0137-00	DUCT, PVC 1" X 2" X 6' PANDUIT SLOTTED ADH, LIGHT GREY, PART# G1X2LG6-A	FT	504	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$65.55	NO BID
135	L0138-00	COVER, PANDUIT DUCT PVC 1"W X 6", LIGHT GREY, PART# CILG6	FT	504	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$11.85	NO BID
136	L0141-00	ADAPTER, UBIQUITY POE 50V P/N# POE 50-60W	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
137	L0144-00	BALLAST, UNIVERSAL 120/277 PHILLIPS# ICN-2P32-N	EA	2	NO BID	\$11.52	\$16.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
138	L0146-00	BALLAST, UNIVERSAL 120/277 PHILLIPS ICN -4P32-N	EA	2	NO BID	\$14.74	\$20.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
139	L0148-00	BALLAST, T8 PART# SOP 2P59N351	EA	2	NO BID	\$26.35	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
140	L0151-00	CONNECTOR, INSULATED 1/0 4 PORT ILSO MODEL# PBTS-4 1/0	EA	20	NO BID	\$24.00	\$35.00	NO BID	\$22.40	NO BID
141	L0153-00	CONNECTOR, INSULATED 250 KCM 2 PORTILSO# PBTS-2-250	EA	20	NO BID	\$28.87	\$40.00	NO BID	\$27.00	NO BID
142	L0155-00	LIGHT, FLUORESCENT 32W SYLVANIA# F032-850-ECO	EA	6	NO BID	\$3.07	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
143	L0155-01	LIGHT, FLUORESCENT BULB P/N F096841XPECO	EA	6	NO BID	\$11.89	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
144	L0159-00	MODULE, 4 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUT #1769-IF4	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,285.00	NO BID	NO BID
145	L0160-00	MODULE, 8 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUT P/N 1769-IF 8	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,863.00	NO BID	NO BID
146	L0161-00	MODULE, IN/OUT P/N 1769-IQ6XOW4	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$522.00	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
147	L0164-00	NANOSTATION, UBIQUITY MS P/N NSM5US	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
148	L0167-00	PLC, COMPACT LOGIC P/N 1769-L32E	BOX	4	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,521.00	NO BID	NO BID
149	L0170-00	VFD, LENZE A/C TECH MODEL# ESU 75 N 04TXB	EA	2	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$416.00	\$1,073.70	NO BID
150	L0172-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + GREEN; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000006098	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.63
151	L0173-00	SCOTCH SUPER 33 + WHITE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000006097	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.30	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.35
152	L0174-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + RED; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000006094	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.35
153	L0175-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + BLUE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
154	L0176-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + YELLOW; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000006096	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.35
155	L0177-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + ORANGE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000031581	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$7.32
156	L0178-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + BROWN; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000031580	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.78
157	L0179-00	TAPE, 3/4" SCOTCH SUPER 33 + GRAY; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 3M 7000006099	BOX	50	NO BID	\$7.50	\$6.40	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.22
158	L0180-00	TRUMETER, TIME LAPSED 24VAC 50/60HZ EMM QUARTZ CHICAGO, MODEL# T50A4	EA	50	NO BID	\$29.09	NO BID	\$43.00	\$34.15	NO BID
159	L0180-01	TRUMETER, 90-264VAC 50/60HZ ROHS MODEL #722-0004	EA	50	NO BID	\$25.28	NO BID	\$31.00	\$27.40	NO BID
160	L0181-00	TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN, 100 KVA, 120V PRI/24VAC SEC, GENERAL ELECTRIC MODEL #9T58K2875	EA	10	NO BID	\$305.27	NO BID	\$137.00	NO BID	NO BID
161	L0181-01	TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN, 100 KVA 240-480V PRI/24VAC SEC, GENERAL ELECTRIC MODEL #9T58K3027	EA	10	NO BID	\$305.27	NO BID	\$141.00	NO BID	NO BID
162	L0181-02	TRANSFORMER, STEP DOWN 100KVA 240-480V PRI/120VAC SEC, GENERAL ELECTRIC MODEL #T58K2804	EA	10	NO BID	\$129.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
163	L0182-00	STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 0 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE D MODEL #8536SB02V01S	EA	4	NO BID	\$251.36	\$450.00	\$292.00	NO BID	NO BID
164	L0182-01	STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 1 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536SCO3V01S	EA	8	NO BID	\$291.59	\$530.00	\$335.00	NO BID	NO BID
165	L0182-02	STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 2 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536SDO1V01S	EA	12	NO BID	\$530.31	\$975.00	\$595.00	NO BID	NO BID
166	L0182-03	STARTER, MOTOR SIZE 3 24VAC CONTROL COIL, SQUARE D MODEL# 8536SEO1V01S	EA	4	NO BID	\$871.71	NO BID	\$985.00	NO BID	NO BID
167	L0183-00	LIGHT, PILOT 24VAC LED RED POWER MODEL# CSW30SD1E26	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$86.00	\$68.05	NO BID
168	L0183-01	LIGHT, PILOT 24VAC LED BLUE POWER MODEL# CSW30SD4E26	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$86.00	\$68.05	NO BID
169	L0183-02	LIGHT, PILOT 24VAC LED YELLOW POWER MODEL# CSW30SD3E26	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$86.00	\$68.05	NO BID
170	L0183-03	LIGHT, PILOT 24VAC LED WHITE POWER MODEL# CSW30SD0E26	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$86.00	\$68.05	NO BID
171	L0184-00	RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC 8 PINS POWER MODEL# R15-2012-23- 5024-WTL, AB-700HA32A244, OR 750XBXRC24A-750	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.00	NO BID	NO BID



					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS ELECTRIC SUPPLY	CONSOLIDATED ELECT. DIST.	CAPP INC	COASTAL AUTOMATION	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
172	L0184-01	RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC 11 PINS POWER MODEL# R15-2013-23- 5024-WTL, AB-700HA33A244, OR 750XCXRC24A-750	EA	50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.00	NO BID	NO BID
173	L0184-02	RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VDC 8 PINS POWER MODEL# R15-2012-23- 1024-WTL, AB-700HA32Z244, OR 750XBXR24D-750	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$39.00	NO BID	NO BID
174	L0184-03	RELAYS, CONTROL COIL 24VAC 11 PINS POWER MODEL# R15-2013-23- 1024-WTL, AB-700HA33Z244 OR 750XBXR24D-750	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$46.00	NO BID	NO BID
175	L0185-00	MODULE, CONTACT NORMALLY CLOSE CONTACT SQUARE D 9998S01	EA	20	NO BID	\$31.91	\$40.00	\$38.00	NO BID	NO BID
176	L0186-00	MODULE, CONTACT NORMALLY OPEN INTERLOCK SIZE 0-7 SQUARE D 9999SX6	EA	20	NO BID	\$40.71	\$84.00	\$66.00	NO BID	NO BID
177	L0187-00	TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 24VAC, 0.6-60 SEC SQUARE D 9050JCK13V14	EA	10	NO BID	\$44.42	\$84.00	\$78.00	\$86.75	NO BID
178	L0187-01	TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 120VAC, 0.6-60 SEC SQUARE D 9050JCK13V20	EA	10	NO BID	\$44.42	\$84.00	\$79.00	\$86.75	NO BID
179	L0187-02	TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 24VAC, 0.1-10 MIN SQUARE D 9050JCK16V14	EA	10	NO BID	\$49.54	\$88.00	\$86.00	\$85.85	NO BID
180	L0187-03	TIMER, PLUG IN, ON DELAY 8 PINS 120VAC, 0.1-10 MIN SQUARE D 9050JCK16V20	EA	10	NO BID	\$49.54	\$88.00	\$86.00	\$85.85	NO BID
181	L0188-00	PB1011-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE, EDISON BURNDY BUCHANNA	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
182	L0188-01	PB1012-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
183	L0188-02	PB1013-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE, 1492100X	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
184	L0188-03	PB1041-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
185	L0188-04	PB1042-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
186	L0188-05	PB1043-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE, 1492PD3141	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
187	L0188-06	PB1061-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
188	L0188-07	PB1062-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
189	L0188-08	PB1063-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
190	L0188-09	PB3061-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
191	L0188-10	PB3062-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
192	L0188-11	PB3063-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION BLOCKS 1 POLE	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
193	L0190-00	9999SX04 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D	EA	6	NO BID	\$92.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
194	L0190-01	9999S1X10 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D	EA	5	NO BID	\$54.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
195	L0190-02	9999S1X11 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D	EA	5	NO BID	\$46.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
196	L0190-03	9999S1X12 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D	EA	5	NO BID	\$46.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN	DEALERS	CONSOLIDATED	CAPP INC	COASTAL	MSC
					BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX	CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	BROWNSVILLE, TX	HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
197	L0190-04	9999S1X14 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D	EA	5	NO BID	\$46.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
198	L0192-00	EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 3A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1492-M2C030	EA	10	NO BID	\$43.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
199	L0192-01	EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 5A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1492-M2C050	EA	10	NO BID	\$43.92	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
200	L0192-02	EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 10A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT, OR ALLEN BRALEY 1492-M2C100	EA	10	NO BID	\$40.16	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
201	L0194-00	1 POLE D10-WMS1D10 240V BREAKER DIN RAIL	EA	10	NO BID	\$18.62	NO BID	\$43.00	NO BID	NO BID
202	L0196-00	POWER PACT, CIRCUIT BREAKER, 240V, SQUARE D #QB150	EA	8	NO BID	\$27.46	NO BID	\$23.00	NO BID	NO BID
203	L0198-00	CABLE, Copper #14AWG 3 Pairs TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
204	L0198-01	CABLE, Copper #14AWG 6 Pairs TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.47	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
205	L0198-02	CABLE, Copper Wire 4C/#3 TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$8.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
206	L0198-03	CABLE, Copper Wire 4C/#4 TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$6.665	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
207	L0198-04	CABLE, Copper Wire 4C/#6 TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$4.46	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
208	L0198-05	CABLE, Copper Wire 4C/#8 TC 1000 FT REEL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$2.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
209	L0200-00	HOFFMAN ENCLOSURE A48H3612GQRLP	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,600.00	\$3,231.00	NO BID	NO BID
210	L0201-00	FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 1AMP, LF- KLK010	EA	20	NO BID	\$7.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.95	NO BID
211	L0201-01	FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 3AMP, LF- KLK030	EA	20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.95	NO BID
212	L0201-02	FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 5AMP, LF- KLK050	EA	20	NO BID	\$7.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$42.90	NO BID
213	L0201-03	FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 10AMP, LF- KLK100	EA	20	NO BID	\$7.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$41.05	NO BID
214	L0203-01	3 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600VAC CLASS CC, 30AMP MAX SQUARE D OR LITTELFUSE L60030C-3PQDINR	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$22.60	NO BID
215	L0203-00	2 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600V 30A MAX, LITTELFUSE #L60030C2PQDINR	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.25	NO BID
216	L0205-00	FUSE BLOCKS, LF SERIES, CLASS CC/CD, 3 POLES, 30 AMP RATING, CONNECTOR TYPE: PRESSURE	EA	6	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.35	NO BID
217	L0207-00	FUSE HOLDER 2 POLE 600VAC LUG BOLT BCA6032PQMT, LF-L60030M-	EA	12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$14.75	NO BID
218	L0209-00	HORN, 24 VAC, FEDERAL SIGNAL 350-024-30, OR AB-855HFG24GPA	EA	15	NO BID	\$105.00	NO BID	\$151.00	\$143.95	NO BID
219	L0211-00	PILOT LIGHT COMPLETE, 30 MM, 24V AC/DC VOLTAGE, LAMP TYPE: LED, TERMINAL CONNECTION: PRESSURE PLATE	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
220	L0213-00	BEACON WARNING LIGHT, LED, 12 TO 24V AC/DC OR 120 TO 240V, AB- 855BSS35SL4	EA	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$305.00	NO BID	NO BID
221	L0215-00	HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK PLATE A24P24AL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$243.00	\$213.00	NO BID	NO BID
222	L0215-01	HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK PLATE A30P24AL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$291.00	\$248.00	NO BID	NO BID
223	L0215-02	HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK PLATE A36P30AL	EA	10	NO BID	NO BID	\$419.00	\$357.00	NO BID	NO BID
224	L0215-03	HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK PLATE A48P36AL	EA	4	NO BID	NO BID	\$653.00	\$556.00	NO BID	NO BID

					CORE & MAIN BROWNSVILLE, TX	DEALERS ELECTRIC SUPPLY HARLINGEN, TX	CONSOLIDATED ELECT. DIST. BROWNSVILLE, TX	CAPP INC CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA	COASTAL AUTOMATION BROWNSVILLE, TX	MSC HARLINGEN, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NUMBER	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
225	L0219-00	SIZE 1 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD OR AB-100C30J10 + AB-193EEED	EA	8	NO BID	65.22 41.73 106.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
226	L0219-01	SIZE 2 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD OR AB- 100C85J10 + AB-193EEGE	EA	12	NO BID	132.92 186.25 319.17	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
227	L0219-02	SIZE 3 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD OR AB- 100E116KJ11L + AB-193EEHJ	EA	12	NO BID	193.14 186.25 379.39	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
228	L0219-03	SIZE 1 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD	EA	12	NO BID	47.99 65.22 113.21	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
229	L0219-04	SIZE 2 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD	EA	12	NO BID	132.92 186.25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
230	L0219-05	SIZE 3 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D WITH OVERLOAD	EA	12	NO BID	193.14 186.25 379.39	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
231	L0221-00	NON-ILLUMINATED SELECTOR SWITCH, 30 MM, 3, MAINTAINED, 2NO/2NC, LEVELER, SQUARE D 800T-J17A	EA	5	NO BID	\$45.91	NO BID	\$78.00	NO BID	NO BID
232	1	SQUARE D 9070T150D23 120/240 TO 24VAC, OR ALLEN BRADLEY 1497B- A4-M13-0-N	EA	20	NO BID	\$143.58	\$275.00	\$103.00	NO BID	NO BID

APPROVED BY:

*DiSolitaire* 7-1-2022

DIANE SOLITAIRE