BPROWNNYILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B048-22 ANNUAL SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL INVENTORY MATERIAL
DATE AND TIME: JUNE 17, 2022 -2:30 PM
TRAYER PRIESTER
SUN WESCO TEXAS ELECTRIC
NIGHTSWITCH ENGINEERING |TRASTAR. INC. TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC IRBY UTILITY -
ENTERPRISES CORP. NICHOLSON DISTRIBUTION COOPERATIVES
CANTON. MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRQO, CA | RICHARDSON. TX SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX

ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

I E0002-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID :g;":? NO BID $61.60 $58.92 $66.52 $67.76

2 E0005-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $122.00 NO BID $100.00 $109.43 NO BID $120.00

3 E0006-00 200 NO BID $7.39 NO BID NO BID $12.23 $6.60 $9.40 $8.66 $9.84 $10.00

4 E0007-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $297.84 $300.75 $225.00 $196.08 $188.36 $200.00

5 E0008-00 400 NO BID $14.29 NO BID NO BID $19.28 NO BID $11.14 $10.29 $11.40 $11.95

. $6.03

6 E0009-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 5934 $10.50 $8.25 $5.63 $7.77 NO BID

7 E0010-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.44 NO BID $9.61 $8.88 $13.09 NO BID

8 éz)‘(’)‘;‘(’)'_‘olo 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.62 NO BID $9.40 $8.67 $13.02 $10.00

22
9 E0012-00 500 NO BID $144.00 NO BID NO BID $$191—6-155 NO BID $77.00 $97.47 $83.45 $91.00
Option 1 $108.15
2 2l 2

10 E0012.00 500 NO BID $119.00 NO BID NO BID e $119.40 $93.18 $81.23 $90.02 $112.00

1 E0012-01 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $270.69 NO BID $134.50 $158.34 $175.50 $177.50

12 ;‘g;i’foll 50 NO BID $124.00 NO BID NO BID $252.48 $123.20 $172.00 $149.64 $165.86 $168.00

13 E0013-00 300 NO BID $29.00 NO BID NO BID $16.32 NO BID $17.63 $19.94 $17.15 $21.00

14 E0014-00 500 NO BID $1.84 NO BID NO BID $3.40 $3.50 $1.15 $2.24 $2.75 $2.60




TRAYER PRIESTER
SUN WESCO TEXAS ELECTRIC
NIGHTSWITCH ENGINEERING [TRASTAR, INC.| TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC IRBY UTILITY
ENTERPRISES CORP. NICHOLSON DISTRIBUTION COOPERATIVES
CANTON, MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX AUSTIN. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM # BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
15 E0015-00 150 | NOBID $1.83 NO BID NO BID :gzg $2.54 $1.35 $3.02 $3.78 $1.60
16 E0016-00 100 | NOBID $5.19 NO BID NO BID 2‘9" ;‘: $6.20 $4.95 $5.36 $6.17 $4.00
5.
17 E0017-00 200 |  NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $$| 48607 $8.70 $2.42 $7.30 $3.84 $5.50
18 E0018-00 200 | NOBID $7.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.70 $6.09 $10.15 $9.50
19 E0020-00  |1.500| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.92 $14.90 $8.75 $8.35 $10.84 $9.30
20 E0021-00 300 | NOBID $17.00 NO BID NO BID $24.40 $20.80 $17.00 $16.24 $13.50 $18.75
$1.22 $2.10 PLUS
2 22- : 02 . 45 :
! E0022-00 400 | NOBID $2.89 NO BID NO BID N REIGHT $1.0 $1.46 $1.4 $1.80
22 E0023-00 200 | NOBID $5.49 NO BID NO BID $8.32 NO BID $2.92 $3.43 $4.17 $4.00
23 E0024-00 300 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $67.24 $73.00 $34.66 $29.92 $33.21 $33.57
24 E0025-00 150 | NOBID $21.00 NO BID NO BID $18.42 $25.30 $12.70 ::é;ﬁ $13.07 $12.25
25 E0026-00 300 | NOBID $9.00 NO BID NO BID $14.11 $10.55 $5.25 $4.85 $5.46 $7.00
26 E0026-01 150 | NOBID $13.00 NO BID NO BID $53.03 NO BID $13.50 $15.63 $17.77 $18.00
$12.28
27 E0027-00 150 | NOBID $9.49 NO BID NO BID $19.96 $11.00 $13.30 5890 $14.66 $14.50
28 E0028-00  |3.000| NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.35 NO BID $0.24 $0.22 $0.29 $0.35
29 E0029-00  [6.000 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.72 NO BID $0.52 $0.49 $0.61 $0.60
30 E0030-00 50 | NOBID $10.00 NO BID NO BID $ﬁ92'7697 NO BID $94.30 $88.15 $12.84 $8.60
$4.66
31 E0031-00 400 | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.26 $8.22 $5.25 $4.87 $5.49 $6.95
$8.03
32 E0041-00 50 | NOBID $134.00 NO BID NO BID $163.65 $162.00 $93.51 $89.45 $106.84 $105.00
33 E0049-00 200 | NOBID $9.00 NO BID NO BID $16.98 $10.20 $7.20 $6.63 $7.92 $7.75




TRAYER PRIESTER - -
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESI:JPT{ISES ENG(I:I\(I)ii}'UNG TRASTAR. INC. TECHLINE le::ldtsgé)N KBS ELECTRIC l)lsxﬁggglON IRBY UTILITY TCh())(C/;‘SE[lE([fTClyE]SC
CANTON, MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX [ AUSTIN.TX | SANANTONIO. TX | BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN. TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
34 E0100-00 150 NO BID $2.59 NO BID NO BID $2.69 $3.00 $1.52 $1.55 $1.84 $2.00
35 E0101-00 2,000 NO BID $2.84 NO BID NO BID $3.06 $3.40 $1.74 $1.82 $2.12 $2.10
36 E0102-00 500 NO BID $3.10 NO BID NO BID $3.30 $3.75 $2.00 $2.02 $2.38 $2.45
37 E0104-00 100 NO BID $4.09 NO BID NOBID $6.43 $4.92 $2.94 $3.99 $3.12 $3.00
38 E0107-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.39 $6.00 $4.50 :Zgg $9.44 $5.25
39 E0110-00 100 NO BID $9.00 NO BID NO BID $8.76 $7.85 $4.26 $3.76 $4.49 $5.20
40 EO111-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.05 $8.50 $4.50 $4.15 $5.09 $6.30
41 EO0119-00 50 NO BID $8.00 NO BID NO BID $9.52 $7.85 $4.12 $5.77 $4.90 $4.50
42 E0120-00 50 NO BID $9.00 NO BID NO BID $10.53 $9.65 $4.41 :2(7); $5.41 $5.00
43 E0121-00 100 NO BID $14.00 NO BID NOBID $17.15 NO BID $7.81 2322 $8.32 $7.65
44 E0125-00 200 NO BID $1.27 NO BID NO BID $1.86 $0.70 $0.60 §82? $1.07 $0.75
45 E0128-00 300 NO BID $2.50 NO BID NO BID $4.05 $1.70 $2.60 $1.25 $2.80 $2.85
46 E0133-00 100 NO BID $5.69 NO BID NO BID $14.26 $6.90 $6.13 :Zi; $8.84 $7.30
47 E0135-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $2.26 NO BID $1.07 $1.01 $1.17 $2.25
48 E0136-00 200 NO BID $2.59 NO BID NOBID $4.03 $2.90 $2.00 $2.48 $2.66 $2.55
49 E0138-00 3,000 NO BID $0.69 NO BID NO BID $0.92 $0.80 $0.52 $0.58 $0.69 $0.63
50 E0139-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.96 NO BID $0.26 $0.28 $0.30 $0.27
51 E0140-00 1.500 NO BID $3.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.30 NO BID $0.72 $1.6t NO BID
52 E0142-00 1.500 NO BID $2.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.65 NO BID $0.21 $0.42 NO BID
53 E0143-00 1.500 NO BID $2.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.40 NO BID $0.13 $0.40 NO BID




TRAYER PRIESTER -
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESIS’TQISES ENG(I:IEI)I;EIZ;’I.UNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE ngl:ét:(‘)N KBS ELECTRIC DlS']YvR[;:lSB(l:J'CI‘)lON IRBY UTILITY Tg())(SSEi;‘{LAE'](':lyEISC
CANTON, MA BLANCO, TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX [ AUSTIN.TX | SANANTONIO. TX | BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN. TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
54 E0144-00 1.500 NO BID $3.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.30 NO BID $0.13 $0.32 NO BID
55 E0149-00 2.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.62 $0.99 NO BID
56 E0195-00 5,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.50 $7.85 $0.40 NO BID $0.57 NO BID
57 E0196-00 3,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.78 $10.45 $0.63 NO BID $0.88 NO BID
58 E0198-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.16 $15.25 $7.01 $7.98 $7.88 $9.00
59 E0375-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.72 $2.60 $3.60 $1.30 $1.33 NO BID
60 E0376-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.25 $4.75 $6.65 $2.21 $2.25 NO BID
61 E0382-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.92 NO BID $7.20 $6.65 $7.94 $7.75
62 E0385-00 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.36 NO BID $8.10 $7.42 $8.87 $8.60
63 E0400-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID z’:ig $2.25 $0.90 $3.23 $1.05 $0.95
64 E0403-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ;S?g $4.15 $1.80 $1.96 $1.99 NO BID
65 E0404-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.49 $5.30 $2.31 $2.65 $2.61 NO BID
$13.25
66 E0405-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.35 $7.80 $3.15 $5.03 $3.05 $2.95
$5.69
67 E0413-00 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.79 $1.40 $1.05 $0.66 $0.66 $1.00
68 E0414-00 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.89 $1.48 $1.02 $0.73 $0.74 $0.95
69 E0415-00 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.90 $1.80 $0.95 $0.87 $0.62 $0.90
70 E0416-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.90 $1.80 $1.07 $0.87 $0.62 $1.00
71 E0417-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.40 $2.52 $1.42 $1.19 $1.17 $1.30
72 E0418-00 1,500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.48 $2.60 $1.22 $1.26 $1.66 $1.15
73 E0420-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.66 $7.20 $3.20 $3.41 $3.46 $3.00




TRAYER PRIESTER - - .
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESI:JPTIISES ENG(I:]\(I)l;:g.“NG TRASTAR.INC.| TECHLINE lel:gll: SS(L) " KBS ELECTRIC DI STV‘:{I;:S% on | IRBY UTILITY ch g (l‘)\:EE{lf;?élSC
CANTON. MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY [ UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

74 E0422-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.80 $10.50 $4.00 $4.98 $3.94 $3.70

75 E0464-00 500 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID :2222 NO BID $40.20 $37.12 $45.17 $41.75

76 E0465-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $101.86 NO BID NO BID $39.20 $96.84 NO BID
77 E0467-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $147.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID $151.07 NO BID
78 E0478-00 100 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.69 NO BID
79 E0479-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.97 NO BID
80 E0480-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.97 NO BID
81 E0481-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.84 NO BID
82 E0483-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.17 NO BID
83 E0485-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.69 NO BID
84 E0486-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.69 NO BID
85 E0487-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.69 NO BID
86 E0488-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.69 NO BID
87 E0489-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.42 NO BID
88 E0490-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.15 NO BID
89 E0491-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.42 NO BID
90 E0492-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.42 NO BID
91 E0493-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.15 NO BID
92 E0495-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.15 NO BID
93 E0496-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID $13.15 NO BID
94 E0497-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.92 NO BID




TRAYER PRIESTER —— .
NIGHTSWITCH ENTE'SI;JPTUSES ENG(l:I\é)iil.llNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE ngl;:gtSK(L)N KBS ELECTRIC Dlsx{?gﬁglON IRBY UTILITY nggsei[f_ﬁyssc
CANTON. MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX [ AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
95 E0499-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.84 NO BID
96 E0501-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.79 $5.60 $1.64 $3.76 . $2.40 $4.25
97 E0505-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.09 $16.44 $8.72 $8.73 $10.21 $12.50
98 E0543-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.30 $6.20 $2.42 $2.42 $3.02 $4.65
99 E0544-00 200 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $11.16 $13.00 $4.70 $4.69 $5.50 $9.80
100 E0600-00 50 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.07 $3.33 NO BID
101 E0601-00 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $0.64 $3.33 NO BID
102 E0602-00 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $0.67 $3.33 NO BID
103 E0603-00 200 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.73 $3.33 $3.60
104 E0604-00 200 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.73 $3.33 $3.60
105 E0605-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.73 $3.33 NO BID
106 E0607-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.73 $3.33 $3.70
107 E0609-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.73 $3.33 $3.60
108 E0610-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $3.25 $5.92 $3.33 NO BID
109 E0613-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.93 NO BID $2.63 $5.71 $3.33 NO BID
110 E0623-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.15 $0.47 $0.40 $0.69 $0.45
111 E0624-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.15 $0.47 $0.40 $0.69 $0.45
112 E0627-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $L1S $0.60 $0.40 $0.69 $0.45
113 E0628-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.15 $0.60 $0.40 $0.69 $0.45
114 E0629-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1L.1S $0.60 $0.40 $0.69 $0.45
115 E0630-00 2,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.15 $0.50 $0.41 $0.69 $0.45




NIGHTSWITCH

SUN
ENTERPRISES

TRAYER
ENGINEERING
CORP.

TRASTAR, INC.

TECHLINE

PRIESTER
MELL &
NICHOLSON

KBS ELECTRIC

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

IRBY UTILITY

TEXAS ELECTRIC
COOPERATIVES

CANTON, MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
116 E0632-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.20 $0.91 $0.65 $0.69 NO BID
117 E0633-00 700 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $LIS $0.90 $0.64 $0.69 NO BID
118 E0634-00 1,500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.15 $0.87 $0.64 $0.69 NO BID
19 E0635-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.75 $1.20 $0.84 $0.67 $0.69 NO BID
120 E0639-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.85 $0.96 $0.33 $0.47 $0.84 NO BID
121 E0640-00 500 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $1.08 $2.46 $0.53 $0.46 $0.66 $0.50
122 E0641-00 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.08 $3.70 $0.62 $0.51 $0.66 $0.60
123 E0642-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.08 $5.20 $0.86 $2.51 $3.15 NO BID
124 E0650-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.15 NO BID $1.28 $1.03 $1.84 $L15
125 E0652-00 30 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $2.50 $6.16 $4.41 $2.27 $2.72 $3.65
126 E0670-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.95 $4.58 $1.60 $2.65 $2.84 NO BID
127 E0671-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.72 $16.00 $17.00 $10.67 $9.17 NO BID
128 E0720-00 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.86 $47.50 $35.30 $38.50 $39.50 $15.75
129 E0723-00 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.36 $100.75 NO BID $48.69 $52.79 NO BID
130 E0724-00 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $52.36 $97.98 $30.00 $47.33 $51.32 NO BID
131 E0727-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $23.29 $37.50 $94.00 $18.12 $19.66 NO BID
132 E0728-00 15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.56 $39.50 NO BID $19.10 $20.71 NO BID
133 E0730-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $50.78 $101.00 $111.76 $48.82 $40.97 NO BID
134 E0731-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $82.35 $146.90 NO BID $71.00 $79.98 NO BID
135 E0740-01 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.65 NO BID $3.50 $3.46 $3.57 $1.95
136 E0744-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.50 $10.17 $9.42 $8.80




TRAYER PRIESTER .
SUN WESCO TEXAS ELECTRIC
NIGHTSWITCH ENGINEERING |TRASTAR. INC. TECHLINE MELL & KBS ELECTRIC IRBY UTILITY -
ENTERPRISES CORP. NICHOLSON DISTRIBUTION COOPERATIVES
CANTON, MA BLANCO, TX SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
137 E0796-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $41.89 $101.85 $40.94 $49.20 $43.50 NO BID
138 E0797-00 50 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $61.76 NO BID $68.17 NO BID
2
139 E0900-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ::Iggg NO BID $76.70 $81.75 $78.57 $94.00
140 E0903-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 2:232 NO BID $40.15 $40.85 $40.17 NO BID
141 E0904-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $222.70 NO BID $200.00 $223.25 $204.32 NO BID
$156.25 i
142 E0904-01 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $150.07 NO BID $107.00 $141.11 $109.84 NO BID
143 E0907-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID ::;3?; NO BID $370.00 $328.50 $371.61 NO BID
$225.00
144 E0908-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $219.57 NO BID $154.00 $228.75 $163.21 NO BID
$291.25
145 E0909-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $147.92 NO BID $232.00 $327.46 $236.34 $359.00
$418.75
146 E0909-01 60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $444.89 NO BID $380.00 $471.55 $416.17 $516.00
147 E0921-00 320 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.00 $3.60 $3.55 $3.57 $3.60
148 E0922-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.65 $8.65 $7.12 $11.36 $7.66 NO BID
149 E0922-01 75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $68.59 $80.00 $56.50 $37.60 $54.61 NO BID
150 E0924-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID ::2(8)2; NO BID $26.50 $33.29 $30.61 NO BID
$127.50
151 E0925-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $96.58 NO BID $100.50 $91.10 $117.42 NO BID
152 E0926-00 600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.00 NO BID $35.75 $71.57 $32.17 $79.00
153 E0927-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $29.25 $29.69 $27.21 $25.00
154 E0932-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.34 $21.75 $12.80 $12.25 $12.21 $9.00
155 E0933-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.94 $20.35 $14.35 $14.39 $14.32 $11.50




TRAYER PRIESTER . 5
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESI:LTKISES ENG(l:l\(l)l;F;’I.UNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE Nl:\:'i:gll:S&ON KBS ELECTRIC DlS'I\'VR';‘:fJFT)lON IRBY UTILITY ngg:é;‘fﬁvélgc
CANTON, MA BLANCO, TX SAN LEANDRO.CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX [ AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP, TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

156 E0933-01 500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.74 $31.82 $22.50 g;?:f $21.71 $18.75
157 E0934-00 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.87 $5.54 $5.57 $5.98 $5.00

158 E0936-00 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $48.08 NO BID $33.00 $51.00 $42.90 NO BID
159 E0937-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID :Z;(S)g NO BID $31.00 $45.30 $33.84 NO BID
160 E0939-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $206.45 NO BID NO BID $193.22 $257.66 NO BID
161 E0942-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
162 E0942-01 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
163 E0942-02 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
164 E0942-03 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.40 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
165 E0942-04 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.40 NO BID $15.07 NO BID
166 E0942-05 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.70 NO BID $18.66 NO BID
167 E0942-06 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
168 E0942-07 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
169 E0942-08 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.30 NO BID $14.88 NO BID
170 E0943-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $206.00 NO BID $212.66 NO BID
171 E0945-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $330.00 NO BID $395.42 NO BID
172 E0945-02 50 NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $745.00 NO BID $833.47 NO BID
173 E0946-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $46.57 NO BID $47.20 $43.93 $51.52 NO BID
174 E0948-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $334.16 NO BID $248.20 $286.00 $327.61 $280.00
175 E0948-01 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $274.62 NO BID $250.00 $269.00 $299.66 $280.00
176 E0948-02 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $109.77 NO BID $100.00 $108.00 $115.15 $115.00




TRAYER PRIESTER - . o1 (2]
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESISPTUSES ENG(l:I:l)iEPI.{lNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE Nl:\:d:gtS(S(L)N KBS ELECTRIC DlST\ijl;gﬁfr)lON IRBY UTILITY T(;:(;(SSEI:IT’[(‘:IIIEISC
CANTON. MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO, CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX [ AUSTIN. TX SAN ANTONIO,TX | BASTROL. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

177 E0948-03 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $212.60 NO BID $150.00 $160.00 NO BID $170.00
178 E0959-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70.39 NO BID $133.20 NO BID $80.84 $97.00
179 E0960-00 1.500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.29 NO BID $15.20 $13.72 $14.17 $10.50
180 E0963-00 100 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $301.60 $310.22 NO BID $340.00
181 E0965-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $64.60 $56.07 $40.55 $32.58 $40.41 $43.50
182 E0965-01 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.36 $11.00 $6.25 $6.64 $7.80 $5.75
183 E0965-02 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.49 $13.40 $8.90 $6.67 $9.69 $8.75
184 E0966-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.76 $10.40 $7.75 $6.42 $7.77 $7.25
185 E0967-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.75 $15.90 $11.90 $10.59 $11.66 $9.85
186 E0968-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $165.78 $184.40 $138.00 $115.89 $122.08 $140.30
187 E0970-00 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.322.90 NO BID $700.00 $1.445.00 NO BID $780.00
188 g)%l;%rjolo 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.188.70 $860.00 $774.64 $950.21 $869.00
189 E0973-00 50 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $1,973.15 $1,655.00 $1,125.00 $1.079.71 $1.324.44 ::z(l)(l)gg
190 E0974-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID A $2,589.00 NO BID $1.480.00 NO BID NO BID $1.667.00
191 E0975-00 60 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $36.67 NO BID $23.75 $38.35 $25.25 NO BID
192 E0984-00 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.15 $12.30 $3.82 $3.22 $6.77 $4.00
193 E0984-01 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.40 NO BID $9.52 NO BID
194 E0985-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.00 NO BID $20.30 NO BID
195 E0986-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $158.26 NO BID $79.21 $76.95 $139.15 $140.00
196 E0986-01 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $217.45 NO BID $12.00 $10.03 $190.21 $99.00
197 E0987-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.26 NO BID NO BID $15.75 $15.17 NO BID




nwtswrre | SN ENZEQ(:%'?NG masTAR e, TECHUNE | | gggggN es eLecric| | VSO0 | gy urimy |TEXAS ELECTRIC
CANTON, MA BLANCO, TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX [ SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX SAN ANTONIOLTX BANTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE

198 E0990-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.99 $9.00 $8.66 $9.37 $6.75

199 E0995-00 50 NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID $18.35 $15.11 $13.80 $15.61 $12.40
200 E1010-00 50 NO BID $436.00 NO BID NO BID $348.00 $522.00 $206.00 $197.45 $225.61 $227.00
201 E1011-00 50 NO BID $49.00 NO BID NO BID $88.25 $58.72 $46.50 $43.03 $50.17 $50.00
202 E1012-00 50 NOBID $79.00 NO BID NO BID $145.08 $94.76 $71.54 $66.10 $78.97 $76.00
203 E1013-00 50 NO BID $129.00 NO BID NOBID $180.43 $154.50 $85.50 $79.00 $96.66 $91.00
204 E1014-00 50 NO BID $159.00 NO BID NO BID $229.79 $189.50 $114.00 $108.60 $128.07 $125.00
205 E1019-00 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $398.03 $470.35 $340.00 $185.64 $210.84 $208.25
206 E1024-00 100 NO BID $51.00 NO BID NO BID $144.90 $59.40 $41.75 $38.58 $44.84 $44.50
207 E1031-00 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $707.00 $1.423.92 $805.40 NO BID
208 E1031-01 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $1.090.00 $1.456.52 $1.213.15 NO BID
209 E1031-02 10 NO BID Nd BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $675.00 $805.44 $735.15 NO BID
210 E1033-00 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $367.70 NO BID $298.00 NO BID $384.66 NO BID
211 E1037-00 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.99 NO BID $15.00 $14.27 $17.05 $16.50
212 E1038-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.56 NO BID $16.00 $14.88 $17.55 $19.20
213 E1039-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.80 NO BID $26.85 $25.68 $31.02 $29.60

214 E1050-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $190.86 NO BID $142.80 $159.77 NO BID $175.00
215 E1051-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $240.00 NO BID $164.50 $200.40 NO BID $215.00
216 E1059-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $63.50 $50.15 $24.60 $22.73 $27.84 $36.75

217 E1075-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,331.00 NO BID $1,500.00 $1.329.35 $1.661.21 NO BID
218 E1075-01 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.090.00 NO BID $1.220.61 NO BID




NIGHTSWITCH ENTESI;JPTUSES ENZZI\‘I:E:EE;NG TRASTAR. INC. TECHLINE N:)IE;EE(I;IEEL:N KBS ELECTRIC l)lS'lY\l/{l;:lSSlCJ('?l ON IRBY UTILITY TCE ())((I)A:E!;:{l;\E’l'ClyElSC
CANTON, MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
219 E1083-00 100 NO BID $9.00 NO BID NO BID :1:(2);2 $10.35 $9.50 $8.79 $10.66 $9.90
220 E1085-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.883.20 NO BID $3.900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
221 E1094-00 5 NO BID $19.00 NOBID NO BID $50.73 $21.25 $23.20 $21.42 $27.17 $24.75
222 E1098-00 288 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $167.15 $143.75 $150.00 NO BID $169.00 NO BID
223 E1098-01 288 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $78.58 $63.75 $83.00 NO BID $74.80 NO BID
224 E1145-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.48 NO BID $31.00 $29.86 $27.66 NO BID
225 E1202-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $94.96 NO BID $84.70 $82.29 $96.00 $105.00
226 E1203-00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.49 NO BID $74.11 $89.84 $127.15 $90.00
227 E1207-00 150 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.39 NO BID $63.00 $61.20 $66.92 $80.00
228 E1239-00 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $129.78 NO BID NO BID
229 E1240-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID IRIRIEECD $10.42 $10.52 $15.24 $12.65
FREIGHT
230 E1241-00 200 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID LA BOR $13.30 $13.27 $16.61 $16.15
FREIGHT
231 E1242-01 5.000 $10.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.00 NO BID $24.84 $31.50
232 E1243-01 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $21.18 NO BID $40.61 $50.75
233 E1259-00 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
234 E1365-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $;é);lgl;_ll,;,s NO BID $2.80 $3.61 NO BID
235 E1366-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $;|{6glpcl;1lgrg NO BID $1.98 $2.84 NO BID
236 E1367-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $lzl26é)lgll:ll'JI'S NO BID $4.34 $6.21 NO BID
237 E1368-00 1.000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1F2R‘l‘§Cl;);¥S NO BID $6.88 $8.84 NO BID




TRAYER PRIESTER . - =1
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESI:JPTUSES ENGg:)iiI.UNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE NIL\:/IE(ISII::LON KBS ELECTRIC l)lsx{iigﬁ?loN IRBY UTILITY TChC))(CI)A:El:{L;::'I?I.\I;EISC
CANTON, MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN. TX
ITEM # BPUB COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
238 E1369-00 1,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $£|§SIZIL;UT§ NO BID $0.12 $0.35 NO BID
239 E0969-01 6 NO BID NO BID $32,400.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $40.480.00 NO BID $49.082.05 NO BID
240 E0972-01 3 NO BID NO BID $33,133.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $38.939.00 NO BID $47.210.42 NO BID
241 E1219-02 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $206.53 $231.00 $208.00 $218.38 NO BID $264.00
242 E1220-02 500 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $331.53 $331.00 $298.00 $312.43 $297.84 i:;’igg
243 E1221-02 600 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $565.22 $640.00 $577.00 $604.32 $564.05 22;?88
244 E1222-02 600 NO BID NO BID NO BID $116.88 $103.26 $134.00 $121.00 $126.49 $129.66 $153.00
245 E1223-03 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $211.00 $233.70 $247.00 $222.00 $232.43 $258.95 iig;gg
246 E1223-04 3,000 NO BID NO BID NO BID $192.78 $228.26 $235.00 $211.00 $221.62 $224.84 $268.00
247 E1224-02 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID $239.00 $260.87 $269.00 $242.00 $254.05 $314.61 g:gzgg
248 E1226-01 50 NO BID NOBID NO BID $268.00 $266.31 $281.00 $253.00 $264.86 $348.17 :z?ggg
249 E1302-00 18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $208.44 $358.00
250 E1303-00 42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.05 NO BID NO BID $112.55 $109.66 $57.00
251 E1305-00 20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $234.34 NO BID NO BID $210.90 $257.66 NO BID
252 E1306-00 1.064 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $70.17 NO BID
253 E1307-00 36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $185.99 NO BID NO BID $167.39 $271.15 $358.00
254 E1307-01 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.05 NO BID NO BID $112.55 NO BID $358.00
255 E1307-02 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $237.74 NO BID NO BID $213.97 $294.57 $385.00
256 E1308-00 3.496 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $39.50 NO BID NO BID $34.78 $43.15 $43.00
257 E1309-00 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $71.71 NO BID NO BID $64.53 $123.40 $56.00
258 E1312-00 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $840.00 NO BID




TRAYER PRIESTER - .
NIGHTSWITCH ENTESRUPTUSES ENG(I:F\(I)!;F;I.UNG TRASTAR, INC. TECHLINE ngl:lo_ll:stg:)N KBS ELECTRIC DlS'xlI;ZSCT)ION IRBY UTILITY ngggg;‘;f_ﬁzzlsc
CANTON. MA BLANCO. TX SAN LEANDRO. CA | RICHARDSON. TX [ SAN ANTONIO, TX | SAN ANTONIO.TX | AUSTIN.TX | SAN ANTONIO. TX | BASTROP. TX GEORGETOWN, TX
ITEM #| BPUB COMMODITY | QTY [ UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
259 E1312-02 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.140.71 NO BID NO BID $1.026.64 NO BID NO BID
260 E1313-00 120 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $363.53 NO BID NO BID $327.18 $256.84 $358.00
261 E1314-00 240 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $363.53 NO BID NO BID $327.18 $256.84 $358.00
262 E1315-00 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $328.61 NO BID NO BID $295.75 $256.84 $385.00
263 E1316-00 400 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $161.66 $96.00
264 E1317-01 12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
265 E1321-00 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $329.74 NO BID NO BID $296.77 $341.66 $333.00
266 E1323-00 40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $125.05 NO BID NO BID $112.55 $196.92 $102.00
267 E1326-00 24 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $185.99 NO BID NO BID $167.39 $275.15 $358.00
268 E1327-00 8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $520.56 NO BID NO BID $468.50 $289.42 $358.00
-~
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