BROWNSVILLE

PuUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B049-22 WATERLINE MATERIAL FOR BOCA CHICA 16” WATER TRANSMISSION LINE AND 30TH STREET
ELEVATED WATER STORAGE TANK WATERLINE
DATE AND TIME: JUNE 9, 2022 - 10:30 AM

CORE & MAIN LP

AGUAWORKS PIPE

& SUPPLY
BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION UM QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
BOCA CHICA 16" WATER TRANSMISSION LINE

1 | 6-Inch DR-25 PVC LF 120 $11.37 $10.25
2 |8-Inch DR-25 PVC LF 60 $17.90 $16.14
3 |12-Inch DR-25 PVC LF 40 $40.45 $36.49
4 |16-Inch DR-25 PVC LF | 2,300 $70.76 $69.62
5 |16-Inch x 5/16" Steel Casing LF 20 $100.00 $54.86
6 |24-Inch x 7/16" Steel Casing LF 160 $126.67 $160.26
7 |6-Inch Gate Valve & Cover EA 3 $834.23 $858.21
8 |8-Inch Gate Valve & Cover EA 1 $1,244.23 $1,322.41
9 |12-Inch Gate Valve & Cover EA 3 $2,418.78 $2,536.12
10 |16-Inch Gate Valve & Cover EA 5 $11,730.95 $8,898.08
11 |16-Inch Tee EA 1 $1,091.72 $1,205.14
12 ]16-Inch x 6-Inch Tee EA 3 $666.22 $735.43
13 |16-Inch x 8-Inch Tee EA 2 $723.68 $798.86
14 [16-Inch x 12-Inch Tee EA 1 $864.99 $564.36
15 [12-Inch Tee EA 1 $478.31 $528.00
16 |16-Inch 90 Degree Bend EA 1 $779.06 $860.00
17 [6-Inch 45 Degree Bend EA 8 $90.59 $100.00
18 |8-Inch 45 Degree Bend EA 5 $132.00 $145.71
19 [12-Inch 45 Degree Bend EA 4 $284.71 $314.29
20 |16-Inch 45 Degree Bend EA 13 $556.99 $614.86
21 |8-Inch Cap EA 1 $74.55 $82.29
22 [8-Inch Blind Flange EA 1 $148.05 $163.43
23 |6-Inch x 4-Inch Reducer EA 1 $65.23 $72.00
24 |16-Inch x 8-Inch Reducer EA 1 $397.56 $438.86
25 |16-Inch x 12-Inch Reducer EA 1 $369.60 $408.00
26 |4" Restraining Joint (Megalug or Approved Equal) EA 1 $51.35 $104.74
27 |6" Restraining Joint (Megalug or Approved Equal) EA | 26 $64.29 $143.30
28 |8" Restraining Joint (Megalug or Approved Equal) EA 17 $86.73 $166.17
29 |12" Restraining Joint (Megalug or Approved Equal) EA 15 $158.48 $271.23
30 [16" Restraining Joint (Megalug or Approved Equal) EA 45 $326.52 $474.77
31 ]4-Inch Repair Clamp Coupling EA 1 $63.32 $259.66
32 |6-Inch Repair Clamp Coupling EA 2 $106.08 $346.76
33 |8-Inch Repair Clamp Coupling EA 2 $170.48 $413.60
34 |12-Inch Repair Clamp Coupling EA 3 $274.38 $550.23




AGUAWORKS PIPE

| CORE & MAIN LP & SUPPLY
LR | BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM # ITEM DESCRIPTION UM QTY UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
35 {16-Inch Repair Clamp Coupling EA 1 $524.40 $1,261.31
30TH STREET ELEVATED STORAGE TANK WATERLINE MATERIAL
1 [16-inch PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18. 1,250 LF NO BID $131.25
2 ]20-inch PVC AWWA C-900 DR-18. 425 LF NO BID $318.75
24" Steel Casing, 7/16" Thick, Smooth Steel Min.
3 Yield Strength 35,000 PSI, W/Skids. 163 LF NO BID $160.25
30" Steel Casing, 7/16" Thick, Smooth Steel Min.
4 Yield Strength 35,000 PSI, W/Skids. 20 LF NOBID —
16"x16" DI Wide Range Transition Coupling for PVC
: to AC Pipe Connection W/Gaskets. 2 EA IO el
6 16-inch 45 Deg. DI MJ X MJ Bend W/SS 316 Bolt Kit 7 EA NO BID $972.96
and Gaskets.
7 20-inch 45 Deg. DI MJ X MJ Bend W/SS 316 Bolt Kit 5 EA NO BID $1.824.91
and Gaskets.
g l§-1nch 11.25 Deg. DI MJ X MJ Bend W/SS 316 Bolt 3 EA NO BID $1,387.00
Kit and Gaskets.
16-inch Mechanical Joint Restraint (Mega Lug) with
0 Polyester Powder Coating and SS 316 T-Bolts. 28 EA NOBID $586.13
20-inch Mechanical Joint Restraint (Mega Lug) with
10 Polyester Powder Coating and SS 316 T-Bolts. 10 EA NOBID R
6-inch Mechanical Joint Restraint (Mega Lug) with
1 Polyester Powder Coating and SS 316 T-Bolts. 2 EA NO BID LRELE
16" x 16" X 16" DI Flange X Flange X Flange Tee
12 W/SS 316 and Gaskets. 1 EA NO BID $2,868.15
20" x 20" X 20" DI Flange X Flange X Flange Tee
3 W/SS 316 Bolt Kit and Gaskets. : EA NOBID iR
20" X 20" X 6" DI MJ X MJ X Flange Tee
) ,211.40
14 (Reducing on outlet) W/SS 316 Bolt Kit and Gaskets. ] EA Sl S
5 20" X 20" DI Wide Range Transition Coupling I EA NO BID $3.907.69
W/Gaskets.
16 20" X 16" DI MJ Reducer W/SS 316 Bolt Kit and 1 EA NO BID $2.195.97
Gaskets.
17 120" DI MJ Plug W/Gasket and SS 316 Bolts. 1 EA NO BID $878.19
18 16" DI Flange X MJ Resilient Gate Valves W/Gaskets 3 EA NO BID $9.111.89
and Valve Boxes.
19 20" DI Flange X MJ Resilient Gate Valve W/Gaskets 3 EA NO BID $19.624.94
and Valve Boxes.
Fire Hydrant W/ 6" DI Flange X MJ Gate Valve and
93.95
20 Valve Box W/SS 316 Bolt Kit and Gaskets. EA NOBID i
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