



## BID TABULATION

**BID NAME:** B040-22 SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL INVENTORY MATERIAL

**DATE AND TIME:** MAY 12, 2022 - 11:00 AM

					KBS ELECTRIC	PRIESTER MELL & NICHOLSON	TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES	TECHLINE, INC	WESCO DISTRIBUTION
					AUSTIN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	GEORGETOWN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX
ITEM #	BPUB COMMODITY	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	E0969-01	Switchgear 15KV-2SD MOST 9 Oil S/S 600/200A	4	EA	\$36,700.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	E0914-00	Cable, URD 1/0 STR 15KV Aluminum Primary Direct Burial (PDB), 19W, 220 MIL, EPR 133%	60,000	FT	NO BID	\$6.70	\$4.37	\$3.18	\$2.81
3	E0915-00	500 MCM 15 KV AL PDB, 220 MIL, MV-90 15 KV/133% 500KCM-1C AL 1/C 500 MCM 37/W CPRS AL, 220 NOM EPR,	15,000	FT	NO BID	\$10.00	\$8.74	\$11.88	\$6.10
4	E0912-00	Cable URD , 350 MCM 3/C AL XLP, Code name "WESLEYAN" 4/0 Neutral Wire (1,000 FT. Reels) with footage markers	10,000	FT	NO BID	\$8.20	\$4.30	\$4.95 \$7.12	\$6.99
5	E0245-00	Cable #6 STR. 1-Conductor THHN/THWN INSU CU Black	12,000	FT	NO BID	\$1.95	\$1.15	NO BID	\$1.05
6	E0919-00	Pipe URD 1" Polyethylene Duct, SCH 40. HDPE Smooth Wall, with Pulling Rope #WP1130 (3,000 ft/Reel), Black Color	21,000	FT	\$0.67	\$0.75	\$0.79	\$0.68	\$0.77
7	E0920-01	Pipe URD 2.5" Polyethylene Duct, SCH 40. HDPE Smooth Wall, with Pulling Rope (2,000 ft/Reel), Black Color	20,000	FT	\$2.00	\$1.95	\$2.35	\$1.75	\$2.35
8	E0465-00	Fuseholder 100 Amp, 15/27KV Loadbreak, 125BIL with lever, Arm, Chance # T720-213T; ABB #7194C60G05MP	100	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.07	\$56.40
9	E0900-00	Arrestor URD, 15KV Cooper #3238018C10M, Hubbell 215ELA10; Maclean #8132B0010J001; Elastimold #167ESA10	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$95.00	\$107.49	\$158.00
10	E0939-00	Elbow URD 500 MCM 220 MIL deadbreak, Elbow RTE. Hubbell #625BTL33 Hubbell Mfg. Only	100	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$183.97	\$197.61

					KBS ELECTRIC	PRIESTER MELL & NICHOLSON	TEXAS ELECTRIC COOPERATIVES	TECHLINE, INC	WESCO DISTRIBUTION
					AUSTIN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	GEORGETOWN, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX	SAN ANTONIO, TX
ITEM #	BPUB COMMODITY	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
11	E0948-00	Above Grade Secondary Pedestals, AP#1014DG; Pencil #AG-15HDX-L3 5-EWB; Hubbell #SP101536MDH; Nordic #PSPS-101544-MG-X; Pencil #AG15HDNL000; Oldcastle #12201195 1220-12;	100	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$362.00	\$215.00 \$281.00	\$305.51 \$255.68
12	E0970-00	Cabinet, Single Phase Aluminum Maysteel #CC33018TH(RS)AL .125 Aluminum TRINETICS # 63294303; BARFIELD #183030SP	10	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$865.00	\$1,042.00	\$996.00 \$1,202.03
13	E0973-00	Cabinet URD 3Phase 15KV 200 Amp Trinetics/Maysteel #CW360-18TH ( R ) AL Std; 60" wide aluminum enclosure, 0.090" thickness; Musell 7GY 3.29/1.5 Green Paint ANSI C57.12.28 Dimensions 30"Hx60"Wx18"D; Trinetic #63294307; Aluma Form #ENC-SC3-306018-A1-G	10	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,115.00	\$1,213.00	\$1,284.06 \$1,438.00
14	E0974-00	Trinetics/Maysteel #CC366-22TH ( R ) AL Std; 66" wide Aluminum enclosure, 0.125" thickness; Musell 7GY 3.29/1.5 Green Paint ANSI C57.12.28 Dimensions 30"Hx66"Wx22"D; must come with Sstl Hinges, lifting nuts, ground nuts, carriage bolts, screw, & washer. Trinetic	6	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,665.00	\$2,181.00	\$1,851.16 \$2,215.27
15	E0986-01	Terminator, 500 MCM 15 KV URD, Outdoor Cold Shrink Termination Kits, 3M#7654-S-4 NO SUBSTITUTION	60	EA	NO BID	NO BID	\$191.00	\$149.35	\$197.15
16	E0996-00	Pad URD Transformer #F4848-4CSL1228T, Diversitech	50	EA	NO BID	\$198.00	\$225.00	\$187.36	\$723.74 \$562.93
		Mfg/Brand Name			EATON/COOPER, DURALINE	AWG, PETROFLEX, DIVERSITECH	CME WIRE AND CABLE, DURALINE, OLD CASTLE, ALUMAFORM, DIVERSITECH	OKONITE, PRYSMIAN, PRIORITY WIRE, PETROFLEX, HPS, PENCIL, TRINETICS, 3M, DIVERSITECH	OKONITE, PRIORITY WIRE, DURALINE, ABB, MACLEAN, HUBBELL, PENCELL, OLD CASTLE, ALUMAFORM, TRINETICS
		Lead Time			17 - 44 WEEKS	21 DAYS - 28 WEEKS	3 - 48 WEEKS	2 - 50 WEEKS	1 - 45 WEEKS

APPROVED BY:

*D Solitaire* 5-13-2022

DIANE SOLITAIRE