



**B R O W N S V I L L E  
P U B L I C U T I L I T I E S B O A R D**

**BID TABULATION**

**BID NAME:** B037-22 ROAD SERVICE TO INCLUDE AUTOMOBILE TIRES

**OPENING DATE & TIME:** APRIL 28, 2022 - 10:00 AM

**BID PRICING FORM - SERVICE**

			AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS FORT WORTH, TX	SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC HARLINGEN, TX	JAIME'S TIRE STORE BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
<b>TIRE MOUNTING/ DISMOUNTING (NEW &amp; USED)</b>					
1	SIZES (ALL PLYS) UP TO -16.5" DIAMETER	200	NO BID	\$12.00	\$10.00
2	SIZES (ALL PLYS) 17.0" – 22.0" DIAMETER	100	NO BID	\$18.00	\$18.50
3	SIZES (ALL PLYS) 22.5" – 24.5" DIAMETER	100	NO BID	\$25.00	\$25.00
4	SIZES (ALL PLYS) 25.0" – AND UP	100	NO BID	\$65.00	\$65.00
5	WHEEL SPIN BALANCING (PASSENGER/LIGHT TRUCK)	500	NO BID	\$12.00	\$12.00
<b>FLAT REPAIR</b>					
6	PASSENGER CAR TIRES	50	NO BID	\$10.00	\$10.00
7	LIGHT TRUCK TIRES (ALL PLYS)	100	NO BID	\$12.00	\$12.00
8	MEDIUM/HEAVY TRUCK TIRES (ALL PLYs)	200	NO BID	\$35.00	\$28.50
9	OFF ROAD TIRES	50	NO BID	\$55.00	\$48.50
10	OFF ROAD LOADER TIRES	30	NO BID	\$85.00	\$85.00
<b>PASSENGER CARS AND LIGHT TRUCKS</b>					
11	TIRE DISPOSAL FEE	1000	NO BID	\$3.00	\$3.00
12	TRUCK TIRE CASINGS (AMOUNT CREDITED PER CASING)	500	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>HEAVY TRUCKS</b>					
13	TIRE DISPOSAL FEE	150	NO BID	\$7.00	\$10.00
14	WHEEL SPIN BALANCING (HEAVY TRUCKS)	100	NO BID	\$35.00	\$38.50
15	TRUCK TIRE CASINGS (AMOUNT CREDITED PER CASING)	100	NO BID	\$35.00	NO BID
16	<b>SUBTOTAL</b>		NO BID	\$44,250.00	\$39,575.00
17	CASH DISCOUNT FOR EARLY PAYMENT (WITHIN 21 DAYS)		NO BID	\$0.00	\$0.00

			AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS FORT WORTH, TX	SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC HARLINGEN, TX	JAIME'S TIRE STORE BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	QTY	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
18	TOTAL BID PRICING ROAD SERVICES (LINES 16-17)		NO BID	\$44,250.00	\$39,575.00
19	GRAND TOTAL FOR BID PRICING ROAD SERVICE TO INCLUDE TIRES		NO BID	\$163,874.35	\$194,106.00
20	ADDITIONAL INFORMATION				
21	MINIMUM SERVICE CHARGE PER CALL		NO BID	\$85.00 + LABOR	\$55.00

APPROVED BY: *D Solitaire 5-2-2022*  
 DIANE SOLITAIRE



**BROWNSVILLE  
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD**

**BID TABULATION**

**BID NAME: B037-22 ROAD SERVICE TO INCLUDE AUTOMOBILE TIRES**

**OPENING DATE & TIME: APRIL 28, 2022 - 10:00 AM**

**BID PRICING FORM - TIRES**

					AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS	SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC	JAIME'S TIRE STORE
					FORT WORTH, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL QTY	U/M	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
1	Y0200-00	TIRE, 245/70R17, FIRESTONE P/N 191-316 OR EQUAL	60	EA	\$152.86	\$126.89	\$214.00
2	Y0200-01	TIRE, 245/70R17AT, FIRESTONE P/N 200-173 OR EQUAL	40	EA	\$147.92	\$139.73	\$229.00
3	Y0202-00	TIRE P225-70R15LE, FIRESTONE OR EQUAL	12	EA	\$100.67	\$105.75	\$113.00
4	Y0203-01	TIRE, P235/70R16, 104S FIRESTONE P/N 026-767 OR EQUAL	4	EA	\$114.52	\$81.00	\$163.00
5	Y0204-00	TIRE, LT235/85R16, FIRESTONE P/N 189-718 OR EQUAL	25	EA	\$119.47	\$112.00	\$180.00
6	Y0205-00	TIRE, LT235/85R16AT FIRESTONE P/N #189-633 OR EQUAL	20	EA	\$143.46	\$133.16	\$220.00
7	Y0208-00	TIRE 11L-16 FIRESTONE OR EQUAL	4	EA	\$121.95	\$106.75	\$189.00
8	Y0209-00	TIRE, 11R-22.5 T559 FIRESTONE P/N 290-491 OR EQUAL	30	EA	\$312.40	\$328.04	\$394.00
9	Y0210-00	TIRE, LT265/70R17 MUD/TERRAIN FIRESTONE P/N 190-296 OR EQUAL	50	EA	\$197.39	\$165.33	\$260.00
10	Y0214-00	TIRE, 385/65R22.5, FIRESTONE P/N 294-586 OR EQUAL	4	EA	\$510.80	\$510.80	\$560.00
11	Y0218-00	TIRE, 315/80R22.5 16 PLY, T819 FIRESTONE P/N 157-147 OR EQUAL	8	EA	\$410.95	\$404.75	\$550.00
12	Y0220-00	TIRE, 245/75R22.5 HWY RADIAL BRIDGESTONE P/N 292-869 OR EQUAL	4	EA	\$294.61	\$315.00	\$405.00
13	Y0223-00	TIRE, 225/70R19.5 MUD GRIP, BRIDGESTONE P/N 299-839 OR EQUAL	15	EA	\$190.94	\$270.00	\$275.00
14	Y0223-01	TIRE, 225/70R19.5 HWY, R250F BRIDGESTONE P/N 153-028 OR EQUAL	10	EA	\$275.60	\$251.00	\$275.00
15	Y0224-00	TIRE, 11-22.5 MUD GRIP, T831 FIRESTONE P/N 281-557 OR EQUAL	70	EA	\$315.64	\$382.70	\$487.00
16	Y0225-00	TIRE, 21L-24 BACKHOE, ALL TRACTION UTILITY. P/N 328-480 OR EQUAL	15	EA	\$666.85	\$783.24	\$775.00

					AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS	SOUTHERN TIRE MART LLC	JAIME'S TIRE STORE
					FORT WORTH, TX	HARLINGEN, TX	BROWNSVILLE, TX
ITEM NO.	COMMODITY NO.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL QTY	U/M	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE	UNIT PRICE
17	Y0226-00	TIRE, 14.5 X 75-16.1 BACKHOE TIRE, FIRESTONE P/N 321-567 OR EQUAL	15	EA	\$304.26	\$340.65	\$490.00
18	Y0227-00	TIRE, LT 265/75R16 AT FIRESTONE OR EQUAL	6	EA	\$167.21	\$142.19	\$246.00
19	Y0227-01	TIRE, LT265/75R16 MUD/TERRAIN FIRESTONE P/N 223-589 OR EQUAL	12	EA	\$201.59	\$150.00	\$250.00
20	Y0231-00	TIRE, 295/75 R22.5 REAR TRACTION FIRESTONE FD-663OR EQUAL	4	EA	\$311.28	\$335.60	\$468.00
21	Y0232-00	TIRE, 295/75 R.22.5 FRONT STEER FIRESTONE FS-560 OR EQUAL	6	EA	\$293.91	\$333.35	\$438.00
22	Y0233-00	TIRE, TRAILER 12-PLY CARLISLE TRAC CHIEF P/N 570141 OR EQUAL	8	EA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
23	Y0234-00	TIRE 425/65R22.5 20 FRONT FIRESTONE T839	2	EA	\$563.30	\$563.30	\$1,052.00
24	Y0235-00	TIRE 12R 22.5 TIRE 12R FIRESTONE	4	EA	\$355.97	\$357.20	\$615.00
25	Y0236-00	TIRE ST235/85R 16/12 128/24L #72985	6	EA	\$137.00	\$125.73	\$124.50
26	Y0237-00	TIRE 20.5/R25 BRIDGESTONE PART #26337 VKT L-2	2	EA	\$2,127.69	\$2,143.49	\$1,880.00
27			10	EA	\$152.39	\$238.90	\$225.00
28			10	EA	\$121.20	\$159.50	\$125.00
29			10	EA	\$176.51	\$247.08	\$250.00
30			10	EA	\$137.00	\$164.61	\$155.00
31			10	EA	\$152.39	\$238.90	\$225.00

APPROVED BY:

*D Solitaire 5-2-2022*

DIANE SOLITAIRE