BID NAME: B038-22 SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS

DATE & TIME: APRIL 14, 2022 - 9:30 AM

BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

WEG ZERO MAINTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS PRODUCTS LLC IECHEIRIENE KBS
WASHINGTON, MO HOUSTON, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX
WEG DELTA HOWARD POWER CENTRAL WEG
FOCEMOUN, SINELERHASE TRANSFORMERS |TRANSFORMADORES INDUSTRIES PARTNERS MOLONEY | TRANSFORMERS
E1410-01 NO BID NO BID $3,619.00 $3,898.00
10 |10KVA 7200 NL 32 36
1 EA [240/480 LL 137 124
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 169 160 0
+/-2.5%)
E1410-02 NO BID NO BID $3,524.00 $3,340.00
10 |10KVA 7200 NL: 34 34
2 EA |1201240 LL 126 135
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 160 169 0
+/-2.5%)
E1411-01 NO BID NO BID $3,962.00 $3,510.00
15 |15KVA 7200 NL 42 42
3 EA [120/240 LL: 195 204
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 237 246 0
+/-2.5%)
E1412-01 NO BID NO BID $5,132.00 $4,598.00
100 J25KVA 7200 NL 69 56
4 EA [1201240 LL 256 326
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 325 382 0
+/-2.5%)
E1413-01 NO BID NO BID $5,090.00 $4,180,00
10 [25 KVA 7200 NL 64 61
5 EA  [240/480 LL: 275 305
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 339 366 0
+/-2.5%)
E1414-01 NO BID NO BID $4,928.00 $3,815.00
30 |25 KVA 7200 NL 70 52
6 EA [|277/480 LL 259 346
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 329 398 0
+1-2.5%)
E1417-01 NO BID NO BID $5,912.00 $4,428.00
120 |37.5 KVA 7200 NL: 83 72
7 EA [120/240 LL 395 459
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 478 531 0
+/-2.5%)
E1418-00 NO BID NO BID $5,994.00 $4,568.00
10 {37.5 KVA 7200 NL 90 75
8 EA (240480 LL 366 450
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 456 525 0
+/-2.5%)
E1419-01 NO BID NO BID $5,807.00 $4,600.00
10 {37.5 KVA 7200 NL 93 78
9 EA [277/480 LL 358 420
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 451 498 0
+/-2.5%)
E1425-00 NO BID NO BID $7,053.00 $5,939.00
70 50 KVA 7200 NL 11 115
10 EA [120/240 LL 454 444
(WITH TAP CHANGER 0 0 565 559 i}
+1-2.5%) b




WEG ZERO MAINTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS PRODUCTS LLC LSt R AT KBS
WASHINGTON. MO HOUSTON., TX SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX
NO BID NOBID $6,937.00 $6,208.00
121 102
11 EA |240/480 LL: 413 509
(WITH TAP CHANGER - [4] 0 534 611
+/-2.5%) )
E1427-00 NO BID NO BID $6,737.00 $5,008.00
15 |50 KVA 7200 NL: 117 100
12 EA |277/480 LL: 445 525
(WITH TAP CHANGER o 0 0 562 625
+/-2.5%) )
E1433-00 NO BID NO BID $10,407.00 $5,500.00
12 |75 KVA 7200 NL: 146 100
13 EA  }120/240 LL: 656 520
(WITH TAP CHANGER - 0 0 802 620
+/-2.5%) )
E1434-00 NO BID INOBID $9,662.00 $6,920.00
16 {75 KVA 7200 NL: 155 123
14 EA [240/480 LL: 618 771
(WITH TAP CHANGER . 0 0 773 894
+/-2.5%) )
E1435-00 NO BID NO BID $9,482.00 $6,700.00
8 [75KVA 7200 NL: 157 115
15 EA  [277/480 LL: 632 750
(WITH TAP CHANGER - 0 0 789 865
+/-2.5%) )
|E1441-00 NO BID NO BID $12,728.00 $13,580.00
16 |100 KVA 7200 NL: 179 178
16 EA [|120/240 LL: 798 784
(WITH TAP CHANGER - 0 0 977 962
+/-2.5%) )
E1443-00 INO BID INOBID $11,807.00 $12,900.00
20 J100 KVA 7200 NL: 196 171
17 EA [277/480 LL: 757 778
(WITH TAP CHANGER o 0 0 953 949
+/-2.5%) )
E1448-00 NO BID NO BID $19,199.00 $17,795.00
6 167 KVA 7200 NL: 238 232
18 EA |120/240 LL: 1308 1385
(WITH TAP CHANGER - 0 0 1546 1617
+/-2.5%) )
E1456-00 NO BID NO BID $24,807.00 $26,305.00
2 J250 KVA 7200 NL: 383 311
19 EA  [240/480 LL: 1550 1929
(WITH TAP CHANGER _— 0 0 1933 2240
+/-2.5%) )
E1463-00 NO BID [NOBID $32,712.00 $29,656.00
2 |333 KVA 7200 NL: 484 361
20 EA [240/480 LL: 1847 2508
(WITH TAP CHANGER - 0 0 2331 2869
+/-2.5%) )
E1464-00 NO BID NO BID $32,082.00 $29,492.00
2 |333KVA 7200 NL: 462 399
21 EA  [277/480 LL: 2052 2317
(WITH TAP CHANGER o~ 0 0 2514 2716
+/-2.5%) )




WEG ZERO MAINTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS PRODUCTS LLC TN KBS
WASHINGTON, MO HOUSTON, TX SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX
WEG DELTA HOWARD POWER CENTRAL WEG
P s
O N e TRANSFORMERS |TRANSFORMADORES INDUSTRIES PARTNERS MOLONEY  |TRANSFORMERS
E1510-00 NO BID NO BID $28,582.00 $32,542.00
10 167 KvA 7200 NL: 314 249
22 EA | 1201240 LL 1029 1370
(WITH TAP CHANGER | 0 0 1343 1619 0
+/-2.5%)




WEG ZERO MA INTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS PRODUCTS LLC e KBS
WASHINGTON. MO HOUSTON. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX AUSTIN.TX
WEG DELTA HOWARD POWER CENTRAL WEG
PADMOUNT, THREE PHASE TRANSFORMERS | TRANSFORMADORES INDUSTRIES PARTNERS MOLONEY |TRANSFORMERS
E1521-00 $31,020.00 NO BID $29,798.00 $41,335.00
2 |75KVA 7200 INL 165 179 165
23 EA 1201208 LL 865 783 865
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 1030 0 962 1030
+/-2.5%)
E1522-00 $32,667.00 1NO BID $30,779.00 $43,556.00
3 |112.5 KVA 7200 NL 240 222 240
24 EA (1201208 LL 1148 1185 1148
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 1388 0 1407 1388
+/-2.5%)
E1522-01 $33,120.00 NO BID $30,948.00 $44,160 00
6 [112.5KVA 7200 INL 237 249 237
25 EA |120240 LL 1174 1065 1174
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 1411 0 1314 1411
+/-2.5%)
[ET523-00 $34,102.00 NO BID $33,638.00 $45,470.00
11 |150 KVA 7200 NL 308 330 308
26 EA |120r208 LL 1437 1266 1437
(WITH TAP CHANGER LL 1745 0 1596 1745
+/-2.5%)
E1523-01 $33,330.00 INO BID $32,463.00 $44,440.00
2 |1sokva 7200 NL 301 304 301
27 EA [277/480 |28 1471 1386 1471
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 1772 0 1690 1772
+1-2.5%)
E1524-00 $37,096.00 $23,380.00 $39,182.00 $49,462.00
6 [225KVA 7200 NL 404 900 413 404
28 EA |120/208 L 2049 3310 1899 2049
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 2453 4210 2312 2453
+-2.5%)
E1525-00 $36,482.00 $25,060.00 $36,544.00 $48,643.00
3 [225KVA 7200 NL 439 977 434 439
29 EA [277/480 |28 1895 3343 1827 1895
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 2334 4320 2261 2334
+/-2.5%)
E1526-00 $39,373.00 $26,180 00 $40,773.00 $52,498.00
2 [300KVA 7200 NL 485 1100 516 485
30 EA 1201208 LL 2730 4260 2445 2730
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 3215 5360 2961 3215
+/-2.5%)
E1526-01 $39,275.00 $26,74000 $41,182.00 $52,367.00
4 |300KVA 7200 NL 531 1100 519 531
3 EA [120240 DELTA | 23 2501 4260 2394 2501
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 3032 5360 2913 3032
+/-2.5%)
E1527-00 $38,593.00 $29,540 00 $40,319.00 $51,458 00
3 |300KVA 7200 NL 510 1210 577 510
32 EA [277/480 LL 2596 2286 2184 2596
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 3106 3496 2761 3106
+/-2.5%)
E1528-00 $49,569.00 $31,360.00 $67,360.00 $66,092.00
3 |500 KVA 12470Y/7200 [NL 656 1550 777 656
33 EA [120/208 LL 4249 6486 3504 4249
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 4905 8036 4281 4905
+/-2.5%)
E1528-01 $47,852.00 $31,360.00 $55,148.00 $63,803.00
1 [500KVA 7200 NL 759 1597 772 759
34 EA 120,240 |28 3788 6489 3525 3788
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 4547 8086 4297 4547
+/-2.5%)




WEG ZERO MAINTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS | PRODUCTS LLC A ECHEINE 115C s
WASHINGTON, MO HOUSTON. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX AUSTIN, TX
E1529-00 $45,466.00 $33,040.00 $52,563.00 $60,622.00
5 [500 Kva 7200 NL 741 1530 801 741
35 EA [277/480 LL 3894 6456 3342 3894
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 4635 7986 4143 4635
+/-2.5%)
E1530-00 $66,697.00 NO BID $76,585.00 $88,930.00
1 750 KvA 7200 NL 895 845 895
36 EA [120/208 LL: 5905 5850 5905
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 6800 0 6695 6800
+/-2.5%)
E1531-00 $58,764.00 NO BID $75,292.00 $78,352.00
1 750 KVA 7200 INL 932 934 932
37 EA [120/240D LL 5676 5394 5676
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 6608 0 6328 6608
+/-2,5%)
E1531-01 $58,875.00 NO BID $78,167.00 $78,500.00
2 |750 KVA 24000V NL|  |o40 1059 949
38 EA |277/480D LL 5709 4884 5709
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 6658 0 5943 6658
+/-2.5%)
E1532-00 $57,497.00 NO BID $68,429.00 $76,663.00
2 {750 KVA 7200 NL|  [oso 1016 980
39 EA [277/480 LL 5584 4995 5584
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 6564 0 6011 6564
+/-2.5%)
E1533-00 $88,530.00 NO BID $92,829.00 $118,040.00
1 ]1,000 KVA 7200 NL: 1097 1114 1097
40 EA [120/208 LL 7556 7101 7556
(WITH TAP CHANGER |[TL 8653 0 8215 8653
+/-2.5%)
E1534-00 $62,865.00 NO BID $80,119.00 $83,820.00
4 |1,000 KVA 7200 NCE 11142 1386 1142
41 EA [277/480 e |7ss7 5865 7557
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 8699 0 7251 8699
+/-2.5%)
E1535-00 $78,380.00 NO BID $105,094.00 $104,507.00
4 |1,500 KVA 7200 NL 1668 1803 1668
42 EA [277/480 LL 9833 8502 9833
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 11501 0 10305 11501
/-2 5%)
E1536-00 $91,201.00 NO BID $108,354.00 $121,602.00
2 |1500KVA NL 1962 2297 1962
43 EA 2,400V DELTA LL 11019 7959 11019
(WITH TAP CHANGER [TL 12981 0 10256 12981
+/-2.5%)
E1537-00 $124,019.00 NO BID $149,094.00 $165,359.00
1 [2500KVA, 7200 NL | |2987 3660 2987
44 EA [12470Y/4160D LL 15699 11637 15699
(WITH TAP CHANGER [ 18686 0 15297 18686
+/-2.5%)
E1538-00 $113,920.00 NO BID $155,844.00 $151,894.00
4 {2500KVA NL 1957 2296 1957
45 EA {7200, 277/480 LL 17160 14259 17160
(WITH TAP CHANGER |TL 19117 0 16555 19117
+/-2.5%)




WEG ZERO MAINTENANCE
TRANSFORMERS | PRODUCTS LLC NS s
WASHINGTON, MO HOUSTON., TX SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN. TX
E1539-00 $132,888.00 NO BID $149,513.00 $177,184.00
1 |3.000KvaA, NC | [3069 4164 3069
46 EA [4.160/2,400V Wye LL 17463 12660 17463
(WITH TAP CHANGER L | 20532 0 16824 0 0 20532
+/-2.5%)
E1540-00 NO BID NO BID $160,635.00 NO BID
1 |3.750KkVA NL 4153
47 EA [7200, 277/480 LL 23499
(WITH TAP CHANGER || o 0 27652 0 0 0
+/-2.5%)
E1541-00 NO BID NO BID $190,350.00 NO BID
1 |s5,000KkvA, 12470y | 5470
48 EA [2400/4160Y/ LL 23985
(WITH TAP CHANGER [T | o 0 29455 0 0 0
+1-2.5%)
DELIVERY IN DAYS/WEEKS (ARO) 90 - 92 WEEKS 70 - 180 DAYS 60 + WEEKS 650 DAYS

APPROVED BY: %m"‘-b Y- )1852022

DIANE SOLITAIRE




