BID NAME: B036-22 ANNUAL TOOL SUPPLY
OPENING DATE & TIME: APRIL 21,2022 - 11:00 AM

BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

CENTRAL BOLT CcC
TECHLINE, INC TE;J(S ?)II\E/I\I;:I’I(‘:%R & I;\ILIJ)PL;){{]};;AL DISTRIH\B;(I:J.TORS, DI S]\}};I;ZES% ON IRBY UTILITIES
SAN ANTONIO, TX WACO, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX | CORPUS CHRISTL TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX BASTROP, TX
I;IE)M COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
1 T0001-00 10 $49.00 $47.51 $66.24 $54.80 $48.35 $54.80
2 T0003-00 5 $48.00 $46.69 $79.00 $53.85 $47.52 $53.85
3 T0004-00 10 $36.00 $35.02 $58.05 $40.39 $35.64 $40.38
4 T0005-00 15 $12.75 $12.15 $33.55 $14.01 $12.36 $14.02
5 T0006-00 40 $380.00 $366.17 $572.00 $546.16 $372.64 $422.32
6 T0007-00 10 $19.75 $19.02 NO BID $21.93 $19.35 $21.94
7 T0008-00 20 $67.00 $64.80 $99.16 $74.73 $65.94 $74.74
8 T0010-00 15 $43.00 $41.98 NO BID $48.41 $42.72 $48.41
9 T0011-00 20 $22.00 $21.01 $35.09 $24.23 $21.38 $24.22
10 T0012-00 30 $30.00 $32.83 $43.49 $33.41 $29.48 $33.42
11 T0013-00 30 $11.00 $10.69 $15.54 $12.33 $10.88 $12.42
12 T0014-00 20 $7.75 $7.47 $12.50 $8.61 $7.60 $8.66
13 T0015-00 20 $25.20 $24.32 $39.00 $28.05 $24.75 $28.05




CENTRAL BOLT

CC

| TECHLINE, INC Tflzl(g ;II\E/I\I;:IT;:%R & IIS\IUDPLII)i'II‘g;AL DISTRIIILSSTORS, DI STY\IIQI?EICJ?I ON IRBY UTILITIES
fids SAN ANTONIO, TX WACO. TX BROWNSVILLE. TX | CORPUS CHRISTLTX | SAN ANTONIO. TX BASTROP. TX
I;I(E)M COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
14 T0016-00 20 $8.50 $8.12 $12.57 $9.36 $8.56 $9.66
15 T0017-00 20 $6.50 $5.25 $9.04 $6.05 $5.54 $6.69
16 T0018-00 20 $22.50 $21.88 $37.63 $25.24 $22.27 $25.24
17 T0019-00 20 $6.50 $5.25 $10.60 $7.27 $5.54 $6.66
18 T0020-00 20 $25.25 $24.51 $46.85 $28.27 $24.94 $28.27
19 T0021-00 5 $6.00 $4.87 $8.36 $6.73 $5.13 $6.61
20 T0022-00 10 $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.54 $17.30
21 T0023-00 20 $27.00 $26.24 $47.83 $30.27 $26.71 $30.27
22 T0024-00 15 $45.25 $43.78 $68.92 $50.49 $44.55 $50.49
23 T0025-00 20 $28.00 $32.18 $38.93 $30.93 $27.29 $30.93
24 T0026-00 15 $27.50 $26.47 $42.36 $34.20 $27.96 $66.66
25 T0027-00 15 $8.75 $8.28 $13.13 $9.55 $8.61 $9.84
26 T0028-00 10 $7.00 $6.66 $10.47 $7.68 $7.02 $8.84
27 T0029-00 10 $7.00 $6.66 $10.47 $7.68 $7.02 $8.84
*28 T0030-00 15 $155.00 $86.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID $102.17
29 T0031-00 10 $10.25 $9.82 $15.21 $11.32 $10.35 $12.12
*30 T0032-00 10 $459.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $399.82 $482.50
*31 T0033-00 10 $199.00 $148.14 NO BID NO BID $169.81 $184.17
32 T0033-01 5 $23.00 $20.07 NO BID NO BID $21.17 $26.77
33 T0034-00 15 $58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.55 $66.61




| mecrune e | TESSMETER | & oustriaL pistuburons, | o, VSO | sy v
._ + SAN ANTONIO. TX WACO. TX BROWNSVILLE. TX CORPUS CHRISTI. TX SAN ANTONIO. TX BASTROP. TX
I’;%M COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
34 T0035-00 20 $18.00 $16.26 $23.00 $21.92 $13.83 $21.21
*35 T0036-00 35 $479.00 $508.54 NO BID NO BID $378.73 NO BID
36 T0037-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.47 $17.17
37 T0038-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.58 NO BID
*38 T0039-00 10 NO BID $20.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID $29.66
39 T0040-00 15 $28.00 $17.31 $46.67 $31.31 $27.62 $31.30
40 T0042-00 15 $25.50 $24.73 $36.52 $28.52 $25.16 $28.57
41 T0043-00 15 $40.50 $78.81 $67.74 $45.44 $40.09 $45.44
42 T0044-00 10 $288.00 $267.66 NO BID NO BID $263.56 $330.84
43 T0045-00 5 $85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $72.01 $88.61
44 T0046-00 5 $489.00 $443.28 NO BID NO BID $451.11 $547.77
45 T0046-01 5 $489.00 $443.28 NO BID NO BID $451.11 $547.77
46 T0046-02 5 $489.00 $443.28 NO BID NO BID $451.11 $547.77
47 T0046-03 15 $489.00 $443.28 NO BID NO BID $451.11 $547.77
48 T0046-04 5 $489.00 $443.28 NO BID NO BID $451.11 $547.77
49 T0047-00 10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.33 $45.45
50 T0048-00 24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $126.73 NO BID
51 T0049-00 10 NO BID $106.43 NO BID NO BID $110.71 $171.40
52 T0049-01 10 NO BID $106.43 NO BID NO BID $110.71 $171.40
53 T0049-02 10 NO BID $106.43 NO BID NO BID $110.71 $171.40




4 TECHLINE, INC T:;(S %IEISEC%R ?%Eﬁ%ggig DISTR]II(]\:IBEJ.TORS’ DIST\‘RIIQI;JEICJ(';I ON IRBY UTILITIES
SAN ANTONIO, TX WACO. TX BROWNSVILLE. TX | CORPUS CHRISTLTX | SAN ANTONIO.TX BASTROP. TX
I';IE)M COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

54 T0049-03 10 NO BID $106.43 NO BID NO BID $110.71 $191.40
55 T0049-04 10 NO BID $106.43 NO BID NO BID $113.35 $191.40
56 T0049-05 5 NO BID $113.21 NO BID NO BID $116.00 $191.40
57 T0049-06 5 NO BID $115.92 NO BID NO BID $118.64 $191.40
*58 T0050-00 40 $55.00 $37.57 NO BID $64.56 $51.66 NO BID
*59 T0050-01 100 $55.00 $37.57 NO BID $64.56 $51.66 NO BID
*60 T0050-02 100 $55.00 $37.57 NO BID $64.56 $51.66 NO BID
*61 T0050-03 75 $59.00 $37.57 NO BID $68.12 $54.52 NO BID
*62 T0050-04 50 $63.00 $39.88 NO BID $71.69 $57.29 NO BID
*63 T0050-05 25 $67.00 $39.88 NO BID $75.28 $60.25 NO BID
64 T0051-00 100 $165.00 $137.93 NO BID NO BID $140.36 $198.85
65 T0051-01 20 $79.00 $58.18 NO BID NO BID $59.20 $125.84
66 T0051-02 25 $119.00 $92.46 NO BID NO BID $94.09 $114.25
67 T0052-00 5 $365.00 $331.61 NO BID NO BID $403.99 $599.84
68 T0052-01 10 $365.00 $331.61 NO BID NO BID $403.99 $599.84
69 T0052-02 15 $365.00 $331.61 NO BID NO BID $403.99 $599.84
70 T0052-03 10 $365.00 $331.61 NO BID NO BID $403.99 $652.52
71 T0052-04 5 $392.00 $357.62 NO BID NO BID $439.28 $652.52
72 T0052-05 5 $392.00 $357.62 NO BID NO BID $439.28 $652.52
*73 T0053-00 40 $101.00 $87.79 NO BID NO BID $89.34 $287.25




APPROVED BY: /ék‘ € ’ ‘7['- %

CENTRAL BOLT CcC
TEXAS METER WESCO
TECHLINE, INC & INDUSTRIAL | DISTRIBUTORS, IRBY UTILITIES
AND DEVICE SUPPLIES INC. DISTRIBUTION
SAN ANTONIO, TX WACO. TX BROWNSVILLE. TX | CORPUS CHRISTLTX [ SAN ANTONIO.TX BASTROP. TX

I';%M COMMODITY | QTY | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

74 T0054-00 10 $318.00 $312.40 NO BID NO BID $317.92 $372.81

75 T0054-01 10 $786.00 $763.45 NO BID NO BID $776.92 $910.84

76 T0055-00 100 $38.00 $32.49 NO BID NO BID $33.06 $46.84
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