



BROWNSVILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

BID NAME: B011-22 SEMI-ANNUAL SUPPLY OF POLEMOUNT & PADMOUNT TRANSFORMERS

DATE & TIME: JANUARY 13, 2022 - 10:30 AM

				KBS AUSTIN, TX	WEG TRANSFORMERS WASHINGTON, MO	WESCO DISTRIBUTION SAN ANTONIO, TX		TECHLINE SAN ANTONIO, TX
POLEMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE				POWER PARTNERS & CENTRAL MOLONEY	WEG TRANSFORMERS	POWER PARTNERS	HITACHI	HOWARD
	100 EA	E1412-01 25 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$2,272.00 56 326 382	NO BID 0	\$2,342.00 56 326 382	0	\$2,648.40 0
	10 EA	E1414-01 25 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$2,272.00 52 346 398	NO BID 0	\$2,345.00 52 346 398	0	\$2,787.30 0
	80 EA	E1417-01 37.5 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$2,697.00 72 459 531	NO BID 0	\$2,784.00 72 459 531	0	\$3,150.00 0
	50 EA	E1425-00 50 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$3,439.00 115 444 559	NO BID 0	\$3,551.00 115 444 559	0	\$3,738.95 0
	15 EA	E1427-00 50 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$3,155.00 100 525 625	NO BID 0	\$3,257.00 100 525 625	0	\$3,908.40 69 256 325
	5 EA	E1435-00 75 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$4,743.00 133 735 868	NO BID 0	\$4,897.00 133 735 868	0	\$5,485.25 70 259 329

				KBS	WEG TRANSFORMERS	WESCO DISTRIBUTION		TECHLINE
PADMOUNT, SINGLE PHASE				POWER PARTNERS & CENTRAL MOLONEY	WEG TRANSFORMERS	POWER PARTNERS	HITACHI	HOWARD
	30 Ea	E1502-00 37.5 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL LL TL	\$11,299.00 49 375 424	NO BID 0	 0	\$9,433.33 66 458 524	\$8,645.25 90 368 458
	100 Ea	E1504-00 50 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL LL TL	\$12,416.00 90 579 669	NO BID 0	 0	\$9,566.00 80 577 657	\$7,175.70 118 436 554
	35 Ea	E1506-00 75 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL LL TL	\$15,674.00 137 716 853	NO BID 0	 0	\$11,100.00 122 641 763	\$11,214.75 149 652 801
	15 EA	E1508-00 100 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL LL TL	\$18,181.00 157 958 1115	NO BID 0	 0	\$13,905.00 171 814 985	\$14,915.75 207 713 920
	5 EA	E1510-00 167 KVA 7200 120/240 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL LL TL	\$27,118.00 249 1370 1619	NO BID 0	 0	\$15,800.00 232 1310 1542	\$29,111.60 317 1021 1338

			KBS	WEG TRANSFORMERS	WESCO DISTRIBUTION		TECHLINE
PADMOUNT, THREE PHASE			POWER PARTNERS & CENTRAL MOLONEY	WEG TRANSFORMERS	POWER PARTNERS	HITACHI	HOWARD
	I EA	E1535-00 1,500 KVA 7200 277/480 (WITH TAP CHANGER +/-2.5%)	NL: LL: TL:	\$174,195.00 555 12564 13119	\$48,544.00 0	\$52,276.00 1660 9029 10689	\$72,315.70 1713 8910 10623
DELIVERY IN DAYS/WEEKS (ARO)			350 - 420 DAYS	50 - 52 WEEKS	42 - 118 WEEKS		560 DAYS

APPROVED BY: *D Solitaire* 1-13-2022

DIANE SOLITAIRE