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BROWNSVILLE
PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD
BID TABULATION
BID NAME: B010-22 SUPPLY OF ELECTRICAL UNDERGROUND CABLE AND EQUIPMENT
DATE AND TIME: JANUARY 20,2022 - 11:30 AM
TRAYER TEXAS
AMERICAN NEXGEN PRIESTER MELL WESCO
ENGINEERING ELECTRIC KBS AUSTIN TECHLINE
WIRE GROUP o) POWERINC. | . oonr  rvEs | & NICHOLSON DISTRIBUTION
MIAMI, FL SAN LEANDRO, CA GARDENA, CA GEORGETOWN, TX | SAN ANTONIO, TX AUSTIN, TX SAN ANTONIO SAN ANTONIO, TX
ITEM 4 ON:’;‘(’)‘I’““ DESCRIPTION QTY UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 E0969-01  |SWITCHGEAR 15KV-2SD 10 EA NO BID $29,972.00 NO BID NO BID $50,212.00 $32,594.00 NO BID NO BID
MOST 9 OIL S/S 600/200A
2 E0972-01  |SWITCHGEAR 15KV-2SD 8 EA NO BID $31,380.00 NO BID NO BID $45,944.00 $31,213.00 NO BID NO BID
MOST 110IL S/S 600/200A
3 E0914-00 |Cable, URD 1/0 STR 15KV 60,000 FT $5.10 NO BID $3.80 $4.30 NO BID $4.67 $2.69 $2.85
Aluminum Primary Direct Burial
(PDB), 19W, 220 MIL, EPR 133%
500 MCM 15 KV AL PDB, 220
4 E0915-00 |MIL, MV-90 15 KV/133% 500KCM{ 20,000 FT $10.64 NO BID $5.17 $8.58 NO BID $8.94 NO BID $7.81
1C AL 1/C 500 MCM 37/W CPRS
AL, 220 NOM EPR,
5 E0245-00 |\p1 E 46 STR. 1-CONDUCTOR | 1000 FT $1.10 NO BID $0.82 $1.20 NO BID NO BID $0.88 $0.83
THHN/THWN INSU CU BLACK
6 | E0917.00 [300MCM 15KV CUPDB, 220 11,000 FT NO BID NO BID $15.25 $23.12 NO BID NO BID $5.60 $7.81
MIL, MV-90 15 KV/133%
(1,100 ft. reels) “Footage Marker”
Mfg/Brand AMERICAN DAEWON | CME WIRE AND PRIORITY
Name WIRE GROUP CABLE CABLE COOPER SORlng (S eh 100
22 -
Lead Time < 32%551(5 6 WEEKS ARO | 33 - 34 WEEKS 36-40 WEEKS | 23-26 WEEKS | 20-22 WEEKS
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