BID NAME: B005-22 ELECTRIC AND ELECTRONIC SPARE PARTS
OPENING DATE & TIME: JANUARY 6, 2022 at 2:00 PM

COMMODITY
NUMBER

DESCRIPTION

*;,-Nv

BROWNSVILLE

PUBLIC UTILITIES BOARD

BID TABULATION

| CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITL, TX

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

1.0001-00

SIZE 00 STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SAG12-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY
MODEL# 509-TOD-A2E (TO INCLUDE TO LUG NUT
KITS #140G-M-TLA23)

NO BID

$250.00

$259.00

$369.43

NO BID

L.0002-00

SIZE 0 STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SBG2-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
509-A0OD-A2F (TO INCLUDE TO LUG NUT KITS #140G-
M-TLA23)

EA

NO BID

$310.00

$317.00

$456.74

NO BID

L0003-00

SIZE | STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SCG3-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
509-BOD-A2F (TO INCLUDE TO LUG NUT KITS #140G-
M-TLA23)

30

EA

NO BID

$350.00

$316.00

$348.93

NO BID

L.0004-00

SIZE 2 STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SDG1-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
509-COD-A2J (TO INCLUDE TO LUG NUT KITS #140G-
M-TLA23)

35

EA

NO BID

$605.00

$642.00

$1,022.80

NO BID

L0005-00

SIZE 3 STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SEG1-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
509-DOD-A2L (TO INCLUDE TO LUG NUT KITS #140G-
M-TLA23)

10

EA

NO BID

$970.00

$1,178.00

$1,700.84

NO BID

1.0006-00

SIZE 4 STARTER NEMA 1 120VAC SQUARE D
MODEL# 8536-SFG1-V02S, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
509-EOD-A2M

EA

NO BID

$2,600.00

$2,545.00

$3,835.00

NOBID

1.0007-00

ROTOFLOAT NORMALLY OPEN FLOATS, TYPE S,
MERCURY FREE, ROTOFLOAT MODEL# S40NO

20

EA

$50.00

NO BID

$83.00

NO BID

$53.19

L0008-00

ROTOFLOAT NORMALLY OPEN FLOATS, TYPE S,
MERCURY FREE, ROTOFLOAT MODEL# S60NO

30

EA

$62.73

NO BID

$90.00

NO BID

$65.32

1L.0009-00

ROTOFLOAT NORMALLY OPEN FLOATS, TYPE S,
MERCURY FREE, ROTOFLOAT MODEL# S80NO

30

EA

$75.46

NO BID

$103.00

NO BID

$78.97

L.0010-00

ROTOFLOAT NORMALLY CLOSE FLOATS, TYPE S,
MERCURY FREE, ROTOFLOAT MODEL# S80NC

10

EA

$75.46

NO BID

$103.00

NO BID

$53.19
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

ITEM

COMMODITY

NO. NUMBER DESCRIPTION QTY UM UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
8 Pin 3 PHASE MONITOR | CONTACT, 480VAC TIME
11 L0011-00 MARK MODEL A2588 40 EA NO BID $59.50 $80.00 NO BID $70.98
8 Pin 3 PHASE MONITOR | CONTACT, 2400VAC TIME
12 L0012-00 MARK MODEL 257B 40 EA NO BID $59.50 $80.00 NO BID $70.98
11 Pin PHASE MONITOR 2 CONTACTS, 240VAC TIME
13 L0013-00 MARK 2522BM 40 EA NO BID $96.00 $122.00 NO BID $114.99
14 L0014-00 [RELAY 120VAC TIME MARK MODEL# A471-24V 10 EA NO BID $240.00 $282.00 NO BID $264.95
BREAKER, SINGLE POLE | ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL#
15 L0015-00 1492-SPM1C200, SQUARE D #QOU120 60 EA NO BID $32.56 $35.00 $32.80 $21.56
16 L0016-00 BREAKER, 3 POLE | SIEMENS MODEL# CQD34040 15 EA NO BID $249.32 $177.00 $251.15 $187.22
17 L0017-00  |BREAKER, 3 POLE | SIEMENS MODEL# CQD34060 12 EA NO BID $249.32 $177.00 $251.15 $187.22
18 L0018-00  |BREAKER, 3 POLE | SIEMENS MODEL# CQD34080 15 EA NO BID $363.92 $251.00 $366.55 $229.42
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 30X24X10 | 3 POINT
LATCH AND LOCK NEMA 4X STAHLIN MODEL#
19 L0019-00 N30208FHLWT, HOFFMAN MODEL# 5 EA NO BID $1,621.00 $1,667.00 $1,525.15 $987.14
A30H2410GQRLP3PT
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 36X30X12 | 3 POINT
20 L0020-00 LATCH AND LOCK NEMA 4X HOFFMAN MODEL# 5 EA NO BID $2,397.00 $2,454.00 $2,255.25 $1,402.87
A36H3012GQRLP3PT
ENCLOSURE, FIBERGLASS 24X24X8 | 3 POINT LATCH
21 L0021-00  |AND LOCK NEMA 4X HOFFMAN MODEL# 3 EA NOBID $1,322.00 $1,350.00 $1,309.25 $772.82
A24H2408GQRLP3PT
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 100A | SQUARE D 600VAC
22 L0022-00  |MODEL# FAL36100 ALLEN BRADLEY 600VAC 3 EA NO BID NO BID $351.00 $1,083.47 $243.75
MODEL# 140G-G2C3-D10
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 15A | SQUARE D 600VAC
23 L0024-00 |MODEL# HDL36015 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G- 6 EA NO BID $881.28 $480.00 $887.66 $156.78
G2C3-C15
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 70A | SQUARE D 600VAC
24 L0025-00  |MODEL# FAL34070 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G- | 10 EA NO BID NO BID $317.00 $1,083.47 $222.85
G2C3-C70
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 80A | SQUARE D 600VAC
25 L0026-00 |MODEL# HDL36080 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G- 6 EA NO BID $1,075.68 $583.00 $1,083.47 $222.85
G2C3-C80
DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, 3 POLE HEAVY DUTY
26 L0027-00  |600VAC | ILSCO MODEL# PDB-11- 60 EA NO BID $85.00 $77.00 $69.20 $38.50
2/0-3 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1492-PD3141
DISTRIBUTION BLOCK, | POLE HEAVY DUTY
27 L0028-00  [600VAC | ILSCO MODEL# PDB-14-2/0-1 MODEL# 1492- | 30 EA NO BID $46.00 $33.00 NO BID $11.35

100Y

Page 2




5 MIDCOAST
CED-BUSH WESCO
CORE & MAIN, LP SUPPLY CO. CAPP, INC. DISTRIBUTION ELECTRIC
SUPPLY
BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA SAN ANTONIO, TX COPUS CHRITI, TX
'L’E)M C%%mgg" DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 120VAC | SQUARE D
28 1L.0029-00 MODEL# 8501KPR12P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY 100 EA NO BID $51.00 $38.00 $51.07 $13.56
MODEL# 700-HA32A14 TO INCLUDE LED INDICATOR
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VAC | SQUARE D
29 L0030-00 MODEL# 8501 KPR12P14V 14 MODEL# 700-HA32A24 100 EA NO BID $51.00 $32.00 $51.10 $10.33
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 12VDC | SQUARE D
30 L0031-00 |MODEL# 8501KPDR12P14V51 ALLEN BRADLEY 20 EA NO BID $51.00 $31.00 $51.10 $10.15
MODEL# 700-HA32Z12
RELAY, 8 PIN SOCKET TYPE 10A 24VDC | SQUARE D
31 1L0032-00 |MODEL# 8501KPDR12P14V53 ALLEN BRADLEY 20 EA NO BID $51.00 $31.00 $51.10 $10.15
MODEL# 700-HA32Z24
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE NEMA 1 800AMP 600VAC |
32 1.0033-00 CUTLER HAMMER MODEL# HND3800T36W ALLEN 1 EA NO BID NO BID $9.461.00 NO BID $4.154.44
BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-M6F3-D80
CONTROL PUMP, DUPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS
33 L0034-00 120VAC | DIVERSIFIED ELECTRONICS MODEL# ARM- | 22 EA NO BID NO BID $362.00 NO BID $339.82
120-AFE
CONTROL PUMP, TRIPLEX INTRINSICALLY INPUTS
34 L0035-00 1420VAC | DIVERSIFIED ELECTRONICS MODEL# 12 EA NO BID NO BID $320.00 NO BID $318.82
ARMI120ADE
TRANSDUCER, 10 PSI LEVEL 80 FEET 4-20MA |
35 L0036-00 CONTEGRA PART# SLX130-M-15-10-100-BT 6 EA NO BID NO BID $1,272.00 NO BID $1,389.19
TRANSDUCER, 15 PSI LEVEL 80 FEET 4-20MA |
36 L0037-00 CONTEGRA PART# SLX130-M-15-15-100-BT 6 EA NO BID NO BID $1.272.00 NO BID $1.389.19
PIPE 2" X 10' RIDGID, GALVANIZED | METAL,
37 L0038-00 MODEL# GALV2 ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# | 200 FT NO BID $9.15 NO BID $17.00 NO BID
RIG200
PIPE 3" X 10' RIDGID, GALVANIZED | METAL, GALV3,
38 L0039-00 ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# RIG300 200 FT NO BID $1.268.00 NO BID $28.50 NO BID
UNI-STURT 7/8 SS 316 10' SECTION C | MODEL#
39 £0040-00 P1000TSS, ALLIED TUBE & CONDUIT MODEL# 200 FT NO BID $8.70 NO BID $10.00 NO BID
STRUT7/8 SS SLOTTED 10
UNI-STRUT 5/8 SS 316 10' SECTION C | ALLIED TUBE &
40 L0041-00 CONDUIT MODEL# STRUT 1-5/8 SS SLOTTED 10 200 FT NO BID $8.70 NO BID $12.85 NO BID
PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC
41 L0045-00 | 1400 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1766- 5 EA NO BID NO BID $850.00 NO BID $775.00
L32AWA
PLC CONTROLLER PROGRAMMABLE LOGIC 120VAC
42 L0046-00 | 1100 MICROLOGIC, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 1763- 2 EA NO BID NO BID $938.00 NO BID $691.33
LI6AWA
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

';f)'“ C%"ffk‘.‘.i'éﬁ“ DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE | UNIT PRICE

MODULE, DIGITAL INPUT 120VAC | ALLEN BRADLEY

43 Loo47-00  [VODULE DIiTA 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $214.00 NO BID $166.25
MODULE, DIGITAL INPUT 120VAC | ALLEN BRADLEY

44 L004g-00  [vioDULS DIITAL 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $280.00 NO BID $216.04
MODULE, EXPANSION ANALOG INPUT 4-20MA |

45 L0049-00  [AODULE, EXPANSION ANALOG INF 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $861.00 NO BID $340.53
MODULE, OUPUT 4-20MA | ALLEN BRADLEY

46 L0050-00  [VMODULE. OUPUT 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $372.00 NO BID $321.25
POWER SUPPLY, 24VDC 2-5A | DIN RAIL, ALLEN

47 L00S1-00 | e e D oA | DIN 4 | EA NO BID NO BID $288.00 NO BID $156.75
POWER SUPPLY, 12VDC 2-SA | DIN RAIL, ALLEN

48 L0052-00 [ S v 3 | EA NO BID NO BID $288.00 NO BID $141.75
RELAY, TIME DELAY 120VAC | TIME MARK MODEL#

49 L00S3-00 |3 n L oy o MARK 5 | EA NO BID $103.00 $126.00 NO BID $97.15
SURGE PROTECTOR 120VAC | SQUARE D MODEL#

50 L0054-00 | ALLEN BRADL LY ot e moDEA | 12 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $158.12

51 L0055-00 fLEEzR;)ATOR’ TRIPLEXOR 120VAC{FLYGT MODEL#| | | . NO BID NO BID $281.00 NO BID $1,086.10

52 L0056-00 PHASE MONITOR 240V | FLYGT MODEL# 14403212 8 EA NO BID NO BID $132.00 NO BID $350.16
RELAY, 120VAC | INTRINSICALLY SAFE, FLYGT

53 L0057-00  [REAY, 120VAC]] 12 | Ea NO BID NO BID $159.00 NO BID $393.68
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 30A 600VAC | EATON

54 L0058-00 | o100 DREAKER, 3 POLE 208 600 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID $146.84
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 50A 600VAC | SIEMENS

55 L0059-00 0 B0 tareees 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID $146.84
PROTECTION DEVICE 120VAC | EBARRA, MTS

56 L0060-00 | oro  FCTION DEY 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $325.95
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 60A | MOLDED CASE,

57 L0062-00  |ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C60 (TO 1 | EA NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID $169.71
INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-G-TLC13 LUGS)
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 40A 600VAC | MOLDED

58 L0063-00 CASE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C40 (TO 1 EA NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID $169.71
INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS # 140G-G-TLC-13 LUGS
CIRCUIT BREAKER, 3 POLE 20A 600VAC | MOLDED

59 L0064-00 CASE, ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 140G-G2C3-C20 (TO 1 EA NO BID NO BID $230.00 NO BID $169.71
INCLUDE TWO LUG NUT KITS# 140G-G-TLC13 LUGS)

60 L0065-00 | VFD; 100HP 480VAC | ALTIVAR VFD MODEL# 1 | Ea NO BID $9,300.00 $5,580.00 $9,802.70 NO BID

ATV75HD75N4
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: _ SR
= MIDCOAST
£ CED-BUSH WESCO
..s CORE & MAIN, LP SUPPLY CO. CAPP, INC. DISTRIBUTION ELECTRIC
; SUPPLY
= i BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA SAN ANTONIO, TX COPUS CHRITI, TX
'L”(:)M C%%mg;“ DESCRIPTION QrY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
STARTER, 300HP 480VAC | BENSHAW SOFT STARTER
61 L0066-00 [0 0 b bc 1 EA NO BID NO BID $4,578.00 NO BID $4.452.32
STARTER, 200HP 480VAC | BENSHAW SOFT STARTER
62 L0067-00 [0 0 e A5 1 EA NO BID NO BID $4.111.00 NO BID $3,990.20
STARTER, 100HP 480VAC | BENSHAW SOFT STARTER
63 L0068-00 |0 o B 16,0964 13C 1 | Ea NO BID NO BID $2,110.00 NO BID $2,062.50
STARTER, 160HP 480VAC | ALTIVAR SOFT STARTER
64 LO069-00  |5;0m -y Arsagcasy 1 | Ea NO BID $2,600.00 $2.464.00 NO BID NO BID
REACTOR, 3 PHASE 60HP 480VAC | FOR VFD, MTE
65 LO070-00 | Sonp MODEL RL-08002 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $483.00 NO BID $522.37
PROTECTION DEVICE | FLYGT PUMP, MINICAS
66 L0071-00 | X e L b 1440125 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $410.00 NO BID $608.48
67 10072-00 ;%%"E‘ii o DISPOSABLE NITRILE SMIL | HARDY 150 | BX NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68 10073-00 ;";‘v‘v’“él‘;g" I FEDERAL SIGNAL MODEL# 30 | EA NO BID $130.00 $186.00 NO BID $186.99
LED, 120VAC | RED, EDWARDS SIGNALING MODEL#
69 LO0T4-00 |/ enot i s 30 | EA NO BID $360.60 $326.00 NO BID $312.18
RELAY, 11 PIN 120VAC 10A | SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE
70 L0075-00  |D MODEL# 8501KPR13P14V20 ALLEN BRADLEY 100 EA NO BID $39.00 $33.00 $60.15 $10.97
MODEL# 700-HA33A1
RELAY, 11 PIN 24VAC 10A | SOCKET TYPE, SQUARE D
71 L0076-00 MODEL# 8501KPR13P14V14 ALLEN BRADLEY 100 EA NO BID $39.00 $33.00 $60.15 $10.97
MODEL# 700HA33A24
RELAY, 11 PIN 24VDC 10A | SQUARE D MODEL#
72 L0077-00  |8501KPDR13V53 ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 700- 20 EA NO BID $39.00 $32.00 $54.00 $10.34
HA33Z24
RELAY, 8 PIN 600VAC | SOCKET BASE, DIN RAIL,
73 L0078-00  |FINDER MODEL# 8501NRS2 ALLEN BRADLEY 20 | EA NO BID $13.00 $19.50 $11.60 $5.18
MODEL# 700-HN100
RELAY, 11 PIN 600VAC | SOCKET BASE DIN RAIL
74 L0079-00 |MOUNT, FINDER MODEL# 8501NR6! ALLEN 110 EA NO BID $18.00 $20.50 $21.00 $5.82
BRADLEY MODEL# 700-HN101
LED, 120V-130V | RED, PHILIPS LED MODEL#
75 L0080-00 [co 1oty 100 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED
76 L0081-00 [T o DULT MODEL# PSRS. L4.SS 50 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00 $4.95
NUT 1/4" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED
77 L0082:00 |1 o MODEL# PSR 37585 50 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.00 $5.03
NUT 5/16" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED
78 L0083-00 [T > O oy MODEL# PSRS.o/16.85 50 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
NUT 1/2" SPRING, STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED
79 L0084-00 [ e ODEL? PSRS LSS 50 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.05 $5.15
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

COMMODITY

';'f)M UMOER DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

CLAMP, 1 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED TUBE

80 LO0B5-00 o/ OO pos oS 50 | EA NO BID $4.75 NO BID $4.35 $5.54
CLAMP, 2" STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED TUBE &

81 LO086-00 | oMU MOBELE oot e st 50 | EA NO BID $5.50 NO BID $6.35 $5.84
CLAMP, 2 1/2" STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED TUBE

82 LO087-00 |l OIS Bor Lo Lo b 50 | EA NO BID $6.25 NO BID $5.81 NO BID
CLAMP, 3" STAINLESS STEEL 316 | ALLIED TUBE &

83 LO08B-00 | CoNDUT MODELE st 1o ot 100 | EA NO BID $6.10 NO BID $7.60 NO BID
FUSE, 100AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL |

84 L0089-00  |DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H363SS EATON 4 EA NO BID $3.050.00 $2,999.00 NO BID $1,998.77
PART# DH363FWK
FUSE, 200AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESL STEEL |

85 L0090-00  [DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H364SS EATON | 4 | EA NO BID $4,300.00 $4,273.00 NO BID $2,802.60
PART# DH364FWK
FUSE, 400AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL |

86 L0091-00  [DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H365SS EATON | 4 | EA NO BID $8.900.00 $9.255.00 NO BID $4,594.00
MODEL# DH365FWK
FUSE, 600AMP 600VAC NEMA 4X STAINLESS STEEL |

87 L0092-00  [DISCONNECT HEAVY DUTY, PART# H366SS EATON | 2 | EA NO BID $8,390.00 $14,134.00 NO BID $6,498.73
MODEL# DH366FWK

88 L0093-00 FUSE, 100AMP | LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLRS100 12 EA NO BID $32.15 NO BID $27.75 $14.43

89 L0094-00  |FUSE, 200AMP | LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLSR200 12 | EA NO BID $56.00 NO BID $53.34 $28.90

90 L0095-00  |FUSE, 400AMP | LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLSR400 12 EA NO BID $32.15 NOBID $106.75 $113.33

91 L0096-00 FUSE, 600AMP | LITTEL FUSE MODEL# FLSR600 12 EA NO BID $190.00 NO BID $154.81 $171.40
CONNECTOR # 4,2 PORT 600VAC | INSULATED, ILSCO

92 L0097-00  [FOPHIECTOR % 22 25 | EA NO BID $11.35 NO BID $12.85 $14.37
CONNECTOR # 1/0, 2 PORT 600VAC | INSULATED,

93 L0098-00 [ o L prea s 25 | EA NO BID $15.70 NO BID $17.78 $19.68
CONNECTOR # 250kem, 4 PORT 600VAC | INSULATED,

94 L0099-00 |1/ S L o 3 B¢ 25 | EA NO BID $29.85 NO BID $43.50 $38.33
CONNECTOR # 1/0, 3 PORT 600VAC | INSULATED,

95 LO100-00 | o oLs pans ey 25 | EA NO BID $21.50 NO BID $34.13 $27.13
TAPE, 3/4" X 30' 600VAC 3M | INSULATION, SCOTT

96 Lo101-00 |\ ArE 5F X3 30 | EA NO BID $13.00 NO BID $15.51 $16.30
TAPE, 1" X 30' 600VAC 3M | INSULATION, SCOT

97 L0102-:00  [fAnE: X3 30 | EA NO BID $18.25 NO BID $18.76 $22.52

98 L0103-00 [TAFE 1 U2’ X 30'600VACIMINSULATION, SCOTT | 35 | NO BID $26.85 NO BID $28.65 NO BID

99 L0104-00 L’B"DEéf;’I‘;O?OOVAC BARLEINEI IO, B S 30 | EA NO BID $38.15 NO BID $40.73 $45.79

100 | L0105-00 |TAPE 34" X 60°600VAC 3M | CAMBRIC, SCOTT 30 | EA NO BID $30.40 NO BID $30.92 $35.28

MODEL# 2520
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COMMODITY

CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

ITEM

e o DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
SWITCH, 120V 300VAC | HOA N.O N.C. POS SIEMENS

101 L0107-00 MODEL# 52PT6G2A ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T- 25 EA NO BID NO BID $72.00 NO BID $50.33
J2A
LED, RED 120V 300VAC 30.5MM | PILOT LIGHT,

102 | L0108-00 |ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T-QH2R SIEMENS 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $108.00 NO BID $60.83
MODEL# 52PLAG2P
LED, GREEN 120 12-120V 30.5MM | PILOT LIGHT,

103 | L0109-00 | o ODELY S00T-0l20 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $112.00 NO BID $70.18
LED, YELLOW 120V 12-120V 30.5MM | PILOT LIGHT,

104 | 1011000 | N L MOBELA $00T-OM2Y 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $112.00 NO BID $70.18
LED, BLUE 120V 12-120V 30.5MM | PILOT LIGHT,

105 | L0100 | o ODELY s00T-OH2B 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $112.00 NO BID $70.18
LED, AMBER 120V 12-120V 30.5MM | PILOT LIGHT,

106 | LO112:00 [ ODEL S00T.OHIA 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $112.00 NO BID $70.18
PUSH BUTTON, RESET 120V 300VAC |[N.O. ANDN.C,,

107 L0113-00 SIEMENS MODEL# 52PA8B2JP ALLEN BRADLEY 30 EA NO BID NO BID $63.00 NO BID $33.12
MODEL# 800T-A2A
PUSH BUTTON, RED 300VAC | AND LABEL, SIEMENS

108 L0114-00 MODEL# 52PASA3KP ALLEN BRADLEY MODEL# 800T{ 30 EA NO BID NO BID $46.00 $81.41 $69.18
FX6AI1
LABEL, EMERGENCY PUSH BUTTON | ALLEN

109 | LO1IS-00 | e o vsos 30 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.00 $4.22
CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC BLACK |

10 | Lo11600 (S e e b 2000 | FT NO BID $0.62935 NO BID $0.73 $0.80
CABLE, COPPER #8 THHN 600VAC GREEN |

11 LOI17-00 | So s C ta 1000 | FT NO BID $0.62935 NO BID $0.73 $0.80
CABLE, COPPER #3/0 THHN 600VAC BLK |

112 | 011800 [ R e eyom K 1000 | FT NO BID $4.98 NO BID $5.88 $6.33
CABLE, COPPER #4/0 THHN 600VAC BLK |

113 | L0190  [Som O  oaom K 500 | FT NO BID $6,606.00 NO BID $6.77 $7.89000
CHARGER, BATTERY 6AMP 12VDC | MARINCO

114 | L0120-00  |C s OeR B T e 3 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $184.92
LED, SECURITY LIGHT GALVANIZED 4000WATTS |

15 | 012100 [ e ey WaL L MODELAMAOIOLIICR | 20 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID $111.78 $125.18
FUSEHOLDER, 600VAC | THREE FUSES DIN RAIL

16 | L0122:00 | S E MODELY L §0030C3PODINK 40 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.65
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

17 | L0123:00 [ O OADS, SQUARE D MODELY 825 50 | EA NO BID $30.00 $29.00 $32.10 $32.69
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

118 | L0124:00 | OADS, SOUARE o MODELY 832 50 | EA NO BID $30.00 $29.00 $32.10 $32.69
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

119 | 1012500 [ O OADS, SOUARE D MODELY B3 50 | EA NO BID $30.00 $29.00 NO BID $32.69

120 | Lo126-00 |HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS 50 | EA NO BID $30.00 $29.00 $31.00 $32.69

600VAC | OVERLOADS, SQUARE D MODEL# B45
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

ITEM

COMMODITY

- e DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

121 L0127-00 |00 R oA DS Soc AR b o 50 | EA NO BID $30.00 $29.00 $31.00 $32.69
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

122 | LOI28-00 [ L OADS, SQUARE & Mo s o112 50 | EA NO BID $31.80 $29.00 NO BID $34.95
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

123 LOI29-00 |t O VERLOADS, SOUARE b s ¥ eclse 50 | EA NO BID $31.80 $29.00 $31.00 $34.95
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

124 | LO130-00 |t e L OADS, SOt RE & Mot o103 50 | EA NO BID $31.80 $29.00 $31.00 $34.95
HEATER ELEMENT, FOR SQUARE D STARTERS

125 LOI3I-00 (it OVERLOADS, SOUARE B VO ¥ o208 50 | EA NO BID $31.80 $29.00 $31.00 $34.95
POWER SUPPLY, 24VAC 120VAC | TELEMECANIQUE

126 | LOI32:00 |TOWERSUPRLY. 24UAC 3 | EA NO BID NO BID $251.00 $244.60 $135.00

127 | L0132-01 |DC POWER SUPPLY P/N: ALLEN BRADLEY 1769-PA2 | 5 | EA NO BID NO BID $333.00 NO BID $272.00

128 L0133-00 REACTOR, 3 PHASE 600VAC | MTE MODEL# RL-08002 3 EA NO BID NO BID $483.00 NO BID $522.37
ARRESTOR, SECONDARY SURGE 600VAC | SQUARE

120 | L0134-00 [ARRESTOR SECOND. 5 | EA NO BID NO BID $157.00 $228.00 $296.09
END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE | FOR UNITSTRUT

130 | L0I35-00 | C e e m o ans T 500 | EA NO BID $3.18 NO BID $7.30 NO BID
END CAPS, PLASTIC WHITE | FOR UNISTRUT

131 L0136-00 | e e e /8 et o s e 500 | EA NO BID $2.99 NO BID $3.55 NO BID
DUCT, PVC 1" X 2" X 6 PANDUIT SLOTTED ADH |

132 | 013700 [P e e et 504 | FT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

133 L0138-00 [COVER PANDUITDUCT PVC I"W X 6" | LIGHT GREY, | 504 | pp NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
PART# CILG6

134 L0141-00 ADAPTER, UBIQUITY POE 50V P/N# POE 50-60W 2 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $35.18

135 L0144-00 BALLAST, UNIVERSAL 120/277 PHILLIPS# ICN-2P32-N 2 EA NO BID $7.75 NO BID $13.25 $12.59

136 L0146-00 BALLAST, UNIVERSAL 120/277 PHILLIPS ICN -4P32-N 2 EA NO BID $23.70 NO BID $16.55 $18.46

137 | L0148-00 |BALLAST, T8 PART# SOP 2PSON351 2 | EA NO BID $23.15 NO BID $31.21 NO BID

138 L0151-00 gg’TNS“fIC/EOR’ INSULATED 1/04 PORTILSOMODEL# | 5, | £, NO BID $15.70 NO BID $35.70 NO BID

139 | L0153-00 gg;’s“fgg“ RGeS A IR0 20 | EA NO BID $29.85 NO BID $32.00 NO BID

140 | Lo155-00 |MIGHT, FLUORESCENT 32W SYLVANIA# F032-850- 6 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.88

ECO
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CAPP, INC.

CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA

WESCO
DISTRIBUTION

SAN ANTONIO, TX

MIDCOAST
ELECTRIC
SUPPLY

COPUS CHRITI, TX

#8536SCO3V01S

e C%“lmgg;“ DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
141 L0155-01  |LIGHT, FLUORESCENT BULB P/N F096841XPECO 6 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.81
142 | L0159-00 |MODULE, 4 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUT #1769-IF4 4 | EA NO BID NO BID $850.00 NO BID $524.33
143 | L0160-00 |MODULE, 8 CHANNEL ANALOG INPUTPN 1769-F8 | 4 | EA NO BID NO BID $1.653.00 NO BID $795.82
144 | 1L0161-00 |MODULE, INOUT P/N 1769-1Q6XOW4 4 | EA NO BID NO BID $275.00 NO BID $249.18
145 | L0164-00 |NANOSTATIOIN, UBIQUITY MS P/N NSM5US 4 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $195.18
146 | LO0167-00 |PLC, COMPACT LOGIC P/N 1769-L32E 4 | BX NO BID NO BID $4,526.00 NO BID $3.225.18
147 | L0170-00 |VFD, LENZE A/C TECH MODEL# ESU 75 N 04TXB 2 | EA NO BID NO BID $398.00 NO BID NO BID
148 L0172-00  [SCOTCH SUPER 33 + GREEN; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
149 1.0173-00  |SCOTCH SUPER 33 + WHITE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NOBID $5.00 $5.90
150 L0174-00  |[SCOTCH SUPER 33 + RED; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
151 1L0175-00  |SCOTCH SUPER 33+ BLUE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
152 L0176-00  [SCOTCH SUPER 33 + YELLOW, HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE | 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
153 1.0177-00  [SCOTCH SUPER 33 + ORANGE; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE | 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
154 L0178-00 |SCOTCH SUPER 33 + BROWN; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE 50 BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
155 | L0179-00 |SCOTCH SUPER 33+ GRAY; HIGH VOLTAGE TAPE s0 | BX NO BID $4.96 NO BID $5.00 $5.90
156 | L0180-00 [N QUARTZ CHICAGO TIME LAPSED METER 50 | EA NO BID NO BID $40.00 NO BID $37.18
157 | Lo1go-01  [FRUMETER 722-004 ROHS 90-264VAC 30/60H2 s0 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $32.68
158 | LOI81-00 (3T Er D e re sre Mo corecsgrs | 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $75.88

STEP DOWN TRANSFORMER .100KVA GENERAL
159 | EO0181-01 |ELECTRIC 240480V PRL/24VAC SEC MODEL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $92.00
#9T58K3027
STEP DOWN TRANSFORMER .100KVA GENERAL
160 | [EO0181-02 |ELECTRIC 240480V PRVI20VAC SEC. MODEL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $83.11
#9T58K2804
161 | L0182-00 [pie OSTUARE D 24VAC CONTROL COIL MODEL 4 | EA NO BID $287.50 $291.00 $428.00 NO BID
162 | E0182-01 |SiEE ! SQUARE D24VAC CONTROL COIL MODEL 8 | EA NO BID $330.10 $296.00 $492.00 NO BID
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CED-BUSH

WESCO

MIDCOAST

G40 SC AL IR SUPPLY CO. LI DISTRIBUTION E55§;5¢C
- : BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA SAN ANTONIO, TX COPUS CHRITI, TX
e C%%rdgg;TY DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

163 |  L0182-02 jg';:ssl)%‘fﬁ(‘}fs” 24¥EF CONTROLEQIE MODEL 12 | EA NO BID $600.20 $522.00 $893.18 NO BID
164 | L0182-03 |23 3IUARE D 24VAC CONTROL COIL MODEL 4 | EA NO BID NO BID $688.00 $1,444.26 NO BID
165 | L0183-00 |70V HOH TS LED RED 24VAC POWER MODEL 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $81.00 NO BID $56.78
166 | L0183-01 |;i 07 LOHT LED BLUE 24VAC POWER MODEL 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $81.00 NO BID $56.78
167 | Lo183-02  |LO7 LOHT LED VELLOW 24VACPOWERMODEL | 55 | pa NO BID NO BID $81.00 NO BID $56.78
168 | L0183-03 |1 OF WGHY LED WHITE 24VACPOWER MODEL 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $81.00 NO BID $56.78
169 | L0I84-00 [COTIROLKELAY § PINS 24vAC COIL POWER 100 | EA NO BID NO BID $35.00 NO BID $14.30
170 | 1018401 [FOTTROLRELAY 1] FINS 24VAC COIL POWER 100 | EA NO BID NO BID $36.00 NO BID $14.97
171 | L0I84-02  [FOTTROLRELAY 8 PINS 24VDC COIL POWER 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $36.00 NO BID $13.62
172 | L0184-03  [FOTTHROLKELAY |1 PINS 24VAC COIL POWER 20 | EA NO BID NO BID $36.00 NO BID $14.30
173 | L0185-00 g?;ji‘QENS’RMAL” GRS eIn R RH 3 20 | EA NO BID $38.00 NO BID $37.75 NO BID
174 |  L0186-00 :‘ggi’é;go"““” SRIMNTIAIZS Y S A S 20 | EA NO BID $75.16 $64.00 $75.90 NO BID
175 | L0187-00 |00 B TIMER ON DELAY S PINS 24VACSQUARED |15 | g NO BID $72.00 $71.00 $73.00 NO BID
176 | Loig7-01 |7-U0 S Soao oM DELAY B PINS 120VACSQUARED| 15 | g NO BID $72.00 $71.00 $73.00 NO BID
177 | L0187-02  |PLUS T FIMER ON DELAY B PINS 24VACSQUARED |15 | Ea NO BID $81.00 $78.00 NO BID NO BID
178 | L0187-03 |7LU0 T TIMER ON DAY BPINS 120VACSQUARED) 19 | 4 NO BID $81.00 $78.00 NO BID NO BID
179 1 ;‘Eg’&:?fg&fﬁg N A A 20 | EA NO BID $25.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
180 2 D e DION SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION 20 | EA NO BID $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
181 3 g‘ig’c‘;f?;ﬁ’gﬁ?;‘;gy S LS 20 | EA NO BID $39.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
182 4 B e L e SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION 20 | EA NO BID $39.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
183 5 o 042 PDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION 20 | EA NO BID $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
184 6 E?é‘?if?;ﬁ'éfﬁiﬁpﬁﬁﬁk DISTRIBUTION 20 | EA NO BID $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
185 7 SRS RN e S0k 23 S0 LT OO 20 | EA NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID

BLOCKS 1 POLE
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CORE & MAIN, LP

BROWNSVILLE, TX

CED-BUSH
SUPPLY CO.

BROWNSVILLE, TX
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WESCO
DISTRIBUTION
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MIDCOAST
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W/Q.C. TERMINAL, LITTELFUSE L60030C-3PQDINR

R C(mmg;“ DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE

PB1062-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION

186 8 s 20 | EA NO BID $125.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PB1063-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION

187 9 A 20 | EA NO BID $135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PB3061-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION

188 10 N 20 | EA NO BID $92.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PB3062-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION

189 1 P 20 | EA NO BID $115.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
PB3063-EDISON SCCR POWER DISTRIBUTION

190 12 pass 20 | EA NO BID $145.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
NON-ILLUMINATED SELECTOR SWITCH, 30 MM, 3,

191 13 MAINTAINED, 2NO/2NC, LEVELER, SQUARE D 800T- S EA NO BID NO BID $72.00 NO BID $39.18
J17A
PILOT LIGHT COMPLETE, 30 MM, 24V AC/DC

192 14 VOLTAGE, LAMP TYPE: LED, TERMINAL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
CONNECTION: PRESSURE PLATE, SQUARE D MODEL
HORN, 24 VAC, FEDERAL SIGNAL 350-024-30, OR AB-

193 15 osreRion 15 | EA NO BID $110.26 $131.00 NO BID $79.36
BEACON WARNING LIGHT, LED, 12 TO 24V AC/DC OR

194 16 T 15 | EA NO BID NO BID $247.00 NO BID $228.40
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 3A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT,

195 17 T oy 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $97.00 NO BID $51.50
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 5A 600V DIN RAIL MOUNT,

196 18 e 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $97.00 NO BID $51.50
EATON 2 POLE BREAKER 10A 600V DIN RAIL

197 19 T o A e o 10 | EA NO BID NO BID $93.00 NO BID $51.50

198 20 1 POLE D10-WMSI1D10 240V BREAKER DIN RAIL 10 EA NO BID NO BID $34.00 NO BID $17.60
FUSE HOLDER 2 POLE 600VAC LUG BOLT

199 21 BN PONT et Bo0SOM a5 12 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.18
HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK

200 22 O ! 10 | EA NO BID $95.00 $194.00 NO BID $133.18
HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK

201 23 RN 10 | EA NO BID $115.00 $229.00 NO BID $149.18
HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK

202 24 POTTAN AL 10 | EA NO BID $180.00 $328.00 NO BID $199.18

203 25 NEMA SWING DOOR PANEL KIT HOFFMAN ANADFK 6 EA NO BID $475.00 $123.00 NO BID $69.82

204 26 :81‘:;‘;‘; PACT, CIRCUIT BREAKER, 240V, SQUARED | ¢ | g\ NO BID NO BID $23.00 NO BID NO BID
FUSE BLOCKS, LF SERIES, CLASS CC/CD, 3 POLES, 30

205 27 AMP RATING, CONNECTOR TYPE: PRESSURE PLATE 6 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.65
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ITEM

COMMODITY

o o DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
SIZE 1 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH

206 28 e e e, 8 | EA NO BID NO BID $294.00 NO BID $187.19
SIZE 2 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH

207 29 e et 12 | EA NO BID NO BID $501.00 NO BID $293.95
SIZE 3 IEC TYPE STARTER 24V COIL SQUARE D WITH

208 30 OVERLOAD OR ABA GO ey SOIL SQUARE D, 12 | EA NO BID NO BID $549.00 NO BID $521.44
SIZE 1 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D

209 31 o eES 12 | Ea NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIZE 2 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D

210 32 Ak 12 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
SIZE 3 IEC TYPE STARTER 120V COIL SQUARE D

211 33 oL oS 12 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

212 34 99995X04 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D 6 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

213 35 9999S1X10 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D 5 | EA NO BID $101.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID

214 36 9999S1X11 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D 5 | EA NO BID $86.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID

215 37 9999S1X12 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARED 5 EA NO BID $86.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID

216 38 9999S1X14 AUXILLIARY CONTACTS SQUARE D 5 EA NO BID $86.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID

217 39 HOFFMAN ENCLOSURE A48H3612GQRLP 4 EA NO BID $2.625.00 $3,041.00 NO BID $1,537.26
HOFFMAN ALUMINUM FRONT PLATE AND BACK

218 40 PO 4 | EA NO BID $475.00 $511.00 NO BID $344.95

219 41 ;gocc;‘LBLE 6 PAIRS # 14AWG COPPER DIRECTBURIAL( | £ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

220 42 ggoco"LBLE R e R T NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4C/#3 COPPER WIRE TC CABLE DIRECT BURIAL

21 43 SPOOL DK R TC CABL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4C/#4 COPPER WIRE TC CABLE DIRECT BURIAL

222 44 oG R N TC CABL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4C/#6 COPPER WIRE TC CABLE DIRECT BURIAL

223 45 oL IR IR TC CABL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4C/#8 COPPER WIRE TC CABLE DIRECT BURIAL

224 46 oo PR MIRE TC CABL 10 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600VAC CLASS CC, 30AMP

225 47 Teaner e SR NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $19.65

226 48 2 POLE FUSE HOLDER 600V 30A MAX, LITTELFUSE |\ | ¢ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.95

#L60030C2PQDINR

Page 12




APPROVED BY: W / -
[ 4

MIDCOAST
] CED-BUSH WESCO
CORE & MAIN, LP SUPPLY CO. CAPP, INC, DISTRIBUTION ELECTRIC
SUPPLY
AT BROWNSVILLE, TX BROWNSVILLE, TX CLIFTON HEIGHTS, PA SAN ANTONIO, TX COPUS CHRITI, TX
'Lf)M C(]’V":ngl"" DESCRIPTION QTY | UM | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNITPRICE | UNIT PRICE
227 49 FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 1AMP, LF-KLK010 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.10
228 50 FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 3AMP, LF-KLK030 20 | EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.10
229 51 FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 5AMP, LF-KLK050 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.10
230 52 FUSE TYPE KTK OR KLK 10AMP, LF-KLK 100 20 EA NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.10
SQUARE D 9070T150D23 120/240 TO 24VAC, OR
231 53 BN A Porae 20 | EA NO BID $150.00 $95.00 $245.15 $68.75
SQUARE D 9070T150D23 240/480TO 24VAC OR ALLEN
232 54 T E AT T 10 | EA NO BID $150.00 $79.00 NO BID $66.33
SQUARE D 9070T150D23 240/480TO 120VAC OR
233 55 by N e Cow Ry 10 | EA NO BID $150.00 $79.00 NO BID $98.67
Valid Until March
1, 2022
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